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RUSSELL STANDARD CORP. 
General Contractors 
Manufacturers of Asphalt 
Mateiials; Emulsions and Coatirigs 
S:irice.l929 · 

Certificate of Secretary 
As to 

Corporate Resolution 

285 Kappa Diive, Suite 300 
Pittsburgh, PA .15238 
< 412) 449-moo 
(412) 449-0704 Fax 

I, George Leach, Secretary of Russell Standard Corporation, a Corporation 
organized under the laws of the state ofPerlrisylvania, do hereby certify that the 
following resolution is a full, true and correct copy of a .resolution of the Board of 
Directors of said Corporation, duly and regularly ~dopted by the Board of 
Directors in confotn1ance with applicable law and the by-laws of said Corporation 
on .the 3rd day of February, 2014. 

Resolved that: 

David Obyc, ChiefEstimator 

Is hereby authorized and directed to sign bid documents on hehalfofthe Corporation, and 
bind the Corporation to the terms ofSuch bid documents that may apply to the 
procurement and execution of construction work and related activities. 

I further certify that said resolution has not been amended or revoked and is still in full 
force and effect 

In witness whereof, I have hereunto set in:y name as Secretary and affixed the seal of said 
Corporation, this 3rd day of February, 2014. 

An Equal Opportunity Employer through Affirmative .Action 



CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE PAGE 

By signing below, or submitting documentation through the West Virginia Vendor( Self Service 
Portal website, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand the 
requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer or 
proposal constitutes an offer to the State that caru:lot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product or 
service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that product 
or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and conditions 
contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or 
proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit 
this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor's behalf; that I am 
authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, 
the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require registration. 

Russell Standard Corp. 

David P Obyc, Chief Estimator 
(Print or Type Name and Title 
of Signatory) 
(412) 449-0700 

(Phone Number) 

(412) 449-0704 
(Fax Number) 

david.obyc@russellstandard.com 
(Email address) 

28-Mar-18 
(Date) 

I 

Form pre-approved by DOH legal division on July 12,2016. 
· Attorney signature not required. 

r 
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I 

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM 
SOLICITATION NO.:DOT1800000041 

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by 
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum 
received and sign below. Frulure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. 

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the 
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc. 

Addendum Numbers Received: 
(Check the box next to each addendum rece1ved) 

~ Addendum No. 1 

D Addendum No. 2 

0 Addendum No. 3 

D Addendum No. 4 

0 Addendum No. 5 

0 Addendum No. 6 

0 Addendum No. 7 

0 Addendum No. 8 

0 Addendum No. 9 

0 Addendum No. 10 

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I 
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral 
discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the 
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding. 

Russell 
1
Standard Corp. 

Full Company Name 

Date 

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite 
document processing. 
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INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM 
SURFACE TREATMENT 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location 
VENDOR NAME Russell Standard Corp 

Mandatory • Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission. 

The Vendor shall provide the 911 address or the most recent physical street address, city and state, for the 
Equipment Storage Location. The Vendor may provide additional Equipment Storage Locations, if applicable. 
The Vendor shall identify the District(s) being serviced by each Equipment Storage Location. 

If the Vendor fails to provide the Equipment Storage Location information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified 
in its entirety. 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location: 

Russell Standard Corp - Mars District( s) 1,2,3,4 
171 7th Ave Serviced: 6, 7,9, 10 
Valencia, PA 16059 
(724) 625-1505 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location: 

Hammaker East Limited District(s) 5,8 
1514 Black Gap Road Serviced: 
Fayetteville, PA 17222 · 
(717) 352-8187 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location: 

District(s) 
Serviced: 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location: 

Oistrict(s) 
Serviced: 

• 

Vendor may duplicate this page if additional space is needed for additional Equipment Storage Locations. 
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150757 1-A1 Russell Standard Corp N/A I-Al 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 • Surface Treatment, Type B Single - 0 - 25000 yards SY 2.06 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-A2 Russell standard Corp N/A 1-A2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Surface Treatment, Type B Single - 25,001 - 75000 yards SY 1.85 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-A3 Russell standard Corp N/A 1-AS 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Surface Treatment, Type B Single -75,001 yards and greater SY 1.62 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-A4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-A4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type 8 Single SY 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-01 Russell &larded Corp NIA 1-81 73181020 Surface Treatment Services alpha 1 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double -0-25,000 yards SY 4.03 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-132 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 25,001 - 75,000 yards SY 3,64 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-83 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-83 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DiStriCt 1 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double • 75,001 yards and greater SY 3.42 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-84 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1434 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District I - Surcharge for Polymer modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type C Double SY 0.22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-C1 Russell standard Corp N/A 1-C1 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 1 - Surface Treatment, Type D Tdple - 0 - 25,009 yards SY 5.62 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-C2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-C2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 • Surface Treatment, Type D Tdple -25,001 to 75,000 yards SY 5.18 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-C3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-C3 73151020 surface TmatmeM Services Distncl 1 -Surface Treatmeffi Type D Triple -75,001 yards and greater SY 4.97 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-04 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-C4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Oihrict 1 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type D Triple SY 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-D1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Fog Seal - 0 - 25,000 yards SY 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Fog Seal • 25001 to 75,000 yards SY 0.70 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-03 Russell standard Corp N/A 1-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Fog Seal -15,001 yards and greater SY 0.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-E1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-E1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Maintaining Traffic • Pilot Truck and Driver Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-52 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-E2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Maintaining Traffic- Traffic Cordroi Devices UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-53 Russell standard Corp N/A 1-53 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1- Maintaining Traffic - Finger HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-E4 Russell standard Corp N/A 1-54 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-F1 Russell standard Corp N/A 1-Fl 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DisIdd 1 - Mobilization for First MO MILE 1000.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-F2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-F2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Mobilization for cacti Additltnui Mile atter the area mile MILE 29.95 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-01 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge- Boone Canty TON 9.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge • Clay County TON 11.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 1-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services OishiCt 1 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Kanawha County TON 4.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 1-04 Russeii Standard Corp N/A 1-04 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Aggregate Hauling Sunnharge - Mason County TON 6.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1-05 Russet! Standen] Corp N/A 1-05 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 1 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge- Putnam County TON 2.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-Al Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-Al 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Surface Treatment, Type B Single - 0 - 25000 yards SY 2.16 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 2-A2 Russell Standen] Corp NW 2-A2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surface TreMmeM, Type B Single - 25,001 - 75,000 yards SY 1.95 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-A3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-A3 73151020 Sudace Treatment Services District 2 - Surface Treatment, Type 13 Single • 75.001 yards and greater SY 1.72 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-A4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-M 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt • Type 0 Single SY 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

152757 2-01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-81 73181020 Surface treatment Services District 2- Sudace Treatment, Type C Double - 0 - 25,000 yards SY 4.13 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-82 Russell standard Corp N/A 2-82 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surface Treatment, Type C Double -25,000 -75,000 yards SY 3.74 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-03 	- 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surface Treatment. Type C Double- 75.001 yards and greater SY 3.52 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2434 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-84 73181020 surface Treatment Services COO! 2- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Ermesified Asphalt. Type C Double SY 0.22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-C1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-Cl 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surface Treatment, Type I) Triple - 0 - 25,000 yards SY 5.72 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-C2 Russell Standard Corp 14/A 2-C2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Surface Treatment, Type D Triple - 25,001 to 75,000 yards SY 5.28 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-C3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-C3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Surface Treatment, Type D Triple -75,007 yards and greater SY 5.07 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-04 Russell standard Corp N/A 2-04 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type D Triple SY 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-01 Russell standard Corp NIA 2-01 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Fog Seal - 0 - 25,000 yards SY 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-02 73101020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Fog Seat- 25,001 to 75,000 yards SY 0.70 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-D3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Dihdct 2- Fog Seat -75,001 yards and greater SY 0.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-E1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-51 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Di 	2- Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-E2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-E2 73081020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- MaiMaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-E3 Russell Mandan] Corp N/A 2-83 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Maintaining Traffic • nagger HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-E4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2.84 73181020 Surface Treatment Services 015-ifict 2- Maintaining Traffic • Arrow Board Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-F1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-Fl 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Mobilization for First Mite MILE 1000.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-F2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-F2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Mobilization for each Additional Mile after the first mile MILE 22.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-01 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Cabell County TON 1.00 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Lincoln County TON 2.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-G3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Aggregate Haying Surcharge- Loon county TON 6.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-04 Russell Standard Corp NIA 2-04 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Mho County TON 8.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 2-05 RUSSO Standard Corp WA 2-05 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Wayne County TON 8.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 3-Al Russell mended Corp N/A 3-Al 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Surface Treatment, Type B Single - 0 - 25,000 yards SY 1.96 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 3-A2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-A2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DOM 3 - Surface Treatment, Type B Single -25,001 -75,000 yards SY 1.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 3-A3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-AS 73181020 Surface Treaunent Services District 3 - Surface Treatment, Type 8 Single -75,001 yards and greater SY 1.52 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

15975/ 3-A4 Russell standard Corp N/A 3-A4 73181020 Surface Treatrnent Services District 3 - surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type B Single SY 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-01 RUSSO! Standard Corp N/A 3-81 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts-Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 0 - 25,000 yards SY 3.92 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3.82 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Sudece Treatment, Type C Double - 25,001 - 75,000 yards SY 3.54 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A-  N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-83 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts-Surface Treatment, Type C Double -71,001 yards and greater SY 3.32 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-04 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-04 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Surbharge for Poiymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type C Double SY 0.22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-C1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-C1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts-Surface Treatment, Type 0 Triple -0-25,000 yards SY 5.52 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-C2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts - Surface Treatment, Type D Triple -25,001 to 75,000 yards SY 5.08 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-C3 Russell standard Corp N/A 3-C3 7318/020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Surface Treatment, Type D Triple -75,001 yards and greater SY 4.87 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-04 Russell standard Corp N/A 3-C4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt Type 0 Triple SY 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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15975/ 3.01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-01 73181020 Surface Treatmern Services Distdct 3- Fog Seal -0-25.000 yards St 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA N/A 
159757 3-02 Russell Standard Corp WA 3-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Fog Seal. 25.001 to 75,000 yards St 0.70 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 3-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Fog Seal- 75.001 yards and greater St 0.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 0-E1 Russell standan1 Corp N/A 3-E1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Maintaining Traffic- Pilot Truck and Driver Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 3-E2 Russel/ Standard Corp N/A 3-E2 731131020 Surface Treatment Services DIstitt 3 - Maintaining Traffic-Traffic Control Devices UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 3-E3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-E3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Maintaining Traffic - Flapper HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 3-E4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-E4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
1513757 3-F1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-F1 73161020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - MoNlizatIon for FUN Mile MILE 1000.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 3-F2 Russell standard Corp N/A 3-F2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Mobilization for each Additional Mlle after the first mile MILE 27.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 3-01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-01 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Calhoun County TON 6.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A t 
159757 3-02 Russell Standen:I Corp N/A 3-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DiStrict 3 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge -Jackson Gourdy TON 15.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-03 Russell Standard Corp WA 3-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DiStrIct 3 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Rieasants County TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 3-04 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-04 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Ocelot 3- Aggregate Hauling surcharge - Ritchie County TON 11.25 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-05 Russell standard Corp N/A 3-05 73181020 Surface Tremment Services District 3 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Roane County TON 11.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-08 Russell standard Corp N/A 3-08 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 3 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Viirt County TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 3-07 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-07 73181020 surface Treatment paiwas District 3. Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Wood County TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A 

159757 4-Al Russell standam Corp N/A 4-Al 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Surface Treatment, Type B Single - 0 -25,000 yards St 1.85 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-A2 Russell standard Corp N/A 4.0.2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Surface Treatment, Type B Single -25,001 -75,000 yards St 1.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-A3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-A3 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 4- Surface Treatment, Type B Single -75,001 yards and greater St 1.45 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 4-A4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-A4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type B single St 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 4-61 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-81 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - surface Treatment, Type C Double - 0 - 25,000 yards St 3.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-62 Russell standard Corp WA 4-82 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 4- Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 25,001 -75,000 yards St 3.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-63 Russell standard Corp N/A 4-S3 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 4 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double -75,001 yards and greater St 3.10 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-84 Russell Standard Carp N/A 4-134 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 4- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type C Double St 0.22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 4-C1 Russell Standen] Corp N/A 4-C1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services MOM 4 - Surface Treatment, Type 0 Triple -0-25,000 yards St 5.20 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-C2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Surface Treatment. TYpe D Triple • 25,001 to 75,000 winds St 4.80 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A 

159757 4-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Surface Treatment, Type 0 Triple -75,001 yards and greater St 4.55 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-04 Russell standard Corp N/A 4-C4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Surcheise for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type D Triple St 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-01 Russell Standard Carp N/A 4-01 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4- F00 Seal - 0 - 25,000 yards St 0.75 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-D2 Russell Standard Carp N/A 4-D2 73181020 Suffice Treatment Services mom 4 - Fog Seal -25,001 to 75,000 yards St 0.70 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-03 73181020 Surface Treat:nem Services District 4 - Fog Seal -75,001 yards and greater St 0.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-E1 Russell standard Corp N/A 4-E1 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 4- Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-E3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Maintaining Traffic- Flapper HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A 

159757 4-E4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-E4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Distdct 4- Maintaining Traffic • Arrow Scars Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-F1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-F1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Mobilization for First Mire MILE 1000.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-F2 Russell standard Corp N/A 4-F2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Mobilization for each Additional Mile after the first mile MILE 49.95 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4421 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-01 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 4- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Doddridge County TON 11.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-02 RUM!! Standard Corp N/A 73181020 SYMMS Treatment Services Distdct 4 - Aggregate Hauling Surchame - Harrison County TON 7.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-03 73181020 sal-race Treatment Services District 4 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge • madon counter TON 6.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-04 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-04 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Monongalla Count,/ TON 4.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-65 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-05 73151020 Surface Treatment Services Distdct 4 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Preston County TON 7.00 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 4-08 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-08 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge • Taylor county TON 6.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-A1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-A1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - surface Treatment, Type El Single -0- 25,000 yards St 1.85 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-A2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-A2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts-Surface Treatment, Type 13 Single • 25,001 - 75,000 yards St 1.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 5-A3 Russell standard Corp NW 5-A3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - Surface Treatment, Type 8 Single -75,00t yards and greater St 1.45 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-A4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-A4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - SurclrargeforPolymerunodlfltd Cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type B single St 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-61 Russet! Standard Corp N/A 5-61 73181020 Sultana Treatment Services Dislrict 5 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 0 - 25,000 yards St 3.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-62 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-62 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Di 	ct 5 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 25,001 - 75,000 yards St 3.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-63 Russell Standard Corp WA 5-133 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts - surface Treatment, Type C Double- 75.001 yards and greater St 3.10 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-64 Russell standard Corp N/A 5-64 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DIstdct 5 - surcharge for Polymer mooted Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type C Double St 0.22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-C1 Russell standard Corp N/A 5-C1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - surface Treatment, Type 0 Triple -0-25,000 yards St 5.19 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 BC2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-C2 73181020 Surface TreMmeM Services District 5 - Surface Treatment, Type 0 Triple - 25,001 to 75,000 yards St 4.80 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-C3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-C3 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 5 - Surface Treatment, Type D Triple -75,001 yards and greater St 4,55 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-04 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-c4 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 5 - surcharge for Roiymer modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type D Triple St 0,36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-01 Russell Standard Corp WA 5-01 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - F017 Seal - 0 -25,000 yards St 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-02 Russell Mandan] Corp N/A 5-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts- Fran Seal • 25,001 to 75,000 yards St 0.70 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5.1)3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - Fag Seal -75,001 yards and greater St 0.65 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-El Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-E1 73181020 Surface Tremment Services Districts- Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-E2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-E2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-E3 Russet! standard Corp N/A 5-E3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - Maintaining Traffic - Flapper HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-04 Russell standard Corp N/A 5-E4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services 015111015- Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-F1 Russell standard Corp N/A 5-F1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 5 - mobilization for First Mile MILE 1000.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-F2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-F2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Oceact 5 - MoNlization for each Addeional Mile after Me first mite MILE 49.95 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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159757 5431 Rune. Standard Corp NIA 5-01 73101020 Surface Treatment Santee Ditdriot 5 - Aggregate IteuMm Surcharge • Berkeley Cowry TON 1.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 5432 Ruiseft Standard Corp NIA 542 73101020 Surface TreelmeM Semites DINAMI 5  - ADM:tate SteuRrm Surcharge • Grant County TON 13.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 5-03 Russell &stud Corp WA 5-03 73101020 Surface Treatment SeNtoes Olstrid 5. Acgregate HauMm Suntharge - Harm:entre County TON 7.00 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 5-04 Russell Slardard Corp WA 544 73181020 Surfarre Treatment ServIcies District 5 • Aggregate ItautIng Sumitomo • Hardy County TON 9.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 
159757 5-05 itrasee Sondra Cap WA 545 73101020 Surface Treatment Garden Drstritt 5 • Aggregate limAIng Surcharge • Jeff erson County TON 1.00 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A 
159757 540 Rome Standard Corp WA 5-06 73151020 Surface Treatmerd Services Distrk4 5. &parapet. Naunng Swamp, . Mineral County TON 7.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 547 Russell Standed Corp WA 547 73101020 Surface Treatment Services mem 5. Aggregate Hach° Surcharge • Morgan County TON 3.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 0-Al Russell Mandard Corp WA 8-Al 73101020 Surface Treshrien Services Distrld 6 - Surface Tmatmerd. Type 8 Single - 0. 25.030 yards St 1.85 5 )4/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 15A2 Russeg Standard Corp WA 0-A2 73101020 Surface Trealnient Services Districi 6 • Surface Trertmeni•  Type B SMLIN - 25.001  - 75.000  Was St 1.65 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 6..43 Russell Standan1 Com N/A 5-A3 73101020 Surface Treatmere Services DiVrid 0 . Surface Trimmers Type 8 smme - 75.00i yards and greater St 1.45 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
150757 ESA4 Rum.* Standard Corp WA 5-A4 73101020 surface Treatment Services Olstrici 0- Sun:Muse for Polymer Modified Work EmumMed Asphalt - Type a Singh, St 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A 
150757 0-81 Rusfell Standard Carp WA 15431 73181020 surface Treatment Services Disalci 0- Surface Trenton Type C Double . 0 - 25,000 yards St 3.65 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 
159751 0-B2 Russel Standard Carp WA 5432 73161020 Surface Treatment SeMces 0IRri0 6 - Surface Treatment Type C Double - 25.001 • 750E0 yards St 3.30 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 
¶59757. 6-03 Russel Standard Corp WA 0433 73151020 Surface Trertmern Seivices Districi 6 - Surf ece Treatment, Type C Double - 75,001 yards end greeter St 3.10 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A 

159757 0-04 Russel standard Carp N/A 5434 73151020 Surface Treatmen Services DisNici 5-  Surchold for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asrlwit. Type C Double St 0.22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 641 Russet Mendip Cow  WA 541 73151020 SWIM Treatment Services Mstrid 6- Surface Treatment Type D Td#e -0-25.000 yards St 5.20 5 N/A WA N/A NIA N/A NIA N/A N/A 

159757 	- 6.42 Russell Mended Cap WA 6-C2 73161020 Surf's. TrestrneM Services Otsgict 5- Surface Tenement Type 0 Triple .25,001 W75.000 yards St 4.80 5 N/A NIA N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 643 Runes standard Corp WA 0-C3 73161020 Surface Treatment Services District 0 - Surface Treatment Type Cr Id* • 75,031 ma, Ed greeter St 4.55 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 0-C4 Busse Standard Carp WA 644 73161020 Surface Treatment Seldom 	. Markt 0- sumname for Polymer Modified CsOoMc Emulsified Molten, Type D Triple St 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A 

159757 0411 Russen Eaandard Com WA 0431 73181020 Surface Trestrnerd Services Odificl 5 - Fag Seal - 0 - 25000 yards St 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5.02 Rumen Standard Corp N/A 6-02 731151020 sulfate Treatment Services DDIrla 0 - Fag Seel • 25.001 to 75.003 yards St 0,70.  5 N/A N/A N/A-  N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 0-03 Russell Standard Cap N/A 8-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Distrla 0 • Fog Seel • 75.001 yards and greater St 0.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 

150157 6E1 Russel Maraud Coop WA 8-Et 73101020 Burrow Treatment services (Marla 0 - MAIMaintng Trek • Pilot Inn* mid Caber Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A 
150757 0-02 Russell Standard Corp NIA 15E2 73161020 Surface TreerneM Services District 6 - Mainiehdrat Trafird - Traffic Cacho' Devices UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 5-E3 Russo Standard Corp WA 0-E3 73181020 Surface TreaUneM Services Distrkl 0 - MaIntainIng Traffic - Finder HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 6.€4 Rumen Standard Corp N/A e-E4 73151020 Surface Treatment Services O&M 5 • wilmeintng Trek • Arrow Board Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 6-Fl Russell Standard Carp NIA 6-F1 73181020 Swine Treatment Sento., DINA] 6 - Mobilization for First Nuie MILE 1000.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA NIA 
159757 542 Russell Mansard Corp NIA 842 731611720 Surface Treatment Services (*Mkt 0- Motrtizallon for each Arktildrial mac after Me CPS mite MILE 49.95 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA NIA N/A 

150757 8-G1 Reader Standard Coop N/A 1541 71161020 Surface Treatment Services DistIO 0- Aggregate Hauling Sotimme • Brooke County TON 5.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 542 Runen Standard Corp N/A 042 73151020 Su/face Treatment Services Didria 15 - Aggregate Hauling Surtherge • Haneocg County TON 6.25 5 N/A WA N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA NIA 
159757 8433 Russell Standen] Corp NM 043 73181020 surface Tretlfreli Services Distdc1 e - Aggregate Hagang Stactrame • marshal County TON 4.75 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A NIA N/A N/A 

159757 8-04 Russen Mandan] Corp N/A 8434 73181020 Surfma Treatment Services Otririci 0 - Aggregate Nauflog Surdumn • Ohio CountY TON 2.75 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 
150157 5425 Russell Standard Corp WA 645 73161020 Surface Treatment Services Drsttlel 6 -*Wept. Hauling Surcharge • Tyier county . TON No Bid 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
150757 6-138 Russell Standard Corp WA 846 73151020 Surface Treatment &Mots Drat 0  - AWregete Haulm Surchrge • wetym county TON 3.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA NIA N/A 

159757 7-Al Russen Standard Corp N/A 7-Al 73151020 Surface Treatment Services Disrld 7 - Surface Treatment. Type B Single - 0 • 25.000 yards St 1.9S 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA 
159757 7,A2 Russet Standard Corp N/A 7-A2 73161020 Surface Treatment Services DIstriet 7- Surface Treatment. Type 8 Single .25.001 .75.000 yards St 1.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA 
159757 7-A3 Russell StandenI Carp WA 7.A3 73161020 Surface TMATTlent Services Distrid 7- Surface Treatment Type B Slagle -75.001 yards cud greeter St 1.55 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7.A4 Reset mansard Carp N/A 7•A4 73161020 Surface Treatment Services Otand 7- Cytherea tor POIrlet McdMed Cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type B single St 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A 

159757 7411 Russell Standard Corp N/A 7•81 73181020 S ;face Tntatmern Services DtstrIrl 7 - Surfatm Trestment. Type C Double -0-25.020 yards St 3.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 782 Rumen Starelerd Corp N/A 7432 73151020 Surface TrestmeM Services Distsici 7 - Surface Treatment. Type C Double - 25,001. 75.030 yards St 3.40 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A NIA 
159757 7-83 Russen Standard Carp N/A 7-83 73181020 Scene TreatrneM Servism Distrld 7 - Surface Treatment. Type C Double • 75.001 yards and reefer St 3.20 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-84 Russell Standard Corp WA 7434 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DisMci 7-  SurcilaMe  for Polymer Meeftfied Cationic Emulsified Amid% Type C Dout4e SY 0.22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-C1 Russell Standard Corp WA 7-C1 73181020 surface Trerment Servants Mitt 7- Surface Treatmera, Type D Mole -0-25.000 yards St 5.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-C2 Riese Standard Corp WA 7-C2 73161020 Surface Treatmern SeMces Dislrici 7 - Surface Treatment. Type D Triple • 25.001 to 75,000 yards St 4.90 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-C3 Russell Enarviard Corp WA 7-C3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Distrld 7 • Surface Treatment. Type D Tricee - 75.001 yards and greeter St 4.85 5 N/A WA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-C4 Russell Standard Corp WA 744 73181020 Surface Treatment Servfces District 7- Surcharge for Polymer Modftled Woke Emulsified Asphalt. Type D Triple St 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-01 Rumen Standard Corp WA 7-01 73161020 surface nem/nein SeMces Oislrici 7 - Fog Seal - 0 - 25.000 yards St 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

157/57 7-02 Russen Stereired Corp WA 7-02 73161020 SIOSCO Trerlment Services District 7 - Fag Seal - 25.001 to 75,030 pads St 0.70 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A 

159757 7433 Russell Standard Corp WA 74/3 73161020 Surface Trealment Services 0istric4 7 - FOg Seal • 75,001 yards and greater SY 0.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 741 Russell standard Carp N/A 7-El 73181020 Surface Treetmem &Mon Distdot 7- MeNtehting Traffic • Rot Truck end Myer Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA WA N/A 

159757 742 Russell Standard CafP WA 7-E2 memo Surface TreiltMent Serb's °ism., 7- mehttalnIng Trek • Traffic Control Devices UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-E3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 7-E3 73151020 Surface Treatment Services Dtstrid 7 - lArtaining Trent • Flogger HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-E4 Rumen Mtn:lard Corp N/A 7-E4 13181020 Surface Trestrnent Services District 7 - mentalning Tram° • *now Bawd Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A NIA 

159757 7-F1 Russell Standard Corp N/A 7.41 73151020 Surface Treatment Services Distrid 7 - Mobilization fa Fad mlie MILE 1000.00 5 WA NIA N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA 

159757 742 Russet Standard Carp WA 7-F2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 7 - Mod/nation for each Additional Mile altar the find mite MILE 39.95 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA 

191/57 7.01 Rumen Standard Corp N/A 741 73151020 simians Treatment See/Ices DIstdci 7 - Aggregate Nadine Surdiarga • Bartour County TON 2.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

159757 	- 742 Russell Standard Corp WA 7-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DIstrIcl 7. Aggregate ilaultng Sunthame - Breston Canty TON 12.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 743 Rumen Standard Cap WA 7-03 13181020 Surraoe Trod/pent Services District 7 - Aggregate Hauling Sumberge - Gamer COuntY TON 12.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 7-04 RISSRII Standard Corp N/A 7-04 73181020 surface Treatment Services Districi 7 .4goreserte Hauling Sumatra° - LAMS CcuelY TON 5.00 5 N/A NIA N/A WA N/A N/A NIA N/A 

150757 7-G5 Russell Standard Corp WA 7-05 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DIRTIDI 7  - ADIregare Hauling Surcharge • Upshur County TON 3.00 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

150757 146 Russell Steady@ Corp WA 740 73161020 seam Treatmem Services Dialect 7 . Aggregate Hauling surdierge • Webster Coumy TON 10.25 5 'N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A WA N/A N/A 

150757 6.-Al Russell Standard Corp WA 6-Al 73161020 Surface Treatfilent Seniors 0/dude- Surface Treatment. Type B Single - 0 - 25.000 yards St 1.90 5 N/A NIA-NIA-  N/A N/A NIA N/A WA 

159757 6-.A2 Rumen Standard Corp WA 5-A2 73161020 Surface Treatment Sawkes ONtrici 5 - Sedate Treatmerd. Type 13 EIngfe • 25.001 • 75.000 yirdS St 1.75 5 N/A NIA N/A NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA 

159757 6-A3 Rune Standard Corp WA 5-A3 73181020 SWUM TISKITIelli Services 017/1.1 6- Surface Tree/mall, Type B Single - 75.001 yards and greeter St 1.50 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A 
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159757 (1-A4 Russell Standard Corp NIA 13-A4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services 
-..- 

District 8- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt- Type B Single St 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-91 Russell Standard Corp NIA 8-Ell 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Distdct 8- Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 0 - 250.00 yards St 3.75 5 N/A NIA -11I/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 5432 Russell Standen] Corp NIA 0.512 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8 • Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 25,001 . 75.000 yards St 3.45 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8433 Russell Standard Corp N/A 13-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double- 75.001 yards and greater St 3.21 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-134 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8434 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Distdct 8- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt. Type C Double St 0,22 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-C1 . Russell Standard Corp Nth 8-C1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8- Surface TreatmeM, Type 0 Triple - 0 - 25,000 yards St 5.45 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-C2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8- Surface Treatment, Type D Triple - 25,001 to 75,000 yank St 5,01 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8.C3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 0.03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8 • Surface Treatment, Type D Triple - 75,091 yards and greater 	- St 4.79 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 &CA Russell Standard Corp N/A 0-04 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type 0 Triple St 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 5-01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-D1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Fog Seel - 0 - 25,000 yards St 0.85 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 0.1)2 Russell Standass Corp N/A 8-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Fog Seal - 25.001 to 75,000 yards St 0.80 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 B-D3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-03 73181020 Surface TreatmeM Services District 8 - Fog Seal -75,001 yards and greeter St 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-E1 Russell standard Corp N/A 8-E1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8- Maintaining Traffic - Piss Thick and Driver Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 0-E2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8 • MalMainIng Traffic • Traffic Control Devices UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-E3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DIstrid 8 . Maintaining Traffic- Flogger HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-E4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-E4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Distdct 8 - Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-F1 Russell standard Corp N/A 8-F1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8- Mobilization for First Mile MILE 1000.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-F2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 13-F2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services fiddle! 8 - Mobilization for each Additional Mlle after the first mile MILE 27.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-31 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-01 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 8- Aggregate Hailing Surcharge- Pendleton County TON 11.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District B • Aggregate Hauling Surcharge • Pocahontas County TON 18.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-G3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-G3 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 8 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Randolph County TON 2.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 8-04 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-34 73181020 Surface TreatmeM Services bistrict 0- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge. Tucker County TON 4.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 9-Al Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-Al 731/31020 Surface Treatment Services Deffict 9 - Surface Treatment, Type El Single -0.25,000 yards St 2.05 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-A2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-A2 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surface Treatment, Type 13 Single - 25,001 - 75,000 yards St 1.85 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
150757 9-A3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-A3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surface Treatment, Type B Single -75,001 yards and greater St 1.60 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-A4 Russell Standen] Corp WA 9-0.4 73181020 Surface Treatrnent Services District 9 - Sunaharge for Polymer Modified cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type!) Single St 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9431 Russell Standard Corp WA 9431 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9- Surface Treatment, Type C Massie - 0 - 25,000 yards St 3.95 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9432 Russell Standard Corp WA 9-132 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double .25,001 - 75.000 yards St 3.55 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-B3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9433 79181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 75,001 yards and greater St 3.35 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-314 Russell Standard Copp N/A 8-B4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surcharge for Polymer modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type C Double St 0,22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-01 73181025 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surface Treatment, Type D Triple . 0 - 25,000 yards St 5.65 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 	- 9.C2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-C2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - surface Treatment, Type D Triple • 25,001 to 750.00 yards St 5.25 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 	. 9-C3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-C3 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surface Treatment, Type 0 Triple -75,001 yards and greater St 5.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-04 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-04 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type D Triple St 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-D1 Russell Standard Corp WA 9-01 73181020 Surface TreatmeM Services District 9 - Fog Seal - 0 - 25.000 yards St 0.85 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-02 Russell Standard Corp WA 9-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Dishict 9 - Fog Seal -25,0011075,000 yards St 0.80 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 9-03 Russell Standen] Corp N/A 9-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts - Fog Seal -75,001 yards and greater St 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-E1 Russell Standard Corp NIA 9-El 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck end Driver Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 9-02 Russell Standard Corp WA 9-E2 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 9 - Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT _ 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 13-E3 Russell Standard Carp N/A 9-E3 73181020 Surface TreatmeM Services Distdct 5- Maintaining Traffic - Finger HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-E1 Russell standard Corp WA 9-E4 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9 . Maintaining Traffic- Arrow Board Day 20.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 9-F1 Russell standard Corp NIA 9-F1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services 	' District 9 • Mobilization for First Mile MILE 1000.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-F2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9.F2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Modlization for each Additional Mlle after the first mile MILE 22.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-01 Russell Standard Corp WA 9-01 73101020 Surface Treatment Services ()Istria 9 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Fayette County TON 0.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-02 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 9 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Greenbiler County TON 13.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9.03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 9- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge • Monroe County TON 15.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 	• 9-04 Russell standard Corp N/A 9-01 73181025 Seifert Treatment Services Districts- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge • Nicholas County TON 7.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 9-05 Russell Standard Corp WA 9-05 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Districts - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Summers County TON 8.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-Al Russell Standard Corp N/A 10-A1 73181020 surface Treatment Services 	. District ID - Surface Treatment. Type 13 Single - 0 - 25,000 yards St 2.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-A2 Russell Standard Coss N/A 10-A2 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District la-Surface Treatment, Types Single -25,001-75,050 yards St 1.80 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 10-A3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 10-A3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 10- Surface Treatment, Type B Single -75,001 yards and greater St 1.60 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 10-A1 Russell standard Corp NIA 10-A1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 10- Surcharge for Polymer Massed Cationic Emulsified Asphatt - Type B Single St 0.12 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10431 Russell Standard Carp N/A 10-Ell 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District la-Surface Treatment. Type C Double - 0.25,000  yards St 3.90 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-132 Russell Standard Corp NIA 10432 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 10. Surface Treetmess. Type C Double -25,001-75,500 yards St 3.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 10-83 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District ID- Surface Treatment. Type C Double - 75.001 yards and greater St 3.35 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A -  N/A 

159757 10434 Russell Standard Corp N/A 10-E14 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 10 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt. Type C Double St 0.22 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-C1 Russell Standard Carp N/A 10-01 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District ID- Surface Treatment Type D Triple -5-25,000 yards St 5.55 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 10-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District It- Surface Treatment, Type D Tele - 25,001 to 70.01:0 yards St 5.10 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-C3 Russell Standard Corp NIA 10-C3 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 10 - SurlaCe Treatment, Type D Triple -75,051 yards and greater St 4,90 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-04 Russell Standard Coss N/A 15-04 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 10. Surcharge for Polymer modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt Type D Tit* St 0.36 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10.01 Russell Standard Corp NIA 10-01 73181020 surface Treatment Services District 10- Fog Seal - 0 - 25,000 yards St 0.85 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 10-02 73181020 Surface Treatment Services Distdd 18- Fog Seal -25,001 to 75,000 yards St 0.80 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-03 Russell standard Corp NIA 10.03 73181020 Surface Treatment Services DiSifiCt ID- Fog Seal - 75,1321 yards and greater St 0.75 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

159757 10-El Russell Standard Corp N/A 10-E1 73181020 Surface Treatment Services District 10. MaiMainIng Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver Day 350.00 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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159757 10-E2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 10.E2 73181020 Striate Trartment Services Obtrld 10- Mairnaintro Traffic . Traffic Ccoln51Devka UNIT 0.30 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/; N/A NIA NIA 
159757 10-E3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 10-E3 73181020 Surface Vestment Semites DIstrld 10- MahtelnIng Traffic -Flamer HOUR 55.00 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A NIA 
159757 10-Ed Russel standard Corp NIA 10-Ed 73181020 Surface Treatment Services OftlEbel 10 - MaIntatnhW Traffic • Arrow Bad Day 20.00 5 NIA N/A N/A WA N/A N/A NIA N/A 
159757 10..F l Rumen Mandare Corp NIA 10-F1 73181020 Surface Treatment Senkea District 10 - Mobilization for Flit Mae MILE 1000.00 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 1Sn Russell Standard Cap NIA 1042 73181020 Seat irestrneat ServRes Obit 10- A1oDalzatIon for each Addll/Orta Mile after the first mille MILE 22.50 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 
159757 1041 Russel Stenaerd Corp NIA 10G1  73181020 Surface Trearnimt Santos District 10- Aogreorne Hauling Surettme • McOonell County TON 17.25 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 
150757 1042 Menet Standard Cap NIA 1042 73181020 Surface Treatment Serazes DIM/cl 10 - AGSTROMO Moony Swehargt • Mercer CEO* TON 9.00 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A NIA N/A 
159757 1043 Russell Mandan, Corp WA 10-03 73181E020 SuTface TrwarneW Swims EN5Ww WI- Aggregeno Hau1159 Surcharge • RAIWOft CouftlY TON 1.50 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
159757 10-04 Russel, Standen! Corp WA 10-04 73181020 Swine Treatment Services Darkt 10. AggrellMe Haag Surdierge • Wyoming covmy TON 11.50 5 -WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 
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