Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder : 573533

Solicitation Description : 7019EC12 Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator

Proc Type : Agency Master Agreement

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2019-05-09 SR 0803 ESR05091900000005154 1
13:30:00
LVENDOR
000000206657
J C BOSLEY CONSTRUCTION INC
Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT1900000045
Total Bid : $0.00 Response Date: 2019-05-09 Response Time: 12:14:30
Comments:
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith
(304) 558-9398
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov
Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Hot-Mix Asphalt Hauling Truck 0.00000 EA
Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Hot-Mix Asphalt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 2 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Hot-Mix Asphalt Hauling Truck 0.00000 EA
Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Hot-Mix Asphalt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 3 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Hot-Mix Asphalt Hauling Truck 0.00000 EA
Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Hot-Mix Asphalt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 4 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Hot-Mix Asphalt Hauling Truck 0.00000 EA
Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Hot-Mix Asphalt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 5 Axle Bed

Extended Description :
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Aggregate Hauling Truck 0.00000 EA $100.000000 $0.00
Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Aggregate Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 2 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Aggregate Hauling Truck 0.00000 EA $100.000000 $0.00
Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Aggregate Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 3 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Aggregate Hauling Truck 0.00000 EA $100.000000 $0.00
Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Aggregate Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 4 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Aggregate Hauling Truck 0.00000 EA
Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Aggregate Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 5 Axle Bed

Extended Description :
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Ditch Dirt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental ~ 0.00000 EA $100.000000 $0.00
WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Ditch Dirt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 2 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Ditch Dirt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental ~ 0.00000 EA $100.000000 $0.00
WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Ditch Dirt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 3 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Ditch Dirt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental ~ 0.00000 EA $100.000000 $0.00
WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Ditch Dirt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 4 Axle Bed

Extended Description :

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Ditch Dirt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental ~ 0.00000 EA
WITH Operator
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141702
Ditch Dirt Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator-Heavy Industrial 5 Axle Bed

Extended Description :
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J.C. Bosley Construction,

inc.

Vendor Should Type Pricing Page Schedule

Please contact dusty.j.smith@wv.gov for an Excel version

Exhibit A
Lease/Rental Rate of | Lease/Rental Rate of | Lease/Rental Rate of
With Operator Equipment With Equipment With Equipment
Equipment Description Equipment Offered for Lease/Rental Operator Operator With Operator
Hot-Mix Asphalt Aggregate Ditch Dirt
Manufacturer's Name Model/Serial # S /Hour S /Hour S /Hour
ASPHALT HAULING TRUCKWITHTARP - 11995 Ford LTS 1FDZY90X6SVA80892
Heavy Industrial 2 Axle Bed 1995 Ford LTS 1FDZY90X6SVA42773 No Bid $100.00 $100.00
ASPHALT HAULING TRUCK WITH TARP - 1994 Ford LTS TFDZY90T9RVAS52172
Heavy Industrial 3 Axle Bed 1991 Ford LTL 1FDZA90XXMVAQ7483 No Bid $100.00 $100.00
ASPHALT HAULING TRUCK WITHTARP - 15001 Sterling LT |2FZHAZA881AG90393
Heavy Industrial 4 Axle Bed 2001 Sterling LT I|2FZHAZA861AI0880 No Bid $100.00 $100.00
ASPHALT HAULING TRUCK WITHTARP - 12001 Sterling LT |[2FZHAZA8X1AJ0880
Heavy Industrial 5 Axle Bed 2001 Volvo DT 4V55C8JH11N31487 No Bid No Bid No Bid

The Vendor should identify their base location and any other potential base locations where the equipment bid may be delivered by the Vendor. The Vendor should
provide the 911 address or the most recent physical street address, city and state for the base location(s). If the Vendor fails to provide the base location(s) on the

Information Attachment Form, the Vendor’s bid may be disqualified. If additional space is needed for additional base locations, you may duplicate this page. This list
does not determine sole base locations for a Vendor, but provides a base for determining potential mileage.

Vendor Base Location:

Vendor Base Location:

J.C. Bosley Construction, Inc. Shop

2831 Pike St.

Parkersburg, WV 26101

Vendor Base Location:

Vendor Base Location:

Vendor Base Location:

Vendor Base Location:




J.C. Bosley Construction,Inc.

Counties Bid:

Exhibit B

Vendor should indicate the County, Counties or District-Wide serviced by the Vendor for lease/rent of equipment tothe
WVDOH by placing an "X" or "\" beside the County, Counties or District-Wide.

District 1

Hot-Mix

Aggr_egate

Ditch Dirt

District-Wide

District 6

Hot-Mix

Aggregate

Ditch Dirt

Boone

District-Wide

Clay

Brooke

Kanawha

Hancock

Marshall

Mason

Ohio

Putnam

Tyler

Wetzel

District 2

Hot-Mix

Aggregate

Ditch Dirt

District-Wide

Cabell

District 7

Hot-Mix

Agﬂgate

Ditch Dirt

District-Wide

Lincoln

Barbour

Logan

Mingo

Braxton

Wayne

Gilmer

Lewis

Upshur

District 3

Hot-Mix

Aggggate

Ditch Dirt

Webster

District-Wide

Calhoun

District 8

Hot-Mix

Aggggate

Ditch Dirt

Jackson

<

District-Wide

Pleasants

Pendleton

Ritchie

Pocahontas

Roane

Randolph

Wirt

>

Tucker

Wood

District 9

Hot-Mix

Awate

Ditch Dirt

District 4

Hot-Mix

Aggregate

Ditch Dirt

District-Wide

District-Wide

Fayette

Doddridge

Greenbrier

Harrison

Monroe

Marion

Nicholas

Monongalia

Preston

Summers

Taylor

District 10

Hot-Mix

Aggregate

Ditch Dirt

District-Wide

District 5

Hot-Mix

Aggregate

Ditch Dirt

McDowell

District-Wide

Berkeley

Mercer

Raleigh

Grant

Wyoming

Hampshire

Hardy

Jefferson

Mineral

Morgan




State of West Virginia
Request For Quotation

Procurement Folder : 573533
Document Description : 7019EC12 Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator
Procurement Type : Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued | Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version Phase
2019-05-03 2019-05-09 ARFQ 0803 DOT1900000045 2 Final
13:30:00

¥ ."mn- Wﬂwﬂ-’;ﬂr‘u'ﬂ"h

FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION | Vendor Name, Address and Telephone
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
BLDG 5, RM A-220

J.C. Bosley Construction,Inc.
1 Bosley Ave.

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E Parkersburg, WV 26101
CHARLESTON W 25302 304-422-0025
us

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE
Dusty J Smith

(304) 558-9398 V(\ ) (\
d J.smith@wv. X
u(y j.smi WV.go! \ )

- May 9,2019
Signature X FEINg >°>—0691657 DATE oY !
All offers subject to all terms and conditions conftained in this solicitation
Date Printed : May 03, 2019 Solicitation Number : DOT1800000045 Page : 1 FORM ID : WV-PRC-ARFQ-001




ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS (Construction Contracts Only)

1. CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE: West Virginia Code § 21-11-2 requires that all persons
desiring to perform contracting work in this state be licensed. The West Virginia Contractors
Licensing Board is empowered to issue the contractor’s license. Applications for a contractor’s
license may be made by contacting the West Virginia Division of Labor. West Virginia Code §
21-11-11 requires any prospective Vendor to include the contractor’s license number on its bid.
If an apparent low bidder fails to submit a license number in accordance with this section, the
Purchasing Division will promptly request by telephone and electronic mail that the low bidder
and the second low bidder provide the license number within one business day of the request.
Failure of the bidder to provide the license number within one business day of receiving the
request shall result in disqualification of the bid. Vendors should include a contractor’s license
number in the space provided below.

Contractor’s Name: J.C. Bosley Construction, Inc.

Contractor’s License No.: WV- 003012 (see attached)

The apparent successful Vendor must furnish a copy of its contractor’s license prior to the
issuance of a contract award document

2. AIA DOCUMENTS: All construction contracts that will be completed in conjunction with
architectural services procured under Chapter 5G of the West Virginia Code will be governed by
the attached AIA documents, as amended by the Supplementary Conditions for the State of West
Virginia, in addition to the terms and conditions contained herein.

2A. PROHIBITION AGAINST GENERAL CONDITIONS: Notwithstanding anything
contained in the AIA Documents or the Supplementary Conditions, the State of West Virginia
will not pay for general conditions, or winter conditions, or any other condition representing a
delay in the contract. The Vendor is expected to mitigate delay costs to the greatest extent
possible and any costs associated with Delays must be specifically and concretely identified. The
state will not consider an average daily rate multiplied by the number of days extended to be an
acceptable charge.

3. GREEN BUILDINGS MINIMUM ENERGY STANDARDS: In accordance with § 22-
29-4, all new building construction projects of public agencies that have not entered the
schematic design phase prior to July 1, 2012, or any building construction project receiving state
grant funds and appropriations, including public schools, that have not entered the schematic
design phase prior to July 1, 2012, shall be designed and constructed complying with the ICC
International Energy Conservation Code, adopted by the State Fire Commission, and the
ANSI/ASHRAE/IESNA Standard 90.1-2007: Provided, That if any construction project has a
commitment of federal funds to pay for a portion of such project, this provision shall only apply
to the extent such standards are consistent with the federal standards.

Revised 01/24/2019



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract.

%)
Mark Husk Project Coordinator

(Printed Name and Title)
1 Bosley Ave., Parkersburg, WV 26101

(Address)

304-422-0025 304-422-0414
(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
markh@jcbci.com

(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
produc’ or service proposed meets the mandatory reqirements contained in the Solicitation for
that pr duct or service, unless otherwise stated herei: - that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that [ am authorized by the vendor to execute
and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf: that
I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my
knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require
registration.

J<C. Bosley Cc ction, Inc.
(CpranLy)

.

(Authorized Sigﬁaﬁ:r&“@r_&;entative Name, Title)

Lisa A. Smith Secretary/ Treasurer
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

May 3,2019
(Date)

304-422-0025 304-422-0414
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 01/24/2019



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM

SOLICITATION NO.: ARFQ DOT1900000045

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.
Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Addendum No. 1 [ Addendum No. 6
[[] Addendum No. 2 [ Addendum No. 7
[] Addendum No. 3 [] Addendum No. 8
[] Addendum No. 4 [] Addendum No. 9
[ Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

[ understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

J.C. Bosley Con/si\uctlon
Companﬁ\ \ B

Authorized Signature™—

May 9,2019

Date

_— \L A \/ ]
\‘Y

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 01/24/2019



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Hauling Truck Lease/Rental WITH Operator

Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other

issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
her contact information below:

Contract Manager: Tessa Bosley-Stull
Telephone Number: 304-422-0025

Fax Number: 304-422-0414

Email Address: tessa@jcbci.com

Revised 10/27/2014



STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a
construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a
political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and
use taxes, fire service fees, or other fines or fees.

ALL CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state
or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related
party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand
dollars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter
eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has
not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the
provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political
subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty
or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including
any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer cefault” means having an outstanding balance or liabilitv to the old fund or to the uninsured employers' fund o~ being
in policy def t, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to mai ‘ain mandatory workers' compensation coverage, or . ure to
fully meet it  bligations as a workers' compensation self-insured e loyer. An employer is not in employer default if it ha:  tered
into a repayiient agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the
repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other
form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through
which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or
control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an
amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on
any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other contracts,
that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related
party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or employer default is permitted under the
exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

J{C. Bosley Construction, Inc.

Authorized Lisa A. Smith Date: May 33,2019
SN Secretary/ Treasurer

State of WV
County of Wood , to-wit:
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this:’ﬂﬂday of May . 202.
My Commission expires _September 1 .20 23

gllllllllllllIIIllllillulllllllllllllllIIIl!lllég;llllllﬂllllllllll! /@g& W
AFFIX SEAL HEREZ /& ‘-% WPghﬂf« State of West Virgin| CET ARY PUBLIC -

£ (&R 9 essa Bosley-Stull s Tessa Bosle tul

£ (s JC Bosiey Construction ing, yAgtull

= - 1 Bosley Ave Purchasin idavit (Revised 01/19/2018)

§ o o 2T WY 25101
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WV-10 State of West Virginia

Approved / Revised

06/08/18 VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Viendor Preference, if applicable.

1. Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

[] Bidderis anindividual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia, or bidder is a partnership, association
or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West
Virginia, for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest
of bidder held by another entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement; or,

[ H

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Elzo

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor that employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, and for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder’s affiliate’s or subsidiary's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the
vendor'’s bid; or,

Ds»

Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

4

Cx]

5. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

[1 Bidderis anindividual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

6. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

[ Bidderis aresident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

y & Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

[] Bidderhas been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

8. Application is made for reciprocal preference.
[x] Bidderis a West Virginia resident and is requesting reciprocal preference to the extent that it applies.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order;
or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to
the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

accurate |n all res ec\ - that if a contract is issued to Bidder

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true a \
uring the term bf the/contract, Bidder will notify the Purchas-

and if anything contained within this certificate chang
ing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: J-C. Bosley Construction, Inc. Signed——AS_ L ——

<
Date: May 3,2019 Title: S€Cretary/Treasurer

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive.



West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts
(Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

Name of Contracting Business Entity: *'C Bosiey Construction, Inc. 5 y4.05. 1 Bosley Ave.
Parkersburg, WV 26101

Name of Authorized Agent: Lisa A. Smith Address: | Bosley Ave., Parkersburg, WV 26101

ARFQ 0803 DOT1900000045

7019EC12 Hauling Truck Lease/Rental with Operator

Contract Number: Contract Description:

Governmental agency awarding contract: WVDOH

O Check here if this is a Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessary).

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract
@ Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
&1 Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract (excluding legal
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

K] Check here if

N

Signature:

list entity/individual names below.

Date Signed: May 3,2019

Notary Verification

State of WV Wood

, County of

I, Lisa A. Smith , the authorized agent of the contracting business
entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this 3r%_%ﬁay , 2019

Kptary Public's Signature

Parkersb: 261 =
Commiss'.uﬂnrgxijﬂt %&J@ﬁ_@ 2018
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To be com ’etedb StateA ency: EIlllllll|lIIllIlllllllllllllllllllllllIll'lI;Ié:;illllllllllIllllll'§
Date Received by State Agency: £ WP‘;‘;‘&% “f_gﬁ'“m'ﬂi z
Date submitted to Ethics Commission: § J C Bosley Consetgucﬁmm §
Governmental agency submitting Disclosure: z 1 Bosley Ave H



S DATE (MMDDAYYYY)
ACORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

10/26/2018

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOE S NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER GONTACT  Kathleen Edman
Intra State Insurance Corporation PHONE o (304) 295-1048 | AR oy (304) 205-3369
Rosemar Road Annnr":‘ss: kathy@intrastateinscorp.com
P.O. Box 5526 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Vienna WV 26105 INSURER A: Travelers Insurance 36161
INSURED INSUREr B: BRICK STREET INSURANCE 12372

J.C. Bosley Construction, Inc. INSURER C :

1 Bosley Avenue INSURER D :

INSURER E :

Parkersburg WV 26101 INSURER F :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: _ CL18102601974 REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

o) TYPE OF INSURANCE ‘il.";’&_ ms . POLICY NUMBER ML (DO YY) LIMITS
><| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE s 1,000,000
| ceamsmaoe [>4] oceur PREMISES (Ea ocurence) | 5 500:000
| | MED EXP {Any one person s 5000
Al ] CO 5614B47A 10/28/2018 | 10/28/2019 | pepsonar s Aovinuury | 1:000,000
| GENL AGGREGATE LIMT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE s 2.000,000
| X povicy B Loc PRODUCTS - coMPIOPAGE | 3 2000,000
OTHER: Employee Benefits $ 1,000,000
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY C:Egh:;;NED! SINALELbAT s 1,000,000
| any auto BODILY INJURY (Per perscn) | §
Al Y icu_r“gg“-m BA 1F453506 10/28/2018 | 10/28/2019 | BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | §
3¢] HiReD NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
| M AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY | (Per accident)
Uninsured Motorist § 1,000,000
| <] umsrELLALIAB | X oocur EACH OCCURRENCE s 5.000,000
A EXCESS LIAB —— CUP 8J32182A 10/28/2018 | 10/28/2019 | \oorecare s 5.000,000
DED ]Xl RreTenTion s 10,000 s
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER )
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY f x| Sve | [& 555560
B |OFHCERMENBER EXCLUDEDY U Ve NIA WCB1021164 06/01/2018 | 06/01/2019 [ EL: EACHACCIDENT $
(Mandatory in NH) EL DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE |5 1.000,000
If yes, describe under
SCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below EL.DISEASE- PoLicY LimT_| 5 1,000,000
) $1,000 Ded $ 50,000
Transportation
A QT-660-1016C565-COF-18 10/28/2018 | 10/28/2019 |$2,500 Ded/Per Convey $ 350,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached If more space is required)

Blanket Additional Insured (Contractors) CG D2 46 08 05 applies to General Liability.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

West Virginia Dept. of Highway ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

1900 Washington Street, East

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Charleston WV 25305 %
|

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2016/03) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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CONTRACTOR LICENSE

Authorized by the

West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board

Number: WV003012

Classification:

ELECTRICAL

GENERAL BUILDING

GENERAL ENGINEERING

HEATING, VENTILATING & COOLING

MULTIFAMILY
PIPING
PLUMBING
RESIDENTIAL
SPECIALTY
J C BOSLEY CONSTRUCTION INC
DBA J C BOSLEY CONSTRUCTION INC
1 BOSLEY AVE
PARKERSBURG, WV 26101
Date Issued Expiration Date
SEPTEMBER 04, 2018 SEPTEMBER 04, 2019

> L
\\ e
Authorized Company Sighature Chair, West Virginia Contractor
Licensing Board
m ARD This license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a conspicuous place at every construction site where work is being

performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all bid submissions and on all fully executed
and binding contracts. This license cannot be assigned or transferred by licensee. Issued under provisions of West

P A A A A A A A A4 Virginia Code, Chapter 21, Article 11.
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WEST VIRGINIA
STATE TAX DEPARTMENT

BUSINESS REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE

ISSUED TO: |
J C BOSLEY CONSTRUCTION INC
1 BOSLEY AVE '
PARKERSBURG, WV 26101-7110

BU_SINESS REGISTRATION ACCOUNT NUMBER: 1040-7204
This certificate is issued on: 08/24/2011 -

This certificate is issued by =~
the West Virginia State Tax Commissioner = -
in accordance with Chapter 11, Article 12, of the West Virginia Code

The person or organization identified on this certificate is registered
to conduct business in the State of West Virginia at the Jocation above.

This certificate is not transferrable and must be displayed at the location for which ls',sfled,

‘This certificate shall be parmanent untll cessation of the business for which the certificate of registration
was granted or until it is suspended, revoked or cancelled by the Tax Commissioner. '

Change in nanie or change of location shall be considered a dessaﬁon of the business and a new
certificate shall be required. '

TRAVELINGISTREET VENDORS: Must carry a copy of this. certificate in every vehicle operated by them.
CONTRACTORS, DRILLING OPERATORS, TIMBER/LOGGING OPERATIONS: Must have a copy of
this certificate displayed at every job site within West Virginia.

atL006 v.4
L1166899456




