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All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 PROJECT PREP SITE WORK / 1.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00
MAINTENANCE BY THE VENDOR
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141003
PROJECT PREP SITE WORK / MAINTENANCE BY THE VENDOR 6619C054

Extended Description :
PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES AND INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORMS

Page: 2



CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing below, or submitting documentation through the West Virginia Vendor Self Service
Portal website, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand the
requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer or
proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product or
service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that product
or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and conditions
contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or
proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit
this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf: that I am
authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge,
the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require registration.

J'/é Thmes L/%’ffé‘n_?‘?zc.faﬁm (o.

(Ful/ Company Name)
ﬁnzed Stgnafure) O/\(—-
4@:5 §). Jlonowr= s I P.

(Print or Type Name and Title

-7 46-8/8/, . 24

(Phone Number)

Fo4-7¢8-8/83

(Fax Number)

/a/ m oxlFt @13 meswhide constieverton- Com
(Email address)

5.2/ -20/9

(Date)

Form pre-approved by DOH legal division on July 12, 2016.
Attorney signature not required.
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO. ARFQ DOT1900000042

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Wdendum No. 1 [] Addendum No. 6
E’}ﬁldendum No. 2 (] Addendum No. 7
[fAddendum No. 3 [] Addendum No. 8
[] Addendum No. 4 (] Addendum No. 9
[] Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

‘ﬂ/é Thmes Wire (on stecerion o,

4]l Company Name

LLr) g
e e =

s-Z/-Zol9

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.
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EXHIBIT AA, INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM
Project Preparation Site work/Maintenance with Labor by the Vendor
Vendor's Storage Sites

DITCHING

VENDOR NAME Mﬂ%m&

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission,

If a Vendor will be sourcing multiple Base of Operations for Ditching service and ALL pricing is the same, ALL

Locations can be listed on one Exhibit AA, Information Attachment Form and one Exhibit A, Pricing Page is
acceptable. If a Vendor will be sourcing multiple Base of Operations, at varying prices, a separate Exhibit AA,
Information Attachment Form and Exhibit A, Pricing Page is required.

Vendor's Base of Operation Location:
f: .
lélggesro ~ LJV.

TBleclk= & M@m&%ﬁ

Vendor's Base of Operation Location:

Vendor's Base of Operation Location:

Vendor's Base of Operation Location:




EXHIBIT BB, INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM
Project Preparation Site work/Maintenance with Labor by the Vendor
Vendor’s Storage Sites

PIPE REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

VENDOR NAME Mﬁ%ﬁm@&m :

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

If a Vendor will be sourcing multiple Base of Operations for Pipe Repair/Replacement service and ALL pricing
is the same, ALL Locations can be listed on one Exhibit BB, Information Attachment Form and one Exhibit A,

Pricing Page is acceptable. If a Vendor will be sourcing multiple Base of Operations, at varying prices, a
separate Exhibit BB, Information Attachment Form and Exhibit A, Pricing Page is required.

Vendor's Base of Operation Location:

L_"/;hcq‘bnfl La i

| Bewle # 4&&&1 och (BUnIT7ES Dn/%v :

Vendor's Base of Operation Location:

Vendor's Base of Operation Location:

Vendor's Base of Operation Location:




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Project Preparation Site Work/Maintenance with Labor by the Vendor

9.2.2 Immediate cancellation of one or more Delivery Orders issued under this
Contract.

9.2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity.

10. MISCELLENOUS:

10.1 No Substitutions: The Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in
response to the Solicitation unless a contract modification is approved in
accordance with the provisions contained in this Contract.

10.2 Vendor Supply: The Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract
Items being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its
bid, the Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid
response.

10.3 Reports: The Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to
the Agency showing the Contract Items purchased, quantities of Contract Items
purchased, and the total dollar value of the Contract Items purchased. The
Vendor shall also provide reports, upon request, showing the Contract Items
purchased during the term of this Contract, the quantity purchased for each of
those Contract Items and the total value of purchases for each of those Contract
Items. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for cancellation of this
Contract.

10.4 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, the Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing the
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. The Vendor should list its Contract manager and
his or her contact information below.

Contract Manager: L.o—u('s 14 A [moN‘Tg

Telephone Number: 504 - £(70- £790
Fax Number: 204 ',74""8 - 8/93
Email Address: _ /AL )oNTE @ FAnpsshif 72 (angruen e -Con)

Revised 10/27/2014



VYV VVVVV VYV VVV VYV VY VV VYV VVYVVYVVVVVVYVVYVYYYVYY

CONTRACTOR LICENSE

Authorized by the

West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board

Number: WV000492

Classification:

GENERAL ENGINEERING

SPECIALTY

ASPHALT

EXCAVATION
THE JAMES WHITE CONSTRUCTION COMPAN
DBA THE JAMES WHITE CONSTRUCTION COMPAN
4156 FREEDOM WAY
WEIRTON, WV 26062-5210

Date Issued Expiration Date
AUGUST 06, 2018 . AUGUST 06, 2019

' Authorized Compan! Signature Chair, West Virginia C’(mtractor
- Licensing Board

BO ARD This license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a conspicuous place at every construction site where work is being
performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all bid submissions and on all fully executed
and binding contracts. This license cannot be assigned or transferred by licensee. Issued under provisions of West

»A A A A A A A A< Virginia Code, Chapter 21, Article 11.




Exhibit A Project Preparation Site Work/Maintenance with Labor by the Vendor
PRICING PAGE

VENDOR NAME: THE JAMES WHITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

District 6 - Brooke County, Hancock County,-Marshal-Ceunty,

Ohio-CountyTyler County-and-Wetzel County
UNIT OF
ITEM NUMBER EXTENDED DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT COST

DITCHING
1-A Ditching shall meet the requirements of Attachment A Shoulder Mile | $ 21,000.00
1-B Correcting Deep Ditches shall meet the requirements of Attachment B Ton $ 110.00
1-C Restoring Shoulders and Shoulder stone shall meet the requirement of Attachment C Ton $ 78.00
1-D Shoulder Stone Placement shall meet the requirements of Attachment D Ton $ 85.00
2-A Ditching Haul by Vendor for ltem 1-B, 1-C and 1-D, First Ton Mile Ton Mile $ 6.00
2-B Ditching Haul by Vendor for Item 1-B, 1-C and 1-D, Each Additional Mile Ton Mile $ 0.40
3-A Ditching Waste Haul by Vendor per truck/driver Hour $  100.00
4-A Ditching Daytime Mobilization
4-A1 Ditching Daytime Mobilization - Brooke County Lump Sum |$ 2,400.00
4-A2 Ditching Daytime Mobilization - Hancock County Lump Sum |$ 2,900.00
4-A3 Ditching Daytime Mobilization - Marshall County Lump Sum NO BID
4-Ad Ditching Daytime Mobilization - Ohio County Lump Sum NO BID
4-A5 Ditching Daytime Mobilization - Tyler County Lump Sum NO BID
4-A6 Ditching Daytime Mobilization - Wetzel County Lump Sum NO BID
4-B Ditching Nighttime Mobilization
4-B1 Ditching Nighttime Mobilization - Brooke County Lump Sum |$ 3,300.00
4-B2 Ditching Nighttime Mobilization - Hancock County Lump Sum |$ 4,200.00
4-B3 Ditching Nighttime Mobilization - Marshall County Lump Sum NO BID
4-B4 Ditching Nighttime Mobilization - Ohio County Lump Sum NO BID
4-B5 Ditching Nighttime Mobilization - Tyler County Lump Sum NO BID
4-B6 Ditching Nighttime Mobilization - Wetzel County Lump Sum NO BID
5-A Ditching On-Site Mobilization Hourly $  250.00
6-A Ditching Maintaining Traffic Pilot Truck and Driver DAY $ 1,050.00
6-B Ditching Maintaining Traffic Traffic Control Devices UNIT $ 1.15
6-C Ditching Maintaining Traffic Flagger HOUR $ 0.79
6-D Ditching Maintaining Traffic Arrow Board DAY $ 30.00

PIPE REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

Pipe Repair/Replacement shall meet the requirements of Attachment E

per the following range tiers:
7-A 15" Type F Trench Linear Foot | $ 78.00
7-B 18" Type F Trench Linear Foot | $ 78.00
7-C 24" Type F Trench Linear Foot | $ 81.00
7-D 30" Type F Trench Linear Foot | $ 81.00
7-E 36" Type F Trench Linear Foot |$ 86.00
7-F 42" Type F Trench Linear Foot |$  102.00
7-G 48" Type F Trench Linear Foot |$  110.00
7-H 54" Type F Trench Linear Foot |$  115.00
7-1 60" Type F Trench Linear Foot |$  125.00
8-A Pipe Repair/Replacement backfill for F Trench CubicYard [$  200.00
9-A Safe Access and Egress Surchage depth of 5-foot to 10-foot Lump Sum |$ 1,500.00
9-B Safe Access and Egress Surchage depth of greater than 10-foot not to exceed 15-foot LumpSum [ $ 2,500.00
9-C Safe Access and Egress Surchage depth of greater than 15-foot not to exceed 20-foot LumpSum | $ 4,500.00
10-A Pipe Repair/Replacement Waste Haul by Vendor per truck/driver Hour $  100.00
11-A Pipe Repair/Replacement Daytime Mobilization $ 2,600.00
11-Al Pipe Repair/Replacement Daytime Mobilization - Brooke County Lump Sum |$ 3,200.00
11-A2 Pipe Repair/Replacement Daytime Mobilization - Hancock County Lump Sum |$ 3,600.00
11-A3 Pipe Repair/Replacement Daytime Mobilization - Marshall County Lump Sum NO BID




Exhibit A Project Preparation Site Work/Maintenance with Labor by the Vendor

PRICING PAGE

VENDOR NAME: THE JAMES WHITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

District 6 - Brooke County, Hancock County,-Marshal-Ceunty,

Ohio-CountyTyler County-and-Wetzel County
UNIT OF
ITEM NUMBER EXTENDED DESCRIPTION MEASURE [ UNIT COST

11-A4 Pipe Repair/Replacement Daytime Mobilization - Ohio County Lump Sum NO BID
11-A5 Pipe Repair/Replacement Daytime Mobilization - Tyler County Lump Sum NO BID
11-A6 Pipe Repair/Replacement Daytime Mobilization - Wetzel County Lump Sum NO BID
11-B Pipe Repair/Replacement Nighttime Mobilization
11-B1 Pipe Repair/Replacement Nighttime Mobilization - Brooke County Lump Sum |$ 3,600.00
11-B2 Pipe Repair/Replacement Nighttime Mobilization - Hancock County Lump Sum |$ 4,300.00
11-B3 Pipe Repair/Replacement Nighttime Mobilization - Marshall County Lump Sum NO BID
11-B4 Pipe Repair/Replacement Nighttime Mobilization - Ohio County Lump Sum NO BID
11-B5 Pipe Repair/Replacement Nighttime Mobilization - Tyler County Lump Sum NO BID
11-B6 Pipe Repair/Replacement Nighttime Mobilization - Wetzel County Lump Sum NO BID
12-A Pipe Repair/Replacement On-Site Mobilization Hourly $  850.00
13-A Pipe Repair/Replacement Maintaining Traffic Pilot Truck and Driver DAY $ 1,050.00
13-B Pipe Repair/Replacement Maintaining Traffic Traffic Control Devices UNIT $ 1.15
13-C Pipe Repair/Replacement Maintaining Traffic Flagger HOUR $ 79.00
13-D Pipe Repair/Replacement Maintaining Traffic Arrow Board DAY $ 30.00

ASPHALT PAVEMENT REPAIR
14-A Pot Hole Repair shall meet the requirements of Attachment F
14-A1 Pot Hole Repair 0 to 50 square yards, per mile Unit NO BID
14-A2 Pot Hole Repair 51 to 250 square yards, per mile Unit NO BID
14-A3 Pot Hole Repair 251 to 500 square yards, per mile Unit NO BID
14-A4 Pot Hole Repair greater than 501 square yards, per mile Unit NO BID
14-B Base Failure Repair shall meet the requirements of Attachment G
14-B1 Base Failure Repair 0 to 50 square yards, per mile, asphalt Unit NO BID
14-B2 Base Failure Repair 51 to 250 square yards, per mile, asphalt Unit NO BID
14-B3 Base Failure Repair 251 to 500 square yards, per mile, asphalt Unit NO BID
14-B4 Base Failure Repair greater than 501 square yards, per mile, asphalt Unit NO BID
14-B5 Base Failure Repair 0 to 50 square yards, stone Square Yard NO BID
14-B6 Base Failure Repair 51 to 250 square yards, stone Square Yard NO BID
14-B7 Base Failure Repair 251 to 500 square yards, stone Square Yard NO BID
14-B8 Base Failure Repair greater than 501 square yards, stone Square Yard NO BID
14-C Edge Failure Repair shall meet the requirements of Attachment H
14-C1 Edge Failure Repair 0 to 50 square yards, per mile Unit NO BID
14-C2 Edge Failure Repair 51 to 250 square yards, per mile Unit NO BID
14-C3 Edge Failure Repair 251 to 500 square yards, per mile Unit NO BID
14-C4 Edge Failure Repair greater than 501 square yards, per mile Unit NO BID
15-A Asphalt Pavement Repair Haul by Vendor First Ton Mile Ton Mile NO BID
15-B Asphalt Pavement Repair Haul by Vendor Each Additional Mile Ton Mile NO BID
16-A Asphalt Pavement Repair Waste Haul by Vendor per truck/driver Hour NO BID
17-A Asphalt Pavement Repair Daytime Mobilization
17-Al Asphalt Pavement Repair Daytime Mobilization - Brooke County Lump Sum NO BID
17-A2 Asphalt Pavement Repair Daytime Mobilization - Hancock County Lump Sum NO BID
17-A3 Asphalt Pavement Repair Daytime Mobilization - Marshall County Lump Sum NO BID
17-A4 Asphalt Pavement Repair Daytime Mobilization - Ohio County Lump Sum NO BID
17-A5 Asphalt Pavement Repair Daytime Mobilization - Tyler County Lump Sum NO BID
17-A6 Asphalt Pavement Repair Daytime Mobilization - Wetzel County Lump Sum NO BID
17-B Asphalt Pavement Repair Nighttime Mobilization
17-B1 Asphalt Pavement Repair Nighttime Mobilization - Brooke County Lump Sum NO BID
17-B2 Asphalt Pavement Repair Nighttime Mobilization - Hancock County Lump Sum NO BID




Exhibit A Project Preparation Site Work/Maintenance with Labor by the Vendor
PRICING PAGE

VENDOR NAME: THE JAMES WHITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

District 6 - Brooke County, Hancock County,-Marshal-Ceunty,

Ohio-CountyTyler County-and-Wetzel County
UNIT OF
ITEM NUMBER EXTENDED DESCRIPTION MEASURE [ UNIT COST

17-B3 Asphalt Pavement Repair Nighttime Mobilization - Marshall County Lump Sum NO BID
17-B4 Asphalt Pavement Repair Nighttime Mobilization - Ohio County Lump Sum NO BID
17-B5 Asphalt Pavement Repair Nighttime Mobilization - Tyler County Lump Sum NO BID
17-B6 Asphalt Pavement Repair Nighttime Mobilization - Wetzel County Lump Sum NO BID
18-A Asphalt Pavement Repair On-Site Mobilization Hourly NO BID
19-A Asphalt Pavement Repair Maintaining Traffic Pilot Truck and Driver DAY NO BID
19-B Asphalt Pavement Repair Maintaining Traffic Traffic Control Devices UNIT NO BID
19-C Asphalt Pavement Repair Maintaining Traffic Flagger HOUR NO BID
19-D Asphalt Pavement Repair Maintaining Traffic Arrow Board DAY NO BID
20-A Asphalt Pavement Repair Off-Season Plant Opening First Day DAY NO BID
20-B Asphalt Pavement Repair Off-Season Plant Opening Each Additional Day DAY NO BID




