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Proc Folder :

Solicitation Description :

Proc Type :

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

Solicitation Response

Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East

Charleston, WV 25305-0130
Post Office Box 50130

State of West Virginia

677072

ADDENDUM #1

Agency Master Agreement

2020-01-30

13:30:00

SR 0803 ESR01222000000004297 1

 VENDOR

000000192590

C WILLIAM HETZER INC

Comments:

Total Bid : Response Date: Response Time:Total Bid : 

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2000000031

$0.00 2020-01-30 12:17:40

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Signature on File FEIN # DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001

Tina L Lewis

(304) 558-9398
tina.l.lewis@wv.gov
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 Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

Extended Description :

1 ASPHALT - MATERIALS, DELIVERY
AND LAYDOWN BY THE VENDOR

0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00

30121601

ASPHALT - MATERIALS, DELIVERY AND LAYDOWN BY THE VENDOR PER THE ATTACHED PRICING
PAGES/E-CATALOG AND INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM













C. William Hetzer, Inc. 

Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan Raleigh Upshur
X Berkeley Fayette Jackson Mason Nicholas Randolph Wayne

Boone Gilmer X Jefferson McDowell Ohio Ritchie Webster
Braxton Grant Kanawha Mercer Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke Greenbrier Lewis Mineral Pleasants Summers Wirt
Cabell Hampshire Lincoln Mingo Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston Tucker Wyoming
Clay Hardy Marion Monroe Putnam Tyler

Item # Commodity Code

A 3012601 Asphalt
B 3012601 Asphalt
C 3012601 Asphalt
D 3012601 Asphalt
E 3012601 Asphalt
F 3012601 Asphalt
G 3012601 Asphalt
H 3012601 Asphalt
I 3012601 Asphalt
J 3012601 Asphalt
K 3012601 Asphalt
L 3012601 Asphalt
M 3012601 Asphalt
N 3012601 Asphalt
O 3012601 Asphalt
P 3012601 Asphalt
PZ 3012601 Asphalt
PE 3012601 Asphalt
PG 3012601 Asphalt MILE
PH 3012601 Asphalt MILE
Q 3012601 Asphalt TON
R 3012601 Asphalt TON
S1 3012601 Asphalt MILE
S2 3012601 Asphalt MILE
T1 3012601 Asphalt TON
T2 3012601 Asphalt TON
T3 3012601 Asphalt TON
T4 3012601 Asphalt TON
U1 3012601 Asphalt SY
U2 3012601 Asphalt SY
U3 3012601 Asphalt SY
U4 3012601 Asphalt SY
V1 3012601 Asphalt TON
V2 3012601 Asphalt TON
V3 3012601 Asphalt TON
V4 3012601 Asphalt TON
W1 3012601 Asphalt TON
W2 3012601 Asphalt TON
W3 3012601 Asphalt TON
W4 3012601 Asphalt TON
X 3012601 Asphalt GL
Y 3012601 Asphalt LF
Z 3012601 Asphalt TON
AB1 3012601 Asphalt SY
AB2 3012601 Asphalt SY
AB3 3012601 Asphalt SY
AB4 3012601 Asphalt SY
AB5 3012601 Asphalt SY
AB6 3012601 Asphalt SY
AC 3012601 Asphalt TON
AF 3012601 Asphalt TON
AG 3012601 Asphalt GL
AH 3012601 Asphalt TON
AI 3012601 Asphalt TON
AJ1 3012601 Asphalt SY
AJ2 3012601 Asphalt SY
AJ3 3012601 Asphalt SY
AJ4 3012601 Asphalt SY
AJ5 3012601 Asphalt SY
AJ6 3012601 Asphalt SY
AL 3012601 Asphalt LF
AM 3012601 Asphalt TON
AN 3012601 Asphalt SY
AO1 3012601 Asphalt DAY
AO2 3012601 Asphalt UNIT
AO3 3012601 Asphalt HOUR
AO4 3012601 Asphalt DAY
AQ1 3012601 Asphalt DAY
AQ2 3012601 Asphalt DAY

 Fine Milling of Asphalt Pavement Surfaces - 251 to 500 Sq Yards
Fine Milling of Asphalt Pavement Surfaces - 501 to 1000 Sq Yards

 Pavement Profiling (Milling) - 2501 to 5000 Square Yards 

 Pavement Repair - Asphalt Base II

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

 Non Tracking Tack - to be used with AF

 Skip Paving Surcharge
 Pavement Profiling (Milling) - 0 to 250 Square Yards
 Pavement Profiling (Milling) - 251 to 500 Square Yards
 Pavement Profiling (Milling) - 501 to 1000 Square Yards 
 Pavement Profiling (Milling) - 1001 to 2500 Square Yards 

 Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons
 Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons
 Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater
 Asphalt Material for Tack Coat or Prime Material
 Additional Heel-In Joints

 Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater

ATTACHMENT A  - PRICING PAGES      Asphalt Materials Delivery & Laydown by Vendor by Location per County

For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the Pricing on this page. 

Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placem't - Each Additional Mile
Surcharge for PG Binder - 70 minus 22

Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placem't First Ton Mile

Extended Description

 Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons
 Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons
 Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons

LayDown of Materials.Items A-P, PZ and AI, Each Site 201 to 500 Tons
LayDown of Materials.Items A-P, PZ and AI, Each Site 501 Tons or greater
 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 0 to 1000 Square Yards

 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 3001 Square Yards or Greater
 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 2001 to 3000 Square Yards
 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 1001 to 2000 Square Yards

 Asphalt Section 401 - Base I
 Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave
 Asphalt Section 401 - Base II
 Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level
 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV
 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV
 Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave
 Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course
 Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave
 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1
 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1
 Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave
 Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave
 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III
 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III
 Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave
 Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave
Shoulder Stone Placement for Asphalt Section 307 - Class 10

 Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons

Surcharge for PG Binder 76 minus 22 ordered in 400 ton increrments
 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - First Ton Mile
 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - Each Additional Mile
LayDown of Materials.Items A-P, PZ and AI, Each Site 0 to 100 Tons
LayDown of Materials.Items A-P, PZ and AI, Each Site 101 to 200 Tons

 Pavement Profiling (Milling) - 5001 Square Yards or Greater 

 Asphalt HPTO - SP496 - PG 64E-22 ordered 300 TN increments

 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day
 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

 Cleaning and Sweeping
 Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver
 Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices
 Maintaining Traffic - Flagger
 Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board

Fine Milling of Asphalt Pavement Surfaces 1001 to 2500 SqYards
Fine Milling of Asphalt Pavement Surfaces 2501 to 5000 SqYards
 Fine Milling of Asphalt Pavement Surfaces - 5001 SY or Greater
 Milled Rumble Strips
 Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving - Items A thru PZ

 Lay Down of Materials - to be used with AF - 300 TN or Greater
 Ultra-Thin Asphalt Overlay - SP498
 Fine Milling of Asphalt Pavement Surfaces - 0 to 250 Sq Yards

1Total Number of Attachment A pages submitted by Vendor is:

List Price

 $           46.50 
 $           50.50 
 $           52.50 
 $           52.50 
 $           52.50 
 $           55.50 
 $           52.50 
 $           59.50 
 $           63.00 
 $           59.50 
 $           63.00 
 $           68.00 
 $           71.50 
 $           68.00 
 $           71.50 
 $           58.00 
 $           61.50 
 $           25.00 
 $             3.00 
 $             0.25 
 $             3.00 
 $             9.00 
 $             3.00 
 $             0.25 
 $           40.00 
 $           22.00 
 $           12.00 
 $             6.50 
 $             5.00 
 $             4.00 
 $             3.00 
 $             2.00 
 $             8.00 
 $             4.00 
 $             2.50 
 $             1.50 
 $             8.00 
 $             4.00 
 $             2.50 
 $             1.50 
 $             2.50 
 $           15.00 
 $             3.00 
 $           30.00 
 $           20.00 
 $           10.00 
 $             4.00 
 $             2.00 
 $             1.25 
 $         225.00 

 no bid 
 no bid 
 no bid 
 no bid 

 $           30.00 
 $           20.00 
 $           10.00 
 $             4.00 
 $             2.00 
 $             1.25 
 $             2.50 
 $           10.00 
 $             0.25 
 $         500.00 
 $             1.25 
 $           35.00 
 $           25.00 
 $      4,000.00 
 $      1,000.00 

Unit of Measure

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON

TON

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

Vendor name shall be entered here by the Vendor:

Vendor shall provide the Plant Information on Corresponding Attachment B1 Asphalt/ Attachment B2 Stone forms which Shall accompany Pricing Pages with bid.
 If Vendor has Varied pricing per county, Vendor Shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each Pricing per County set.   

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.
C. William Hetzer, Inc.

Supplier Name - Vendor's Sourced Plant



County Unit of 
Measure

Item AA -  Pavement 
Profiling 

Item AK - Milled 
Rumble Strips

Item PF - Shoulder 
Stone 

Item AP1  -  DAYTIME 
Paving

Item AP2 - 
NIGHTTIME Paving

Delivery 
Days

Barbour LUMP SUM 7
Berkeley LUMP SUM  $            1,600.00  $            3,000.00  $            1,600.00  $            1,600.00  $            2,000.00 7

Boone LUMP SUM 7
Braxton LUMP SUM 7
Brooke LUMP SUM 7
Cabell LUMP SUM 7

Calhoun LUMP SUM 7
Clay LUMP SUM 7

Doddridge LUMP SUM 7
Fayette LUMP SUM 7
Gilmer LUMP SUM 7
Grant LUMP SUM 7

Greenbrier LUMP SUM 7
Hampshire LUMP SUM 7

Hancock LUMP SUM 7
Hardy LUMP SUM 7

Harrison LUMP SUM 7
Jackson LUMP SUM 7

Jefferson LUMP SUM  $            1,600.00  $            3,000.00  $            1,600.00  $            1,600.00  $            2,000.00 7
Kanawha LUMP SUM 7

Lewis LUMP SUM 7
Lincoln LUMP SUM 7
Logan LUMP SUM 7
Marion LUMP SUM 7

Marshall LUMP SUM 7
Mason LUMP SUM 7

McDowell LUMP SUM 7
Mercer LUMP SUM 7
Mineral LUMP SUM 7
Mingo LUMP SUM 7

Monongalia LUMP SUM 7
Monroe LUMP SUM 7
Morgan LUMP SUM  $            1,600.00  $            3,000.00  $            1,600.00  $            1,600.00  $            2,000.00 7

Nicholas LUMP SUM 7
Ohio LUMP SUM 7

Pendleton LUMP SUM 7
Pleasants LUMP SUM 7

Pocahontas LUMP SUM 7
Preston LUMP SUM 7
Putnam LUMP SUM 7
Raleigh LUMP SUM 7

Randolph LUMP SUM 7
Ritchie LUMP SUM 7
Roane LUMP SUM 7

Summers LUMP SUM 7
Taylor LUMP SUM 7
Tucker LUMP SUM 7

Tyler LUMP SUM 7
Upshur LUMP SUM 7
Wayne LUMP SUM 7

Webster LUMP SUM 7
Wetzel LUMP SUM 7

Wirt LUMP SUM 7
Wood LUMP SUM 7

Wyoming LUMP SUM 7

ATTENTION: Enter your Vendor Name for above Pricing:

Vendor Shall enter below the Mobilization Item Pricing from Vendor's Sourced Plant Locations on  ATTACHMENT B1 Asphalt, ATTACHMENT B2 Stone

ATTACHMENT AA - MOBILIZATION PRICING PAGES - Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor by Vendor by Location 

C. William Hetzer, Inc.

MOBILIZATION PRICING



VENDOR NAME  C. William Hetzer, Inc.

For LAYDOWN, If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple Asphalt Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL Plant
Locations can be listed on one Information Attachment B1 form and one bid submission is acceptable.  If a vendor will be supplying 
LAYDOWN materials from multiple Plant Locations, at varying prices, additional , separate bid sumbissions must be submittted 
 for each Plant Location bid.  Plant Locations shall correspone with Prcing Pages submitted.

Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
This plant Shall be sourced by the Vendor to serve the following counties and correspond with Counties marked on Pricing Pages:

County names:

Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
This plant Shall be sourced by the Vendor to serve the following counties and correspond with Counties marked on Pricing Pages:

County names:

Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
This plant Shall be sourced by the Vendor to serve the following counties and correspond with Counties marked on Pricing Pages:

County names:

Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
This plant Shall be sourced by the Vendor to serve the following counties and correspond with Counties marked on Pricing Pages:

County names:

Plant Name & 
Location 

Plant Name & 
Location 

Plant Name & 
Location 

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

Berkeley, Jefferson, Morgan

C. William Hetzer, Inc.
10104 Mapleville Rd

Plant Name & 
Location 

Hagerstown, MD  21740

ATTACHMENT B1 ASPHALT - Asphalt Plant Location Information 
Plant information on this form is for Vendor’s sourced Asphalt Storage Sites associated with LAYDOWN only

Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor by Vendor by County



ASPHALT Plant locations for  Asphalt LAYDOWN



VENDOR NAME C. William Hetzer, Inc.

For LAYDOWN, If a Vendor will be supplying materials from multiple STONE Plant Locations and ALL pricing is the same, ALL
Plant Locations can be listed on one Attachment B2 form and one bid submission is acceptable.  If a vendor will be supplying 
Stone materials from multiple Plant Locations, at varying prices, additional , separate bid sumbissions must be submittted 
 per each Plant Location bid.  Plant Locations shall corrrespond with Pricing Pages submitted.

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
This plant Shall be sourced by the Vendor to serve the following counties and correspond with Counties marked on Pricing Pages:
County names:

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
This plant Shall be sourced by the Vendor to serve the following counties and correspond with Counties marked on Pricing Pages:
County names:

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
This plant Shall be sourced by the Vendor to serve the following counties and correspond with Counties marked on Pricing Pages:
County names:

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
This plant Shall be sourced by the Vendor to serve the following counties and correspond with Counties marked on Pricing Pages:
County names:

Boonsboro, MD  21713

Martin Marietta - Pinesburg Quarry
14932 Bottom Rd
Williamsport, MD  21795

Berkeley, Jefferson, Morgan

Plant Name & 
Location 

Plant Name & 
Location 

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

Berkeley, Jefferson, Morgan

Plant Name & 
Location 

Plant Name & 
Location 

Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor by Vendor by County

ATTACHMENT B2 STONE  Stone Plant Location Information 
Plant information on this form is for Vendor’s sourced Stone Storage Sites associated with Asphalt LAYDOWN only

Martin Marietta - Boonsboro Quarry
20301 Benevola Church Rd



SHOULDER STONE plant locations associated with Asphalt Laydown


