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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 794754

Solicitation Description: Addendum #1
Tree and Arborist Services by Vendor - Statewid

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2020-12-07 14:30 SR 0803 ESR12072000000004020 1

VENDOR

000000198677
PITTMANS TREE & LANDSCAPING IN

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2100000019

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2020-12-07 Response Time: 11:22:10

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Tina L Lewis
304-414-6859
tina.l.lewis@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Tree trimming services 0.00000 HOUR 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
70111503    

Commodity Line Comments: See attachment for individual line item pricing by county.

Extended Description:

Tree trimming services



BARBOUR BERKELEY BOONE BRAXTON BROOKE CABELL CALHOUN CLAY DODDRIDGE
ITEM

 # DESCRIPTION
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Work Crew

1 Crew Supervisor (minimum of 1 per job site) Hour                175.00                125.00                175.00                    175.00                175.00                175.00                175.00                175.00                    175.00 

2 Laborer / Equipment Operator (minimum of 3 per job site) Hour                125.00                  85.00                125.00                    125.00                125.00                125.00                125.00                125.00                    125.00 

Bucket Trucks / Aerial Life Equipmement
3 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 1 Hour                115.00                  55.00                115.00                    115.00                115.00                115.00                115.00                115.00                    115.00 

4 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 2 Hour                125.00                  75.00                125.00                    125.00                125.00                125.00                125.00                125.00                    125.00 

Tree and Brush Shearing Equipment
5 Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear or Saw Hour                450.00                400.00                450.00                    450.00                450.00                450.00                450.00                450.00                    450.00 

6 Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw Hour                700.00                125.00                700.00                    700.00                700.00                700.00                700.00                700.00                    700.00 

Mulching and Chipping Equipment
7 Mulching Mower Hour                  85.00                  45.00                  85.00                      85.00                  85.00                  85.00                  85.00                  85.00                      85.00 

8 Brush/Log Chipper Type 1 Hour                  50.00                  35.00                  50.00                      50.00                  50.00                  50.00                  50.00                  50.00                      50.00 

9 Brush/Log Chipper Type 2 Hour                  50.00                  35.00                  50.00                      50.00                  50.00                  50.00                  50.00                  50.00                      50.00 

10 Track Chipper Hour  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Mobilization
11 Mobilization Per Site           10,000.00             2,000.00           10,000.00               10,000.00           10,000.00           10,000.00           10,000.00           10,000.00               10,000.00 

TREE AND ARBORIST SERVICES BY VENDOR

ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) - PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Vendor Name:Pittman's Tree & Landscaping, Inc.



FAYETTE GILMER GRANT GREENBRIER HAMPSHIRE HANCOCK HARDY HARRISON JACKSON
ITEM

 # DESCRIPTION
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Work Crew

1 Crew Supervisor (minimum of 1 per job site) Hour                175.00                175.00                175.00                    175.00                125.00                175.00                125.00                175.00                    175.00 

2 Laborer / Equipment Operator (minimum of 3 per job site) Hour                125.00                125.00                125.00                    125.00                  85.00                125.00                  85.00                125.00                    125.00 

Bucket Trucks / Aerial Life Equipmement
3 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 1 Hour                115.00                115.00                115.00                    115.00                  55.00                115.00                  55.00                115.00                    115.00 

4 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 2 Hour                125.00                125.00                125.00                    125.00                  75.00                125.00                  75.00                125.00                    125.00 

Tree and Brush Shearing Equipment
5 Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear or Saw Hour                450.00                450.00                450.00                    450.00                400.00                450.00                400.00                450.00                    450.00 

6 Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw Hour                700.00                700.00                700.00                    700.00                125.00                700.00                125.00                700.00                    700.00 

Mulching and Chipping Equipment
7 Mulching Mower Hour                  85.00                  85.00                  85.00                      85.00                  45.00                  85.00                  45.00                  85.00                      85.00 

8 Brush/Log Chipper Type 1 Hour                  50.00                  50.00                  50.00                      50.00                  35.00                  50.00                  35.00                  50.00                      50.00 

9 Brush/Log Chipper Type 2 Hour                  50.00                  50.00                  50.00                      50.00                  35.00                  50.00                  35.00                  50.00                      50.00 

10 Track Chipper Hour  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Mobilization
11 Mobilization Per Site           10,000.00           10,000.00           10,000.00               10,000.00             2,000.00           10,000.00             2,000.00           10,000.00               10,000.00 

TREE AND ARBORIST SERVICES BY VENDOR

ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) - PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Vendor Name:Pittman's Tree & Landscaping, Inc.



JEFFERSON KANAWHA LEWIS LINCOLN LOGAN McDOWELL MARION MARSHALL MASON MERCER

ITEM
 # EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

UNIT OF 
MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

UNIT 
COST UNIT COST

Work Crew
1 Crew Supervisor (minimum of 1 per job site) Hour                 125.00               175.00            175.00            175.00            175.00                175.00        175.00                175.00       175.00         175.00 

2
Laborer / Equipment Operator (minimum of 3 per job 
site) Hour                   85.00               125.00            125.00            125.00            125.00                125.00        125.00                125.00       125.00         125.00 

Bucket Trucks / Aerial Life Equipmement
3 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 1 Hour                   55.00               115.00            115.00            115.00            115.00                115.00        115.00                115.00       115.00         115.00 

4 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 2 Hour                   75.00               125.00            125.00            125.00            125.00                125.00        125.00                125.00       125.00         125.00 

Tree and Brush Shearing Equipment
5 Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear or Saw Hour                 400.00               450.00            450.00            450.00            450.00                450.00        450.00                450.00       450.00         450.00 

6 Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw Hour                 125.00               700.00            700.00            700.00            700.00                700.00        700.00                700.00       700.00         700.00 

Mulching and Chipping Equipment
7 Mulching Mower Hour                   45.00                 85.00              85.00              85.00              85.00                  85.00          85.00                  85.00         85.00           85.00 

8 Brush/Log Chipper Type 1 Hour                   35.00                 50.00              50.00              50.00              50.00                  50.00          50.00                  50.00         50.00           50.00 

9 Brush/Log Chipper Type 2 Hour                   35.00                 50.00              50.00              50.00              50.00                  50.00          50.00                  50.00         50.00           50.00 

10 Track Chipper Hour  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Mobilization
11 Mobilization Per Site              2,000.00          10,000.00       10,000.00       10,000.00       10,000.00           10,000.00   10,000.00           10,000.00  10,000.00    10,000.00 

Vendor Name:Pittman's Tree & Landscaping, Inc.

TREE AND ARBORIST SERVICES BY VENDOR

ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) - PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY



MINERAL MINGO MONONGALIA MONROE MORGAN NICHOLAS OHIO PENDLETON PLEASANTS
ITEM

 # EXTENDED DESCRIPTION
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Work Crew

1 Crew Supervisor (minimum of 1 per job site) Hour            175.00            175.00                      175.00            175.00            150.00              175.00            175.00                  150.00                  175.00 

2
Laborer / Equipment Operator (minimum of 3 per job 
site) Hour            125.00            125.00                      125.00            125.00            115.00              125.00            125.00                  115.00                  125.00 

Bucket Trucks / Aerial Life Equipmement
3 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 1 Hour            115.00            115.00                      115.00            115.00              95.00              115.00            115.00                    95.00                  115.00 

4 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 2 Hour            125.00            125.00                      125.00            125.00            105.00              125.00            125.00                  105.00                  125.00 

Tree and Brush Shearing Equipment
5 Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear or Saw Hour            450.00            450.00                      450.00            450.00            475.00              450.00            450.00                  475.00                  450.00 

6 Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw Hour            700.00            700.00                      700.00            700.00            650.00              700.00            700.00                  650.00                  700.00 

Mulching and Chipping Equipment
7 Mulching Mower Hour              85.00              85.00                        85.00              85.00              75.00                85.00              85.00                    75.00                    85.00 

8 Brush/Log Chipper Type 1 Hour              50.00              50.00                        50.00              50.00              45.00                50.00              50.00                    45.00                    50.00 

9 Brush/Log Chipper Type 2 Hour              50.00              50.00                        50.00              50.00              45.00                50.00              50.00                    45.00                    50.00 

10 Track Chipper Hour  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Mobilization
11 Mobilization Per Site       10,000.00       10,000.00                 10,000.00       10,000.00         5,000.00        10,000.00       10,000.00               5,000.00            10,000.00 

TREE AND ARBORIST SERVICES BY VENDOR

ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) - PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Vendor Name:Pittman's Tree & Landscaping, Inc.



POCAHONTAS PRESTON PUTNAM RALEIGH RANDOLPH RITCHIE ROANE SUMMERS TAYLOR
ITEM

 # EXTENDED DESCRIPTION
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Work Crew

1 Crew Supervisor (minimum of 1 per job site) Hour                   150.00            175.00            175.00            175.00               175.00            175.00            175.00             150.00            175.00 

2 Laborer / Equipment Operator (minimum of 3 per job site) Hour                   115.00            125.00            125.00            125.00               125.00            125.00            125.00             115.00            125.00 

Bucket Trucks / Aerial Life Equipmement
3 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 1 Hour                     95.00            115.00            115.00            115.00               115.00            115.00            115.00               95.00            115.00 

4 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 2 Hour                   105.00            125.00            125.00            125.00               125.00            125.00            125.00             105.00            125.00 

Tree and Brush Shearing Equipment
5 Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear or Saw Hour                   475.00            450.00            450.00            450.00               450.00            450.00            450.00             475.00            450.00 

6 Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw Hour                   650.00            700.00            700.00            700.00               700.00            700.00            700.00             650.00            700.00 

Mulching and Chipping Equipment
7 Mulching Mower Hour                     75.00              85.00              85.00              85.00                 85.00              85.00              85.00               75.00              85.00 

8 Brush/Log Chipper Type 1 Hour                     45.00              50.00              50.00              50.00                 50.00              50.00              50.00               45.00              50.00 

9 Brush/Log Chipper Type 2 Hour                     45.00              50.00              50.00              50.00                 50.00              50.00              50.00               45.00              50.00 

10 Track Chipper Hour  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Mobilization
11 Mobilization Per Site                5,000.00       10,000.00       10,000.00       10,000.00          10,000.00       10,000.00       10,000.00          5,000.00       10,000.00 

TREE AND ARBORIST SERVICES BY VENDOR

ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) - PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Vendor Name:Pittman's Tree & Landscaping, Inc.



TUCKER TYLER UPSHUR WAYNE WEBSTER WETZEL WIRT WOOD WYOMING
ITEM

 # EXTENDED DESCRIPTION
UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
Work Crew

1 Crew Supervisor (minimum of 1 per job site) Hour                 150.00                   175.00                         150.00                  175.00               150.00            175.00             175.00             175.00                  150.00 

2 Laborer / Equipment Operator (minimum of 3 per job site) Hour                 115.00                   125.00                         115.00                  125.00               115.00            125.00             125.00             125.00                  115.00 

Bucket Trucks / Aerial Life Equipmement
3 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 1 Hour                   95.00                   115.00                           95.00                  115.00                 95.00            115.00             115.00             115.00                    95.00 

4 Bucket Truck / Aerial Lift Type 2 Hour                 105.00                   125.00                         105.00                  125.00               105.00            125.00             125.00             125.00                  105.00 

Tree and Brush Shearing Equipment
5 Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear or Saw Hour                 475.00                   450.00                         475.00                  450.00               475.00            450.00             450.00             450.00                  475.00 

6 Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw Hour                 650.00                   700.00                         650.00                  700.00               650.00            700.00             700.00             700.00                  650.00 

Mulching and Chipping Equipment
7 Mulching Mower Hour                   75.00                     85.00                           75.00                    85.00                 75.00              85.00               85.00               85.00                    75.00 

8 Brush/Log Chipper Type 1 Hour                   45.00                     50.00                           45.00                    50.00                 45.00              50.00               50.00               50.00                    45.00 

9 Brush/Log Chipper Type 2 Hour                   45.00                     50.00                           45.00                    50.00                 45.00              50.00               50.00               50.00                    45.00 

10 Track Chipper Hour  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Mobilization
11 Mobilization Per Site              5,000.00              10,000.00                      5,000.00             10,000.00            5,000.00       10,000.00        10,000.00        10,000.00               5,000.00 

TREE AND ARBORIST SERVICES BY VENDOR

ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) - PRICING PAGE BY COUNTY

Vendor Name:Pittman's Tree & Landscaping, Inc.
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