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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 827738

Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM# 1
READY MIXED PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE & CLSM

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2021-02-17 14:30 SR 0803 ESR02162100000005529 1

VENDOR

000000200683
CENTRAL SUPPLY CO OF WV

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2100000028

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2021-02-16 Response Time: 12:48:54

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Tina L Lewis
304-414-6859
tina.l.lewis@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation



Date Printed: Feb 22, 2021 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 6619C034-READY MIXED PORTLAND 

CEMENT CONCRETE AND CLS
0.00000 EA 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:

READY MIXED PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE AND CLS MATERIAL PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES



































































































      Vendor Name:
UPSHUR WAYNE WEBSTER WETZEL WIRT WOOD WYOMING

Item 
Num EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

Proposed "Equal" Name and 
Part Number

Pay 
Unit UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      370.75  NO BID      406.75      364.75      364.75      364.75      372.75 
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      305.75  NO BID      341.75      299.75      299.75      299.75      307.75 
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      240.75  NO BID      276.75      234.75      234.75      234.75      242.75 
4 Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      175.75  NO BID      211.75      169.75      169.75      169.75      177.75 
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      358.75  NO BID      415.75      352.75      350.75      350.75      352.75 
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      293.75  NO BID      350.75      287.75      285.75      285.75      287.75 
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      228.75  NO BID      285.75      222.75      220.75      220.75      222.75 
8 Class B Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      163.75  NO BID      220.75      157.75      155.75      155.75      157.75 
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      353.75  NO BID      410.75      347.75      345.75      345.75  NO BID 
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      288.75  NO BID      345.75      282.75      280.75      280.75  NO BID 
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      223.75  NO BID      280.75      217.75      215.75      215.75  NO BID 
12 Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      158.75  NO BID      215.75      152.75      150.75      150.75  NO BID 
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      348.75  NO BID      405.75      342.75      340.75      340.75  NO BID 
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      283.75  NO BID      340.75      277.75      275.75      275.75  NO BID 
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      218.75  NO BID      275.75      212.75      210.75      210.75  NO BID 
16 Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      153.75  NO BID      210.75      147.75      145.75      145.75  NO BID 
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      484.75  NO BID      540.75      490.75      472.75      472.75      499.75 
18 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      419.75  NO BID      475.75      425.75      407.75      407.75      434.75 
19 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      354.75  NO BID      410.75      360.75      342.75      342.75      369.75 
20 Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      289.75  NO BID      345.75      295.75      277.75      277.75      304.75 
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      367.75  NO BID      425.75      360.75      359.75      359.75      372.75 
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      302.75  NO BID      360.75      295.75      294.75      294.75      307.75 
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      237.75  NO BID      295.75      230.75      229.75      229.75      242.75 
24 Class K Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      172.75  NO BID      230.75      165.75      164.75      164.75      177.75 
25 Mod ClassK Concrete 2-2.99CY CY      454.75  NO BID      499.75      441.75      422.75      422.75      388.75 
26 Mod ClassK Concrete 3-3.99CY CY      389.75  NO BID      434.75      376.75      357.75      357.75      323.75 
27 Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.99CY CY      324.75  NO BID      369.75      311.75      292.75      292.75      258.75 
28 Mod.ClassK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY      259.75  NO BID      304.75      246.75      227.75      227.75      193.75 
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
32 CLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY      344.75  NO BID      374.75      326.75      321.75      321.75      332.75 
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 CY CY      279.75  NO BID      309.75      261.75      256.75      256.75      267.75 
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY      214.75  NO BID      244.75      196.75      191.75      191.75      202.75 
36 CLSM Type B 5 CY & OVR CY      149.75  NO BID      179.75      131.75      126.75      126.75      137.75 
37 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY      353.75  NO BID      410.75      348.75      344.75      344.75      356.75 
38 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 CY CY      288.75  NO BID      345.75      283.75      279.75      279.75      291.75 
39 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY      223.75  NO BID      280.75      218.75      214.75      214.75      226.75 
40 CLSM Type C 5 CY & OVR CY      158.75  NO BID      215.75      153.75      149.75      149.75      161.75 
41 Option A CY over 5 miles CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
42 Option B TL over 5 miles TRKL          8.00  NO BID        10.00          9.00          8.00          8.00          7.00 
43 Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID          7.00 

44 Chg increased cement  CY CY 15.00      NO BID 15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      
45 Water-reducing set retarder CY CY 9.45        NO BID 9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        
46 Water reducer CY CY 6.85        NO BID 6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        
47 Calcium chloride  OZ OZ 3.70/CY NO BID 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY
48 Non-calcium chloride per OZ OZ 8.00/CY NO BID 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY
49 Super plasticizer CY OZ 7.50/CY NO BID 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY
50 Fiber per CY CY 7.00        NO BID 7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        
51 Heated Concrete CY CY 7.50        NO BID 7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        
52 Ice per Pound LB 0.85        NO BID 0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        
53 Cement trnsptd Vendor CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 Cement trnsptd by DOH CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 Penalty Chg per Truck Minute TRKM 2.50        NO BID 2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        

BUCKHANNON 
PLANT - 
BUCKHANNON  
ELKINS PLANT - 
ELKINS

SUMMERSVILL
E PLANT - 

SUMMERSVILL
E GASSAWAY 

PLANT - 
GASSAWAY  

BUCKHANNON 
PLANT - 

BUCKHANNON

WESTOVER 
PLANT - 
WESTOVER 
SALTWELL 
PLANT - 
SALTWELL

PENNSBORO 
PLANT - 
PENNSBORO

PENNSBORO 
PLANT - 
PENNSBORO

PRINCETON 
PLANT - 
PRINCETON  
MABSCOTT 
PLANT - 
MABSCOTT

NOTE:  Items 1 thru 40 shall include delivery within five (5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

  VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY:                                        
(Additional details shall be provided by the Vendor on 

corresponding Attachment B Information Form

 WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE Central Supply Company of WV



      Vendor Name:
BARBOUR BERKELEY BOONE BRAXTON BROOKE CABELL CALHOUN CLAY

Item 
Num EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

Proposed "Equal" Name and 
Part Number

Pay 
Unit UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      362.75  NO BID  NO BID      401.75  NO BID  NO BID      401.75      401.75 
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      297.75  NO BID  NO BID      336.75  NO BID  NO BID      336.75      336.75 
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      232.75  NO BID  NO BID      271.75  NO BID  NO BID      271.75      271.75 
4 Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      167.75  NO BID  NO BID      206.75  NO BID  NO BID      206.75      206.75 
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      350.25  NO BID  NO BID      410.75  NO BID  NO BID      410.75      410.75 
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      285.25  NO BID  NO BID      345.75  NO BID  NO BID      345.75      345.75 
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      220.25  NO BID  NO BID      280.75  NO BID  NO BID      280.75      280.75 
8 Class B Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      155.25  NO BID  NO BID      215.75  NO BID  NO BID      215.75      215.75 
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      345.25  NO BID  NO BID      405.75  NO BID  NO BID      405.75      405.75 
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      280.25  NO BID  NO BID      340.75  NO BID  NO BID      340.75      340.75 
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      215.25  NO BID  NO BID      275.75  NO BID  NO BID      275.75      275.75 
12 Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      150.25  NO BID  NO BID      210.75  NO BID  NO BID      210.75      210.75 
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      340.25  NO BID  NO BID      400.75  NO BID  NO BID      400.75      400.75 
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      275.25  NO BID  NO BID      335.75  NO BID  NO BID      335.75      335.75 
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      210.25  NO BID  NO BID      270.75  NO BID  NO BID      270.75      270.75 
16 Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      145.25  NO BID  NO BID      205.75  NO BID  NO BID      205.75      205.75 
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      484.75  NO BID  NO BID      535.75  NO BID  NO BID      535.75      535.75 
18 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      419.75  NO BID  NO BID      470.75  NO BID  NO BID      470.75      470.75 
19 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      354.75  NO BID  NO BID      405.75  NO BID  NO BID      405.75      405.75 
20 Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      289.75  NO BID  NO BID      340.75  NO BID  NO BID      340.75      340.75 
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      358.25  NO BID  NO BID      420.75  NO BID  NO BID      420.75      420.75 
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      293.25  NO BID  NO BID      355.75  NO BID  NO BID      355.75      355.75 
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      228.25  NO BID  NO BID      290.75  NO BID  NO BID      290.75      290.75 
24 Class K Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      163.25  NO BID  NO BID      225.75  NO BID  NO BID      225.75      225.75 
25 Mod ClassK Concrete 2-2.99CY CY      420.75  NO BID  NO BID      494.75  NO BID  NO BID      494.75      494.75 
26 Mod ClassK Concrete 3-3.99CY CY      355.75  NO BID  NO BID      429.75  NO BID  NO BID      429.75      429.75 
27 Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.99CY CY      290.75  NO BID  NO BID      364.75  NO BID  NO BID      364.75      364.75 
28 Mod.ClassK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY      225.75  NO BID  NO BID      299.75  NO BID  NO BID      299.75      299.75 
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
32 CLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY      328.75  NO BID  NO BID      369.75  NO BID  NO BID      369.75      369.75 
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 CY CY      263.75  NO BID  NO BID      304.75  NO BID  NO BID      304.75      304.75 
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY      198.75  NO BID  NO BID      239.75  NO BID  NO BID      239.75      239.75 
36 CLSM Type B 5 CY & OVR CY      133.75  NO BID  NO BID      174.75  NO BID  NO BID      174.75      174.75 
37 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY      346.25  NO BID  NO BID      405.75  NO BID  NO BID      405.75      405.75 
38 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 CY CY      281.25  NO BID  NO BID      340.75  NO BID  NO BID      340.75      340.75 
39 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY      216.25  NO BID  NO BID      275.75  NO BID  NO BID      275.75      275.75 
40 CLSM Type C 5 CY & OVR CY      151.25  NO BID  NO BID      210.75  NO BID  NO BID      210.75      210.75 
41 Option A CY over 5 miles CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
42 Option B TL over 5 miles TRKL          6.00  NO BID  NO BID        10.00  NO BID  NO BID          9.00          9.00 
43 Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
44 Chg increased cement  CY CY 15.00      NO BID NO BID 15.00      NO BID NO BID 15.00      15.00      
45 Water-reducing set retarder CY CY 9.45        NO BID NO BID 9.45        NO BID NO BID 9.45        9.45        
46 Water reducer CY CY 6.85        NO BID NO BID 6.85        NO BID NO BID 6.85        6.85        
47 Calcium chloride  OZ OZ 3.70/CY NO BID NO BID 3.70/CY NO BID NO BID 3.70/CY 3.70/CY
48 Non-calcium chloride per OZ OZ 8.00/CY NO BID NO BID 8.00/CY NO BID NO BID 8.00/CY 8.00/CY
49 Super plasticizer CY OZ 7.50/CY NO BID NO BID 7.50/CY NO BID NO BID 7.50/CY 7.50/CY
50 Fiber per CY CY 7.00        NO BID NO BID 7.00        NO BID NO BID 7.00        7.00        
51 Heated Concrete CY CY 7.50        NO BID NO BID 7.50        NO BID NO BID 7.50        7.50        
52 Ice per Pound LB 0.85        NO BID NO BID 0.85        NO BID NO BID 0.85        0.85        
53 Cement trnsptd Vendor CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 Cement trnsptd by DOH CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 Penalty Chg per Truck Minute TRKM 2.50        NO BID NO BID 2.50        NO BID NO BID 2.50        2.50        

SALTWELL 
PLANT - 

BRIDGEPORT

ELKINS PLANT - 
ELKINS   

GLENVILLE 
PLANT - 
GLENVILLE

GASSAWAY 
PLANT - 
GASSAWAY

PENNSBORO 
PLANT - 
PENNSBORO

GLENVILLE 
PLANT - 
GLENVILLE

GASSAWAY 
PLANT - 
GASSAWAY

GASSAWAY 
PLANT - 
GASSAWAY

SUMMERSVILL
E PLANT - 
SUMMERSVILL
E

NOTE:  Items 1 thru 40 shall include delivery within five (5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

  VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY:                                        
(Additional details shall be provided by the Vendor on 

corresponding Attachment B Information Form

 WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE Central Supply Company of WV



      Vendor Name:
DODDRIDGE FAYETTE GILMER GRANT GREENBRIER HAMPSHIRE HANCOCK HARDY

Item 
Num EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

Proposed "Equal" Name and 
Part Number

Pay 
Unit UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      359.75      387.75      401.75      370.75      361.75      380.75  NO BID      380.75 
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      294.75      322.75      336.75      305.75      296.75      315.75  NO BID      315.75 
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      229.25      257.75      271.75      240.75      231.75      250.75  NO BID      250.75 
4 Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      164.75      192.75      206.75      175.75      166.75      185.75  NO BID      185.75 
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      345.75      370.25      410.75      359.75      325.75      369.75  NO BID      369.75 
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      280.75      305.75      345.75      294.75      260.75      304.75  NO BID      304.75 
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      215.75      240.75      280.75      229.75      195.75      239.75  NO BID      239.75 
8 Class B Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      150.75      175.75      215.75      164.75      130.75      174.75  NO BID      174.75 
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      340.75  NO BID      405.75      354.75  NO BID      364.75  NO BID      364.75 
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      275.75  NO BID      340.75      289.75  NO BID      299.75  NO BID      299.75 
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      210.75  NO BID      275.75      224.75  NO BID      234.75  NO BID      234.75 
12 Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      145.75  NO BID      210.75      159.75  NO BID      169.75  NO BID      169.75 
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      335.75  NO BID      400.75      348.75  NO BID      358.75  NO BID      358.75 
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      270.75  NO BID      335.75      283.75  NO BID      293.75  NO BID      293.75 
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      205.75  NO BID      270.75      218.75  NO BID      228.75  NO BID      228.75 
16 Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      140.75  NO BID      205.75      153.75  NO BID      163.75  NO BID      163.75 
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      467.75      495.75      535.75      480.75      489.75      490.75  NO BID      490.75 
18 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      402.75      430.75      470.75      415.75      424.75      425.75  NO BID      425.75 
19 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      337.75      365.75      405.75      350.75      359.75      360.75  NO BID      360.75 
20 Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      272.75      300.75      340.75      285.75      294.75      295.75  NO BID      295.75 
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      354.75      385.75      420.75      365.75      356.75      375.75  NO BID      375.75 
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      289.75      320.75      355.75      300.75      291.75      310.75  NO BID      310.75 
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      224.75      255.75      290.75      235.75      226.75      245.75  NO BID      245.75 
24 Class K Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      159.75      190.75      225.75      170.75      161.75      180.75  NO BID      180.75 
25 Mod ClassK Concrete 2-2.99CY CY      417.75      416.75      494.75      451.75      388.75      461.75  NO BID      461.75 
26 Mod ClassK Concrete 3-3.99CY CY      352.75      351.75      429.75      386.75      323.75      396.75  NO BID      396.75 
27 Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.99CY CY      287.75      286.75      364.75      321.75      258.75      331.75  NO BID      331.75 
28 Mod.ClassK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY      222.75      221.75      299.75      256.75      193.75      266.75  NO BID      266.75 
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
32 CLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY      316.75      345.75      369.75      345.75      307.75      355.75  NO BID      355.75 
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 CY CY      251.75      280.75      304.75      280.75      242.75      290.75  NO BID      290.75 
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY      186.75      215.75      239.75      215.75      177.75      225.75  NO BID      225.75 
36 CLSM Type B 5 CY & OVR CY      121.75      150.75      174.75      150.75      112.75      160.75  NO BID      160.75 
37 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY      341.75      366.75      405.75      355.75      321.75      375.75  NO BID      375.75 
38 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 CY CY      276.75      301.75      340.75      290.75      256.75      310.75  NO BID      310.75 
39 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY      211.75      236.75      275.75      225.75      191.75      245.75  NO BID      245.75 
40 CLSM Type C 5 CY & OVR CY      146.75      171.75      210.75      160.75      126.75      180.75  NO BID      180.75 
41 Option A CY over 5 miles CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
42 Option B TL over 5 miles TRKL          6.00          6.00          9.00        10.00          5.00        10.00  NO BID        10.00 
43 Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID        21.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

44 Chg increased cement  CY CY 15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      NO BID 15.00      
45 Water-reducing set retarder CY CY 9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        NO BID 9.45        
46 Water reducer CY CY 6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        NO BID 6.85        
47 Calcium chloride  OZ OZ 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY NO BID 3.70/CY
48 Non-calcium chloride per OZ OZ 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY NO BID 8.00/CY
49 Super plasticizer CY OZ 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY NO BID 7.50/CY
50 Fiber per CY CY 7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        NO BID 7.00        
51 Heated Concrete CY CY 7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        NO BID 7.50        
52 Ice per Pound LB 0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        NO BID 0.85        
53 Cement trnsptd Vendor CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 Cement trnsptd by DOH CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 Penalty Chg per Truck Minute TRKM 2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        NO BID 2.50        

SALTWELL 
PLANT - 
BRDIGEPORT

PENNSBORO 
PLANT - 
PENNSBORO

GASSAWAY 
PLANT - 
GASSAWAY

SUMMERSVILL
E PLANT - 
SUMMERSVILL
E

GLENVILLE 
PLANT - 
GLENVILLE

GASSAWAY 
PLANT - 
GASSAWAY

ELKINS PLANT 
ELKINS

LEWISBURG 
PLANT - 
LEWISBURG

ELKINS PLANT 
ELKINS

ELKINS PLANT 
ELKINS

NOTE:  Items 1 thru 40 shall include delivery within five (5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

  VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY:                                        
(Additional details shall be provided by the Vendor on 

corresponding Attachment B Information Form

 WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE Central Supply Company of WV



      Vendor Name:
HARRISON JACKSON JEFFERSON KANAWHA LEWIS LINCOLN LOGAN McDOWELL

Item 
Num EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

Proposed "Equal" Name and 
Part Number

Pay 
Unit UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      354.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      362.75  NO BID  NO BID      410.75 
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      289.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      297.75  NO BID  NO BID      345.75 
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      224.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      232.75  NO BID  NO BID      280.75 
4 Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      159.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      167.75  NO BID  NO BID      215.75 
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      340.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      349.75  NO BID  NO BID      369.75 
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      275.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      284.75  NO BID  NO BID      304.75 
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      210.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      219.75  NO BID  NO BID      239.75 
8 Class B Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      145.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      154.75  NO BID  NO BID      174.75 
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      335.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      344.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      270.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      279.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      205.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      214.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
12 Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      140.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      149.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      330.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      339.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      265.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      274.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      200.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      209.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
16 Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      135.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      144.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      488.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      499.75  NO BID  NO BID      519.75 
18 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      423.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      434.75  NO BID  NO BID      454.75 
19 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      358.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      369.75  NO BID  NO BID      389.75 
20 Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      293.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      304.75  NO BID  NO BID      324.75 
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      348.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      358.75  NO BID  NO BID      393.75 
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      283.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      293.75  NO BID  NO BID      328.75 
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      218.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      228.75  NO BID  NO BID      263.75 
24 Class K Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      153.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      163.75  NO BID  NO BID      198.75 
25 Mod ClassK Concrete 2-2.99CY CY      414.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      434.75  NO BID  NO BID      412.75 
26 Mod ClassK Concrete 3-3.99CY CY      349.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      369.75  NO BID  NO BID      347.75 
27 Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.99CY CY      284.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      304.75  NO BID  NO BID      282.75 
28 Mod.ClassK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY      219.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      239.75  NO BID  NO BID      217.75 
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
32 CLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY      311.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      328.25  NO BID  NO BID      344.75 
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 CY CY      246.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      263.25  NO BID  NO BID      279.75 
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY      181.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      198.25  NO BID  NO BID      214.75 
36 CLSM Type B 5 CY & OVR CY      116.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      133.25  NO BID  NO BID      149.75 
37 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY      335.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      345.75  NO BID  NO BID      365.75 
38 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 CY CY      270.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      280.75  NO BID  NO BID      300.75 
39 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY      205.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      215.75  NO BID  NO BID      235.75 
40 CLSM Type C 5 CY & OVR CY      140.75  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      150.75  NO BID  NO BID      170.75 
41 Option A CY over 5 miles CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
42 Option B TL over 5 miles TRKL          5.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID          5.00  NO BID  NO BID        10.00 
43 Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID          7.00 

44 Chg increased cement  CY CY 15.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.00      NO BID NO BID 15.00      
45 Water-reducing set retarder CY CY 9.45        NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.45        NO BID NO BID 9.45        
46 Water reducer CY CY 6.85        NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.85        NO BID NO BID 6.85        
47 Calcium chloride  OZ OZ 3.70/CY NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.70/CY NO BID NO BID 3.70/CY
48 Non-calcium chloride per OZ OZ 8.00/CY NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.00/CY NO BID NO BID 8.00/CY
49 Super plasticizer CY OZ 7.50/CY NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.50/CY NO BID NO BID 7.50/CY
50 Fiber per CY CY 7.00        NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.00        NO BID NO BID 7.00        
51 Heated Concrete CY CY 7.50        NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.50        NO BID NO BID 7.50        
52 Ice per Pound LB 0.85        NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.85        NO BID NO BID 0.85        
53 Cement trnsptd Vendor CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 Cement trnsptd by DOH CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 Penalty Chg per Truck Minute TRKM 2.50        NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.50        NO BID NO BID 2.50        

SALTWELL 
PLANT - 

BRIDGEPORT

SALTWELL 
PLANT - 
BRIDGEPORT

BUCKHANNON 
PLANT - 
BUCKHANNON

PRINCETON 
PLANT - 
PRINCETON

NOTE:  Items 1 thru 40 shall include delivery within five (5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

  VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY:                                        
(Additional details shall be provided by the Vendor on 

corresponding Attachment B Information Form

 WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE Central Supply Company of WV



      Vendor Name:
MARION MARSHALL MASON MERCER MINERAL MINGO MONONGALIA MONROE

Item 
Num EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

Proposed "Equal" Name and 
Part Number

Pay 
Unit UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      354.75      369.75  NO BID      400.75      385.75  NO BID      359.75      400.75 
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      289.75      304.75  NO BID      335.75      315.75  NO BID      294.75      335.75 
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      224.75      239.75  NO BID      270.75      250.75  NO BID      229.75      270.75 
4 Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      159.75      174.75  NO BID      205.75      185.75  NO BID      164.75      205.75 
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      340.75      357.75  NO BID      359.75      369.75  NO BID      347.75      359.75 
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      275.75      292.75  NO BID      294.75      304.75  NO BID      282.75      294.75 
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      210.75      227.75  NO BID      229.75      239.75  NO BID      217.75      229.75 
8 Class B Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      145.75      162.75  NO BID      164.75      174.75  NO BID      152.75      164.75 
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      335.75      352.75  NO BID  NO BID      364.75  NO BID      342.75  NO BID 
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      270.75      287.75  NO BID  NO BID      299.75  NO BID      277.75  NO BID 
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      205.75      222.75  NO BID  NO BID      234.75  NO BID      212.75  NO BID 
12 Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      140.75      157.75  NO BID  NO BID      169.75  NO BID      147.75  NO BID 
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      330.75      347.75  NO BID  NO BID      358.75  NO BID      337.75  NO BID 
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      265.75      282.75  NO BID  NO BID      293.75  NO BID      272.75  NO BID 
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      200.75      217.75  NO BID  NO BID      228.75  NO BID      207.75  NO BID 
16 Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      135.75      152.75  NO BID  NO BID      163.75  NO BID      142.75  NO BID 
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      488.75      495.75  NO BID      509.75      490.75  NO BID      485.75      509.75 
18 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      423.75      430.75  NO BID      444.75      425.75  NO BID      420.75      444.75 
19 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      358.75      365.75  NO BID      379.75      360.75  NO BID      355.75      379.75 
20 Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      293.75      300.75  NO BID      314.75      295.75  NO BID      290.75      314.75 
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      348.75      365.75  NO BID      383.75      375.75  NO BID      355.75      383.75 
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      283.75      300.75  NO BID      318.75      310.75  NO BID      290.75      318.75 
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      218.75      235.75  NO BID      253.75      245.75  NO BID      225.75      253.75 
24 Class K Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      153.75      170.75  NO BID      188.75      180.75  NO BID      160.75      188.75 
25 Mod ClassK Concrete 2-2.99CY CY      414.75      446.75  NO BID      402.75      461.75  NO BID      436.75      402.75 
26 Mod ClassK Concrete 3-3.99CY CY      349.75      381.75  NO BID      337.75      396.75  NO BID      371.75      337.75 
27 Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.99CY CY      284.75      316.75  NO BID      272.75      331.75  NO BID      306.75      272.75 
28 Mod.ClassK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY      219.75      251.75  NO BID      207.75      266.75  NO BID      241.75      207.75 
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  N0 BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  N0 BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  N0 BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
32 CLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  N0 BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY      311.75      331.75  NO BID      334.75      355.75  NO BID      321.75      334.75 
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 CY CY      246.75      266.75  NO BID      269.75      290.75  NO BID      256.75      269.75 
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY      181.75      201.75  NO BID      204.75      225.75  NO BID      191.75      204.75 
36 CLSM Type B 5 CY & OVR CY      116.75      136.75  NO BID      139.75      160.75  NO BID      126.75      139.75 
37 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY      335.75      353.75  NO BID      355.75      375.75  NO BID      343.75      355.75 
38 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 CY CY      270.75      288.75  NO BID      290.75      310.75  NO BID      278.75      290.75 
39 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY      205.75      223.75  NO BID      225.75      245.75  NO BID      213.75      225.75 
40 CLSM Type C 5 CY & OVR CY      140.75      158.75  NO BID      160.75      180.75  NO BID      148.75      160.75 
41 Option A CY over 5 miles CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  N0 BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
42 Option B TL over 5 miles TRKL          5.00        10.00  NO BID          9.00        10.00  NO BID          5.00          9.00 
43 Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID          7.00  N0 BID  NO BID  NO BID          7.00 

44 Chg increased cement  CY CY 15.00      15.00      NO BID 15.00      15.00      NO BID 15.00      15.00      
45 Water-reducing set retarder CY CY 9.45        9.45        NO BID 9.45        9.45        NO BID 9.45        9.45        
46 Water reducer CY CY 6.85        6.85        NO BID 6.85        6.85        NO BID 6.85        6.85        
47 Calcium chloride  OZ OZ 3.70/CY 3.70/CY NO BID 3.70/CY 3.70/CY NO BID 3.70/CY 3.70/CY
48 Non-calcium chloride per OZ OZ 8.00/CY 8.00/CY NO BID 8.00/CY 8.00/CY NO BID 8.00/CY 8.00/CY
49 Super plasticizer CY OZ 7.50/CY 7.50/CY NO BID 7.50/CY 7.50/CY NO BID 7.50/CY 7.50/CY
50 Fiber per CY CY 7.00        7.00        NO BID 7.00        7.00        NO BID 7.00        7.00        
51 Heated Concrete CY CY 7.50        7.50        NO BID 7.50        7.50        NO BID 7.50        7.50        
52 Ice per Pound LB 0.85        0.85        NO BID 0.85        0.85        NO BID 0.85        0.85        
53 Cement trnsptd Vendor CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 Cement trnsptd by DOH CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 Penalty Chg per Truck Minute TRKM 2.50        2.50        NO BID 2.50        2.50        NO BID 2.50        2.50        

SALTWELL 
PLANT - 
BRIDGEPORT

WESTOVER 
PLANT - 
WESTOVER

WESTOVER 
PLANT - 

WESTOVER

PRINCETON 
PLANT - 
PRINCETON

ELKINS PLANT - 
ELKINS

WESTOVER 
PLANT - 
WESTOVER

LEWISBURG 
PLANT - 
LEWISBURG                        
PRINCETON 
PLANT - 
PRINCETON

NOTE:  Items 1 thru 40 shall include delivery within five (5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

  VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY:                                        
(Additional details shall be provided by the Vendor on 

corresponding Attachment B Information Form

 WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE Central Supply Company of WV



      Vendor Name:
MORGAN NICHOLAS OHIO PENDLETON PLEASANTS POCAHONTAS PRESTON PUTNAM

Item 
Num EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

Proposed "Equal" Name and 
Part Number

Pay 
Unit UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID      402.75  NO BID      380.75      364.75      378.75      359.75  NO BID 
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID      337.75  NO BID      315.75      299.75      313.75      294.75  NO BID 
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID      272.75  NO BID      250.75      234.75      248.75      229.75  NO BID 
4 Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID      207.75  NO BID      185.75      169.75      183.75      164.75  NO BID 
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID      387.75  NO BID      369.75      350.75      367.75      347.75  NO BID 
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID      322.75  NO BID      304.75      285.75      302.75      282.75  NO BID 
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID      257.75  NO BID      239.75      220.75      237.75      217.75  NO BID 
8 Class B Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID      192.75  NO BID      174.75      155.75      172.75      152.75  NO BID 
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      364.75      345.75      362.75      342.75  NO BID 
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      299.75      280.75      297.75      277.75  NO BID 
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      234.75      215.75      232.75      212.75  NO BID 
12 Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      169.75      150.75      167.75      147.75  NO BID 
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      358.75      340.75      356.75      337.75  NO BID 
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      293.75      275.75      291.75      272.75  NO BID 
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      228.75      210.75      226.75      207.75  NO BID 
16 Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID      163.75      145.75      161.75      142.75  NO BID 
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID      490.75  NO BID      490.75      472.75      488.75      485.75  NO BID 
18 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID      425.75  NO BID      425.75      407.75      423.75      420.75  NO BID 
19 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID      360.75  NO BID      360.75      342.75      358.75      355.75  NO BID 
20 Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID      295.75  NO BID      295.75      277.75      293.75      290.75  NO BID 
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID      397.75  NO BID      375.75      359.75      373.75      355.75  NO BID 
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID      332.75  NO BID      310.75      294.75      308.75      290.75  NO BID 
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID      267.75  NO BID      245.75      229.75      243.75      225.75  NO BID 
24 Class K Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID      202.75  NO BID      180.75      164.75      178.75      160.75  NO BID 
25 Mod ClassK Concrete 2-2.99CY CY  NO BID      444.75  NO BID      461.75      422.75      459.75      436.75  NO BID 
26 Mod ClassK Concrete 3-3.99CY CY  NO BID      379.75  NO BID      396.75      357.75      394.75      371.75  NO BID 
27 Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.99CY CY  NO BID      314.75  NO BID      331.75      292.75      329.75      306.75  NO BID 
28 Mod.ClassK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY  NO BID      249.75  NO BID      266.75      227.75      264.75      241.75  NO BID 
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
32 CLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID      357.75  NO BID      355.75      321.75      353.75      321.75  NO BID 
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID      292.75  NO BID      290.75      256.75      288.75      256.75  NO BID 
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID      227.75  NO BID      225.75      191.75      223.75      191.75  NO BID 
36 CLSM Type B 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID      162.75  NO BID      160.75      126.75      158.75      126.75  NO BID 
37 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID      383.75  NO BID      375.75      344.75      363.75      343.75  NO BID 
38 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID      318.75  NO BID      310.75      279.75      298.75      278.75  NO BID 
39 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID      253.75  NO BID      245.75      214.75      233.75      213.75  NO BID 
40 CLSM Type C 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID      188.75  NO BID      180.75      149.75      168.75      148.75  NO BID 
41 Option A CY over 5 miles CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
42 Option B TL over 5 miles TRKL  NO BID          8.00  NO BID        10.00          7.00          8.00          7.00  NO BID 
43 Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

44 Chg increased cement  CY CY NO BID 15.00      NO BID 15.00      16.00      15.00      15.00      NO BID
45 Water-reducing set retarder CY CY NO BID 9.45        NO BID 9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        NO BID
46 Water reducer CY CY NO BID 6.85        NO BID 6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        NO BID
47 Calcium chloride  OZ OZ NO BID 3.70/CY NO BID 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY NO BID
48 Non-calcium chloride per OZ OZ NO BID 8.00/CY NO BID 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY NO BID
49 Super plasticizer CY OZ NO BID 7.50/CY NO BID 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY NO BID
50 Fiber per CY CY NO BID 7.00        NO BID 7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        NO BID
51 Heated Concrete CY CY NO BID 7.50        NO BID 7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        NO BID
52 Ice per Pound LB NO BID 0.85        NO BID 0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        NO BID
53 Cement trnsptd Vendor CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 Cement trnsptd by DOH CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 Penalty Chg per Truck Minute TRKM NO BID 2.50        NO BID 2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        NO BID

SUMMERSVILL
E PLANT - 
SUMMERSVILL
E

ELKINS PLANT - 
ELKINS

PENNSBORO 
PLANT - 
PENNSBORO

ELKINS PLANT - 
ELKINS

WESTOVER 
PLANT - 
WESTOVER

NOTE:  Items 1 thru 40 shall include delivery within five (5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

  VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY:                                        
(Additional details shall be provided by the Vendor on 

corresponding Attachment B Information Form

 WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE Central Supply Copmany of WV



      Vendor Name:
MORGAN NICHOLAS OHIO PENDLETON PLEASANTS POCAHONTAS PRESTON PUTNAM

Item 
Num EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

Proposed "Equal" Name and 
Part Number

Pay 
Unit UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      366.75 
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      301.75 
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      236.75 
4 Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      171.75 
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      330.75 
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      265.75 
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      200.75 
8 Class B Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      135.75 
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID 
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID 
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID 
12 Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID 
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID 
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID 
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID 
16 Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID 
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      494.75 
18 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      429.75 
19 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      364.75 
20 Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      299.75 
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      361.75 
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      296.75 
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      231.75 
24 Class K Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      166.75 
25 Mod ClassK Concrete 2-2.99CY CY      393.75 
26 Mod ClassK Concrete 3-3.99CY CY      328.75 
27 Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.99CY CY      263.75 
28 Mod.ClassK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY      198.75 
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID 
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID 
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID 
32 CLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY  NO BID 
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY      312.75 
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 CY CY      247.75 
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY      182.75 
36 CLSM Type B 5 CY & OVR CY      117.75 
37 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY      330.75 
38 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 CY CY      265.75 
39 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY      200.75 
40 CLSM Type C 5 CY & OVR CY      135.75 
41 Option A CY over 5 miles CY  NO BID 
42 Option B TL over 5 miles TRKL          8.00 
43 Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY        21.00 

44 Chg increased cement  CY CY 15.00      
45 Water-reducing set retarder CY CY 9.45        
46 Water reducer CY CY 6.85        
47 Calcium chloride  OZ OZ 3.70/CY
48 Non-calcium chloride per OZ OZ 8.00/CY
49 Super plasticizer CY OZ 7.50/CY
50 Fiber per CY CY 7.00        
51 Heated Concrete CY CY 7.50        
52 Ice per Pound LB 0.85        
53 Cement trnsptd Vendor CY CY NO BID
54 Cement trnsptd by DOH CY CY NO BID
55 Penalty Chg per Truck Minute TRKM 2.50        

SEE MORGAN / 
PUTNAM TAB

SEE MORGAN / 
PUTNAM TAB

SEE MORGAN / 
PUTNAM TAB

SEE MORGAN / 
PUTNAM TAB

SEE MORGAN / 
PUTNAM TAB

LEWISBURG 
PLANT - 
LEWISBURG

SEE MORGAN / 
PUTNAM TAB

SEE MORGAN / 
PUTNAM TAB

NOTE:  Items 1 thru 40 shall include delivery within five (5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

 WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE Central Supply Copmany of WV

  VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY:                                        
(Additional details shall be provided by the Vendor on 

corresponding Attachment B Information Form



      Vendor Name:
RALEIGH RANDOLPH RITCHIE ROANE SUMMERS TAYLOR TUCKER TYLER

Item 
Num EXTENDED DESCRIPTION

Proposed "Equal" Name and 
Part Number

Pay 
Unit UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      372.75      370.75      359.75      401.75      372.75      354.75      370.75      364.75 
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      307.75      305.75      294.75      336.75      307.75      289.75      305.75      299.75 
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      242.75      240.75      229.75      271.75      242.75      224.75      240.75      234.75 
4 Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      177.75      175.75      164.75      206.75      177.75      159.75      175.75      169.75 
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      352.75      359.75      345.75      410.75      352.75      340.75      359.75      350.75 
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      287.75      294.75      280.75      345.75      287.75      275.75      294.75      285.75 
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      222.75      229.75      215.75      280.75      222.75      210.75      229.75      220.75 
8 Class B Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      157.75      164.75      150.75      215.75      157.75      145.75      164.75      155.75 
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID      354.75      340.75      405.75  NO BID      335.75      354.75      345.75 
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID      289.75      275.75      340.75  NO BID      270.75      289.75      280.75 
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID      224.75      210.75      275.75  NO BID      205.75      224.75      215.75 
12 Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID      159.75      145.75      210.75  NO BID      140.75      159.75      150.75 
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID      349.75      335.75      400.75  NO BID      330.75      349.75      340.75 
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID      284.75      270.75      335.75  NO BID      265.75      284.75      275.75 
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID      219.75      205.75      270.75  NO BID      200.75      219.75      210.75 
16 Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY  NO BID      154.75      140.75      205.75  NO BID      135.75      154.75      145.75 
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      499.75      480.75      467.75      535.75      499.75      488.75      480.75      472.75 
18 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      434.75      415.75      402.75      470.75      434.75      423.75      415.75      407.75 
19 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      369.75      350.75      337.75      405.75      369.75      358.75      350.75      342.75 
20 Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      304.75      285.75      272.75      340.75      304.75      293.75      285.75      277.75 
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY      372.75      365.75      354.75      420.75      372.75      348.75      365.75      359.75 
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY      307.75      300.75      289.75      355.75      307.75      283.75      300.75      294.75 
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY      242.75      235.75      224.75      290.75      242.75      218.75      235.75      229.75 
24 Class K Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY      177.75      170.75      159.75      225.75      177.75      153.75      170.75      164.75 
25 Mod ClassK Concrete 2-2.99CY CY      388.75      451.75      417.75      494.75      388.75      414.75      451.75      422.75 
26 Mod ClassK Concrete 3-3.99CY CY      323.75      386.75      352.75      429.75      323.75      349.75      386.75      357.75 
27 Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.99CY CY      258.75      321.75      287.75      364.75      258.75      284.75      321.75      292.75 
28 Mod.ClassK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY      193.75      256.75      222.75      299.75      193.75      219.75      256.75      227.75 
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
32 CLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY      332.75      345.75      316.75      369.75      332.75      311.75      345.75      321.75 
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 CY CY      267.75      280.75      251.75      304.75      267.75      246.75      280.75      256.75 
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY      202.75      215.75      186.75      239.75      202.75      181.75      215.75      191.75 
36 CLSM Type B 5 CY & OVR CY      137.75      150.75      121.75      174.75      137.75      116.75      150.75      126.75 
37 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY      356.75      355.75      339.75      405.75      356.75      335.75      355.75      344.75 
38 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 CY CY      291.75      290.75      274.75      340.75      291.75      270.75      290.75      279.75 
39 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY      226.75      225.75      209.75      275.75      226.75      205.75      225.75      214.75 
40 CLSM Type C 5 CY & OVR CY      161.75      160.75      144.75      210.75      161.75      140.75      160.75      149.75 
41 Option A CY over 5 miles CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
42 Option B TL over 5 miles TRKL          5.00          8.00          7.00          7.00          7.00          5.00          8.00          8.00 
43 Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

44 Chg increased cement  CY CY 15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      15.00      
45 Water-reducing set retarder CY CY 9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        9.45        
46 Water reducer CY CY 6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        6.85        
47 Calcium chloride  OZ OZ 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY 3.70/CY
48 Non-calcium chloride per OZ OZ 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY 8.00/CY
49 Super plasticizer CY OZ 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY 7.50/CY
50 Fiber per CY CY 7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        7.00        
51 Heated Concrete CY CY 7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        7.50        
52 Ice per Pound LB 0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        0.85        
53 Cement trnsptd Vendor CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 Cement trnsptd by DOH CY CY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 Penalty Chg per Truck Minute TRKM 2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        2.50        

MABSCOTT 
PLANT - 
MABSCOTT

ELKINS PLANT - 
ELKINS

PENNSBORO 
PLANT - 

PENNSBORO

GASSAWAY 
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PENSBORRO 
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NOTE:  Items 1 thru 40 shall include delivery within five (5) miles of Vendor's Plant.

  VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY:                                        
(Additional details shall be provided by the Vendor on 

corresponding Attachment B Information Form

 WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE Central Supply Company of WV
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