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Purchasing Division P
2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder:

Solicitation Description:

827738
ADDENDUM# 1

DCARNV MIVEN DNADTI AN ACMENIT ANNCADETE O 1 CNA

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2021-02-17 14:30 SR 0803 ESR02122100000005439 1

VENDOR

000000201143
RBS INC

Solicitation Number:

Total Bid:

Comments:

ARFQ 0803 DOT2100000028

0 Response Date: 2021-02-12

Response Time: 12:57:49

Tina L Lewis
304-414-6859

tina.l.lewis@wv.gov

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Vendor
Signature X

FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Feb 18, 2021

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

1 6619C034-READY MIXED PORTLAND 0.00000 EA
CEMENT CONCRETE AND CLS

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: Bid attached as PDF

Extended Description:

READY MIXED PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE AND CLS MATERIAL PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES

Date Printed:  Feb 18, 2021 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05



State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Proc Folder: 827738 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: READY MIXED PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE & CLSM BY COUNTY

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2021-01-29 2021-02-17 14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2100000028 1

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 5, RM A-220

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25302
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:  1))0000201143

Vendor Name : R B S Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix
Address : PO Box 490,
- White Sulphur Springs
i WV USA 24986
GiNR William Snyder
State : 304.645.2277
Principal Contact :
Vendor Contact Phone: 7 Extension: 7

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Tina L Lewis

304-414-6859
tina.l.lewis@wv.gov

\A/W\KAJ O T I e Zlgb A

All offers subject to all tekms and-conditions contained in this solicitation
Date Printed:  Jan 29, 2021 Page 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



INVOICE TO e el . |SHIPTO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV 99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 6619C034-READY MIXED PORTLAND 0.00000 EA
CEMENT CONCRETE AND CLS
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505

Extended Description:
READY MIXED PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE AND CLS MATERIAL PER THE ATTACHED PRICING PAGES

|SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Line Event Event Date
1 TECHNICAL QUESTIONS DUE BY 10:00AM 2021-02-08

Date Printed: ~ Jan 29, 2021 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing below, or submitting documentation through the West Virginia Vendor Self Service
Portal website, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand the
requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer or
proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the product or
service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that product
or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and conditions
contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or
proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit
this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that I am
authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge,
the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require registration.

KBS Tnc.

(Full Company Namef

(Authorized Signatjire)
r[ )an’zr/'g 5”@4/&’- (F

(Print or Type Name and Title

of Signatory) go 4 é t/g—‘ 22 7 1

(Phone Number)
304- 6. 25577
(Fax Number) N
O @rbsine. com
(Email address)
(2 Feb 202
(Date) ’
Form pre-approved by DOH legal division on July 12, 2016.
Attorney signature not required.
Revised 9/6/2019 14 RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix

PO Box 490

White Sulphur Sprm s, WV 2
304.645.2277 + 908




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County

addresses, or phone numbers change, the Vendor shall update the WVDOH in writing
and update wvOASIS. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or her contact
information below.

Contract Manager: W‘ \ \\é‘M SY\q’AC g
Telephone Numbers: _39Y ., 64yS. 227

Fax Number: 30d. byS. 25979
Email Address: bil\e Cbsin¢.cam

RBS Inc. Green
REVISED 1/24/20 PO Box 490

White Sulphur Sprin
3046452077 O WY 24986

brier Ready Mix



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: ARFQ DOT2100000028

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:

(Check the box mext to each addendum received)
QA:ndum No. 1 [] Addendum No. 6

[0 Addendum No. 2 [J Addendum No. 7
[J Addendum No. 3 [] Addendum No. 8
[J Addendum No. 4 [0 Addendum No. 9
[J Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

L8S. . Tue.
Full Company Name/
‘A/‘/V\/\/\/M/

Authorized Signature

\Z fclo #02‘

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Date

Revised 9/6/2019 15 RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix
PO Box 490

White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986
304.645.2277



WVDOH Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM by County 6621C019

ATTACHMENT A (ATT A) PRICING PAGE

And Controlled Low-Strength Material by County
Vendor | R B § Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix

DODDRIAYETHLMERAN GREENBRIER MPSHNCGARD
Item| Proposcd "Equal” Name and Part | Pay
| Ny | EXTENDED DESCRIPTION it JUNIT] UNI | UNI JUNI] UNITCOST [UNI|U JUN
1_|Class A Concrete 2-2.99 CY CcY No Bid
| 2 [Class A Concrele 3-3.99 CY cY No Bid
3 _|Class A Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY No Bid
4 |Class A Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY No Bid
| 5 |Class B Concrete 2:2.99 CY CY 367.15
6 |Class B Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY 30345
7 |Class B Concrete 4-4.99 CY CY 23165
"8 [Class B Concrete 5 CY 8 OVR cY 164,30
9 |Class C Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY No Bid
10 |Class C Concrete 3:3.99 CY CY No Bid
11 |Class C Concrete 44.99 CY CY No Bid
12 |Class C Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY No Bid
13 |Class D Concrete 2-2.89 CY CY No Bid
14 |Class D Concrete 3-3.99 CY cYy No Bid
| 15 [Class D Concrele 44.99 CY cY No Bid
16 |Class D Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY No Bid
17 jClass H Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY No Bid
18 |Class H Concrete 3-3.99 CY cY No Bid
19 [Class H Concrete 44.99 CY cY No Bid
20 |Class H Concrete 5 CY & OVR CY No Bid
21 |Class K Concrete 2-2.99 CY CY 477.00
22 [Class K Concrete 3-3.99 CY CY 392.26
23 |Class K Concrete 44.99 CY CcY 29807
AGassKConcreteSCY&OVR CY 211.40
25 [Mod ClassK Cx te 2-2.99CY CY No Bid
26 |Mod ClassK Concrate 3-3.98CY cY No Bid
27 [Mod.ClassK Concrete 4-4.93CY CY No Bid
28 MocLCIaLssK Concrete 5CY & OVR CY No Bid
29 |CLSM Type A 2-2.99 CY CY No Bid
30 |CLSM Type A 3-3.93 CY CY No Bid
31 |CLSM Type A4-4.99 CY CY No Bid
32 JCLSM Type A 5-5.99 CY CY No Bid
33 JCLSM Type B 2-2.99 CY CY 300,09
34 |CLSMType B 3-3.99 CY CY 246.79
35 |CLSM Type B 4-4.99 CY CY 187.59
36 C.LﬂﬁTypeBSCY&OVR CY 13300
37 JCLSM Type C 2-2.99 CY CY 37072
38 JCLSMType C3-3.99CY CY 304,86
39 |CLSM Type C 4-4.99 CY CY 23166
40 (LM Type cY 16430
41 |Option A CY over 5 miles CY No Bid
42 |Option B TL over 5 miles KU 7.50
43 |Prov Class B using Sil Sand CY 19.50
44 Chgincreased cement CY CY 1295
45 |Waterreducing set retarder CY CY 780
46 _|Water reducer CY CY 6.30
47 |Calcium chloride OZ 0z 0.10
| 48 |Non-calcium chlorids per 0Z Eucon Accelguard 80 oz .20
49 [Superplasticizer CY 0z .15
50 {Fiberper CY 77777777777774 €Y 750
51 |Heated Concrete CY V7777242 CY 6.50
52 Jlce perPound 07 274747) LB 060
53 [Cement imsptd Vendor CY 2027724 cY No Bid
54 |Cement tmsptd by DOHCY V277, W cY No Bid
55 |Penalty Chg per Truck Minute 7772727777277/ TRKM 2.20
VENDOR'S PLANT SOURCE - NAME & CITY: RBS Inc., GRM1.01.101
Caldwell, WV
R.B.S. Inc,,
Greenbrier Ready Mix

Superior Supply Concrete
PO Box 490, WSS, WV 24986
304.645.2277




ATTACHMENT B (ATT B) Information Form
Must be submitted at the time of bid and corresponding ATTACHMENT A.
Vendor shall complete ATTACHMENT B form for any plants Sourced for County(s) bid on ATTACHMENT A

Per Section 3.2.3, Vendor shall provide the source plant name and 911/physical address including street, city, and state:
R B S Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix Is Plant currently certified?: Yes

256 Industrial Way If yes, list Certified Plant Code: GRM1.01.001

Caldwell, WV 24925

Per Section 3.2.3, Vendor shall provide the source plant name and 911/physical address including street, city, and state:
R B S Inc., Superior Supply Concrete Is Plant currently certified?: Yes

256 Industrial Way If yes, list Certified Plant Code: SSC1.02.001

Caldwell, Wv 24925

Per Section 3.2.3, Vendor shall provide the source plant name and 911/physical address including street, city, and state:
Is Plant currently certified?: Yes or No

If yes, list Certified Plant Code:

Per Section 3.2.3, Vendor shall provide the source plant name and 911/physical address including street, city, and state:
Is Plant currently certified?: Yes or No

If yes, list Certified Plant Code:

Per Section 3.2.3, Vendor shall provide the source plant name and 911/physical address including street, city, and state:
Is Plant currently certified?: Yes or No

If yes, list Certified Plant Code:

Per Section 3.2.3, Vendor shall provide the source plant name and 911/physical address including street, city, and state:
Is Plant currently certified?: Yes or No

If yes, list Certified Plant Code:

Per Section 3.2.3, Vendor shall provide the source plant name and 911/physical address including street, city, and state:
Is Plant currently certified?: Yes or No

If yes, list Certified Plant Code:

Details supporting proposed Equvalentis or "Equal” Bid on ATT A/Pricing Pages

Per Section 3.2.7.1 Calcium Chloride based accelerator brand requested is HE-122. If a Vendor is bidding an
equal to product, the name and any product identification numbers shall be listed below.

Per Section 3.2.7.2 Non-Calcium Chloride based accelerator brand requested is Darex Set. If a Vendor is bidding
a proposed "equal" product, the name and any product identification numbers shall be listed below.

Eucon Accelguard 80 143867A

Per Section 3.2.7.3. Super Plasticizer brand requested is Eucon 37. If a Vendor is bidding a proposed "equal"
product. the name and any product identification numbers shall be listed below.

R:B:Sulncy

Greenbrier Ready Mix
Superior Supply Concrete

PO Box 490, WSS, WV 24986
304.645.2277




West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts
(Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

Name of Contracting Business Entity: RB S Inc. Address: PO Box 490
White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986

Name of Authorized Agent: William Snyder Addigss: PO Box 490, White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986

Contract Number: DOT 2100000028 Contract Description: Concrete & CLSM

Governmental agency awarding contract: Division of Highways

[0 Check here if this is a Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessary):

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract
Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
O Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

20” Shqd/ff’ Wh ) \ierm Sv\u\o\er Deowad vatoeer

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract (excluding legal
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

R 17 O 1,771

Notary Verification

State of A% , County of Greenbrier

, William Snyder , the authorized agent of the contracting business
entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this 12 day of February , 21

C&&%’ W dass)

Notary Public’s Signature

To be completed by State Agency:
Date Received by State Agency: bining
Date submitted to Ethics Commission: 4 \ NOTARY PUBLIC

s T STATE OF WEST VIRGIN
Governmental agency submitting Disclosure: Chen L Hawking

RoRéTWsé@Uune 8,5%2018
nceverte, WV 24970
My Commission Expires June 3, 2021

OFFICIAL SEAL
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STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a
construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a
political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and
use taxes, fire service fees, or other fines or fees.

ALL CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state
or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related
party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand
dollars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter
eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has
not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the
provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political
subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty
or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including
any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers' fund or being
in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers' compensation coverage, or failure to
fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An employer is not in employer default if it has entered
into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the
repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other
form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through
which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or
control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an
amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on
any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other contracts,
that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related
party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or employer default is permitted under the
exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:

Vendor's Name: RBS In;C'l N

Authorized Signature: \AI / Date: 12 FEB 2021
v \——

State of WV

County of Greenbrier , to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this 12 day of February ,2021.

My Commission expires j\k Ne 3 ; 20_2—_!

OFFICIAL SEAL
NOTARY PUBLIC
STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Cheryl L. Hawkins
197 Taylor Street
Ronceverte, WV 24970
My Commission Expires June 3, 2021

NOTARY PUBLIC(J%A( 0 b@/ ; \leu,QQQM/D

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 01/19/2018)
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Clients: 534075

ACORD.

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

18RBSINC

DATE (MWDDIVYYY)
9/29/2020

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer any rights to the certificate holder In lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER

McGriff Insurance Services

300 Summers Street, Suite #650
Charleston, WV 25301

CONTACT
NAME:

Allison Morris
PHONE

FAONE, xy: 304 346-0806 [ TA%, no): 8887513002

AbbhEss: ammorris@mcgriff.com

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
304 346-0806 INSURER a : Phoenix Insurance Company 25623
INSURED (NSUReR B : Travelers Property Casuaity Co of Amer 25674
RBS, Inc. (NSURER C : Travelers Indemnity Co of America 25666
P O Box 490 INSURER D -
White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986-0409 INSURER E_'
INSURERF:

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERICD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

JINSR

POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP

LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE !ﬁ’gngfiﬂ"v%“ POLICY NUMBER (MWDD/YYYY) |(MWDD/YYYY) LIMITS
A | X| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY X | X [Y6601L626379 10/01/2020|10/01/2021| EACH OCCURRENCE $1,000,000
) cLamsmane [ X] ocoun AR R ) | $300,000
| X| XCU Not Excluded MED EXP (Any one p $5,000
| X| Contratual Liab. PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | 1,000,000
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE 32,000,000
|| Pouicy D 528'[ l:l Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG { $2,000,000
OTHER: $
C | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY X | X [8101L5769492 10/01/2020|10/01/2021] GOMENED SINGLELMIT 11,000,000
X| anv auto BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
: D oLy SCHEDULED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
(X Rowr [X|ANSUED b i
Xprive Oth Car $
B | X|UMBRELLALIAB | X | occur CUP1L6477812 10/01/2020 | 10/01/2021| EACH OCCURRENCE 5,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $5,000,000
oeo | X| reentions10000 s
C | eRpLovEnS LinbiLary “n X |UB1L63317420 10/01/2020[10/01/2021| X [EFryre | [
g’;}‘lggg&lgMEfB%g@ngEDgg;ﬁECUﬂVE N/A Includes Employers|Liability | E.L EACH ACCIDENT $1,000,000
(Mandatory In NH) Broad orm Section | Ee.L. pisease - Ea empLovee| 1,000,000
gég%gfﬁ%ﬁ ‘Bnlggpenmous below 23-4-2 of WV Code E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | 51,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Schedule, may be attached If more space Is requlred)

** Workers Comp Information **

Other States Coverage

Proprietors/Partners/Executive Officers/Members Excluded:
Ronald B Snyder, President

Broad Form Employers Liability

(See Attached Descriptions)

Division of Highways
1900 Kanawha Blvd East
Charleston, WV 25305-0330

_CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
P SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
State of West Virginia THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Favsmg 8. Sonlly.

ACORD 25 (2016/03)
#526564429/M26550063

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

1 of2 The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

JPD




Blanket Waiver of Subrogation (WV)

Evidene of Insurnace

SAGITTA 25.3 (2016/03) 2 'of 2 '
#526564429/M26550063




WEST VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
Byrd E. White, I11
Secretary of Transportation

CONTRACTOR'S CERTIFICATE OF QUALIFICATION
NO. 26577

THIS CERTIFIES THAT R.B.S., INC.
WHITE SULPHUR SPRINGS, WV

HAS FILED WITH THE DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS A FINANCIAL AND EXPERIENCE QUESTIONNAIRE
AS REQUIRED BY THE COMMISSIONER, AND IS HEREBY AUTHORIZED TO BID AT ANY DIVISION OF
HIGHWAYS LETTING UNTIL THE UNCOMPLETED WORK UNDER CONTRACT IN TERMS OF
ESTIMATED COSTS AT ANY ONE TIME DOES NOT EXCEED IN THE AGGREGATE $40,207,000 FOR THE
FOLLOWING TYPES OF WORK: ITEM(S) A.

THIS CERTIFICATE EXPIRES ON WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
April 30,2021 M

DATED AT CHARLESTON, WV ON £ /) A “h =

July 1, 2020 DIRECTOR

CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION DIVISION
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CONTRACTOR LICENSE

Authorized by the

West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board

Number:
WV001531

Classification:

ELECTRICAL MASONRY
GENERAL BUILDING

GENERAL ENGINEERING

HEATING, VENTILATING & COQLING

PIPING

PLUMBING

RESIDENTIAL

SPECIALTY

CONCRETE
R B S INC
DBA R B S INC
PO BOX 490

WHITE SULPHUR SPRINGS, WV 24986-049

Date Issued Expiration Date
AUGUST 09, 2020 : : AUGUST 09, 2021
Ibual- ST
- Authorized any Signature Chair, West Virginia Contractor
s Licensing Board

BO ARD ; This license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a conspicuous place at every construction site where work is being

performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all bid submissions and on all fully executed
and binding contracts. This license cannot be assigned or transferred by licensee. Issued under provisions of West

DA AAAAAAAYL Virginia Code, Chapter 21, Article 11.
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