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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 828216

Solicitation Description: Addendum #8
Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2021-02-08 14:30 SR 0803 ESR02082100000005288 1

VENDOR

000000197624
SLURRY PAVERS INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2100000027

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2021-02-08 Response Time: 13:41:05

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Tina L Lewis
304-414-6859
tina.l.lewis@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Highway and road resurfacing service 0.00000 EA 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141104    

Commodity Line Comments: Tack Coat pricing is for Microsurfacing only.
The districts we did not bid on were left blank.
Please see attached Excel sheet with unit pricing for bid items.Extended Description:

Highway and road resurfacing service









Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason X Nicholas X Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie X Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston X Tucker X Wyoming

X Clay X Hardy Marion X Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

P1-A Mile $

P2-A Mile $

Fog Seal
$
$
$
$

P1-B Mile $

P2-B Mile $

Tack Coat
0.50$                         
0.45$                         
0.35$                         
0.25$                         

P1-C Mile 2,000.00$                 

P2-C Mile 10.00$                       

Stress Absorbing Membrane Interlayer (SAMI). 
-$                           
-$                           
-$                           
-$                           

P1-D Mile $

P2-D Mile $

Hot Applied Mastic (HAM)

P1-E Mile 3,500.00$                 

P2-E Mile 12.00$                       

Asphalt Emulsion Slurry Seal Coat
3.25$                         
2.68$                         
2.46$                         
2.44$                         

P1-F Mile 4,500.00$                 

P2-F Mile 20.00$                       

Micro Surface
4.33$                         
3.62$                         
3.20$                         
3.03$                         
6.04$                         
5.89$                         
5.52$                         
5.40$                         
4.18$                         
3.67$                         
3.37$                         

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000

Less than 20,000
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3621 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 20,000 - 50,000

50,001 - 100,000
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3623 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 100,001 or greater
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3624 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA Less than 20,000

--------

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA Less than 20,000
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 20,000 - 50,000

50,001 - 100,000
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3619 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 100,001 or greater

Less than 20,000
Asphalt Emulsions Inc. Manassas VA CSS-1h 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 20,000 - 50,000
Asphalt Emulsions Inc. Manassas VA CSS-1h 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 50,001 - 100,000

100,001 or greater

--------

--------

--------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

Crafco Inc., Asphalt Pav. Repair Mastic, Chandler, AZ Slurry Pavers Inc. (Yard)
3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA
3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA
3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA
3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

--------

--------

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM

--------

--------

NO BID Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

Light (A-1)
Single (A-2)
Double (A-3)
Triple (A-4)

-------- -------- --------

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater
Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic 
Emulsified Asphalt, 
Per Application Type

SY

Chip Seal, Triple SY

Hot Applied Mastic (HAM) POUND

Mobilization for First Mile, Fog Seal

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Fog 
Seal

Fog Seal SY

SY

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised)

Chip Seal, Double SY

Chip Seal, Single SY

Extended Description

Chip Seal, Light SY

                                                                                                                * For Asphalt Preservation, list emulsion/binder sources below and list 
Chip Seal                                                                                                            aggregates in the Aggregage Surcharge by County, Item Q)

CHIP SEAL BID ON SEPARATE SHEET

Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*

50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

SAMI (Stress Absorbing Membrane 
Interlayer)
(Interlayer only; not intended as a stand-
alone application)

SY

-------- --------

--------

-------- --------

--------

NO BID

Asphalt Emulsion Slurry Seal Coat SY

Mobilization for First Mile, Hot Applied 
Mastic (HAM)
Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Hot 
Applied Mastic (HAM)

Micro Surface - Type 2FA - Single Course

Asphalt Emulsions Inc. Manassas VA CSS-1h 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

-------- --------

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3618 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

-------- --------

Asphalt Emulsions Inc. Manassas VA CSS-1h 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

-------- --------

SY

SY

Micro Surface - Type 2FA - Multiple Course 
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3622 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3626 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3620 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3625 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Mobilization for First Mile, SAMI

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, SAMI

E

A-1

A-2

A-3

A-4

A-5

B

C Tack Coat

Mobilization for First Mile, Fog Seal
Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Fog 
Seal

D

F

G-1

G-2

G-3

Mobilization for First Mile, Chip Seal
Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Chip 
Seal

3.15$                         

Micro Surface - Type 3FA - Single Course SY

Mobilization for First Mile, Asphalt Emulsion 
Slurry Seal Coat

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, 
Asphalt Emulsion Slurry Seal Coat
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason X Nicholas X Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie X Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston X Tucker X Wyoming

X Clay X Hardy Marion X Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised)

Extended Description Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*
3.14$                         
6.15$                         
5.93$                         
5.59$                         
5.45$                         
4.45$                         
4.15$                         
4.06$                         
3.85$                         

395.00$                     
345.00$                     
338.00$                     
326.00$                     

P1-G Mile 6,500.00$                 

P2-G Mile 40.00$                       

Crack Sealing, 1" or Less
1.46$                         
1.15$                         
1.10$                         
1.10$                         

P1-K Mile 3,500.00$                 

P2-K Mile 10.00$                       

Eradication (Removal) of Pavement Markings

L-1 LF 12.00$                       

L-2 Each 115.00$                     

L-3 Each 45.00$                       

P1-L Mile 2,000.00$                 

P2-L Mile 12.00$                       

Temporary Pavement Markings, Installed

M-1 LF -$                           

M-2 LF -$                           

M-3 LF -$                           

M-4 LF -$                           

M-5 Each -$                           

P1-M Mile -$                           

P2-M Mile -$                           

Type V Pre-Formed Pavement Markings, Installed 

N-1 LF -$                           

N-2 LF -$                           

N-3 LF -$                           

N-4 LF -$                           

N-5 LF -$                           

N-6 LF -$                           

N-7 LF -$                           

N-8 LF -$                           

N-9 LF -$                           

N-10 LF -$                           

N-11 LF -$                           

N-12 LF -$                           

N-13 LF -$                           

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

-------- -------- --------

--------

-------- -------- --------

Temporary Pavement Marking Type VII-A

Temporary Pavement Marking - Type VII-C

NO BID --------

Temporary Pavement Marking - Type VII-B

Temporary Raised Pavement Marker

Mobilization for First Mile
Mobilization for Each Additional Mile, Temp 
Pavement Markings

-------- -------- --------

NO BID --------

--------

N/A
Slurry Pavers Inc.                                  3617 Nine 

Mile Road,                Richmond VA 23223
--------

N/A
Slurry Pavers Inc.                                  3617 Nine 

Mile Road,                Richmond VA 23223

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

N/A
Slurry Pavers Inc.                                  3617 Nine 

Mile Road,                Richmond VA 23223
--------

Crafco Inc., Allentown, PA Slurry Pavers Inc. (Yard) 3617 Nine Mile Road 
LF

Crafco Inc., Allentown, PA Slurry Pavers Inc. (Yard) 3617 Nine Mile Road 

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

Crafco Inc., Allentown, PA Slurry Pavers Inc. (Yard) 3617 Nine Mile Road 
Crafco Inc., Allentown, PA Slurry Pavers Inc. (Yard) 3617 Nine Mile Road 

50,001 - 100,000
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3635 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 100,001 or greater
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3636 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3637 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3638 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Ton

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Less than 200
201 - 500
501 - 1,000
1,001 and greater

50,001 - 100,000
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3631 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 100,001 or greater
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3632 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA Less than 20,000
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3633 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 20,000 - 50,000

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3627 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 100,001 or greater
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3628 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA Less than 20,000
Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3629 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA 20,000 - 50,000

6" Longitudinal Line, White with Black 
Contrast - Installed

6" Longitudinal Line, Black - Installed

6" Longitudinal Line, Yellow - Installed

6" Longitudinal Line, Grey- Installed

8" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

8" Longitudinal Line, White with Black 
Contrast - Installed

4" Longitudinal Line, Blue - Installed

Eradication of Thermoplastic Markings (Line 
markings such as crosswalks, stop bars and 
channelizing lines) 

Eradication of Thermoplastic Markings 
(Symbols such as arrows and railroad 
crossing markings)

Eradication of Raised Pavement 
Markers

Mobilization for First Mile

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, 
Eradicating RPMs

4" Longitudinal Line, Black - Installed

4" SKID RESISTANCE ENHANCED Longitudinal 
Line, Blue - Installed

6" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

Temporary Pavement Marking - Paint

4" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

4" Longitudinal Line, White, with Black 
Contrast - Installed

4" Longitudinal Line, Yellow - Installed

Micro Surface - 3' Wide, Single Course 

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3630 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA

Asphalt Emulsions, Richmond VA CQS-1hLM 3634 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA
SY

G-4

G-5

H

Mobilization for First Mile, Micro Surface

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Micro 
Surface

Mobilization for First Mile
Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Crack 
Sealing

Crack Sealing, 1" or Less

Micro Surface - Type 3FA -  Multiple Course

K

Micro Surface, Rut Fill

SY
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason X Nicholas X Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie X Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston X Tucker X Wyoming

X Clay X Hardy Marion X Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised)

Extended Description Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*

N-14 LF -$                           

N-15 LF -$                           

N-16 LF -$                           

N-17 LF -$                           

N-18 LF -$                           

N-19 LF -$                           

N-20 LF -$                           

N-21 Each -$                           

N-22 Each -$                           

N-23 Each -$                           

N-24 Each -$                           

N-25 Each -$                           

N-26 Each -$                           

N-27 Each -$                           

N-28 Each -$                           

N-29 Each -$                           

N-30 Each -$                           

N-31 Each -$                           

N-32 Each -$                           

N-33 Each -$                           

N-34 Each -$                           

N-35 Each -$                           

N-36 Each -$                           

N-37 Each -$                           

N-38 Each -$                           

N-39 Each -$                           

N-40 Each -$                           

N-41 Each -$                           

N-42 Each -$                           

N-43 Each -$                           

N-44 Each -$                           

N-45 Each -$                           

N-46 Each -$                           

N-47 Each -$                           

P1-N Mile -$                           

P2-N Mile -$                           

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

Two Head Roundabout Arrow, White, Left/ 
Right - Installed
Two Head Roundabout Arrow, White, Left/ 
Straight - Installed
Two Head Roundabout Arrow, White, 
Right/Straight - Installed
Three Head Roundabout Arrow, White, 
Left/Right/Straight - Installed
Mobilization for First Mile

Mobilization for Each Additional Mile, Type V 
Pavement Markings

Left Side Lane Drop Arrow (Points to the 
Right) - Installed
Railroad Crossing R's 12'x78",  "X" 16", "20" 
height, 42" Width - Installed
White Handicap Symbol with Blue 
Background, 48" square - Installed

Yield Line Triangle, 24" x 36" - Installed

Freeway Ramp Wrong Way Arrow 8' wide - 
Installed

SKID RESISTANCE ENHANCED Bicycle with 
Rider and Helmet Symbol, 24" x 48".  Bicycle 
to Point to the Left - Installed

Shared Lane Bike Symbol 9'-4" x 3'4" SKID 
RESISTANCE ENHANCED - Installed

One Head Roundabout Arrow, White, Left - 
Installed
One Head Roundabout Arrow, White, 
Straight - Installed

Curved Arrow, Right, with Black Contrast, 12" 
at Bottom of Shaft, 6'-3" x 8'-2" - Installed

Combination Arrow 12" at Bottom of Shaft, 
7'-4" x 13'-1" (Left or Right, Specified at Time 
of Order) - Installed

Combination Arrow with Black Contrast 12" 
at Bottom of Shaft, 7'-4" x 13'-1" (Left or 
Right, Specified at Time of Order) - Installed

"ONLY" 6'-8" x 8'-0" - Installed

"STOP" 7'-4" x 8'-0" - Installed

"AHEAD" 8'-10" x 8'-0" - Installed

"SCHOOL" 11'-4" x 8'-0" - Installed

"SCHOOL" 14'-6" x 10'-0" - Installed

Right Side Lane Drop Arrow (Points to the 
Left) - Installed

12" Longitudinal Line, Yellow - Installed

12" Longitudinal Line, Black - Installed

12" Longitudinal Line, Grey- Installed

24" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

Straight Arrow 12" @ Bottom of Shaft 3'-3" x 
9'-10" - Installed

Straight Arrow with Black Contrast 12" at 
Bottom of Shaft, 3'3" x 9'10" - Installed

Curved Arrow, Left, 12" at Bottom of Shaft, 6'-
3" x 8-2" - Installed

Curved Arrow, Left with Black Contrast, 12" 
at Bottom of Shaft, 6'-3" x 8'-2" - Installed

Curved Arrow, Right, 12" at Bottom of Shaft, 
6'-3" x 8-2" - Installed

8" Longitudinal Line, Yellow - Installed

12" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

12" SKID RESISTANCE ENHANCED 
Longitudinal Line, White - Installed
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason X Nicholas X Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie X Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston X Tucker X Wyoming

X Clay X Hardy Marion X Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised)

Extended Description Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*
Raised Pavement Markings, Installed

O-1 Each -$                           

O-2 Each -$                           

P1-O Mile -$                           

P2-O Mile -$                           

Maintaining Traffic by Vendor

Q-1 Day 650.00$                     

Q-2 Each 1.65$                         

Q-3 Hour 50.00$                       

Q-4 Day 250.00$                     

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge Per County:

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

R-1 Ton $

R-2 Ton $

R-3 Ton $

R-4 Ton $

R-5 Ton $

R-6 Ton $

R-7 Ton $

R-8 Ton $

R-9 Ton $

R-10 Ton $

R-11 Ton $

R-12 Ton $

R-13 Ton $

R-14 Ton $

R-15 Ton $

R-16 Ton $

R-17 Ton $

R-18 Ton $

R-19 Ton $

R-20 Ton $

R-21 Ton $

R-22 Ton $

R-23 Ton $

R-24 Ton $

R-25 Ton $

R-26 Ton $

R-27 Ton $

R-28 Ton $

R-29 Ton $

R-30 Ton $

Name/Location of Quarry/Source Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

CHIP SEAL BID ON SEPARATE SHEET --------

NO BID ON SAMI (Item D, P1-D, P2-D) --------

--------

--------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

NO BID --------Type P-2 Raised Pavement Marker - Installed

Extended Description

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Mineral County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Mingo County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Kanawha 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Lewis County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Lincoln County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Logan County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Marion County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Marshall 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Mason County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  McDowell 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Mercer County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Gilmer County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Grant County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Greenbrier 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Hancock 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Hardy County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Harrison 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Jackson County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Jefferson 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Hampshire 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Calhoun County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Clay County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Barbour County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Berkeley 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Boone County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Braxton County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Brooke County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Cabell County

Flagger

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Fayette County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Doddridge 
County

VARIOUS SOURCES VARIOUS LOCATIONS --------

Arrow Board Slurry Pavers Inc. (Yard) 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA --------

Pilot Truck and Driver Slurry Pavers Inc. (Yard) 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA --------

Traffic Control Devices Slurry Pavers Inc. (Yard) 3617 Nine Mile Road, Richmond VA --------

Type R-4 Raised Pavement Marker - Installed

Mobilization for First Mile
Mobilization for Each Additional Mile, RPMs 
Installed 
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason X Nicholas X Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie X Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston X Tucker X Wyoming

X Clay X Hardy Marion X Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised)

Extended Description Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*

R-31 Ton $

R-32 Ton $

R-33 Ton $

R-34 Ton $

R-35 Ton $

R-36 Ton $

R-37 Ton $

R-38 Ton $

R-39 Ton $

R-40 Ton $

R-41 Ton $

R-42 Ton $

R-43 Ton $

R-44 Ton $

R-45 Ton $

R-46 Ton $

R-47 Ton $

R-48 Ton $

R-49 Ton $

R-50 Ton $

R-51 Ton $

R-52 Ton $

R-53 Ton $

R-54 Ton $

R-55 Ton $--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Tucker County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Tyler County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Upshur County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Monongalia 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Monroe County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Morgan County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Nicholas 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Ohio County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Pendleton 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Pleasants 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Wayne County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Webster 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Wetzel County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Wirt County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Wood County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Wyoming 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Pocahontas 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Preston County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Putnam County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Raleigh County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Randolph 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Ritchie County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Roane County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Summers 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Taylor County
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason Nicholas Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston Tucker X Wyoming
Clay X Hardy Marion Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

2.74$                         
2.07$                         
2.03$                         
1.97$                         
3.05$                         
2.38$                         
2.32$                         
2.12$                         
4.54$                         
3.74$                         
3.64$                         
3.47$                         
6.10$                         
5.29$                         
5.23$                         
5.03$                         
0.09$                         
0.14$                         
0.29$                         
0.44$                         

P1-A Mile 5,000.00$                 

P2-A Mile 20.00$                       

Fog Seal
$
$
$
$

P1-B Mile $

P2-B Mile $

Tack Coat
$
$
$
$

P1-C Mile $

P2-C Mile $

Stress Absorbing Membrane Interlayer (SAMI). 
$
$
$
$

P1-D Mile $

P2-D Mile $

Hot Applied Mastic (HAM)

P1-E Mile $

P2-E Mile $

Asphalt Emulsion Slurry Seal Coat
$
$
$
$

P1-F Mile $

P2-F Mile $

Micro Surface
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater
Less than 20,000

--------

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

--------

--------

--------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

--------

--------

--------

--------

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

Light (A-1)
Single (A-2)

Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2L Double (A-3)
Triple (A-4)

-------- -------- --------
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2L

Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000

Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA 50,001 - 100,000
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA 100,001 or greater

3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA Less than 20,000
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA 20,000 - 50,000
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA 50,001 - 100,000
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA 100,001 or greater

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA

3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA
3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA

3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA Less than 20,000
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA 20,000 - 50,000

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic 
Emulsified Asphalt, 
Per Application Type

SY

Chip Seal, Triple SY

Hot Applied Mastic (HAM) POUND

Mobilization for First Mile, Fog Seal

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Fog 
Seal

Fog Seal SY

SY

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised 2/1/2021)

Chip Seal, Double SY

Chip Seal, Single SY

Extended Description

Chip Seal, Light SY

                                                                                                                * For Asphalt Preservation, list emulsion/binder sources below and list 
Chip Seal                                                                                                            aggregates in the Aggregage Surcharge by County, Item Q)

Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2

Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*

Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA 50,001 - 100,000
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA 100,001 or greater
Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2

SAMI (Stress Absorbing Membrane 
Interlayer)
(Interlayer only; not intended as a stand-
alone application)

SY

Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2 3617 Nine Mile Road Richmond, VA

Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2L

-------- --------

--------

Asphalt Emulsions. Chesterfield VA CRS-2L

-------- --------

--------

Asphalt Emulsion Slurry Seal Coat SY

Mobilization for First Mile, Hot Applied 
Mastic (HAM)
Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Hot 
Applied Mastic (HAM)

Micro Surface - Type 2FA - Single Course

-------- --------

-------- --------

-------- --------

SY

SY

Micro Surface - Type 2FA - Multiple Course 

Mobilization for First Mile, SAMI

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, SAMI

E

A-1

A-2

A-3

A-4

A-5

B

C Tack Coat

Mobilization for First Mile, Fog Seal
Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Fog 
Seal

D

F

G-1

G-2

G-3

Mobilization for First Mile, Chip Seal
Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Chip 
Seal

$

Micro Surface - Type 3FA - Single Course SY

Mobilization for First Mile, Asphalt Emulsion 
Slurry Seal Coat

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, 
Asphalt Emulsion Slurry Seal Coat
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason Nicholas Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston Tucker X Wyoming
Clay X Hardy Marion Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised 2/1/2021)

Extended Description Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

P1-G Mile $

P2-G Mile $

Crack Sealing, 1" or Less
$
$
$
$

P1-K Mile $

P2-K Mile $

Eradication (Removal) of Pavement Markings

L-1 LF $

L-2 Each $

L-3 Each $

P1-L Mile $

P2-L Mile $

Temporary Pavement Markings, Installed

M-1 LF $

M-2 LF $

M-3 LF $

M-4 LF $

M-5 Each $

P1-M Mile $

P2-M Mile $

Type V Pre-Formed Pavement Markings, Installed 

N-1 LF $

N-2 LF $

N-3 LF $

N-4 LF $

N-5 LF $

N-6 LF $

N-7 LF $

N-8 LF $

N-9 LF $

N-10 LF $

N-11 LF $

N-12 LF $

N-13 LF $

N-14 LF $

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

-------- -------- --------

--------

-------- -------- --------

Temporary Pavement Marking Type VII-A

Temporary Pavement Marking - Type VII-C

--------

Temporary Pavement Marking - Type VII-B

Temporary Raised Pavement Marker

Mobilization for First Mile
Mobilization for Each Additional Mile, Temp 
Pavement Markings

-------- -------- --------

--------

--------

--------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

--------

LF

Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000
50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater

Ton

Less than 200
201 - 500
501 - 1,000
1,001 and greater

50,001 - 100,000
100,001 or greater
Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000

100,001 or greater
Less than 20,000
20,000 - 50,000

6" Longitudinal Line, White with Black 
Contrast - Installed

6" Longitudinal Line, Black - Installed

6" Longitudinal Line, Yellow - Installed

6" Longitudinal Line, Grey- Installed

8" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

8" Longitudinal Line, White with Black 
Contrast - Installed

8" Longitudinal Line, Yellow - Installed

4" Longitudinal Line, Blue - Installed

Eradication of Thermoplastic Markings (Line 
markings such as crosswalks, stop bars and 
channelizing lines) 

Eradication of Thermoplastic Markings 
(Symbols such as arrows and railroad 
crossing markings)
Eradication of Raised Pavement 
Markers
Mobilization for First Mile

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, 
Eradicating RPMs

4" Longitudinal Line, Black - Installed

4" SKID RESISTANCE ENHANCED Longitudinal 
Line, Blue - Installed

6" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

Temporary Pavement Marking - Paint

4" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

4" Longitudinal Line, White, with Black 
Contrast - Installed

4" Longitudinal Line, Yellow - Installed

Micro Surface - 3' Wide, Single Course SY

G-4

G-5

H

Mobilization for First Mile, Micro Surface

Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Micro 
Surface

Mobilization for First Mile
Mobilization for each Additional Mile, Crack 
Sealing

Crack Sealing, 1" or Less

Micro Surface - Type 3FA -  Multiple Course

K

Micro Surface, Rut Fill

SY
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason Nicholas Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston Tucker X Wyoming
Clay X Hardy Marion Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised 2/1/2021)

Extended Description Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*

N-15 LF $

N-16 LF

N-17 LF $

N-18 LF $

N-19 LF $

N-20 LF $

N-21 Each $

N-22 Each $

N-23 Each $

N-24 Each $

N-25 Each $

N-26 Each $

N-27 Each $

N-28 Each $

N-29 Each $

N-30 Each $

N-31 Each $

N-32 Each $

N-33 Each $

N-34 Each $

N-35 Each $

N-36 Each $

N-37 Each $

N-38 Each $

N-39 Each $

N-40 Each $

N-41 Each $

N-42 Each $

N-43 Each $

N-44 Each $

N-45 Each $

N-46 Each $

N-47 Each $

P1-N Mile $

P2-N Mile $

Raised Pavement Markings, Installed

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

Two Head Roundabout Arrow, White, Left/ 
Right - Installed
Two Head Roundabout Arrow, White, Left/ 
Straight - Installed
Two Head Roundabout Arrow, White, 
Right/Straight - Installed
Three Head Roundabout Arrow, White, 
Left/Right/Straight - Installed
Mobilization for First Mile

Mobilization for Each Additional Mile, Type V 
Pavement Markings

Left Side Lane Drop Arrow (Points to the 
Right) - Installed
Railroad Crossing R's 12'x78",  "X" 16", "20" 
height, 42" Width - Installed
White Handicap Symbol with Blue 
Background, 48" square - Installed

Yield Line Triangle, 24" x 36" - Installed

Freeway Ramp Wrong Way Arrow 8' wide - 
Installed

SKID RESISTANCE ENHANCED Bicycle with 
Rider and Helmet Symbol, 24" x 48".  Bicycle 
to Point to the Left - Installed

Shared Lane Bike Symbol 9'-4" x 3'4" SKID 
RESISTANCE ENHANCED - Installed

One Head Roundabout Arrow, White, Left - 
Installed
One Head Roundabout Arrow, White, 
Straight - Installed

Curved Arrow, Right, with Black Contrast, 12" 
at Bottom of Shaft, 6'-3" x 8'-2" - Installed

Combination Arrow 12" at Bottom of Shaft, 
7'-4" x 13'-1" (Left or Right, Specified at Time 
of Order) - Installed

Combination Arrow with Black Contrast 12" 
at Bottom of Shaft, 7'-4" x 13'-1" (Left or 
Right, Specified at Time of Order) - Installed

"ONLY" 6'-8" x 8'-0" - Installed

"STOP" 7'-4" x 8'-0" - Installed

"AHEAD" 8'-10" x 8'-0" - Installed

"SCHOOL" 11'-4" x 8'-0" - Installed

"SCHOOL" 14'-6" x 10'-0" - Installed

Right Side Lane Drop Arrow (Points to the 
Left) - Installed

12" Longitudinal Line, Yellow - Installed

12" Longitudinal Line, Black - Installed

12" Longitudinal Line, Grey- Installed

24" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

Straight Arrow 12" @ Bottom of Shaft 3'-3" x 
9'-10" - Installed

Straight Arrow with Black Contrast 12" at 
Bottom of Shaft, 3'3" x 9'10" - Installed

Curved Arrow, Left, 12" at Bottom of Shaft, 6'-
3" x 8-2" - Installed

Curved Arrow, Left with Black Contrast, 12" 
at Bottom of Shaft, 6'-3" x 8'-2" - Installed

Curved Arrow, Right, 12" at Bottom of Shaft, 
6'-3" x 8-2" - Installed

12" Longitudinal Line, White - Installed

12" SKID RESISTANCE ENHANCED 
Longitudinal Line, White - Installed
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason Nicholas Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston Tucker X Wyoming
Clay X Hardy Marion Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised 2/1/2021)

Extended Description Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*

O-1 Each $

O-2 Each $

P1-O Mile $

P2-O Mile $

Maintaining Traffic by Vendor

Q-1 Day $

Q-2 Unit $

Q-3 Hour $

Q-4 Day $

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge Per County:

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

R-1 Ton $

R-2 Ton 8.00$                         

R-3 Ton $

R-4 Ton $

R-5 Ton $

R-6 Ton $

R-7 Ton $

R-8 Ton $

R-9 Ton $

R-10 Ton 15.45$                       

R-11 Ton $

R-12 Ton 7.00$                         

R-13 Ton 8.90$                         

R-14 Ton 9.25$                         

R-15 Ton $

R-16 Ton 9.00$                         

R-17 Ton $

R-18 Ton $

R-19 Ton 8.50$                         

R-20 Ton $

R-21 Ton $

R-22 Ton $

R-23 Ton $

R-24 Ton $

R-25 Ton $

R-26 Ton $

R-27 Ton 16.45$                       

R-28 Ton 7.35$                         

R-29 Ton 6.00$                         

R-30 Ton $

R-31 Ton $

Name/Location of Quarry/Source Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

--------

Applachian Aggregates, Mercer Quarry (Princeton, 
WV)

--------

Allegany Aggregates, Inc., Short Gap Quarry --------

--------

--------

--------

Applachian Aggregates, Mercer Quarry (Princeton, 
WV)

--------

--------

--------

--------

Martin Marietta, Pinesburg Quarry --------

--------

--------

Fairfax Materials Inc., Hours Quarry --------

--------

--------

Applachian Aggregates, Lewisburg Quarry --------

Allegany Aggregates, Inc., Short Gap Quarry --------

--------

Applachian Aggregates, Lewisburg Quarry --------

--------

Fairfax Materials Inc., Hours Quarry --------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

Martin Marietta, Pinesburg Quarry --------

--------

--------

-------- -------- --------

-------- -------- --------

--------Type P-2 Raised Pavement Marker - Installed

Extended Description

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Mineral County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Mingo County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Monongalia 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Kanawha 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Lewis County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Lincoln County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Logan County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Marion County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Marshall 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Mason County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  McDowell 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Mercer County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Gilmer County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Grant County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Greenbrier 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Hancock 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Hardy County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Harrison 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Jackson County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Jefferson 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Hampshire 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Calhoun County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Clay County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Barbour County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Berkeley 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Boone County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Braxton County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Brooke County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Cabell County

Flagger

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Fayette County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Doddridge 
County

--------

Arrow Board --------

Pilot Truck and Driver --------

Traffic Control Devices --------

Type R-4 Raised Pavement Marker - Installed

Mobilization for First Mile
Mobilization for Each Additional Mile, RPMs 
Installed 
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Barbour Doddridge Harrison Marshall X Morgan X Raleigh Upshur

X Berkeley X Fayette Jackson Mason Nicholas Randolph Wayne
Boone Gilmer X Jefferson X McDowell Ohio Ritchie Webster
Braxton X Grant Kanawha X Mercer X Pendleton Roane Wetzel
Brooke X Greenbrier Lewis X Mineral Pleasants X Summers Wirt
Cabell X Hampshire Lincoln Mingo X Pocahontas Taylor Wood
Calhoun Hancock Logan Monongalia Preston Tucker X Wyoming
Clay X Hardy Marion Monroe Putnam Tyler

Contract Item 
#

Unit of 
Measure List Price

VENDORS NAME SHALL BE ENTERED HERE, BY THE VENDOR: Slurry Pavers Inc.

Vendor's Storage Location Size of Project

 If Vendor has different pricing per county, Vendor shall complete Attachment A spreadsheet for each pricing per county set.   If additional space for Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source is 
needed, please include a separate attachment listing the additional sources, and referencing them to the corresponding Contract Item #.   

INSTRUCTIONS FOR VENDORS:  For bidding, Vendor shall mark with an "X" the Counties that correspond with the pricing on this page. 

Asphalt Preservation and Pavement Markings, Materials, Equipment and Labor by Vendor - by Location per County
ATTACHMENT A (ATT A)  - PRICING PAGES (Revised 2/1/2021)

Extended Description Name/Location of Material Supplier/Source*

R-32 Ton $

R-33 Ton 8.00$                         

R-34 Ton $

R-35 Ton $

R-36 Ton 10.50$                       

R-37 Ton $

R-38 Ton 14.40$                       

R-39 Ton $

R-40 Ton $

R-41 Ton 14.40$                       

R-42 Ton $

R-43 Ton $

R-44 Ton $

R-45 Ton 14.40$                       

R-46 Ton $

R-47 Ton $

R-48 Ton $

R-49 Ton $

R-50 Ton $

R-51 Ton $

R-52 Ton $

R-53 Ton $

R-54 Ton $

R-55 Ton 14.40$                       
Appalachian Aggregates, Mercer Quarry, (Princeton, 

WV)
--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

--------

Appalachian Aggregates, Lewisburg Quarry --------

--------

Appalachian Aggregates, Lewisburg Quarry --------

--------

--------

Appalachian Aggregates, Mill Point Quarry --------

--------

--------

--------

Fairfax Materials Inc., Hours Quarry --------

--------

Martin Marietta, Wadfordsburg Quarry --------

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Tucker County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Tyler County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Upshur County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Monroe County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Morgan County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Nicholas 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Ohio County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Pendleton 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Pleasants 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Wayne County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Webster 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Wetzel County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Wirt County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Wood County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Wyoming 
County

Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Pocahontas 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Preston County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Putnam County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Raleigh County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Randolph 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Ritchie County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Roane County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  Summers 
County
Aggregate Hauling Surcharge:  
Taylor County
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