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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

1 SERPENTINE BELT - PART NO 4593852AB 24.00000 EA 24.110000 578.64
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101503

Commodity Line Comments: Color Black
Effective Length 79.53 in
Material EPDM, Aramid Reinforced
Outside Circumference 80.19 in
Top Width .82 in

Extended Description:
SERPENTINE BELT - PART NO 4593852AB

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 STARTER - PART NO. 56044736AC 12.00000 EA 313.710000 3764.52

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: Design PMGR
Manufacture Mitsubishi
Power Rating 1.4 KW
Rotation Clockwise
Tooth Quantity 10
Voltage 12 VDC

Extended Description:
STARTER - PART NO. 56044736AC

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 ALTERNATOR - PART NO. 4801477AG 12.00000 EA 580.360000 6964.32

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: Carquest Professional alternators are 100% new units that are built to meet or exceed original equipment (O.E.)
specifications. Our new alternators are engineered and built by an IATF/TS 16949 certified supplier that meets the
highest standards achievable

Extended Description:

ALTERNATOR - PART NO. 4801477AG

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 FUEL RAIL - PART NO. 4627355AA 10.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
FUEL RAIL - PART NO. 4627355AA
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

5 GRILLE ASSEMBLY - PART NO. 15.00000 EA
68091526AA

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
GRILLE ASSEMBLY - PART NO. 68091526AA

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 TRANSMISSION MODULE - PART NO. 8.00000 EA
68227783AA

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
TRANSMISSION MODULE - PART NO. 68227783AA

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 EXHAUST MANIFOLD - PART NO. 10.00000 EA 561.030000 5610.30
68066674AC
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101503

Commodity Line Comments: This catalytic converter with integrated exhaust manifold - a.k.a. manifold converter - is precision-engineered to

match the original equipment on specific vehicle years, makes and models for a reliable replacement.
Convenient kit - includes gaskets and downpipe hardware to simplify installation

Extended Description:
EXHAUST MANIFOLD - PART NO. 68066674AC

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

8 TAIL LAMP - PART NO. 55277415AF 8.00000 EA

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
TAIL LAMP - PART NO. 55277415AF

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 HEAD LAMP - PART NO 68096439AJ 8.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
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Extended Description:
HEAD LAMP - PART NO 68096439AJ

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 SENSOR CRANK - PART NO 56044180AC 10.00000 EA 19.190000 191.90

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: Color Black
Connector Gender Female
Connector Quantity 1
Connector Shape Rectangle
Mounting Bracket Included No
Mounting Hole Quantity 1
Sensor Body Diameter 0.87 Inch
Terminal Gender Male
Terminal Quantity 3
Terminal Type Blade
Wire Quantity O
Wiring Harness Included No
Wiring Harness Length 0 Inch

Extended Description:
SENSOR CRANK - PART NO 56044180AC

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 PLATE, TORQUE - PART NO. 4736253AA 5.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
PLATE, TORQUE - PART NO. 4736253AA

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 CLUTCH FAN - PART NO. 68194962AA 8.00000 EA 89.370000 714.96

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: Out of box installation
Designed, tested, and built by application
Precision machined
OE performance, fit, and appearance

Extended Description:
CLUTCH FAN - PART NO. 68194962AA

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 WATER PUMP - PART NO 5149077AB 12.00000 EA 27.990000 335.88

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503
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Commodity Line Comments: Approved materials for increased durability in even the most extreme temperatures. All MotoRad Coolant
Temperature Sensors are designed to meet or exceed OEM specifications at our ISO TS16949 manufacturing

facilities.
Extended Description:
WATER PUMP - PART NO 5149077AB

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 OIL COOLER - PART NO. 68015126AA 6.00000 EA 501.830000 3010.98
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25101503

Commodity Line Comments: Core Charge Applicable No
Core Material Aluminum
Core Row Quantity 7
Depth 3.7
Inlet Diameter 0.6 in

Iltem Grade Standard Replacement

Length 2 in

Mounting Hardware Included No
Outlet Diameter 0.6 in

Width 6.5 in

Extended Description:
OIL COOLER - PART NO. 68015126AA

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 CONVERTER, CATALYTIC - PART NO. 6.00000 EA
68371837AA
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
25101503
Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
CONVERTER, CATALYTIC - PART NO. 68371837AA
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40. PREFERENCE FOR USE OF DOMESTIC STEEL PRODUCTS: Except when
authorized by the Director of the Purchasing Division pursuant to W. Va. Code § 5A-3-56, no
contractor may use or supply steel products for a State Contract Project other than those steel
products made in the United States. A contractor who uses steel products in violation of this
section may be subject to civil penalties pursuant to W. Va. Code § 5A-3-56. As used in this
section:

a. “State Contract Project” means any erection or construction of, or any addition to, alteration of
or other improvement to any building or structure, including, but not limited to, roads or
highways, or the installation of any heating or cooling or ventilating plants or other equipment,
or the supply of and materials for such projects, pursuant to a contract with the State of West
Virginia for which bids were solicited on or after June 6, 2001.

b. “Steel Products” means products rolled, formed, shaped, drawn, extruded, forged, cast,
fabricated or otherwise similarly processed, or processed by a combination of two or more or
such operations, from steel made by the open heath, basic oxygen, electric furnace, Bessemer or
other steel making process. The Purchasing Division Director may, in writing, authorize the use
of foreign steel products if:

c. The cost for each contract item used does not exceed one tenth of one percent (.1%) of the
total contract cost or two thousand five hundred dollars ($2,500.00), whichever is greater. For the
purposes of this section, the cost is the value of the steel product as delivered to the project; or

d. The Director of the Purchasing Division determines that specified steel materials are not
produced in the United States in sufficient quantity or otherwise are not reasonably available to
meet contract requirements.

41. PREFERENCE FOR USE OF DOMESTIC ALUMINUM, GLASS, AND STEEL: In
Accordance with W. Va. Code § 5-19-1 et seq., and W. Va. CSR § 148-10-1 et seq., for every
contract or subcontract, subject to the limitations contained herein, for the constructio

Revised 8/24/2023



item is a single unit of equipment or machinery manufactured primarily of aluminum, glass

or steel, is part of a public works contract and has the sole purpose or of being a permanent part
of a single public works project. This provision does not apply to equipment or machinery
purchased by a spending unit for use by that spending unit and not as part of a single public
works project.

All bids and offers including domestic aluminum, glass or steel products that exceed bid or offer
prices including foreign aluminum, glass or steel products after application of the preferences
provided in this provision may be reduced to a price equal to or lower than the lowest bid or
offer price for foreign aluminum, glass or steel products plus the applicable preference. If the
reduced bid or offer prices are made in writing and supersede the prior bid or offer prices, all
bids or offers, including the reduced bid or offer prices, will be reevaluated in accordance with
this rule.

42. PROHIBITION AGAINST USED OR REFURBISHED: Unless expressly permitted
in the solicitation published by the State, Vendor must provide new, unused commodities, and
is prohibited from supplying used or refurbished commodities, in fulfilling its responsibilities
under this Contract.

43. VOID CONTRACT CLAUSES - This Contract is subject to the provisions of West

Virginia Code § 5A-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract clauses that violate State
law.
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DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract.

Todd Sanders, SVP Professional Sales, Strategic Accounts
(Printed Name and Title)
4200 Six Forks Road, Raleigh, NC 27609
(Address)
919-909-6348 919-301-4079
(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
government(@advance-auto.com

(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that [ am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that I am
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto on Vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By signing below, I further certify that I understand this Contract is subject to the
provisions of West Virginia Code § 54-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law.

Advance Stores Company, Incorporated dba Advance Auto Parts
(Company)
ML

Todd Sanders (Feb 20, 2024 09:48 EST)

(Signature of Authorized Representative)

Todd Sanders, SVP Professional Sales, Strategic Accounts
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

Feb 20,2024
(Date)

919-909-6348/919-301-4079
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 8/24/2023




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

SPECIFICATIONS

1. PURPOSE AND SCOPE: The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on
behalf of West Virginia Department of Transportation to establish a contract for Chrysler
OEM or Equal Parts. The Contract awarded from this Solicitation shall cover Eligible
Items from Vendor’s Catalog.

2. DEFINITIONS: The terms listed below shall have the meanings assigned to them
below. Additional definitions can be found in section 2 of the General Terms and
Conditions.

2.1 “Adjusted Unit Price” means the unit price either reduced by the discount
percentage or increased by the markup percentage.

2.2 “Attachment” or “Attachments” means any device that is not integrated to the
original manufactures design that modifies or expands the range of tasks that can

be done by the equipment or motor vehicle.

2.3 “Catalog” means the price list or sales catalog that includes all items that Vendor can
and will sell under this Contract.

2.4 “Catalog Unit Price” means the lowest price listed for a contract item in Vendors
current catalog.

2.5 “Contract Item” or “Contract Items” means the list of items identified in Section
3.1 below and on the Pricing Pages.

2.6 “Discount Percentage” means the percentage discount that Vendor will apply to all
Agency purchases of Eligible Items in a given product category

2.7 “OEM” or “Original Equipment Manufacturer” means the manufacturer or
manufacturers involved in the original assembly.

2.8 “Or Equal” means Contract [tem or Contract [tems must meet or exceed the original
Equipment Manufacturers (OEM) standards in form, fit and function.

2.9 “Markup Percentage” means the percentage markup that Vendor will apply to all
Agency purchases of Contract Item or Contract Item.

2.10 “Part or Parts” means any system, part, or component of equipment or motor
vehicle as originally manufactured; or any similar part or component manufactured
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

or sold for replacement or improvement of a system, part or component, or as an
accessory to equipment or motor vehicle.

2.11 “Pricing Pages” means the schedule of prices, estimated order quantity, and totals
contained in WVOasis or attached hereto as Exhibit A, and used to evaluate the
Solicitation responses.

2.12 “Solicitation” means the official notice of an opportunity to supply the state
with goods or serviced that is published by the Purchasing division.

2.13 “Total Bid Cost” means the sum of the bid total column on the Pricing Pages shown
below the bid total column and identified as the total bid cost.

2.14 “Unit” means the smallest measurable amount of an Eligible Item and is identified
on the Pricing Pages in the Unit column. The Unit will only be utilized for bid
evaluation purposes.

2.15 “Unit Price” means the price of an individual unit of an Eligible Item as shown on
the Pricing Pages.

2.16 “Units Provided for Catalog Price” means the total number of units of an Eligible
Item contained in the package advertised for sale in Vendor’s Catalog that
corresponds with the Catalog Price. (Ex. A box of 200 nuts advertised in vendor’s
catalog for $4.00 has a Units Provided for Catalog Price of 200. A crate of nuts
advertised in Vendor’s catalog for $400.00, each containing 100 boxes with 200 nuts
per box, yields a Units Provided for Catalog Price of 20,000.)

3. GENERAL REQUIREMENTS:

3.1 Mandatory Eligible Item Requirements: Eligible [tems must meet or
exceed the mandatory requirements listed below.

3.1.1 Eligible Items must be Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts.

3.1.2 Eligible Items must be compatible with Chrysler manufactured
motor vehicles and models.

3.1.3 Vendor must bid straight Chrysler “OEM” product line or straight
“or equal” product line.
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

3.1.3.1 Vendor may submit multiple bids so long as the two
product lines are not represented in a single bid.

3.1.4 If bidding an “or equal” product line, vendor should provide
written certification from the manufacturer with bid, and will
be required prior to award, that product line is completely
compatible and interchangeable in form, fit and function with
“OEM” product line.

3.1.5 Ifbidding an “or Equal” product line with non “OEM” part
numbers, Vendor must provide a complete written cross
reference of their product line numbers as they coincide with
the “OEM” contract item.

3.1.6 If bidding an “or Equal” product line, the Vendor must be able
to a contract item for each “OEM” contract item.

3.1.7 [If bidding an “or Equal” product line, the Vendor must be able
to supply product warranty comparable with “OEM” product
line warranty.

3.1.8 Vendor shall furnish any consulting services which might be
needed in the proper installation of these parts at no additional
cost the West Virginia Division of Highways

3.1.9 Concurrently with each shipment, vendor shall forward a
proper and current material safety data sheet (“MSDS”) on
hazardous materials only, to the West Virginia Division of
Highways, Equipment Division, PO Box 610, Buckhannon,
West Virginia 26201.

3.2 This contract shall exclude the purchase of any “Attachment or
Attachments” that may be listed within the manufacturer's catalog.

3.3 Vendor will assume all responsibility of core exchanges associated with

contract items in a fair and reasonable amount of time. Failure to abide by
terms may lead to cancellation of this contract.

Revised 10/27/2014



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

4. CONTRACT AWARD, PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT, CATALOG:

4.1 Contract Award: This Contract is intended to provide the Agency with a
discounted price on all Eligible Items. The Contract shall be awarded to the
Vendor that meets the Solicitation specifications and provides the lowest
Total Bid Cost for the Eligible Items listed on the Pricing Pages.
Notwithstanding the foregoing, the Purchasing Division reserves the right to
award this Contract to multiple Vendors if it deems such action necessary.

4.2 Discount Percentage: Vendor shall quote a single Discount Percentage that
will reduce the lowest price shown in the Catalog for every Eligible Item. The
resulting Discounted Price shall be the price Agencies pay for purchases of
that Eligible Item under this Contract.

Vendor shall not incorporate Discount Percentages into its Catalog unless the
Vendor clearly shows the Catalog Price and then separately lists the
applicable Discount Percentage and the Discounted Price for each Eligible
Item.

The Discount Percentage and subsequent Discounted Price derived from that
discount must take into account any and all fees, charges, or other
miscellaneous costs that Vendor may require, including delivery charges as
indicated below, because those fees, charges, or other miscellaneous costs
will not be paid separately. The Agency shall only pay the appropriate
Discounted Unit Price for items purchased under this Contract.

4.3 Pricing Pages: Vendor should complete the Pricing Pages by filling in any
blank spaces with the information requested. The information requested on
the Pricing Pages for each frequently purchased Eligible Item includes the
Vendor’s Eligible Item manufacturer, the manufacturer’s number for each
Eligible Item, Catalog Prices, Units Provided for Catalog Price, Unit Prices,
Discount Percentage, Discounted Unit Prices, and item total costs. The
Vendor should also include the Total Bid Cost. Vendor should complete all
columns as failure to complete the Pricing Pages in their entirety may result
in Vendor’s bid being disqualified.

The Pricing Pages contain a list of frequently purchased items and estimated
unit quantity that will be purchased. The estimated unit quantity for each item
represents the approximate volume of anticipated purchases only. No future
use of the Contract or any individual item is guaranteed or implied.

Vendors are strongly encouraged to complete the Pricing Pages through
wvVOASIS or electronically in Microsoft Excel. Doing so will reduce the
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

number of, and the possibility for, calculation errors. The Pricing Pages were
created as a Microsoft Excel document and Vendor can request an electronic
copy for bid purposes by sending an email request to the following address:
Kristy.e.james@wv.gov.

The Purchasing Division reserves the right to take Vendor’s Pricing Pages
and insert the appropriate numbers into the Microsoft Excel spreadsheet if
Vendor chooses to complete the Pricing Pages in any other way.

5. Catalog:

5.1 Submission. Vendor must submit its Catalog prior to award of this Contract
for evaluation purposes. Vendor shall also mail the Catalog free of charge to
any Agency desiring to use this Contract if the Catalog is not electronically
entered into WVOASIS. Vendor may be required to input its Catalog data
into wvOASIS utilizing the format required by wvOASIS. Copies of the
Catalog may also be requested in an electronic format. Vendor’s Catalog, or
data from the Catalog entered into wvOASIS will be used by Agencies to
order Eligible Items under this Contract.

Vendor should identify all items listed on the Pricing Pages by circling or
highlighting those items in its Catalog and earmarking, tabbing, or listing the
pages for those items, to assist in the evaluation and verification of the bids
and pricing. If any discrepancies exist between the Pricing Pages and the
actual price listed in the Catalog, the actual price shall prevail and the Pricing
Pages may be corrected by the Purchasing Division buyer for evaluation
purposes.

5.2 Catalog Modification. The Purchasing Division may permit Vendor to
update its Catalog at each renewal date. Determination of whether or not to
allow a Catalog update is at the sole discretion of the Purchasing Division.
Any request by Vendor to update its Catalog must include a detailed listing
of the following: (1) any Eligible Items being removed, Discounted Unit
Prices for those items, Agencies quantity usage of those items, and total spent
by Agencies on those items; (2) any Eligible Items being added to the Catalog
and the Discounted Unit Price of those items; (3) all changes in the
Discounted Unit Price to Eligible Items, estimated usage relating to items that
have changed in price, and the total impact of the price change on the State;
and (4) justification for updating its Catalog. The Purchasing Division may
waive the detailed listing requirement if it finds that doing so is in the best
interest of the State. Unless an updated catalog is approved, the Eligible [tems
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

available under this Contract and prices for those items shall remain
unchanged during the term of this Contract.

In the event that multiple vendors are awarded a contract under the
Solicitation, the first priority vendor shall not be permitted to include in its
updated Catalog items being sold by a vendor that is lower in ordering priority
without the consent of that lower priority vendor.

6. ORDERING AND PAYMENT:

6.1 Ordering: Vendor shall accept orders through wvOASIS, regular mail, facsimile, e-
mail, or any other written forms of communication. Vendor may, but is not required
to, accept on-line orders through a secure internet ordering portal/website. If Vendor
has the ability to accept on-line orders, it should include in its response a brief
description of how Agencies may utilize the on-line ordering system. Any on-line
ordering system must have the capability to restrict prices and available items to
conform to the Catalog originally submitted with this Solicitation. Vendor shall
ensure that its on-line ordering system is properly secured prior to processing Agency
orders on-line.

Vendor shall provide the Purchasing Division with access to its internet ordering
portal/website, if one will be used under this Contract, to allow the Purchasing
Division to ensure that the requirements of this Contract are being met.

Vendor shall also give quotes to Agency when they are requested. Quotes must be
received within 24 hours of request from Agency. If there is a reason a quote can not
be given in that time frame, Agency must be informed ASAP in writing. If a quote is
not obtained within this timeframe and no communication is received from Vendor,
Agency will have the ability to go elsewhere for the required parts. A quote shall not
be considered an order. No parts can be delivered to Agency based on a quote request
only. An official order must be placed by the Agency. If parts are received by Agency
when only a quote is requested, Agency has the right to return parts to Vendor for a
full refund.

6.2 Invoicing and Payment: Vendor shall indicate the discount received on each
invoice submitted for payment. Vendor shall accept payment in accordance with the
payment procedures of the State of West Virginia. Methods of acceptable payment
must include the West Virginia Purchasing Card. Payment in advance is not
permitted under this Contract.
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

7. DELIVERY AND RETURN:

7.1 Delivery Time and Place: Vendor shall deliver standard orders within five
(5) working days after orders are received. Vendor shall deliver emergency
orders within one (1) working day after orders are received. Vendor shall
ship all orders in accordance with the above schedule and shall not hold
orders until a minimum delivery quantity is met. Vendor must provide an
ETA when an order or quote is placed by the Agency. If one cannot be given
for an unacceptable reason, the Agency has the ability to order from another
vendor for time sensitive items. Eligible Items must be delivered to ordering
Agency attached hereto as exhibit b.

7.2 Late Delivery: The Agency placing the order under this Contract must be
notified in writing if orders will be delayed for any reason. Any delay in
delivery that could cause harm to an Agency will be grounds for cancellation
of the delayed order, and/or obtaining the items ordered from a third party.

7.3 Delivery Payment/Risk of Loss: Standard order delivery shall be F.O.B.
destination to the Agency’s location. Vendor shall include the cost of
standard order delivery charges in its bid pricing/discount and is not permitted
to charge the Agency separately for such delivery. The Agency will pay
delivery charges on all emergency orders provided that Vendor invoices those
delivery costs as a separate charge with the original freight bill attached to the
invoice.

7.4 Return of Unacceptable Items: Items that Agency deems unacceptable
shall be returned to Vendor at Vendor’s expense and with no restocking
charge. Vendor shall either make arrangements for the return within five (5)
days of being notified that items are unacceptable, or permit the Agency to
arrange for the return and reimburse Agency for delivery expenses. If the
original packaging cannot be utilized for the return, Vendor will supply the
Agency with appropriate return packaging upon request. All returns of
unacceptable items shall be F.O.B. the Agency’s location. The returned
product shall either be replaced, or the Agency shall receive a full credit or
refund for the purchase price, at the Agency’s discretion.
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

7.5 Return Due to Agency Error: Items ordered in error by the Agency will be
returned for credit within 30 days of receipt, F.O.B. Vendor’s location.
Vendor shall not charge a restocking fee if returned products are in a resalable
condition. Items shall be deemed to be in a resalable condition if they are
unused and in the original packaging. Any restocking fee for items not in a
resalable condition shall be the lower of the Vendor’s customary restocking
fee or 5% of the total invoiced value of the returned items.

8. VENDOR DEFAULT:
8.1 The following shall be considered a vendor default under this Contract.

8.1.1 Failure to provide Eligible Items in accordance with the requirements
contained herein.

8.1.2 Failure to comply with other specifications and requirements contained
herein.

8.1.3 Failure to comply with any laws, rules, and ordinances applicable to the
Contract Services provided under this Contract.

8.1.4 Failure to remedy deficient performance upon request.

8.2 The following remedies shall be available to Agency upon default.
8.2.1 Immediate cancellation of the Contract.

8.2.2 Immediate cancellation of one or more release orders issued under this
Contract.

8.2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity.

9. MISCELLANEOUS:

9.1 No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Eligible Items contained in its Catalog
submitted in response to the Solicitation or an updated Catalog approved by the
Purchasing Division as described above. Vendor shall not supply substitute items.
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts

9.2 Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Eligible Items being
offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its bid, Vendor
certifies that it can supply the Eligible Items contained in its bid response.

9.3 Reports: Vendor shall provide quarterly reports and annual summaries to the
Agency showing the Agency’s items purchased, quantities of items purchased, and
total dollar value of the items purchased. Vendor shall also provide reports, upon
request, showing the items purchased during the term of this Contract, the quantity
purchased for each of those items, and the total value of purchases for each of those
items. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for cancellation of this
Contract.

9.4 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must designate
and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing Vendor’s
responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract manager must be available during
normal business hours to address any customer service or other issues related to this
Contract. Vendor should list its Contract manager and his or her contact information
below.

Contract Manager: _Debra Carey
Telephone Number: 919-909-6348

Fax Number: 919-301-4079

Email Address: debra.carey@advance-auto.com
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Form w 9

(Rev. October 2018)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

» Go to www.irs.gov/FormW9 for instructions and the latest information.

Give Form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Advance Stores Company, Incorporated

1 Name (as shown on your income tax return). Name is required on this line; do not leave this line blank.

2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above

Advance Auto Parts

following seven boxes.

D Individual/sole proprietor or C Corporation

single-member LLC

Print or type.

|:| Other (see instructions) ™

D S Corporation

|:| Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C corporation, S=S corporation, P=Partnership) »

Note: Check the appropriate box in the line above for the tax classification of the single-member owner. Do not check | Exemption from FATCA reporting
LLC if the LLC is classified as a single-member LLC that is disregarded from the owner unless the owner of the LLC is
another LLC that is not disregarded from the owner for U.S. federal tax purposes. Otherwise, a single-member LLC that
is disregarded from the owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner.

3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification of the person whose name is entered on line 1. Check only one of the | 4 Exemptions (codes apply only to

certain entities, not individuals; see
instructions on page 3):
D Partnership D Trust/estate

Exempt payee code (if any)

code (if any)

(Applies to accounts maintained outside the U.S.)

5 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.) See instructions.

4200 Six Forks Rd

See Specific Instructions on page 3.

Requester’s name and address (optional)

6 City, state, and ZIP code
Raleigh, NC 27609

7 List account number(s) here (optional)

Taxpayer ldentification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other - -
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to get a

TIN, later.

Note: If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. Also see What Name and
Number To Give the Requester for guidelines on whose number to enter.

Social security number

or
| Employer identification number |

5/4|-|0|1]1]8]1]1]0

I  Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and
2. 1 am not subject to backup withholding because: (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) I have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and
3. 1am a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding because
you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage interest paid,
acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and generally, payments
other than interest and dividends, you are not required to sign the certification, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the instructions for Part I, later.

Sign Signature of
Here U.S. person »

N Jh

Date>  1/1/2024

General Instructions

Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise
noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments
related to Form W-9 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go to www.irs.gov/FormW8.

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer
identification number (TIN) which may be your social security number
(SSN), individual taxpayer identification number (ITIN), adoption
taxpayer identification number (ATIN), or employer identification number
(EIN), to report on an information return the amount paid to you, or other
amount reportable on an information return. Examples of information
returns include, but are not limited to, the following.

e Form 1099-INT (interest earned or paid)

* Form 1099-DIV (dividends, including those from stocks or mutual
funds)

® Form 1099-MISC (various types of income, prizes, awards, or gross
proceeds)

® Form 1099-B (stock or mutual fund sales and certain other
transactions by brokers)

* Form 1099-S (proceeds from real estate transactions)
® Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party network transactions)

¢ Form 1098 (home mortgage interest), 1098-E (student loan interest),
1098-T (tuition)

* Form 1099-C (canceled debt)
¢ Form 1099-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person (including a resident
alien), to provide your correct TIN.
If you do not return Form W-9 to the requester with a TIN, you might

be subject to backup withholding. See What is backup withholding,
later.

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W=9 (Rev. 10-2018)



Deviations from Specifications

Catalog & Pricing

Discounts remain static. Pricing is held firm from July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024.

Pricing, availability, product information and warranty are provided through Advance's online catalog,
www.advancepro.com.

Please email omnia@advance-auto.com or debra.carey@advance-auto.com for login information.

Federal Provisions

All contract provisions for contracts under federal awards shall be self-deleting. Buyer further agrees that they
shall not purchase products from vendor utilizing any federal awards.

WORLDPAC s @if AUTO PARTS



http://www.advancepro.com/
mailto:omnia@advance-auto.com
mailto:debra.carey@advance-auto.com

Advance Auto Parts Limited Warranty Policy

General Limited Warranty Period and Applicability

The warranty period is 90 days from your date of purchase or any longer warranty period that may be
printed on your original sales receipt. During the warranty period, we will replace or refund, at our option,
any new part that fails due to a defect in materials or workmanship under normal use and service after
proper installation. Simply return the part along with your original sales receipt to any Advance Auto
Parts store. You must be the original purchaser of the part and still own the vehicle on which it was
installed. This warranty is not transferrable. Replacement parts are warranted for 90 days from the date
of exchange or the remainder of the warranty period on the original part, whichever is longer.

Refunds will only be considered if you bring the defective part to an Advance Auto Parts store along with
your original sales receipt within 45 days from the original date of purchase. Refunds will be issued in
accordance with our Refund Policy.

Battery Limited Warranty

The battery Free Replacement Period begins the day of purchase and expires at the end of the Free
Replacement Period that is printed on your original sales receipt. This period does not renew when the
battery is replaced during the Free Replacement Period. If the battery is found defective after the Free
Replacement Period but prior to the end of the warranty period, a prorated credit will be issued that can
be applied toward the purchase of a new battery. The prorated credit will be determined by dividing the
original purchase price by the number of months of the warranty period, then multiplying the result by the
months remaining in the warranty period. Partial months are rounded to the nearest whole month.
Installation or use of an automotive battery in any other type of vehicle or equipment voids your warranty.

What is Not Covered

e Failure due to: accident or collision; misuse, abuse or modification; chemical fallout; salt, hail, or
other environmental conditions including natural disasters; marine use; improper installation;
installation of an incorrect part; and damages caused by other faulty parts.

Parts under manufacturer's recall for a related problem.
Parts installed on vehicles used off-road or for racing purposes.
Parts installed on a commercial-use vehicle after 90 days (see below).
Normal wear and tear.
e Used or salvage parts.

Commercial Use Vehicles
Parts installed on commercial-use vehicles are warranted for 90 days from the date of purchase only,
regardless of any longer warranty period that may be printed on your sales receipt.

Part-Specific Requirements
Certain parts must meet specific installation requirements. Failure to provide proof that these
requirements have been met will void your warranty.

e A/C Compressors. Flushingis required. Must also install a new receiver dryer/accumulator,
orifice tube or expansion valve (as applicable).

e Clutch/Clutch Kits. The clutch/clutch kit must be installed according to the manufacturer’s
instructions, including installation of a new pilot bearing and resurfacing of the flywheel. Clutches
contaminated by oil and grease are not eligible for warranty replacement/refund.

e Crankshafts. The installer must validate that the crankshaft OE number matches and there is no
visible damage to the unit prior to installation. Warranty is limited to replacement of the
crankshaft and bearings prior to installation. Warranted crankshafts that are returned must
include the bearings supplied with the unit.

e Fuel Pumps. Replacement of pump strainer (for in-tank electric pumps) and inline fuel filter at
time of repair is required. Must also drain and clean fuel tanks.

Adyaﬂce/.:’: ; @ AUTOPART  WORLDPAC " iEngs @I{ AUTO PARTS
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Online Purchases

Your local Advance Auto Parts store can assist with all warranty matters for online purchases. If you do
not have a store location near you, please contact 1-877-ADVANCE (238-2623) for warranty assistance.
Your online order confirmation is required to validate your proof of purchase for warranty coverage.

Additional Important Information

THIS LIMITED WARRANTY DOES NOT COVER LABOR COSTS OR INCIDENTAL, INDIRECT,
SPECIAL OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES SUCH AS, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, PHYSICAL INJURIES
OR PROPERTY DAMAGE, LOSS OF TIME, LOSS OF USE OF THE VEHICLE, INCONVENIENCE,
RENTAL VEHICLE CHARGES, TOWING CHARGES OR ACCOMMODATIONS RESULTING FROM A
DEFECT IN OR FAILURE OF THE PART.

This limited warranty represents the exclusive remedy for any product defect or failure and the total
liability of Advance Auto Parts and its subsidiaries and affiliates (“Advance”) for any part it warrants.
ADVANCE MAKES NO OTHER WARRANTIES, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, INCLUDING ANY
WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, CONDITION OF ANY KIND OR FITNESS FOR A
PARTICULAR PURPOSE. Some states do not allow disclaimers of implied warranties. Therefore all
implied warranties that may apply to your part are limited to the duration of this written warranty. Some
states also do not allow limitations on how long an implied warranty lasts or the exclusion or limitation of
incidental, special or consequential damages, so the above information may not apply to you. This
warranty gives you specific rights, and you may have other rights which vary from state to state. Advance
does not authorize any person to vary the terms, conditions or exclusions of this warranty. If any provision
of the warranty should become invalid or unenforceable because of any laws, the remaining terms and
provisions of the warranty shall remain in full force and effect. To the extent allowed under local law, the
remedies provided in this Limited Warranty Policy are the customer’s sole and exclusive remedies.
Advance Stores Company, Incorporated, P.O. Box 2710, Roanoke VA. 24001. Visit us on the web at
www.advanceautoparts.com.
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Exhibit A

VENDOR: _Advance Stores Company, Inc.

Chrysler OEM or Equal Parts - Pricing Page - 05241034

Discount Percentage**

Markup Percentage** 0.00%

-50.00% (Please enter as a negative. Example discount of 5% should be -5.0%)

Item | Chrysler OEM Part "Or Equal” Parts Estimatec? Unit Unit (for calculation Catalog Unit Price Units PrOVidP?d for Catalog | **Discount/Markup** Adjusted Unit Price Item Total Cost
No. number Quantity purposes) Price Percentage
Part No. Part No.
4593852AB Dayco 5060795
1 Serpentine Belt 24 EACH 48.22 1.00 -50.00% 2411 $578.64
Description: Description:
Serpentine Belt
Part No. Part No.
56044736AC Carquest 72-17948N
2 Starter 12 EACH 627.42 1.00 -50.00% 313.71 $3,764.52
Description: Description:
Starter
Part No. Part No.
4801477AG Carquest 11228AN
3 Alternator 12 EACH 1,160.72 1.00 -50.00% 580.36 $6,964.32
Description: Description:
Alternator
Part No. Part No.
4627355AA No Bid
4 10 EACH - 1.00 -50.00% - $0.00
Description: Description:
Fuel Rail
Part No. Part No.
68091526AA No Bid
5 15 EACH - 1.00 -50.00% - $0.00
Description: Description:
Grille Assembly
Part No. Part No.
68227783AA No Bid
6 8 EACH - 1.00 -50.00% - $0.00
Description: Description:
Transmisson module
Part No.
68066674AC Dorman 674-871
7 Exhaust Manifold 10 EACH 1,122.06 1.00 -50.00% 561.03 $5,610.30
Description: Description:
Exhaust manifold
Part No. Part No.
55277415AF No Bid
8 8 EACH - 1.00 -50.00% - $0.00
Description: Description:
Tail Lamp

Pagel of 2



Exhibit A

Item | Chrysler OEM Part "Or Equal” Parts Estimatec? Unit Unit (for calculation Catalog Unit Price Units Providejd for Catalog | **Discount/Markup** Adjusted Unit Price tem Total Cost
No. number Quantity purposes) Price Percentage
Part No. Part No.
68096439A) No Bid
9 8 EACH $ 1.00 -50.00% $0.00
Description: Description:
Head lamp
Part No. Part No.
56044180AC Carquest CSC1062
10 Sensor Crank 10 EACH S 1.00 -50.00% 19.19 $191.90
Description: Description:
Sensor Crank
Part No. Part No.
4736253AA No Bid
11 5 EACH $ 1.00 -50.00% $0.00
Description: Description:
Plate, Torque
Part No. Part No.
68194962AA Carquest 216091
12 Fan Clutch 8 EACH S 1.00 -50.00% 89.37 $714.96
Description: Description:
Clutch Fan
Part No. Part No.
5149077AB Carquest WTC1003
13 Temp Sensor 12 EACH S 1.00 -50.00% 27.99 $335.88
Description: Description:
Water Pump
Part No. Part No.
68015126AA Dorman 918-335
14 Qil Cooler 6 EACH S 1.00 -50.00% 501.83 $3,010.98
Description: Description:
0il Cooler
Part No. Part No.
68371837AA No Bid
15 6 EACH S 1.00 -50.00% $0.00
Description: Description:
Converter, Catalytic
Total Bid Cost — $21,171.50

CONTRACT MANAGER:

TELEPHONE NUMBER:

FAX NUMBER:

E-MAIL ADDRESS:

Debra Carey

919-909-6348

919-301-4079

debra.carey@advance-auto.com
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