o

,gf{’(i?’i:’??% Deparll'tm‘ent of Administration State of West Virginia
- Purchasing Division [N
2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder: 1436225

Solicitation Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2024-06-26 10:30 SR 0803 ESR06252400000008053 1
VENDOR
000000100174

APPALACHIAN AGGREGATES LLC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000099
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2024-06-25
Comments:

Response Time: 15:05:33

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859

dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024 Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class 1 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class 2 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

5 Class 2 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024 Page: 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

6 Class 2 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Class 10 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024 Page: 3

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024

Page: 4

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024 Page: 5

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024

Page: 6 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Stone for Gabions -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Stone for Gabions -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Fine Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024

Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Steel Slag for SRIC 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Only

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024

Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Cinders 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Pea Gravel -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 #11 Limestone Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024

Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Quarry Waste -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 Rip Rap -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Shot Rock -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Shot Rock -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Imbricated Stone -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments: Do not produce
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024 Page: 10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-41) 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00
1-41)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00
42-45)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 1, 2024 Page: 11 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Highways
Proc Folder: 1436225 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations Addendum 1
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2024-06-12 2024-06-25 14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000099 2

PROCUREMENT DIVISION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: JO0 00001716 /7Y

Vendor Name : Af"f'“’ la c/l;ap 7455 res oTes

Address: 2/ 7 (

Street : M—af lar ol Tea: l w

City: Lew.s éurj

State : W(/ Country: (/ S Zip: 2490 (
Principal Contact : %Nd(7 d/av’f;\(s ef"/ﬂdt»g fa,f/'?tpr'éuf‘/

Vendor Contact Phone: 2¢) (- §92- § & /2 Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

g?g“:a‘i:lrex M %‘ FEIN# D/~ 40503 paTE (o 2F-2.Y

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jun 12, 2024 Page 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




L ADDITIONAL INFORMATION e a e = |

ADDENDUM 1 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. Attachment of the responses to questions.
2. Modify bid opening date.
NO OTHER CHANGES

||NMG!_.GE TO : : Sme e e o .;JS.SHI-F'_;TQ..;*}.- e e e = —l
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City Wv No City WV

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INvOIcETO e T e e e
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV No City wv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: Jun 12, 2024 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1436225 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations Addendum 2
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

2024-06-14 2024-06-26  10:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000099 3

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

PROCUREMENT DIVISION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :
Address :

Street :

City :

State :

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone:

Country :

Extension:

Zip :

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X

FEIN# § /-G 405 O3

pate (-21-2 Y

All offers subject to 2l term'S and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jun 14, 2024

Page 1

FORM ID: WVY-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ADDENDUM 2 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. Modifying the Bid opening to 6/26/24 at 10:30AM

*tttntwwm\-w-lma-kw********w*******Please Note that thIS ARFQ DOT2400000099***********ﬁ*****************

If mailing or hand delivering bids this needs to be delivered to
e WVYDOT-DOH - Procurement Division - Building 6 == Room 34 xssissisisisiiio

1900 Kanawha Blvd E, Charleston, WV 25305
NO OTHER CHANGES

lINVOICE TO

|SHIP TO : E
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY
LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER

AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV No City Wv
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
[INvOICE TO |sHPTO =
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY
LOCATIONS LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City Wwv No City Wwv
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: Jun 14, 2024 Page 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

Proc Folder: 1436225 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations Addendum 1

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2024-06-12 2024-06-25 14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000099 2
BIDRECEIVINGLOCATION = ———— = ===
PROCUREMENT DIVISION

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us
VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :

Address :

Street :

City :

State : Country : Zip :

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor

|Signature X dv\,l‘/ éé,r__ FEIN# Ol 46503

paTE &2l 2 Y

All offers subject to 4l terms ad conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jun 12, 2024 Page 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ADDENDUM 1 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:
1. Attachment of the responses to questions.
2. Modify bid opening date.
NO OTHER CHANGES

|INVOICE TO = SNy seeae e e aSaas e
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV No City Y

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price

1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICETO . e e e e s
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City wv No City WV

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 12, 2024 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Highways

Proc Folder: 1436225 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations Addendum 2
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2024-06-14 2024-06-26  10:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000099 3
PROCUREMENT DIVISION

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E

CHARLESTON WV 25305

us
VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :

Address :

Street :

City :

State : Country : Zip:

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov
Vendor ‘ =
Signature X %"4/%/ FEIN# 0/—6‘/05'03 DATE C" 2(‘26{

All offers subject to/all term§ and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jun 14, 2024 Page 1 - FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



ADDITIONAL INFORMATION |

ADDENDUM 2 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. Modifying the Bid opening to 6/26/24 at 10:30AM

Please Note that this ARFQ DOT2400000099****

If mailing or hand delivering bids this needs to be delivered to

e \WWDOT-DOH - Procurement Division - Building 6 -- Room 340%<**

1900 Kanawha Blvd E, Charleston, WV 25305

NO OTHER CHANGES
[INVOICE TO e ; ==
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY
LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER

AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV No City wv
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
INVOICETO SR 5
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY
LOCATIONS LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City Wwv No City Wv
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: Jun 14, 2024

Page 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract.

Andy Clevinger / Sales Manager
(Printed Name and Title)
21071 Midland Trail W, Lewisburg WV 24901

(Address)
304-392-5872 / 304-392-5828

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)

andy.clevinger@appaggwv.com

(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that I am
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto on Vendor’s behalf: that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By signing below. I further certify that I understand this Contract is subject to the
provisions of West Virginia Code § 54-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law.

Appalachian Aggregates
(Company)

Onots 8

(Signature of Authorized Representative)

Andy Clevinger / Sales Manager
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

06/21/24
(Date)

304-392-5872 / 304-392-5828
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 8/24/2023




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Storage Location Address, and bid pricing
for the contract item listed below. Vendor may bid any or all contract items. Failure to provide source information and
storage location information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. This is a multiple vendor award
contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor

per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. Estimated quantities
are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates LLC

Pounding Mill Quarry 121
*Source Location Address(es): Quarry Rd, Pounding Mill , VA 24637

Bluefield Quarry 171
Required St. Clairs Crossing, Bluefield, Va 24605

Mercer Quarry

1111 Blake Hollow Rd., Princeton, WV 27740 24639

*Storage Location Address(es):
*Required (if different from
Source Location address)

CT::::“ Description Composition* I\E_[J:s::l:):e Bid Price

1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $ 11.90
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $ 11.90
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid

4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $ 11.90
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $ 11.90
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid

7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $ 11.90
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $ 16.85
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $ 16.85
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $ 16.85
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $ 16.85
12 |AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid

13  |AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $ 16.90
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 3 16.90
15  |AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons 3 16.90
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $ 17.90
17  |AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons 3 17.90
18 |AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid

19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid

20 |AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $ 18.10
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $ 18.10
22 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons b 18.10
23 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $ 18.10
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $ 18.10
25 |AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons $ 18.10
26 |AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $ 18.10
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $ 18.10

ATT A Page 1 of 2 Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates LLC
Pounding Mill Quarry 121
*Source Location Address(es): Quarry Rd, Pounding Mill , VA 24637
Bluefield Quarry 171
Required St. Clairs Crossing, Bluefield, Va 24605
Mercer Quarry
1111 Blake Hollow Rd., Princeton, WV 27740 24639
*Storage Location Address(es):
*Required (if different from
Source Location address)
Cq;:::ct Description Composition* ;;:;;l:):e Bid Price
28  |Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $ 16.90
29  |Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $ 16.90
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons 3 20.35
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $ 19.25
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $ 19.25
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons no bid
35 |Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $ 19.25
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons 5 19.25
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
38 Cinders Cinders Tons no bhid
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons no bid
40 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $ 12.50
42 |Rip Rap LSGS Tons $ 16.90
43  |Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $ 16.90
44  |Shot Rock LSGS Tons 3 16.90
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid
46 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.20
47 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-41) Mile $1.50
48 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-41) Mile $0.37
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 42-45) Mile $2.00
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile $0.40

*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand.

ATTA Page 2 of 2

Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Storage Location Address, and bid pricing
for the contract item listed below. Vendor may bid any or all contract items. Failure to provide source information and
storage location information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. This is a multiple vendor award
contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor

per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. Estimated quantities
are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

*Source Location Address(es): 21071 Midland Trail W
Required Lewisburg, WV 24901

*Storage Location Address(es):
*Required (if different from
Source Location address)

COI]::::“ Description Composition* DIIJ:::SI:]:e Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $10.70
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $10.70
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $10.70

Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $10.70
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $10.70
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.35
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.35
10 |AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.35
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.35
12  |AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.35
13  |AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.00
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.00
15  |AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.00
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.50
17  |AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.50
18 |AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
20 |AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.50
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.50
22 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $16.50
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $16.50
24  |AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.50
25 |AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.50
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $17.50
27 |AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $17.50
28  |Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $16.00
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $16.00

ATTA Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

*Source Location Address(es):

21071 Midland Trail W

Required Lewisburg, WV 24901

*Storage Location Address(es):

*Required (if different from

Source Location address)

C'}'::::“ Description Composition* l\flll::::t:}:e Bid Price
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons $19.00
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $17.00
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $17.00
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
34  |Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons no bid
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $17.50
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons $17.50
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
38 Cinders Cinders Tons no bid
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons no bid
40  [#11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons $19.50
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $13.00
42  |Rip Rap LSGS Tons $22.00
43  |Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $22.00
44  |Shot Rock LSGS Tons $22.00
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid
46  |Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.20
47 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-41) Mile $1.50
48 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-41) Mile $0.37
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile $2.00
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile $0.40

*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand.

ATTA Page 2 of 2

Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Storage Location Address, and bid pricing
for the contract item listed below. Vendor may bid any or all contract items. Failure to provide source information and
storage location information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. Thisis a multiple vendor award
contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor

per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. Estimated quantities
are not available.

VENDOR NAME:

*Source Location Address(es):

Required

*Storage Location Address(es):
*Required (if different from
Source Location address)

Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

1700 North Sandbranch

Mt. Hope, WV 25880

C‘;]tl:rmad Description Composition* ;;:;::’:e Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $20.00
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid

Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $20.00
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $20.00
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.00
12 |AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $23.50
16 |AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
17  |AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
20 |AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $24.75
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons no bid
23 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $24.75
24  |AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons no bid
27 |AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons no bid
28 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons no bid
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $23.00

ATTA Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
*Source Location Address(es): 1700 North Sandbranch
Required Mt. Hope, WV 25880

*Storage Location Address(es):

*Required (if different from

Source Location address)

C[;]tl::: Ct Description Composition* R;J:;;l?:e Bid Price
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons no bid
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $23.00
34  |Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons no bid
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons no bid
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
38 Cinders Cinders Tons no bid
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons no bid
40 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
41  |Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $18.00
42 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $25.00
43 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons no bid
44 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $25.00
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid
46 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.20
47 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-41) Mile $1.50
48 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-41) Mile $0.37
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 42-45) Mile $2.00
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile $0.40

*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand.

ATT A Page 2 of 2

Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Storage Location Address, and bid pricing
for the contract item listed below. Vendor may bid any or all contract items. Failure to provide source information and
storage location information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. This is a multiple vendor award
contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor
per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. Estimated quantities
are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

*Source Location Address(es): 5908 Chenoweth Creek Rd

Required Elkons, WV 26241
*Storage Location Address(es):
*Required (if different from
Source Location address)
Contract Description Composition* Unitof Bid Price
Item Measure
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.00
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.00
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.00
Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.00
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.00
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.10
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.10
10 |AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.45
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.45
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.00
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.00
14 |AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $15.50
15  |AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $15.50
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
19  |AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
20 |AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.00
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $18.00
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $18.00
23 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $18.00
24  |AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $19.00
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons $19.00
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $19.00
27 |AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $19.00
28  |Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $17.00
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $17.00
ATTA Page 1 of 2 Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

*Source Location Address(es):

5908 Chenoweth Creek Rd

Required Elkons, WV 26241

*Storage Location Address(es):

*Required (if different from

Source Location address)

Co;::::et Description Composition* ;::;:j:‘e Bid Price
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $18.25
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $18.25
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons no bid
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons no bid
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
38 Cinders Cinders Tons no bid
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons no bid
40 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $12.50
42 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $20.50
43 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $20.50
44 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $20.50
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid
46 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.20
47 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-41) Mile $1.50
48 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-41) Mile $0.37
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 42-45) Mile $2.00
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile $0.40

*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand.

ATT A Page 2 of 2

Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Storage Location Address, and bid pricing
for the contract item listed below. Vendor may bid any or all contract items. Failure to provide source information and
storage location information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. This is a multiple vendor award
contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor

per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. Estimated quantities
are not available.

VENDOR NAME:

*Source Location Address(es):

Required

*Storage Location Address(es):
*Required (if different from
Source Location address)

Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

400 Stamping Creek Rd

Hillsboro, WV 24946

C‘;]tlgjct Description Composition* ;::;;l?:e Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.40
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.40
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.40

Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.40
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.40
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.85
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.85
10 |AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.85
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.85
12 |AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.20
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.20
14  |AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.20
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.20
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.50
17  |AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.50
18 |AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
19 |AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
20 [AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $19.20
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $19.20
22 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $19.20
23 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $19.20
24  |AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $20.35
25 |AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons $20.35
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $20.35
27 |AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $20.35
28 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $16.85
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $16.85

ATTA Page 1 of 2 Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC

*Source Location Address(es): 400 Stamping Creek Rd

Required Hillsboro, WV 24946

*Storage Location Address(es):

*Required (if different from

Source Location address)

C(;Itl:: ¥ Description Composition* ﬁ:;:f:e Bid Price
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $19.50
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $19.50
33 |Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
34 |Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons no bid
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $19.85
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons $19.85
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
38 Cinders Cinders Tons no bid
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons no bid
40  |#11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $14.75
42 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $23.50
43 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $23.50
44 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $23.50
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid
46 |Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.20
47 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-41) Mile $1.50
48 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-41) Mile $0.37
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile $2.00
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile $0.40

*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand.

ATTA Page 2 of 2

Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Highways
Proc Folder: 1436225 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations Addendum 1
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2024-06-12 2024-06-25 14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000099 2

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

PROCUREMENT DIVISION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :

Address :

Street :

City :

State : Country : Zip:
Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

\é%n:a:[arex M@/“ FENg O/ -bHDS03 pate 6-2/1-2Y

All offers subject to £l term€and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jun 12, 2024 Page 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



_ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ADDENDUM 1 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:
1. Attachment of the responses to questions.
2. Modify bid opening date.
NO OTHER CHANGES

[INVOICE TO =T e
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City Wv No City Wv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
[INvoICE TO ' = == [SHPTO=—" =
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV No City WV

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 12, 2024 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1436225 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations Addendum 2

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2024-06-14 2024-06-26 10:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000099 3
BID RECEIVING LOCATION e == ==
PROCUREMENT DIVISION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us
VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :

Address :

Street :

City :

State : Country : Zip :

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov
Vendor . =

Signature X ﬂuoé/%_’___.—- Feng O (-G 0SS OF pate G 2/' 2 Lr

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jun 14, 2024 Page 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




__ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ADDENDUM 2 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. Modifying the Bid opening to 6/26/24 at 10:30AM

*Please Note that this ARFQ DOT2400000099%********sxirknumtsmsssionint

If mailing or hand delivering bids this needs to be delivered to
e \WWVDOT-DOH - Procurement Division - Building 6 - Room 340***

1900 Kanawha Blvd E, Charleston, WV 25305

NO OTHER CHANGES
[INVOICE TO = SHiPTOE=
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY
LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV No City Wv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

[INVOICETO ' = =——=sHipro = E
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City AY No City Wwv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: Jun 14, 2024 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05
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ACORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE A

08/05/2023

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER CONIACT  Jennifer Drake
. FAX
Mountain State Insurance Agency PHON’f-o Exty; (304) 720-2000 (AIC, NoJ: (304) 720-2002
1206 Kanawha Blvd. E. ADbREss: idrake@mountainstateinsurance.com
Suite 100 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Charleston WV 25301-2949 | ysurera: SummitPoint Insurance Company 15136
INSURED nsurer B : Argonaut Insurance Company 19860
Appalachian Aggregates LLC INSURER C :
PO Box 927 INSURER D :
INSURER E :
Chilhowie VA 24319 HEURERE:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 23 24 App Agg REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

NSR ADDL[SUBR POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
TR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | wvD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MMIDDIYYYY) LIMITS
COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $
CLAIMS-MADE D OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) §
MED EXP (Any one person) 3
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $
POLICY D s I:I Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OPAGG | §
OTHER: §
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY Ea eae 5
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Par person) | §
OWNED SCHEDULED -
MR s SoHED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE Py
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY {Per accident)
$
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENGE 3
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
DED | | RETENTION § s
WORKERS COMPENSATION >¢| BER OfH- | WV Code 23-4-2
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY LT | S5rure [ X ER T
A [OFFCERMENBES eXoLUDEDY o UTVE |:| NIA WCS3001197 09/01/2023 | 09/01/2024 |E-L. EACHACCIDENT b ol —
(Mandatory In NH) E.L. DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE | 5 1.000.0
If yes, describe under 1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below £L. DIsEASE -PoLicyumT | g 1,000,
Workers C EL Each Accident 1,000,000
ers Compensation :
B | onasit T WC928908361384 09/01/2023 | 09/01/2024 |EL Disease-EA Employee | 1,000,000
EL Disease-Policy Limit 1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS | VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

West Virginia Department of Administration Purchasing Division ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

2108 Washington East
PO Box 50130

Charleston WV 25305 WL_
!

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2016/03) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




