State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1436225 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations Addendum 2
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2024-06-14 2024-06-26  10:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000099 3

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

PROCUREMENT DIVISION

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E

CHARLESTON WV 25305

us
VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: \/§ (JU000 | G823

Vendor Name : ‘Lao‘ﬁu[ qu q"“’“‘] LLC

Address : 7| (] QMW" D(

Street :

city: Movky Gay n

State: |/|A- Country : U { zip: Y4160

Principal Contact : G [ G Lﬂaﬂ/’

Vendor Contact Phone: = L N {ulg ‘ Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vend
S;;nn;i':;re X @@/’/FEIN# k3- 040 4 €

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jun 14, 2024 Page 1

DATE ’ﬁ/)f/)"f}

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NQ.: DOT2400000099

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[v] Addendum No. 1 [ ] Addendum No. 6
[v] Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No. 7
[ 1 Addendum No. 3 [ 1 Addendum No. 8
[ 1 Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No. 9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

['understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. 1
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

“)OULM\ GGP @umdm 4 ! L(

Compan

\) Autfforized Signature
k=302 Y

1

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012




DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract.

Chip Dunstan, Area Sales Manager
(Printed Name and Title)

PO Box 1620, Dublin, VA 24084
(Address)

540-674-5556

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
chip.dunstan@salemstonecorp.com

(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that I am
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto on Vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By signing below, I further certify that I understand this Contract is subject to the
provisions of West Virginia Code § 54-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law.

Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC
(Company)

//

(Signatufe of AuthorizedKepresentative)

Chip Dunstan, Area Sales Manager
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

07/25/2024
(Date)

540-674-5556
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 8/24/2023




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Storage Location Address, and bid pricing
for the contract item listed below. Vendor may bid any or all contract items. Failure to provide source information and
storage location information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. Thisis a multiple vendor award
contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor
per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. Estimated quantities
are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC

707 Quarry Rd
Rocky Gap, VA 24366

*Source Location Address(es):
Required

*Storage Location Address(es):
*Required (if different from
Source Location address)

Cc;::::‘:t Description Composition* I\}ljt:::l:):e Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 16.90
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons  |no bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 16.90
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons  [no bid
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons  [no bid
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 20.50
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |nobid
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
13 |AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |nobid
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 21.05
15 |AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |nobid
16 |AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons  |nobid
17 |AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
18 |AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons  |no bid
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |nobid
20  |AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 19.45
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |nobid
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons no bid
23 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons  |nobid
24  |AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons  |no bid
25  |AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons  [no bid
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons  |nobid
27  |AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons  [no bid
28 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons 19.45
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons  |[nobid
30 |Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons  |nobid
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons  |nobid
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons  |nobid

ATT A Page 1 of 2 Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC
*Source Location Address(es): 707 Quarry Rd
Required Rocky Gap, VA 24366

*Storage Location Address(es):

*Required (if different from

Source Location address)

COI];:;?“ Description Composition*® IJ[J:;;;):; Bid Price
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons  |no bid
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons  |no bid
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons |no bid
38 Cinders Cinders Tons  |no bid
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons no bid
40  |#11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons  [no bid
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons 13.40
42 Rip Rap LSGS Tons no bid
43 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons 14.90
44 Shot Rock LSGS Tons no bid
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid
46 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons no bid
47 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-41) Mile 3.00
48 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-41) Mile 0.35
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile 4.25
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile 0.40

*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand.

ATT A Page 2 of 2

Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address, Storage Location Address, and bid pricing
for the contract item listed below. Vendor may bid any or all contract items. Failure to provide source information and
storage location information will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. This is a multiple vendor award
contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor
per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. Estimated quantities
are not available.

VENDOR NAME: Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC

707 Quarry Rd
Rocky Gap, VA 24366

*Source Location Address(es):
Required

*Storage Location Address(es):
*Required (if different from
Source Location address)

Colltl::‘:ct Description Composition* D}[J:;:l?rfe Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 16.90
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons  |no bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 16.90
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 20.50
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons  |no bid
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 21.05
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons  |no bid
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons  [no bid
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 19.45
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |[no bid
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons  |no bid
23 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons  [no bid
24 |AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons  |no bid
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons  |no bid
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons  |no bid
27  |AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons  |no bid
28 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons 19.45
29 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons  |no bid

ATT A Page 1 of 2 Non-Established Locations, 6624C084




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Rocky Gap Quarry, LLC
*Source Location Address(es): 707 Quarry Rd
Required Rocky Gap, VA 24366

*Storage Location Address(es):

*Required (if different from

Source Location address)

Colltl::‘:ct Description Composition* D}[J:;:l?rfe Bid Price
30 Fine Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
31 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons no bid
32 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
33 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons  |no bid
34 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons  |no bid
35 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons no bid
36 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
37 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons  |no bid
38 Cinders Cinders Tons no bid
39 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons  |no bid
40 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
41 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons 13.40
42 Rip Rap LSGS Tons no bid
43 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons 14.90
44 Shot Rock LSGS Tons no bid
45 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid
46 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons no bid
47 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-41) Mile 3.00
48 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-41) Mile 0.35
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 42-45) Mile 4.25
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 42-45) Mile 0.40

*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand.

ATT A Page 2 of 2

Non-Established Locations, 6624C084
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