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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1593441

Solicitation Description: Ditch, Pipe and Asphalt Repair and Maintenance by the Vendor

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2025-01-23 10:30 SR 0803 ESR01212500000004429 1

VENDOR

000000203375
KELLY PAVING INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000026

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-01-21 Response Time: 15:32:16

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham
304-720-7383
jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Pilot Truck and Driver 0.00000 DAY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161500    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Traffic Control Devices 0.00000 UNIT 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161500    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Traffic Flagger 0.00000 HOUR 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161500    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Arrow Board 0.00000 DAY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
46161500    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Ditching (Shoulder Mile) 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141003    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Correcting Deep Ditches 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141003    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Restoring Shoulders and Shoulder Stone 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141003    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Shoulder Stone Placement 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141003    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Ditching Haul by Vendor for Items 6, 7 & 8 

(Ton Mile)
0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141003    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Ditching Haul for Items 6, 7 & 8 Addl' Mile 

(Ton Mile)
0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141003    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Ditching Waste Haul by Vendor per Truck/

Driver
0.00000 HOUR 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72153507    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Ditching Daytime Mobilization 0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Ditching Nighttime Mobilization. 0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Ditching On-Site Mobilization 0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 15" Type F Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 18" Type F Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 24" Type F Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 30" Type F Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 36" Type F Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 42" Type F Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 48" Type F Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 54" Type F Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 60" Type f Trench 0.00000 LF 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Pipe Repair/Replacement backfill for F 

Trench (mat+first5mi)
0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Additional Haul per truck load over 5mi, 

Backfill F Trench
0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Safe Access & Egress Surcharge depth of 5ft 

to 10ft
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Safe Access & Egress Surcharge depth of 

10ft to 15ft
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Safe Access & Egress Surcharge depth 15ft 

to 20ft
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Pipe Repair/Replacement Waste Haul by 

Vendor -truck/driver
0.00000 HOUR 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72153507    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Pipe Repair/Replacement Daytime 

Mobilization
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Pipe Repair/Replacement Nighttime 

Mobilization
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Pipe Repair/Replacement On-Site 

Mobilization
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Pothole Repair (Per Project Size Range) 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Base Failure Repair, Asphalt (Per Project 

Size Range)
0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Base Failure Repair, Stone (Per Project Size 

Range)
0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Edge Failure Repair (Per Project Size Range) 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Haul by Vendor First Ton Mile 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Haul by Vendor Each Additional Mile (Ton 

Mile)
0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Waste Haul by Vendor per truck/driver 0.00000 HOUR 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72153507    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Off-Season Plant Opening First Day 0.00000 DAY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Off-Season Plant Opening Each Additional 

Day
0.00000 DAY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141100    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 Asphalt Pavement Repair Daytime 

Mobilization
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Asphalt Pavement Repair Nighttime 

Mobilization
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Asphalt Pavement Repair On-Site 

Mobilization
0.00000 LS 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
See Attached Pricing Page- Attachment A, For Actual Cost.



































































































































































































Ditch, Pipe, and Asphalt Repair and Maintenance by the Vendor
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR'S NAME: KELLY PAVING, INC.

Vendor's Base of Operations:
(Please provide physical address):

Boone Cabell X Calhoun X Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln X Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan X Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo X Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne X Roane Preston Jefferson X Tyler Upshur Summers

X Wirt Taylor Mineral X Wetzel Webster
X Wood Morgan

Contract 
Item #

1
2
3
4

Contract 
Item #

5
6
7
8
9
10
11 $85.00
12 Daytime Mobilization $3,750.00
13 Nighttime Mobilization $3,750.00
14 On-Site Mobilization

Contract 
Item #

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24 Pipe Repair/Replacement backfill for F Trench (material + delivery first 5 miles) Cubic Yard NO BID

54" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID
60" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID

42" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID
48" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID

30" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID
36" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID

18" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID
24" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price

15" Type F Trench Linear Foot NO BID

Lump Sum
Lump Sum
Lump Sum $500.00

Part III - Pipe Repair & Replacement

Ditching Haul by Vendor for Contract Items 6, 7 & 8,  Each Additional Mile Ton Mile $0.32
Ditching Waste Haul by Vendor per truck/driver Hour

Shoulder Stone Placement Ton $66.00
Ditching Haul by Vendor for Contract Items 6, 7 & 8, First Ton Mile Ton Mile $3.00

Correcting Deep Ditches Ton $114.00
Restoring Shoulders and Shoulder Stone Ton $114.00

Ditching Shoulder Mile $7,500.00

Arrow Board Day $40.00

Part II - Ditching Maintenance & Repair

Traffic Control Devices Unit $1.50
Flagger Hour $80.00

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price

Pilot Truck and Driver Day $1,200.00

District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

Part I - Traffic Control  *required

MARTIN MARIETTA

99 KANAWHA ST

PARKERSBURG WV 26101

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall first list their name and Base of Operations physical address applicable to ATT A in the spaces 
above.  If the vendor has multiple Base of Operations location addresses, vendor may insert additional lines.  Vendor shall then mark with 
an "X" the counties that correspond with the bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per county, Vendor shall complete a 
separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A) for each county pricing set.    Vendor must bid all Traffic Control Contract Items in Part I below.  
Vendors may bid any or all categories of work in Part II, Part III, or Part IV below, but must bid all Contract Items within a category of work 
to be awarded a contract.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The 
low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications.  
Estimated quantities are not available.
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6

ATT A -Pricing Pages Page 1 of 3 6623C032



Ditch, Pipe, and Asphalt Repair and Maintenance by the Vendor
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR'S NAME: KELLY PAVING, INC.

Vendor's Base of Operations:
(Please provide physical address):

Boone Cabell X Calhoun X Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln X Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan X Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo X Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne X Roane Preston Jefferson X Tyler Upshur Summers

X Wirt Taylor Mineral X Wetzel Webster
X Wood Morgan

District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

MARTIN MARIETTA

99 KANAWHA ST

PARKERSBURG WV 26101

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall first list their name and Base of Operations physical address applicable to ATT A in the spaces 
above.  If the vendor has multiple Base of Operations location addresses, vendor may insert additional lines.  Vendor shall then mark with 
an "X" the counties that correspond with the bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per county, Vendor shall complete a 
separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A) for each county pricing set.    Vendor must bid all Traffic Control Contract Items in Part I below.  
Vendors may bid any or all categories of work in Part II, Part III, or Part IV below, but must bid all Contract Items within a category of work 
to be awarded a contract.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The 
low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications.  
Estimated quantities are not available.
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6

25
26

Contract 
Item #

27
28
29
30 Daytime Mobilization NO BID
31 Nighttime Mobilization NO BID
32 On-Site Mobilization

Contract 
Item # Contract Item Description

33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49 Haul by Vendor First Ton Mile
50 Haul by Vendor Each Additional Mile ----- Ton Mile NO BID

501 SY or greater NO BID

----- Ton Mile NO BID

501 SY or greater NO BID

NO BID

Edge Failure Repair 
0-50 SY

Mile

NO BID

51-250 SY NO BID

251-500 SY NO BID

Base Failure Repair, Stone

0-50 SY

Mile

NO BID

51-250 SY NO BID

251-500 SY NO BID

501 SY or greater

Base Failure Repair, Asphalt  
0-50 SY

Mile

NO BID

Size of Project, 
per Mile Unit of Measure List Price

Pothole Repair

0-50 SY

Mile

NO BID

51-250 SY

51-250 SY NO BID

251-500 SY NO BID

501 SY or greater NO BID

NO BID

251-500 SY NO BID

Lump Sum
Lump Sum
Lump Sum NO BID

Part IV - Asphalt Pavement Repair 

Safe Access and Egress Surchage depth  15-foot to 20-foot Lump Sum NO BID
Pipe Repair/Replacement Waste Haul by Vendor per truck/driver Hour NO BID

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price

Safe Access and Egress Surchage depth of 10-foot to 15-foot Lump Sum NO BID

Safe Access and Egress Surchage depth of 5-foot to 10-foot Lump Sum NO BID

Part III - Pipe Repair & Replacement (continued)

Additional Haul per truck load over 5 miles, Backfill for F Trench Mile NO BID

ATT A -Pricing Pages Page 2 of 3 6623C032



Ditch, Pipe, and Asphalt Repair and Maintenance by the Vendor
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

VENDOR'S NAME: KELLY PAVING, INC.

Vendor's Base of Operations:
(Please provide physical address):

Boone Cabell X Calhoun X Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln X Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan X Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo X Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne X Roane Preston Jefferson X Tyler Upshur Summers

X Wirt Taylor Mineral X Wetzel Webster
X Wood Morgan

District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

MARTIN MARIETTA

99 KANAWHA ST

PARKERSBURG WV 26101

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall first list their name and Base of Operations physical address applicable to ATT A in the spaces 
above.  If the vendor has multiple Base of Operations location addresses, vendor may insert additional lines.  Vendor shall then mark with 
an "X" the counties that correspond with the bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per county, Vendor shall complete a 
separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A) for each county pricing set.    Vendor must bid all Traffic Control Contract Items in Part I below.  
Vendors may bid any or all categories of work in Part II, Part III, or Part IV below, but must bid all Contract Items within a category of work 
to be awarded a contract.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The 
low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications.  
Estimated quantities are not available.
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6

51 Waste Haul by Vendor per truck/driver
52 Off-Season Plant Opening First Day

Contract 
Item # Contract Item Description

53 Off-Season Plant Opening Each Additional Day
54 Daytime Mobilization
55 Nighttime Mobilization 
56 On-Site Mobilization ----- Lump Sum NO BID

----- Lump Sum NO BID

----- Lump Sum NO BID

Size of Project, 
per Mile Unit of Measure List Price

----- Day NO BID

----- Day NO BID

Part IV - Asphalt Pavement Repair (continued)

----- Hour NO BID

ATT A -Pricing Pages Page 3 of 3 6623C032
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