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State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1623200

Solicitation Description: Addendum 01 - Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes

Solicitation Response

Version

2025-03-11 10:30

SR 0803 ESR03102500000005433

1

VENDOR

000000114364
JOWAR READY MIX

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000042

Total Bid: 0

Comments:

Response Date:

2025-03-10 Response Time: 20:43:32

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham

304-720-7383

jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X

FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

See attached pricing page attachment a, for actual cost

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class A Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 455.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: Class B Concrete 2-2.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: ~ Mar 11, 2025 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




30111505

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 380.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS B CONCRETE 3-3.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 305.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS B CONCRETE 4-4.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Class B Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 230.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS B CONCRETE - 5 OR MORE
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025

Page: 3
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

12 Class C Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

14 Class D Concrete3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025 Page: 4

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Class D Concrete5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Class DC Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 470.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: Class DC Concrete 2-2.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Class DC Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 395.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: Class DC Concrete 3-3.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Class DC Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 320.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: Class DC Concrete 4-4.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Class DC Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 245.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: Class DC Concrete 5 OR MORE
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: ~ Mar 11, 2025 Page: 5 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 575.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: Class H Concrete 2-2.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
22 Class H Concrete 3-3.99

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY 500.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS H CONCRETE 3-3.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 425.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS H CONCRETE - 4-4.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Class H Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 350.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS H CONCRETE 5 OR MORE
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

25 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 460.000000

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: Class K Concrete 2-2.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025 Page: 6
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 385.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS K CONCRETE 3 - 3.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

27 Class K Concrete 4-4.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY 310.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS K CONCRETE - 4-4.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Class K Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 235.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: CLASS K5 OR MORE
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Mod Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

30 Mod Class K Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025 Page: 7
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Comm Code
30111500

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Mod Class K Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Mod Class K Concrete 5 or more

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
35 CLSM Type A 4-4.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025

Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 CLSM Type A 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 CLSM Type B 2-2.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 CLSM Type B 5 or more 0.00000 cCY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025

Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 CLSM Type B -Modified Pipe Slurry 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 CLSM Type B - Modified Pipe Slurry 3-3.99  0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 CLSM Type B - Modified Pipe Slurry 4-4.99  0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 CLSM Type B - Modified Pipe Slurry 5 or 0.00000 CY
more
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
45 CLSM Type C 2-2.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00000 CY 425.000000 0.00

Comm Code
30111500

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: Class CLSM TYPE C Concrete 2-2.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed: ~ Mar 11, 2025 Page: 10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 350.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: Class CLSM TYPE C Concrete 3-3.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

47 CLSM Type C 4-4.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY 275.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111500

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: Class CLSM TYPE C CONCRETE - 4-4.99
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 CLSM Type C 5 or more 0.00000 CY 200.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: Class CLSM TYPE C CONCRETE 5 OR MORE
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Additional Haul per Loaded Truck over 5 miles 0.00000 MILE 15.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121601
Commodity Line Comments: TRUCKLOAD MILE
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Penalty Charge per Truck each Minute 0.00000 TRKM 1.500000 0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
78121601

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: PENALTY CHARGE PER TRUCK EACH MINUTE

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025 Page: 11
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Class B using Silica Sand 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111701

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Increased cement in pounds of a CY mix 0.00000 LB 20.000000 0.00
design

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111601

Commodity Line Comments: INCREASE CEMENT IN POUNDS
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 Water reducing set retarder 0.00000 Oz 0.750000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12162303

Commodity Line Comments: WATER REDUCING SET RETARDER OZ.
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54 Water reducer 0.00000 Oz 0.750000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12164801

Commodity Line Comments: WATER REDUCER OZ.
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55 Accelerating Admixtures 0.00000 Oz 0.500000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12162302

Commodity Line Comments: ACCELERATOR OZ.
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025

Page: 12 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
56 Type G Water Reducing, High Range 0.00000 Oz 3.000000 0.00
Retarding Admixtures
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162303

Commodity Line Comments: HIGH RANGE WATER REDUCER AND RETARDING

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
57 Type F Water Reducing, High Range 0.00000 Oz 3.000000 0.00
Admixtures
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162303

Commodity Line Comments: HIGH RANGE WATER REDUCING
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
58 Fiber, per pound in a CY mix 0.00000 LB 8.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12162305

Commodity Line Comments: FIBER PER POUND
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
59 Heated Concrete 0.00000 CY 9.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: HEATED CONCRETE
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
60 Ice

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 LB 0.850000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
12162305

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: ICE PER POUND
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Mar 11, 2025 Page: 13
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State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Highways

Reason for Modification:

Proc Folder: 1623200
Doc Description: Addendum 01 - Ready Mixed Poritand Cement Concrete and CLSM ADDENDLIM 01
TO ATTACH BESPONSES TO
_ QUESTIONS FROM VENDORS
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreemeant
Date Issued Saolicltatlon Closes Solicitation No Varsion
2025-03-06 2025-63-11  10:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000042 2

PROCUREMENT DIVISION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
BLDG & AM 3404

1800 KANAWHA BEVD E

Vendor Custiomer Code:

Vendor Name !  Jowar Ready Mix
Address -

Street &t 207 coal Heritoge Road

Cily :  laeger

Stale: West Virginia Country :  ysa
Principal Conlact ©  Joseph Salyers

VYendor Contact Phone:  04-835-3856 Extension:

CHARLESTON WY 28305
s

q ..,,..,--'I.‘\'-. _'q:_:;';;?:_.::_-_'_l::::_-"__'_g:'::.'"',.;-'\-'-'.L".F'u""' '{ FE kﬁ":‘ i m = ? A - __L.I--..._L ‘.T"
"QFEH DQB ;. ,_-.._'_I.'.“:' ..'..-_;._ '\-_-.-_'.h:_.\_.".,;.hq':é? ,3 ?I:' .-5 :q,-;ﬁ?;'-{p rﬁiﬁ%fﬁp?}ﬁ%j??—ﬁ -I-\.-!"'\-"F'la. Ena'_"'i ﬁ-ﬁ‘,&@ - 15|5‘.|' a::gr '\-":. \t"-ﬂi.

Zip ! 2s844

FGR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanbam

204-720-7383
jeromie. f lanham@wv.gov

Vendor

Signature X ¢:§/h')’ FEINY 20824 0954

DATE March 10, 2025

All offers subject to all terms and conditions containad in this sallcitation

Dale Prnted:  MWar 6, 2075 Fage 1

FORM 1D WY-FRC-ARFCH002 2020005




DESEGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contrac{ Administrator and the initial poiat of centact for matters relating fo this
Contract.

Joseph Satyers  Ovner
{Printed Name and Title)

202 Coal Heritage Road Iaeger, WV 24844
{Address)

304-938-3656 [ 304-938-2273

(Phone Number) / {Fax Number)
jewarstoresfphofmail.com '
(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitiing docomentation
through wvQASIS, I certify that [ have reviewed this Solicitation in iis entirety; that T understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and giher information contamed herein: that fhis id,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Selicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with aty entity submithing a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bad or offer 15 in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud; that this Centract 15 accepted or entered into without any prior undersianding,
agreement, or conmection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that I am
antharized by the Vendor to execute and subnut this lnd, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto o Vendor’s behalf: thai [ am authorized to hind the vendor in a coniraciuat
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has propedy registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By signing below, I further certify that I undersiand this Coniract is subfect fo the
Drovisions of West Virginia Code § 34-3-62 which miomatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State faw.

Jowar Ready Mix
(Company}

Ly

(Siguaﬁire of Authorized Representative)

Joseph Salyers Owner
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

March 10, 2025

{Daic)
304-938-3656 304-838-2273
{Phone Number) {Fax Mumber)

Revized 8/24/2023



EEATEST FOR QUHOTATION
Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM

84  Contract Manager: During ifs performance of this Contract, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing
Yendor's responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be
avatiable during normal business howrs to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
her contact information below.

Contract Manager: Joseph Safyers

Telephone Number: 304-938 3656

I'ax Number: 304-938-2273

Email Address: jowarstoresigthotinail.com

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes fo the information
provided above within 10 calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may
be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 i4 AMA BBZ50016



Ready Mixed Portland Cament Cancrete and CESHM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE [ATT A)

Vendor Instrystions: Vandor shal mark with an "X" beside the counties fhat corespond with the Scurce Plani(s) bid prices on
this pane. If Vendor hag vared pricing pee county or par plant, Yendor shait complake a separate sef of Pricing Papes {(ATT A)for
each county pricing set or each plant's pricing, Failure to inchude ATT A and ATT B will result in the disguaiification of the
affectssf bid,

Thig is a mulliple vendor sward contract. Al gualifying vendsis meeling the conlract spacifications will ba awarded with a contract.
Fhe lowe bid vandor par project witl he determinad at the ime of need, as per Section 4 of the contract specfications. Estimated
guanlitios are not availabia.

Vendor Name:  Jowar Ready Mix

Souree Plant Name & Locationggy, Jowar Ready ix

lzager, West Virginia
Lystmed 1 Pinirct 2 E."&.’-rr'c:t.? Chiskriat o Disirict 5 DNstricd &  Ewskict 7 Oiskict & Disirict 3 Pisdne! 710
[ {Eaone Cabell | [Cahoun [ jPoddidge [ [Bekeley [ |Booke § ]Bamour [ |Pendieton | Frayene McDowed
| {Clay Lincodn § |llacksan | |Hamison  { |Grant Hancack | [Braxdon | (Pocahontas | {Greenbrer X IMercer
| _{Kanawha begsn 1 Pleasants | [Marion | _|Hampshire Merehall | |Gilrrese Rendolph Monros Raleigh
| [Mazan DOMingo | |Ritchie hcnongafia || Hardy Ohio Lewis Turker Mictofas Wlvonrireg
|_|Putnam Wayne { {Roane Praston |_{efferson Tyler Upshiar Summars
| [t Taylar Minesal Wetzel Webstar
| |wiood Moroan
* Coniract iems T-48 Includas malenals plus delivery within 5 miles of Suppfiar Plant Locadion
** Confract florrs 53-57 are components of 2 CY mix design added a5 oz. per 1008 of cementiious malarial,
Contract - Uinit of Size of ,
lem # Contraet ftem Description Meastre Preject List Price
1 2-2 .89
2 3-389
——Class A Concrete® CY
3 ' A.4 049
4 5 or more
o 2-2 8% 5600 &
& 3-3.85 360,00
Class B Concrefa* Y
7 ? 4-4.08 | $305.00
8 5 or more | $220.00
i 9 2-2.09
10 3-3.09
Clazs © Concrete* CY
11 4-4 59
12 & or more
13 Z-2.04
14 3-3.88
C O Concrete* CY
T i 4-4.99 i
T& S or more
17 2-24893 3470.00
13 3-3.898 $355.00
Class DC Cangrele” oY
12 4-4 59 $320.00
20 5 or more E“Eﬂ“




Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CESM

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE [ATT A}

* eonlract fiems 1-48 incipdes malerisfs plus defivery wilthin 5 miles of Supgiisr Plant f oceton
~* Coniract items 53-57 are compononiz of a CY niix desipn added a5 oz, per 1004 of cameniitions matoal,

21 2-2.99 $576.00

22 Class H Concrate” Y 3-3.99 $500.00

23 4-4 93 F525 00

24 2 0F More | $350.00

25 2-2.89 $460.00

26 Class K Concrate® g 4-3.89 $385.00

27 4-459 | $310.00

28 b ormare | $235.00

28 2-2.99

22} Mad Class K Goncrete* CY ijgg

32 5 ar more

33 Z-2.99

34 , 3-3.99

T CLSM Type A CY 4409

a5 5 oF more

37 2-2.989

34 ) 3-3.99

39 CLSM Type B CY 4499

40 D OF mewe

41 2-2.89

42 - . . 3-3.89

45 CLSM Typa B* - Modified Pipe Siumy L 2-4.99

44 H or more

45 2-3.68 | $425.00

48 . 3-3.88 | $350.00

——CLSM Type C CY 5455 | sarenm

48 Hor more | $200.00

48  |Addifional Haul per Loaded Truck over & miles hil2 e $15.00

50  |Penalty Cherge per tuck, each minkle Minute — $1.50

51 |Class B using Silica Sand oY —-—

R2  {ncreased cement in pounds of a GY Mix Design iB —_ 32600

83 |Waterqeducing sst ratarder = 0L meeme .75

54  |Water reducer ** 2 — - .75

585  |Accolarating Adrbdures * DZ s $0.50

5a TjFpE': (5 Waler Reducing, High Range and Retarding 0z L 23 60
Admixiures

57  [Type F Waler Reduding, High Ransge Adwmibgures ** 0z _ $3.00

58  |Fiber, per pound in & CY mix design LB ——mm 58,00

59  {Healed Concrate CY e $9.00

B0 liee L5 — 0.45




YVendor Name:

NEdAY IWITACH P AT WEINTTEE VWL LS JdiITd Wi

Source Plant nformatian - Attachment B [ATT B}

Jowwar Reacdy MEc

Vendor instructions: ATT B must be submitied at the time of bid and shall correspond with the
source plants lisied on the Pricing Pages, ATT A. ATT B must be completed in #ts entirety. Failure
to submit ATT B at the time of bid will rasult in the disqualification of the entire bid.

Plant Name

Plant Location
(211 Physical Address)

Plant Approval Status {mark one}

MCSAT Approvail
(Facility) Code

Jowar Ready Mix

202 Coal Heritage Road
laager, Wy 24844

B Approved- Provide Fadility Code

L] riot Approved/Fanding

JRM1.01.601

E ¥ Appieoved- Provide Farifity Code

[} Mot Approved/Pending

{1 Approved- Provide Facility Code

{1 Mot Approved/Pending

i 1 Approved- Provida Facility Cotle
L] Not Approved/Pending

[} Approved- Provide Fadlity Code

[ Mot Approved/Pending

L] Approved - Provide Facility Code

(i rect Approved Pending

8i

[ Approved- Provide Facility Code

1 Mot Approved/Pending

{1 Approved- Provide Facility Code

{1 Mot Approved/Pending

{ | Appraved- Provide Facility Code
[} Mot ApprovedsPending

10

[ Approved- Provide Facility Code

[ Mot ApprovedsPending

ATT B .. Snnres Blank Infnrmnfi.;-xn

AMA AR AR



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: ARFQ DOT2500000042

instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of alf addenda issned with this solicitation by
completing this addendnm acknowledgment form. Check the box nexi to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge recsipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my preposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
{Check the box next to each addendum received)

[Al Addendum No. 1 [ § Addendum No. 6
[} Addendum No. 2 [ | Addendum No. 7
[] Addendum Ne, 3 [] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No. 9
] Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

[ understand that failare to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed 1o be made during any orai
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personned is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendurm is
binding.

Jowar Ready Mix

Company

L

Authorized Signature
March 10, 2025

Diafa

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
docament processing.

Revised 11/1/2027



ACORD
—

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

—

DATE (RMWTDAY Y}
1A THED24

THIS CERTIFICATE I8 ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS HO RIGHTS UPDN THE GERTIFICATE HOLDER, THIS

CERTIFICATE DOES NOY AFFIRMATIVELY OR HEGATIVELY AMEMD,

PELOW. THI!S CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A

REPRESENTATIVE OR FRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLOER.

Emﬁtm OR ALTER THE GOVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES

ONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURERIS), ALiTHORIZED

iMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the polioy(ies) must haya ADDITIONAL INSURED provigions o be endorsed.

i SUBROGATIGN IS WAIVED, subject to the tanns and condifions of the polley, certain policies
thiz certificafe foss not canfar rights to tha cartifioats holder In ileu of sueh andorsement(s).

may require 2n enderzomeont, A statement an

PRODUCER
Bankers insurance, LLC dba Bl insurance Agency, LG
214 Federal Streat

ﬂe E Hsifm Cynthia Crews

FAN
[AJG, Wl

-

TRAS. Ho, Exui; BOD-541-1410

BiueRald W 24701 supzess: mall@hankersinsurance.net
INSURER[S} AFFORDING COVERAGE HAiCH
: Ligensedt 537073 maureR a: Nofthfizid Insurahca Company IFORY
INSTRED : JOVAREA-M wieumer B Progresslve Classic Insurance Company 43904

Joseph Salyers dba Jowar Ready Mix
200 Cagl Heritagj Rd
Easger WY 248

MSURER G-

INEURER B:

INSUAER E-

IHSURER F -

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 858575200

REYISION NUMBER:

THIS [5 TG CGERTIFY. THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANGE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN iSSUED TO THE INSURED MAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD

IHDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDANG ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR GOMDITION

OF ANY CONTRACT QR OVTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESFECT TO WHICH THIS

CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANGE AFFORDED BY THE POUCIES DESCRIBED HERE 15 SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

EXCLUSIONS AND GONDITIONE OF SUCH POLICIES, LWWITE SHOWN MAY HAVE

HEEN REDUCED BY FAID CLAIMS.

T TYPE GF INSURANGE w POLICY RUMSER BDGYTYY | e LiTs
A | X | COMMERGIAL GEMERAL LIABIEITY WSEGHDRD2 BAR2024 | GNORNZS | FAGH OBGURRENCE 5 1,000,000
cramsmape | X Jocoun o EaaEs o mmemeny | 5 106,000
[ MED EXP Yury ore person) | 55 00K
PERSCOMAL £ ADV INJURY | § 1,000,000
| GEME AGUHEGATE LWAT APPLIES PER; GENERAL AGGREGATE 5 2 003, A1
pocy || IER LoC PRODUETS - COMPIF AGO | 52,000,000
OTHER: 1
B ] AUTOETOBILE LLABIEITY 02310508 IASI024 KT8 BT A -I?ET;;E‘JEHSI“GLE LT 51,000 060
|| AT AT BORILY INJURY [Par persony | 5
%&Dnuw K | SmeoULED HODILY INJURY [Pt accident)| 8
RAHGS ONLY AUTOS DI Y Pes meodonty 5
L
UMERELLALINE OUCUR EACH OCCURRENCE 5
EXCESE LiAH CLADKSMALE AGGREGATE 5
CED | reveamion s 3
WORKERS COMPENSATION FER, A
AND EMPLOYERE' LIABILITY YIN STATUTE Eit
mﬁ&%ﬁwm HIA EL EACH ACLIRENT
* | {#¥andatery in HH) E L BSEASSE - EA EMPLOYEE] &
I ez, deccrie under
DESCRIPTION OF QPERATHHES balow EL DISEARE - POLICY LT | 5

BESCRIFTION OF OFERATIONE FLOCATIONS FVEHICLES [AGHRD 104, AddManat Remazdes Schedude, may be aHached f more space Ix requingd)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATIGN

E. Dillen & Company

SHOULE ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANGELLED BEFORE
THE EXFIRATION OATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED ‘N
AGCCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROYISIONS.

P O Box 160
Swords Creek VA 24649 fn T REERESE A ATIVE
i
@ 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATICN. All rights resarved.
ACCRD 25 (2016f03) The ACGRD name and logo ara registered marks of ACORD '




