State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1091656 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Addendum 2: Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor by Vendor Co

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2022-10-03 2022-10-06  14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2300000017 3
BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BUDGET & PROCUREMENT

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 5, RM A-260 Ay 33z

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E REC'D BUDGE

CHARLESTON WV 25305

us
VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code; £c>EXIe> E(F /4 (

Vendor Name : BTI Contracting Inc

Address : PO Box 314

Catlettsbur

Street : g, KY 41129

City :

State : Country : 05 Zip:

Principal Contact : é’/m W@%
Vendor Contact Phone: ‘?054 4(5/3 _ é 7 é Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith '

304-414-6859

dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

endor [ 2 ) : 7
‘S,igr:::ture X @p,,{ﬂ(//@% ,ﬁﬁﬁﬂ FEIN® //, /—/Q:( 7923 pare 05 2622

All offers Subjectj’to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: QOct 4, 2022 Page 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



I ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

THIS CONTRACT WILL REPLACE CONTRACTS THAT EXPIRE 12/31/22

dedekdedededededokokodkRhdokdkokk ek ik kdkh ik dokkk kb kkdbhkkhkkhhkh kbbb hkbhhkdidkbihrhkhid

THE WEST VIRIGNIA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION- BUDGET AND PROCUREMENT DIVISION - THIS IS AN
AGENCY OPEN ENDED CONTRACT FOR ASPHALT MATERIALS, DELIVERY & LABOR BY VENDOR BY COUNTY PER THE
ATTACHED DOCUMENTS.

QUESTIONS REGARDING THE SOLICITATION MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO DUSTY.J.SMITH@WV.GOV PRIOR TO
THE QUESTION PERIOD DEADLINE CONTAINED IN THE INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS SUBMITTING BIDS.

*********NOTICE*********
WE DO NOT ACCEPT EMAIL BIDS

MUST USE ONE THE FOLLOWING TO SUBMIT A BID:
* UPLOAD TO OASIS
* HAND DELIVERY
* MAIL IN HARD COPY

MAKE SURE YOU DOWNLOAD ALL INFORMATION
THE- COMPLETE SOLICITATION-PRICING PAGES-SIGN THE PAGES THAT NEED SIGNED

PLEASE NOTE THAT TO BE AWARDED THIS CONTRACT YOU WILL BE TO A REGISTER VENDOR WITH WV STATE
PURCHASING, AND COMPLIANT WITH SEVERAL AGENCIES SUCH AS THE WVSO0S, TAX DEPARTMENT, WORKER'S
COMPENSATION, AND UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE

Fededededededededede e do e dededekedkedededededededede de ke ke ke de ek ke k kok ek kkdkkkkdkkdekkkkkxkhkhkkhhkrkkkkkkkkikk

THIS CONTRACT WILL REPLACE CONTRACTS THAT EXPIRE 12/31/22

[INVOICE TO |SHIP TO

VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City wv No City wyv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Asphalt Section 401 - Base | 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30121600

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A and ATT B (Pricing Pages) for providing its actual Bid. Vendors Note: Do NOT enter prices on
commodity lines in OASIS.

Date Printed: Sep 22, 2022 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



Document Phase
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Page
48
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Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor
by Vendor by County-




DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract.

Robert E. Scott, Representative

(Printed Name and Title)
PO Box 314 Catlettsburg, KY 41129

(Address)
304-453-6196/304-453-6430

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
robertscottbti@live.com

(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that I am
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto on Vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By siening below, I further certify that I understand this Contract is subject to the
provisions of West Vireinia Code § 54-3-62. which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law.

BT! Contracting Inc
(Company)

Vi )b\ 1 L oou

(Signatite of Authorized Representative)

Elizabeth M. Dean, Vice President
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

10-05-2022
(Date)

304-453-6196/304-453-6430
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 09/12/2022




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: DOT2300000017

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

M/ Addendum No. 1 [ 1 Addendum No. 6
%ddendum No. 2 [ 1 Addendum No.7
[ 1 Addendum No. 3 [ ] Addendum No. 8
[ 1 Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No.9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

é 77 &74 ‘/r/éyzéx/&ﬁ

Company

6%@4% IN )

Authorized Signature

/005~ 2022

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012



CONTRACTOR LICENSE

AUTHORIZED BY THE

West Virginia Contractor
Licensing Board

Wv033252

CLASSIFICATION:
ASPHALT

BTI CONTRACTING INC

DBA BLACKTOP INDUSTRIES
21229 BEAR CREEK ROAD -
CATLETTSBURG, KY 41129

DATE ISSUED EXPIRATION DATE
JUNE 13, 2022 JUNE 13, 2023

ot M. A

Authorized Signature Chair, West Virginla Contractor
ticensing Board

contracting work is being performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all
CONTRACTOR bid submissions, and on all fully executed and binding contracts. This licenge is non-transferable.

.{f 1 /WWEST VIRGINIA A copy of this license must be readily available for inspection by the Board on every job site where

-g i+~ LICENSING BOARD This license is being issued under the provisions of West Virginia Code, Chapter 30, Article 42.



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor by Vendor by Ceunty

12.5 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must designate
and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing Vendor’s
responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be available during
normal business hours to address any customer service or other issues related to this
Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or her contact information

below.
Contract Manager: /@7 é/ 66)’4 /¢
Telephone Number: 3,4 ¥4 2-/ /5¢
Fax Number: _ 394/ 453 — £L4Z0
Email Address: r2bert=Ceth L{_—a@ lewe,p o

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information
provided above within ten (10) calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply
may be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 Page 25 of 25 2023 6623C001



._/__‘

BTICO-1

OPID: S

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

ACORDr
\ g CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 00/26/2022

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICGATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER 859-255-3355 | CONEACT Sheila Eskue -
Qid Colony Inis. Servics, Inc. PHONE " 859-255-3355 FAX . 859-269-1614
1900 Cambridge Drive
Lexington, KY 40533-8000 | RofEss:
Mark Howard | INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
| _ | weurer a:BITCO General Insurance Corp 20095
DEUEER rACTIG e | weurer 5 BRICKSTREET MUTUAL INSURANCE 12372
Po‘i‘ BOX 314 | INSURER C :
CATLETTSBURG, KY 41129 | nSURER D :

| INSURERE : B

| INSURERF :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL SUBR POLICY EFF POLICYEXP |

TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MMDDIYYYY)  (MBMDDIYYYY) LIMITS
A | x COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENGE Is 1,000,000
| cLamsmape | X | occur X | CLP3713097 ‘ 01/01/2022|01/01/2023 PAMASEIORENTED . s 1,000,000
| MED EXP (Any one person) 5 5'0_00
| | o | PERSONAL & ADVINJURY | § 1;000,006i
| GEN'L. AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE 3 2,000,000
ooy [ X]58% [ Jroc | PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
| QTHER: ;
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY | EOMBINED DINGLE LT | 1,000,000
| X | anvauto X CAP3713096 01/01/2022 01/01/2023  BODILY INJURY (Per person) | §
OWNED §CHEQULED
| AUTOS ONLY | BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | §
X fBowr | X U
| X 3
A | X umereLLALIAB L OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE § 5,000,000
EXCESS LIAB | CLAIMS-MADE CuUP281881 01/01/2022 | 01/01/2023 |, - -cate s 5,000,000
peo | X | RETENTION s 10000 R
B WORKERS COMPENSATION | | X FEER OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY ' | STATUTE | ER |
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNEREXECUTVE (2 WCB1020017 08/22/2021 08/22/2023 | | ELL. EACH ACCIDENT 5 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? I___| NIA 1,000,000
{Mandatory in NH) | EL. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE] § i
If yes, describe under 1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below | | E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § et/
A Equipment Floater [ [ CLP3713097 01/01/2022 01/01/2023 LLEASED/ | 250,000
| RENTED EQ $1000 ded|
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

Certificate holder is additional insured as required by contract

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
STWV000

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE

‘T\gE %x;‘RAETION %‘I'\TE TI-éEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
cO CE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E, BLDG 5
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

CHARLESTON, WV 25305 Z E = ;‘«

ACORD 25 (2016/03) © 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts
(Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

BTI Contracting Inc

Name of Contracting Business Entity:

address: PO Box 314 Catlettsburg, KY 41129
Elizabeth M. Dean Address: PO Box 314 Catletsburg, KY 41129

Name of Authorized Agent:

ARFQ 0803 DOT2300000017 L. Asphalt Maleriols, Delivery & Labor by Vendor Go
Contract Number: Contract Description: pre e vene

Budget & Procurement - Division of Highways

Governmental agency awarding contract:

O Check here if this is a Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessary):

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract
M Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
O Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract (excluding legal
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

= Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

Signature: ﬁf’ﬂ%"%ﬁﬂéﬁm Date Signed: 10-5-2022

Notary Verification
state of YVESt Virginia County of YVayne

1, Ellza bth M - Dean , the authorized agent of the contracting business
entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this 5th " [ day of OCther , 2 Z

i da P 2N

Notary Public’s Signature

To be completed by State Agency: — OFFICIAL SEAL
Date Received by state agency: » r'ISzS: ryKPILglvic

Date submitted to Ethics Commission: </ B E-E)  State of West Virginia
! My Commission Expires

Governmental agency submitting Disclosure: = Erbruary 18, 2027




Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATTA)

Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc

Vendor's Sourced Asphait Plant(s): American Asphalt of WV, LLC

2334 Rt 52

Kenova, WV

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D will result

in the disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor mesting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be

determined at the time of need, as per Section 8 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not availabie.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
X Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton E Fayette McDowell
Clay 1x_|Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
X Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
X Putnam X |Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers
Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
Contract Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #
1 Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON $74.50
2 Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON $79.90
3 Asphalt Section 401 - Base I TON $79.79
4 Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON $79.79
5 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON $80.78
6 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON $85.50
7 Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON $81.15
8 Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON $87.97
9 Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON $96.44
10 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON $87.97
11 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON $93.11
12 Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $113.00
13 Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $116.00
14 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing I TON $108.00
15 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1l TON $112.00
16 Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $90.86
17 Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $90.86
18 Shoulder Stone Placement for Asphalt Section 307 - Class 10 TON $60.00
19 Shoulder Stone Mobilization - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM e
20 Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - First Ton Mile MILE $1.50
21 Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - Each Additional Mile MILE $0.25
22 Surcharge for PG Binder - 64H minus 22 TON $5.00
23 Surcharge for PG Binder 64E minus 22 ordered in 400 Ton increments TON $12.50
24 ESAL Surcharge - 3 million to 20 million ESALs TON no charge
25 ESAL Surcharge - Greater than 20 miltion ESALs TON no charge
26 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - First Ton Mile MILE $1.00
27 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - Each Additional Mile MILE $0.23
28 Laydown of Materials. ltems #1-17 and #67, Each Site 0-100 Tons TON $60.00
29 Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17 and #67, Each Site 101 to 200 Tons TON $25.00
30 Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17 and #67, Each Site 201 to 500 Tons TON $11.00
31 Laydown of Materials. ltems #1-17 and #67, Each Site 501 Tons or Greater TON $9.50
32 Mobilization - Daytime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM —
33 Mobilization - Nighttime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT.B) LUMP SUM e
34 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 0 to 1000 Sq. Yards Sy $7.00
35 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 1001 to 2000 Sq. Yards SY $5.00
36 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 2001 to 3000 Sq. Yards sy $3.50

ATT A -Revised, Laydown Page 10f 3

2023 6623C001



Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s):

Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc

American Asphalt of WV, LLC

2334 Rt 52

Kenova, WV

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shail mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D will result
in the disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be

determined at the time of need, as per Section 8 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2~ District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
X |Boone |x_|Cabell Caihoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton E Fayette McDowell
Clay x |Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha [x |Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randoiph Monroe Raleigh
X Mason Ix_|Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
X Putnam  [x_|Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers
Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
Contract Contract Item Description Unit of Measure | List Price
ltem #
37 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 3001 Sq. Yards or Greater sY $2.75
38 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons TON $20.50
39 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons TON $16.00
40 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons TON $6.00
41 Asphait Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge ~ 501 Tons or Greater TON $4.00
42 Asphalt Base |l Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons TON $20.50
43 Asphalt Base ll Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons TON $16.00
44 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons TON $6.00
45 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater TON $4.00
46 Asphalt Material for Tack Coat or Prime Material GAL $2.50
47 Additional Heel-In Joints LF $11.00
48 Skip Paving Surcharge TON $5.00
49 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $22.50
50 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $16.75
51 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $11.50
52 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards sy $6.00
53 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $3.50
54 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater SY $2.35
55 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $19.50
56 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards Sy $15.00
57 Pavement Profiling/Miiling-Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sqg. Yards sy $9.50
58 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $5.00
59 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Miliings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards sy $3.20
60 Pavement Profiling/Miliing-Vendor Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater SY $1.95
61 Mobilization - Pavement Profiling/Milling - Compiete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM - ——
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, First 10 Miles MILE no charge
62 (Included #49-60 and #ggt-th} e o AGaeRATH
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, Eac itional Mile
63 (Above 10 Miles) LOADED MILE $4.00
64 Pavement Repair - Asphalt Base |l TON $325.00
65 Asphalt HPTO - SP496 - PG 64E-22 ordered 400 Ton increments TON no bid
66 Non-Tracking Tack - to be used with #65 GAL no bid
67 Lay Down of Materials - to be used with #65 - 400 Ton or Greater TON no bid
68 Ultra-Thin Asphalt Overlay - SP498 TON no bid
69 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings O to 250 Sq. Yards sy $23.50
70 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 261 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $17.50
71 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $11.50

ATT A -Revised, Laydown

Page 2 of 3

2023 6623C001



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): American Asphalt of WV, LLC

2334 Rt 52

Kenova, WV

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. if Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D will result

in the disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be

determined at the time of need, as per Section 8 of the contract specifications. Estimated guantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
X Boone x__|Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendieton Fayette McDowell
Clay Ix_|Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha [x |Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
X Mason X |Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
X Putnam X _|Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers
Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
Contract Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price
ltem #
72 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $6.00
73 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $3.75
74 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater SY $2.50
75 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $19.50
76 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $15.00
77 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $9.50
78 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards sY $5.00
79 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $3.20
80 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater SY $1.95
81 Milled Rumble Strips LF $0.75
82 Mobilization - Milled Rumble Strips - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM e
83 Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving - Items #1-17 TON $6.75
84 Cleaning and Sweeping sY $0.01
85 Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver DAY $900.00
86 Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT $1.00
87 Maintaining Traffic - Flagger HOUR $64.00
88 Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board DAY $30.00
89 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY $2,750.00
90 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY $800.00

ATT A -Revised, Laydown Page 30of 3

2023 6623C€001



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A}

Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc

American Asphalt of WV, LLC
484 Industrial Road -l
St. Atbans, WV )

Vendor's Sourced Asphait Plant(s):

Yendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as weli as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D will result

in the disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a2 multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be
determined at the time of need, as per Section 8 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9
x__|Boone | |Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendieton Fayette
X Clay x |Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas | |Greenbrier
X Kanawha | |Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph | |Monroe
X Mason | |Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker x__|Nicholas
X___|Putnam Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur | |Summers
[ wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
. |Wood Morgan
Contmct Contract ltem Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #
1 Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON $75.02
2 Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON $81.00
3 Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON $81.19
4 Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON $81.19
5 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON $82.50
6 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON $86.75
7 Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON $82.75
8 Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON $88.93
9 Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON $98.30
10 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON $88.93
11 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON $95.53
12 Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $115.00
13 Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $118.00
14 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1ll TON $110.00
15 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |ll TON $114.00
16 Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $92.86
17 Asphalt Section 402 - 12.6mm Superpave TON $92.86
18 Shoulder Stone Placement for Asphalt Section 307 - Class 10 TON $60.00
19 Shoulder Stone Mobilization - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM e
20 Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - First Ton Mile MILE $1.50
21 Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - Each Additional Mile MILE $0.25
22 Surcharge for PG Binder - 64H minus 22 TON $5.00
23 Surcharge for PG Binder 64E minus 22 ordered in 400 Ton increments TON $12.50
24 ESAL Surcharge - 3 million to 20 million ESALs TON no charge
25 ESAL Surcharge - Greater than 20 million ESALs TON no charge
26 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - First Ton Mile MILE $1.00
27 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - Each Additional Mile MILE $0.23
28 Laydown of Materials. ltems #1-17 and #67, Each Site 0-100 Tons TON $60.00
29 Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17 and #67, Each Site 101 to 200 Tons TON $25.00
30 Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17 and #6867, Each Site 201 to 500 Tons TON $11.00
31 Laydown of Materials. ltems #1-17 and #67, Each Site 501 Tons or Greater TON $9.50
32 Mobilization - Daytime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM ———
33 Moabilization - Nighttime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM e —
34 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 0 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $7.00
35 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 1001 to 2000 Sq. Yards SY $5.00
36 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 2001 to 3000 Sq. Yards SY $3.50

ATT A -Revised, Laydown
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Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s):

Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc

American Asphalt of WV, LLC

484 Industriai Road

St. Albans, WV

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that comespond with the Asphait Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D will result
in the disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be

determined at the time of need, as per Section 8 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
X Boone [x |Cabell [ |Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton EFayette McDowell
x __|Clay Ix_|Lincoin |x |Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
X Kanawha Logan [ |Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
X Mason x_|Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Chio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
X Putnam | |Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers
| |Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
| |Wood Morgan
Contract Contract ltem Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #

37 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 3001 Sq. Yards or Greater SY $2.75

38 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons TON $20.50

39 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons TON $16.00

40 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons TON $6.00

41 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater TON $4.00

42 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons TON $20.50

43 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons TON $16.00

44 Asphalt Base |l Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons TON $6.00

45 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater TON $4.00

46 Asphalt Material for Tack Coat or Prime Materiat GAL $2.50

47 Additional Heel-In Joints LF $11.00

48 Skip Paving Surcharge TON $5.00

49 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $22.50

50 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $16.75

51 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards sY $11.50

52 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $6.00

53 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Miflings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $3.50

54 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater sY $2.35

55 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $19.50

56 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards sY $15.00

57 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $9.50

58 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $5.00

59 Pavement Profiling/Mitling-Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $3.20

60 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater SY $1.95

61 Mobilization - Pavement Profiling/Milling - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM —

Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, First 10 Miles MILE no charge
= (Includfe g #td'flgglcl)\llalrz#ggt-taoj Fine Milli Each Additional Mil
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuitings or Fine Millings, Eac itional Mile

63 (Above 10 Miles) LOADED MILE $4.00

64 Pavement Repair - Asphalt Base || TON $325.00

65 Asphalt HPTO - SP486 - PG 64E-22 ordered 400 Ton increments TON no bid

66 Non-Tracking Tack - to be used with #65 GAL no bid

67 Lay Bown of Materials - to be used with #65 - 400 Ton or Greater TON no bid

68 Uitra-Thin Asphalt Overlay - SP498 TON no bid

69 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sqg. Yards sy $23.50

70 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards sy $17.50

71 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards Sy $11.50

ATT A -Revised, Laydown
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Vendor Name:

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s):

Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

BTI Contracting Inc

American Asphalt of WV, LLC

484 Industrial Road

St. Albans, WV

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphait Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D will resuit

in the disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project wili be

determined at the time of need, as per Section 8 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
x___|Boone x_|Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton E Fayette McDowell
X Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
X Kanawha |[x |Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
X Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
X Putnam | |Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers
Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
Contract Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #

72 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sqg. Yards SY $6.00

73 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $3.75

74 Fine Miliing -WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater SY $2.50

75 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $19.50

76 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $15.00

77 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $9.50

78 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $5.00

79 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards Sy $3.20

80 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater SY $1.95

81 Milled Rumble Strips LF $0.75

82 Mobilization - Milled Rumble Strips - Complete-on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM S

83 Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving - ltems #1-17 TON $6.75

84 Cleaning and Sweeping sY $0.01

85 Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver DAY $900.00

86 Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT $1.00

87 Maintaining Traffic - Flagger HOUR $64.00

88 Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board DAY $30.00

89 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY $2,750.00

a0 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY $800.00

ATT A -Revised, Laydown
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT B MOBILIZATION PRICING PAGE (ATT B)

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall complete the Mobilization Pricing Pages by entering a bid price for

the Contract Items below, to correspond with the Contract items on Pricing Pages - Attachment A (ATT
A). Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant
Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D
will result in the disqualification of the affected bid.

Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc

ltem19, | Item32, | Item33, | Item 61, M::%zgfi; ]
County Unit of Mobilization | Mobilization | Mobilization | Mobilization Milled
Measure Shoulder DAYTIME NIGHTTIME | Pavement
Stone Paving Paving Profiling Rurr_lble
Strips
Boone LUMPSUM | $§ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 [$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00| % 3,500.00
= |Clay LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00| % 3,500.00
§ Kanawha LUMPSUM | $§ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 [$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00|% 3,500.00
A [Mason LUMPSUM |$ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00| % 3,500.00
Putnam LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00|% 3,500.00
Cabell LUMPSUM [$ 175000 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00| % 3,500.00
™~ |Lincoln LUMPSUM [$§ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 [$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00|% 3,500.00
':_,5 Logan LUMPSUM |$ 1,750.00 | $ 800.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00 % 3,500.00
3 Mingo LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00|% 3,500.00
Wayne LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00| % 3,500.00
Calhoun LUMP SUM
Jackson LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 [$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00 % 3,500.00
? |Pleasants LUMP SUM
% [Ritchie LUMP SUM
& [Roane LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 [$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00|% 3,500.00
Wirt LUMP SUM
Wood LUMP SUM
Doddridge LUMP SUM
< |Harrison LUMP SUM
G |[Marion LUMP SUM
% [Monongalia | LUMP SUM
“ |Preston LUMP SUM
Taylor LUMP SUM
Berkeley LUMP SUM
Grant LUMP SUM
> |Hampshire LUMP SUM
< [Hardy LUMP SUM
& |Jefferson LUMP SUM
Mineral LUMP SUM
Morgan LUMP SUM
ATT B- Mobilization Pricing Page (Laydown) Page 1 of 2 2023 6623C001



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT B MOBILIZATION PRICING PAGE (ATT B)

Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc

Item 19, ltem 32, Item 33, ltem 61, |, %z:tzi; .
County Unit of Mobilization | Mobilization | Mobilization | Mobilization Milled
Measure Shoulder DAYTIME NIGHTTIME | Pavement
Stone Paving Paving Profiling Run'.ible
Strips
Brooke LUMP SUM
o |Hancock LUMP SUM
© |Marshall LUMP SUM
% [Ohio LUMP SUM
2 [Tyler LUMP SUM
Wetzel LUMP SUM
Barbour LUMP SUM
~ |Braxton LUMP SUM
G |Gilmer LUMP SUM
Z |Lewis LUMP SUM
2 |Upshur LUMP SUM
Webster LUMP SUM
« |Pendleton LUMP SUM
© |Pocahontas | LUMP SUM
% |[Randolph | LUMP SUM
© [Tucker LUMP SUM
Fayette LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 [$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00| % 3,500.00
< |Greenbrier | LUMP SUM
£ [Monroe LUMP SUM
3 [Nicholas LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00 [$ 3,500.00
Summers LUMP SUM
o McDowell LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00|% 3,500.00
1 [Mercer LUMPSUM | $ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00| % 3,500.00
j;,-" Raleigh LUMPSUM | $§ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 [$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00|% 3,500.00
a Wyoming LUMPSUM | $§ 1,750.00 | $ 900.00 |$6,000.00 $ 3,250.00(% 3,500.00
ATT B- Mobilization Pricing Page (Laydown) Page 2 of 2 2023 6623C001



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT C - Asphalt Plants (ATT C)

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall enter below the source ASPHALT Plant Names and Locations asphalt may be pulled from under this
contract, and which are listed on Attachment A, including their 911 address. Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location
listed the counties that plant will be used to service for this contract. Referece Section 7.2.2 for additional information. If additional
space is needed to list additional plant locations, Vendor shall submit muitiple Attachment C (ATT C) pages to ensure all plants
are accounted for under this contract.

Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc

Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

Plant Name; American Asphalt of WV LLC
Plant Location: 484 Industrial Road St. Albans, WV
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District § District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
x__|Boone [x |Cabell [ ]Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton [x |Fayette x__|McDowell
X |Clay X_|Lincoln  [x_]Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas | |Greenbrier |x |Mercer
x__ |Kanawha |x_|Logan [ |Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph | |Monroe x_|Raleigh
x_|Mason |x [Mingo [ _|Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker x_|Nicholas | [Wyoming
x__|Putnam [ _|Wayne [x_|Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur | [Summers
b [Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
| {Wood Morgan
Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
Plant Name: American Asphalt of WV LLC
Plant Location: 2334 Rt 52 Kenova, WV
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
X |Boone M Cabell | |Cathoun | |Doddridge Berkeley | |Brooke | {Barbour Pendleton | |Fayette . McDowell
Clay X _|Lincoln || Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock | |Braxton Pocahontas | ] Greenbrier . Mercer
Kanawha X |Logan Pleasants | [Marion Hampshire |  |Marshall | |Gilmer Randolph |  [Monroe . Raleigh
X [Mason |X |Mingo | __|Ritchie Monongalia Hardy | |Ohio | |Lewis Tucker Nicholas ﬁ Wyoming
X_|Putnam |X |Wayne | {Roane Preston Jefferson | |Tyler | {Upshur ﬁ Summers
|| Wirt I.|4 Taylor Mineral | [Wetzel | |Webster
|__|Wood Morgan
ATT C -Asphalt Plants (Laydown) Page of
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County

ATTACHMENT D - Shoulder Stone Plants (ATT D)

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall enter below the sourced STONE Plant Names and Locations stone may be pulled from under this
contract, including their 911 address(es). Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location listed the counties that plant will
be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 7.2.2 for additional information. If additional space is needed to list additional
plant locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment D (ATT D) pages to ensure all plants are accounted for under this

contract.
Vendor Name: BTI Contracting Inc
Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
Plant Name; Mountain Materials - Valley Quarry
Plant Location: 12434 US 60 Olive Hill, KY
This plant may service the following counties under this contract;

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

x_|Boone [x_[Cabell [ |Calhoun Doddridge | [Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay [x_|Lincoln [ lJackson Harrison |  |Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha [x_|Logan | |Pleasants Marion | [Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh

X__|Mason |x |Mingo | |Ritchie Monongalia | |Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming

x__|Putnam [x |Wayne [ |Roane Preston | |Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

| |Wirt Taylor | [Mineral Wetzel Webster
| |Wood | |Morgan
Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
Plant Name:
Plant Location:
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone |__|Cabell | _|Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley |__|Brooke [ Barbour Pendleton H Fayette McDowell
Clay | |Lincoln | |Jackson Harrison |  |Grant | [Hancock | [Braxton Pocahontas | | Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha | |Logan Pleasants Marion | {Hampshire | [Marshall | |Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason | Mingo | |Ritchie Monongalia | |Hardy | |Ohio | jLewis Tucker | [Nicholas Wyoming
Putham | |Wayne | [Roane Preston | |Jefferson Tyler Upshur | |Summers

| |wirt Taylor | |Mineral | [Wetzel | |Webster
| |Wood | |Morgan

ATT D -Shoulder Stone Plants (Laydown)
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT D - Shoulder Stone Plants (ATT D)

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shali enter below the sourced STONE Plant Names and Locations stone may be puiled from under this
contract, including their 911 address(es). Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location listed the counties that plant will
be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 7.2.2 for additional information. If additional space is needed to list additional
plant locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment D (ATT D) pages to ensure all plants are accounted for under this

contract.
Vendor Name: BTl Contracting inc
Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
Plant Name: Scary Creek Materials
Plant Location: #9 Orders Way Winfield, WV
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
x_|Boone [x |Cabell [ ]Calhoun Doddridge [ |Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette x _|McDowell
x_|{Clay  |x |Lincoln [x_|Jackson Harison | |Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas | _|Greenbrier [x__|Mercer
x__|Kanawha {x_{Logan | |Pleasants Marion | __[Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe x |Raleigh
x_[Mason |[x_|Mingo [ |Ritchie Monongalia | _|Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas | |Wyoming
x__|Putnam | |Wayne x_|Roane Preston | [Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

| |Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster

| {Wood | |Morgan

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:
Plant Name: Valley Stone Yard & Maritime Center
Plant Location: 360 Valley Road Millwood, WV
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
X __|Boone  [x |Cabell | [Calhoun | [Doddridge Berkeley Brooke | [Barbour Pendleton | x [Fayette E McDowell
x  |Clay X _[Lincoln |x |Jackson | |Harrison | |Grant | |Hancock [ [Braxton Pocahontas | [Greenbrier E Mercer
X {Kanawha x_|Logan | [Pleasants | [Marion | |Hampshire | |Marshall | [Gilmer Randolph | |Monroe E Raleigh
x {Mason [x |Mingo Ritchie | |Monongalia | |Hardy | [Ohio | |Lewis Tucker [x_|Nicholas . Wyoming
x {Putnam | |Wayne x_[Roane | |Preston Jefferson | |Tyler | {Upshur | |Summers

| |Wirt |__[Taylor | |Mineral |  |Wetzel | {Webster

| {Wood | |Morgan

ATT D -Shoulder Stone Plants (Laydown)
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