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Purchasing Division S
2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response
Post Office Box 50130

Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder: 1390763
Solicitation Description: Concrete Pavement and Bridge Deck Patch Repair 6624C038

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2024-04-11 14:30 SR 0803 ESR04082400000005858 1
VENDOR

000000181078

BECKLEY CRANE & CONSTRUCTION INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000072
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2024-04-08 Response Time:
Comments:

11:54:30

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859

dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN# DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Concrete Pavement Repair, TYPE | 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141107

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Concrete Pavement Repair, TYPE |

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Concrete Pavement Repair, TYPE Il 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141107

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Concrete Pavement Repair, TYPE Il

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Concrete Pavement Repair, TYPE IlI 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141107

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Concrete Pavement Repair, TYPE lll

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Replace Existing Aggregate Base Course, 0.00000 TON
Class 1
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141107

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Replace Existing Aggregate Base Course, Class 1

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

5 Class A Concrete 0.00000 CY
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Class A Concrete

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Class B Concrete 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Class B Concrete

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Class C Concrete 0.00000 cCY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Class C Concrete

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Class D Concrete 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Class D Concrete

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Modified Concrete, Class A 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500
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Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Modified Concrete, Class A

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Modified Concrete, Class B 0.00000 cCY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Modified Concrete, Class B

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Modified Concrete, Class C 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Modified Concrete, Class C

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Modified Concrete, Class D 0.00000 cCY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Modified Concrete, Class D

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Modified Architectural Concrete, Class B 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111900

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Modified Architectural Concrete, Class B

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Epoxy Coated Reinforcing Steel Bar - 0.00000 LB
Concrete Pavement Repair
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111900

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Epoxy Coated Reinforcing Steel Bar - Concrete Pavement Repair

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Concrete Protective Coating (Concrete 0.00000 SF
Pavement Repair)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141127

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Concrete Protective Coating

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Deck Repair: Patching Concrete Structures - 0.00000 CY
Type D1
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141127

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Deck Repair: Patching Concrete Structures - Type D1

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Deck Repair: Patching Concrete Structures - 0.00000 CY
Type D2
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141127

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Deck Repair: Patching Concrete Structures - Type D2

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Deck Repair: Patching Concrete Structures - 0.00000 CY
Type D3
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

72141127

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Deck Repair: Patching Concrete Structures - Type D3

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Deck Repair: Patching Concrete Structures - 0.00000 CY
Type D4
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141127

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Deck Repair: Patching Concrete Structures - Type D4

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Modified Concrete, Class K 0.00000 cCY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Modified Concrete, Class K

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Epoxy Coated Reinforcing Steel Bar - Bridge 0.00000 LB
Deck Repair
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111900

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Epoxy Coated Reinforcing Steel Bar - Bridge Deck Repair

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Concrete Protective Coating (Bridge Deck 0.00000 SF
Repair)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
72141127
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Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Concrete Protective Coating

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Slurry Removal (Diamond Grinding) 0.00000 LS

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

76122404

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Slurry Removal (Diamond Grinding)

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Erosion Control Items (Diamond Grinding 0.00000 LS
Slurry Release Prev)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Erosion Control Iltems (Diamond Grinding Slurry Release Prevention)

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Final Textured Surface Area of Diamond 0.00000 SY
Ground Pavement
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
73181012

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:

Final Textured Surface Area of Diamond Ground Pavement

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Pilot Truck and Driver 0.00000 DAY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78142004

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Pilot Truck and Driver

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Traffic Control Devices 0.00000 UNIT

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

46161500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Traffic Control Devices

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Flagger 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

64131606

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Flagger

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Traffic Control (per Job Site) 0.00000 JOB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

46161500

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Traffic Control (per Job Site)

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Electric Arrow Board 0.00000 DAY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

46161504

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Electric Arrow Board

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

31 Daytime Mobilization 0.00000 LS
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Daytime Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Nighttime Mobilization 0.00000 LS

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID

Extended Description:
Nighttime Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 On-Site Mobilization 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
On-Site Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Material Disposal 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

64131606

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Material Disposal

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Agricultural Limestone 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10170000
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Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Agricultural Limestone

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Fertilizer 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10170000

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Fertilizer

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Seed Mixtures 0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10151700

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Seed Mixtures

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Mulch 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11121706

Commodity Line Comments: NO BID
Extended Description:
Mulch

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on ATT A Pricing Pages. Bid pricing or other notations made in the
wvOASIS commodity line description area will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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