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2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

Proc Folder: 1077903
Solicitation Description: ADDENDUM 2:Tree and Arborist Services - Statewide-6622C061

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2022-08-18 14:30 SR 0803 ESR08112200000000692 1
VENDOR
VS0000018505

MOUNTAIN TREE SERVICE LLC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2300000006
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2022-08-13 Response Time:
Comments:

21:36:03

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859

dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN# DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Crew Foreman/Climber Specialist 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

76122405

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Minimum of 1 per job site.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Equipment Operator 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

76122405

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Minimum of 1 per job site.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 General Laborer 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

76122405

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Minimum of 1 per job site.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Material / Debris Disposal 0.00000 JOB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

76122407

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

5 Aerial Bucket Truck - Over-center Articulated 0.00000 HOUR 160.000000 0.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22101800

Commodity Line Comments: 160 per hour
Extended Description:

Minimum vertical reach of fifty (50) feet above a roadway and a minimum horizontal reach of thirty (30) feet.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Aerial Bucket Truck - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE 11000.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: 11,000 for 5280 feet

Extended Description:
Aerial Bucket Truck - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Boom Mower Brush Cutter Attachment 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

21101701

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Boom Mower Brush Cutter Attachment - For use with skid steers

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Boom Mower Brush Cutter Attachment - 0.00000 HOUR
Mobilization
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Boom Mower Brush Cutter Attachment - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Boom Mower 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

21101701
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Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Boom Mower w/60 in. rotary mower deck

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Boom Mower - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Boom Mower Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Brush/Log Chipper w/Chip Box - Contract 0.00000 HOUR 160.000000 0.00
Iltem 11
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
23231800

Commodity Line Comments: 160 in hour
Extended Description:

Brush/Log Chipper w/Chip Box: Up to twelve (12) inch diameter log capabilities. Must include a standard two (2) ton truck with chip box (10 cubic
yards) and shall be bid as one inclusive price.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Brush/Log Chipper w/Chip Box - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE 11000.000000 0.00
Contract Item 11
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Commodity Line Comments: 11,000 dollars
Extended Description:

Brush/Log Chipper w/Chip Box - Mobilization for Contract Item 11

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Brush/Log Chipper w/Chip Box - Whole tree 0.00000 HOUR 160.000000 0.00
chipper
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
23231800

Commodity Line Comments: 160 in hour
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Extended Description:
Brush/Log Chipper w/Chip Box - Whole tree chipper. Must include a standard two (2) ton truck with chip box (20 cubic yards) and be bid as one
inclusive price

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

14 Brush/Log Chipper w/Chip Box - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE 11000.000000 0.00
Contract Item 13

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Commodity Line Comments: 11,000 dollars
Extended Description:
Brush/Log Chipper w/Chip Box - Mobilization for Contract Iltem 13

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Chip Van / Trailer 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25181700

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Chip Van / Trailer

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Chip Van / Trailer - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:

Chip Van / Trailer Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Crane - Knuckle Boom w/Grapple Saw 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

24101600

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:

Crane - Knuckle Boom with Grapple Saw:

Minimum 40 ft vertical reach. Minimum 14 in. diameter cutting/grasping capabilities. Minimum 3, 700 Ib. horizontal reach lifting capacity. Rubber
tire chassis with outriggers. Capable of 360 degree rotation on chassis.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Crane - Knuckle Boom with Grapple Saw - 0.00000 MILE
Mobilization
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Crane - Knuckle Boom with Grapple Saw Mobilization.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Crane Mats 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

24101600

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Crane Mats: Must meet the minimum industry standard size of 4x16x8

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Crane Mats - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Crane Mats - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Excavator - Long reach 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

22100000

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Excavator - Long reach with full swing capability

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue

Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Excavator (Long reach) - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Excavator (Long reach) - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Excavator - Mini 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

22100000

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Excavator - Mini

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Excavator (Mini) - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Excavator (Mini) - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Excavator - Wheeled 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

22100000

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Excavator - Wheeled

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Excavator (Wheeled) - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603
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Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Excavator (Wheeled) - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Gooseneck Dump Trailer 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

25181700

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Gooseneck Dump Trailer

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Gooseneck Dump Trailer - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Gooseneck Dump Trailer - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Grapple Truck 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

24101600

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Grapple Truck

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Grapple Truck - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Grapple Truck - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Horizontal Grinder 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

21102200

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Horizontal Grinder

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Horizontal Grinder - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Horizontal Grinder - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Lift truck / Chip truck 0.00000 HOUR 160.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

21102200

Commodity Line Comments: 160 in hour
Extended Description:
Lift truck / Chip truck

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Lift truck / Chip truck - Mobilizatoin 0.00000 MILE 20000.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: 20,000
Extended Description:
Lift truck / Chip truck - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

35 Mulching Mower 0.00000 HOUR
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
21101701

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Mulching Mower

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Mulching Mower - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE 160.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: 160 in hour
Extended Description:
Mulching Mower - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

21102200

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear:

Carrying vehicle should be able to traverse rough terrain. Unit should be capable of saw cutting trees and brush vertically from as low as six (6)
feet above ground, a vertical reach of fifty (50) feet, and a horizontal reach of at least ten (10) feet beyond the edge of the carrying vehicle tires.
*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear - 0.00000 MILE
Mobilizationl
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Skid Steer - Mini 0.00000 HOUR
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
22000000

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Skid Steer - Mini

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Skid Steer (Mini) - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Skid Steer (Mini) - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Skid Steer - Wheeled / Track Loader 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

22000000

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Skid Steer - Wheeled / Track Loader

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 Skid Steer (Wheeled / Track Loader) - 0.00000 MILE
Mobilization
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:

Skid Steer (Wheeled / Track Loader) - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Slope Mower 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

21101701
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Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Slope Mower: Compact tractor / Minimum 30 deg. slope rating.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Slope Mower - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Slope Mower - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Spider Lift 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

22101800

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Spider Lift: Minimum 72 ft working height. Minimum 41 ft side reach.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Spider Lift - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Spider Lift - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Stump Grinder - Tracked 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

23101506

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Stump Grinder - Tracked

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Stump Grinder (Tracked) - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Stump Grinder (Tracked) - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Stump Grinder - Walk-behind 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

23101506

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Stump Grinder - Walk-behind

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Stump Grinder (Walk-behind) - Mobilzation 0.00000 MILE 160.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

23101506

Commodity Line Comments: 160 in hour
Extended Description:
Stump Grinder (Walk-behind) - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Track Chipper 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

23101506

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Track Chipper

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

52 Track Chipper - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Track Chipper - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 Tracked Feller Buncher 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

21102200

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Tracked Feller Buncher: With 360 degree rotating bunching head.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54 Tracked Feller Buncher - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid

Extended Description:
Tracked Feller Buncher - Mobilization.

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55 Tree Handler / Harvester 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

21102200

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:

Tree Handler / Harvester: Rubber tired undercarriage. 4 point outrigger support. Felling head with 360 degree capabilities.
*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
56 Tree Handler / Harvester - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603
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Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Tree Handler / Harvester - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
57 Tub Grinder 0.00000 HOUR

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

23101506

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Tub Grinder

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
58 Tub Grinder - Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121603

Commodity Line Comments: No bid
Extended Description:
Tub Grinder - Mobilization

*VENDOR NOTE: Bid evaluation will be based on bid prices submitted on the ATT A and ATT B Pricing Pages. Vendor entries of bid prices or
other notations made in the wwOASIS commaodity line descriptions will not be considered for bid evaluation or award.
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