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2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1162204

Solicitation Description: Addendum 1: 6623C026 Ready Mixed Cement Concrete & CLSM

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes

Solicitation Response

Version

2023-02-14 14:30

SR 0803 ESR02132300000003755

1

VENDOR

000000114364
JOWAR READY MIX

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2300000050

Total Bid: 0

Comments:

Response Date:

2023-02-13 Response Time: 19:57:26

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859

dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X

FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class A Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 cCY 315.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 260.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 210.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Class B Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 205.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 3
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty

Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

12 Class C Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 cCY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 4 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Class D Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 500.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 450.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 400.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 cCY 350.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 325.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY 275.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 225.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Class K Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 220.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

25 Mod Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 6
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Mod Class K Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Mod Class K Concrete 4-4.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Mod Class K Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code
30111500

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 CLSM Type A 5 or more

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bld
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bld
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code
30111500

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 CLSM Type B 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 CLSM Type B-Modified Pipe Slurry 2-2.99 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500
Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 CLSM Type B-Modified Pipe Slurry 3-3.99 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500
Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 CLSM Type B-Modified Pipe Slurry 3-3.99 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500
Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 CLSM Type B-Modified Pipe Slurry 4-4.99 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

41 CLSM Type C 2-2.99

0.00000 CY 305.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111500

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 255.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 205.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 CLSM Type C 5 or more 0.00000 CY 200.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
45

Additional Haul per truck load over 5 miles 0.00000 MILE 12.000000

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111500

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 10
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Penalty Charge per truck, each minute 0.00000 TRKM 2.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Class B using Silica Sand

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Increased cement 0.00000 CY 25.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Water-reducing set retarder 0.00000 CY 8.250000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12162303

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Water reducer 0.00000 CY 4.900000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12164801

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 11 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Calcium chloride 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Non-calcium chloride 0.00000 CY 25.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 Super plasticizer 0.00000 CY 10.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54 Fiber 0.00000 CY 8.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162305

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55 Heated Concrete 0.00000 CY 15.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 12 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

56 Ice 0.00000 LB 3.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162305

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 13 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05



State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1162204 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Addendum 1; 6623C026 Ready Mixed Cement Concrete & CLSM Addendum 1 is issued:

1. To attach vendors questions

and responses
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement no other changes
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2023-02-03 2023-02-14 14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOTZ2300000050 2

BUDGET & PROCUREMENT
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
BLDG 5, RM A-317

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WY 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: 000000114364

Vendor Name : Jowar Ready Mix Concrete

Address : 202 Coal Heritage Road

Street ;

City : laeger

State : West Virginia Country : USA Zip : 24844
Principal Contact : Joseph Salyers

Vendor Contact Phone: 304-938-3658 Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Busty J Smith

304-414-58559

dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor G - .

Signatura X P S FEINg 20-824-0984 DATE  February 13, 2023

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Feb 3, 2073 Page 1 FORM ID. \WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020105



Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: Jowar Ready Mix Concrete

Source Plant Name & Location(s): Jowar Ready Mix Concrete
202 Coal Heritage Rosad

lzeger, West Virginia 24844

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" beside Ihe counties that correspond with the Source Plant(s) bid prices on
this page. If Vendor has vaned pricing per county or per plant, Viendor shall compleie a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT &)
for each county pricing set or each plant's pricing. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C (if applicable) will result in the

disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the coniract specifications will be awarded with a
cantract. The low bid vendor perproject will be determined al the lime of need, as per Section 4 of the contract specifications.
Estimated quantitias are not avaiiable.

Distrct 1 Distnct 2 District3 District ¢ District & Distict @ District 7 Distnct 8 Districi 9 District 10

| |Boone |_|Cabell Calthoun Doddridge. | |Berkeley | [Brooke | |Barbour Pandiston | |Fayetls ﬂ McDaowell
| |Clay | |Lincoln Jackson Harrisan | |Grant | |Hancock | |Braxton Pocahontas | |Greenbrier % |Msrcer
| |Kanawha [x |Logan Fieasants Marion |_[{Hampshire | |Marshall | |Gilmer Randoiph | |Monros ﬂ Raleigh
| |Mason ¥ [Minga Ritchpe Monongaliz | |Hardy | |Ohio | |Eewis Tucker | _[Micholaz % |Wyoming
| |Putnam | |Wayns Reane Freston | |Jefterson | |Tyler | |Upshur | |Summers
Wirt Taylor | Mineral | |Watze! Webster
Wood __{Morgan
* Coniract lems 1-40 Inclides matedals plus delivery within 5 miles of Suppfier Plant Location
Contract Linit of Size of : )
Cont |
item ¥ ontract ltem Description Maasira Projact List Price
1 2-2.99
2 3-3.99
Class A Concrete® CY
3 4-4 98
4 5 or mare.
5 2-2.89 $315.00
6 3398 | $260.00
Class B Concreie” cY -
‘ 4499 | $210.00
|8 5 or more | $205.00
g 2-2.99
10 - a-3.99
Class C Concrete* '
11 cY 4-4,99
12 S Or mMore
13 2-2.99
14 4-3.89
Class D Can ! '
15 Grete i 44,99
16 5 or more
17 2-200 | $500.00
18 lorass H Cancrete: oy | 3389 | 345000
18 4-4 95 3400.00
20 3 or more 535000

ATT A -Pricing Pages Page 1of 2 AMA 6623C026



Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

21 2-2.95 $325.00
22 ; 3-3.90 | $275.00
>3 Class K Concrete CY 4465 %535 00
24 5 or more | $220.00
25 2-2.89

gg Mod Class K Conerete® cY ij‘:g

28 5 or more

29 2-2.89

30 = . 3-3.89

31 CLSM Type A cY 3400

¥ 5 or mare

K] 2-2.99

34 . 3-3.99

35 CLSM Type B CY 4.4 90

38 5 or more

37 2-2.99

gg CLSM Type B* - Modified Pipe Slurry Y iigg

40 5 or more

41 2-2.99 $305.00
42 . 3-3.99 $255.00
a3 oM Tipe € wl 4409 | $205.00
44 S5 ormore | $200.00
45  |Additional Haul per truck load over 5 miles Mile — $12.00
46 |Penalty Charge per inick, each minute MinLite eeeen $2.00
47  |Class B using Silica Sand cy S,

48 |Increased cement cY —— $25.00
49  |Waler-reducing sef retarder cY —— $8.25
50 |Water reducer CY — $4.50
51 |CGalclum chlporide Y ———

52  |Non-caleium chlonde cY = $256.00
53  |Super plasticizer Y — 510.00
54  |Fiber CY T $8.00
55 |Heated Concrete CY - $15.00
56 |lce LB ———— $3.00

ATT A -Pricing Pages

Page 2 of 2
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Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
Source Plant Information - Attachment B (ATT B)

Vendor Name:; Jowar Ready Mix Concrete

Vendor Instructions: ATT B must be submitted at the time of bid and shall correspond with the
source plants listed on the Pricing Pages, ATT A. ATT B must be completed in its entirely. Failure
to submit ATT B at the time of bid will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.

Piant Name Plant Location
(211 Physical Address)

Plant Approval Status (mark one) ”C?;;}“g:;:\'al

Approvei- Provide P/5S Code
Jowar Ready Mix |202 Coal Herntage Road

Concrete lasger, WV 24844 ikl JRM 1.01.601

—

Approved- Provide Py5 Code
Mot Approved/Fending

Approved- Provide P/S Code

O R O O 5

Mot Approved/Panding

Approved- Provide P/S Code

L[

Mot Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide P/S Code

i il

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide P/5 Code

Not Approved /Pending

Approved- Provide P/5 Code

EN

Mot Approved/Pending

-u."
L

Approved- Provide P/5 Code
Not Approvad/Pending

1

Approved- Provide P75 Code

A

i ot Approved/Pending

I

Approved - Pravide /5 Code

.

hot Approved/Pending

10
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Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
Equal To Proposals - Attachment C (ATT C}

Vendor Name. Jowar Ready Mix Concrete

Vendor Instructions: ATT C must be submitted al the time of bid if bidding an "equal to” product, and shall
correspond with the prices bid on the Pricing Pages, ATT A, ATT C must be completed in its entirety. Vendor shall
list the proposed "equal lo” products’ name and product identification number below. If left blank or if ATT C is not
submitted with the bid, Agency will assume Vendor is bidding the requested brand.

Specified Brand Proposed "Equal to" Product Name & Number

HE-122 Calcium Chionde based accelerator

MASTERSET AC 534

Darex Set Non-Calcium Chioride hased accelarator

MASTERRHEBUILD 1000

Eucon 37 Super Plasticizer

ATT C-Equal To Proposals 1 AMA 66230026



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO,: DOT23-50

Instructions: Please acknowledge reccipt of ull addenda issued with this solicitation _by_ completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualilication,

Acknuwledgment: | hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions o my proposal, plans and/or specilication, ele.

A hers ived:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[x] Addendum No. | | | Addendum No, 6
| ] Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No.?7
| | Addendum No. 3 [ 1 Addendum No. 8
[ 1 Addendum No. 4 | | Addendum No, 9
[ ] Addendum No. 3 | | Addendum No. 10

[ understand that [ailure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid, [
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed o be made durimg any oral
discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding, Only the
mformation 1ssued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

Jowar Ready Mix Concrele

Company

g

J’::_,.:-‘_:_'E';;: :—5-‘:"" = e

Authonzed Signature

February 13, 2023

[ate

NOTE: This-addendum acknowledgement should be submitied with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised /82012



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this

Contract,

Joseph Salyers Owner

(Printed Name and Title)
202 Coal TNeritage Road lasger, WV 24844

(Address)
304-038-1656 / 304-038- 3600
(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)

jowarstoresi@thotmail.com

(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wyOASIS, 1 certify that | have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that [ understand
the requirements. terms and conditions, and other information contained herein: that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer (o the State that cannol be unilaterally withdrawn: that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service. unless otherwise stated herem; that the Vendor uccepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that | am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services: that this bid or offer is in all respects [air and without
collusion or fraud: that this Contract is accepted or entered into without-any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection o any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that T am
authorized by the Vendor to execule and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto on Vendor’s behall’ that | am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly régistered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By signing below. I further certify that 1 understand this Confract is subject to the
rovisions of West Vireinia Code § 34-3-62, which avtomatically voids certain contraet
clauses thai violate State law.

Jowar Ready Mix Concrete
(Company)

/v;ﬂ :ﬁf;'(_::‘_ﬁ_z'———_

(Signature of Authorized Represenative)

Joseph Salyers Owner
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

February 13, 2023
(Date)
J04-938-3656 / 304-938-3690

(Phone Number) (IFax Number)
Revised 08/12/2022




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Ready Mixed Portland Cement Conerete & CLSM

Form Revisad

Reports: Vendor shall provide the Agency with guarterly reports, annual
summaaries, and/or m-:-mhl}r reports as requested by the Agency und/or the West
Virginia Purchasing Division showing quantities. total dollar value of the Contract
ltems purchased, ordered, shipped & invoiced with dates in sprn:adshﬂft format as
defined by the Agency, Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this Contract.

Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contruct, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor's responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be
available during normul business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
her contact information below,

Contract Manager: Joseph Salvers
Telephone Number: 304-938-3656
Fax Number: 304-938-3690

Email Address: jowarstoresi@hotmail.com

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information
provided above within 10 calendar days of such changes, Failure o comply may
be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

15 AMA



THIS CERTIFICATE [ ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION OMLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIRICATE HOLDER. THIS

i TE DOES NOT AFARMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERASE AFFOROED BY THE POUCIES
T3 CERMPICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE IBSUING INSURER(E), AUTHORIZED

HRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIRICATE HOLDER.

H.IP"EIH'IIH'I" i the cartificate halder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, tha :ullt::.l{h:l]ml be endorsad. i SUSROGATION 15 WAIVED, subject o
\erme and condiidons of the palicy, certain policies may reguite an endorssment. A stalement on this cerificate does not confar rights o

holdar o lieu of such endorsementis)

RETAIL AGENT
BANKERS INSLIRANCE LLEC

OMNE STAFFFRD COABMCRS

PRINCETORN, W 24748

PHONE 3044317038 FAX: 3044335004

GENERAL AGENT

RS SPECIALTY, LLC, INC.
2307 MENDHER BLVD
JOHNSTOWN, PA 15805

COMPART A NORTHRIELD IM5 00

COMPANY B

JOVER FREALTY MK COMNCRETE
JOEEPH BALYERS

M2 COAL HERITAGE FD)
IAEGER, VW 24844

COMPANY G
COMPENY D

COMPANY E

LCOMPANIES AFFORGING COVERMIE

THE 1E 10 CERTIEY THAT TFE FOLICIES OF INSLRANLCE LIS TED BELDMW HAVE BEEN SSUED T0) THE INGLRED NANELD ABGIVE FUR THE POLULYT PERICD INDICAT ED,
NOTWITHSTANING ANy RECLIFENENT, TERM 0, COMDITION OF ANY COWTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TOWHICH TME CERTIFICATE MAY EE 1SSUED
DR BAY PERTAN THE INSURANCE AFFORIED BY THE POLIGES ESCREEDHEREIN IS SLBIECT TOALL THE TERME, BRSNS AMD COADTT oS OF SUICH
POLIGES. Lmsslﬂww.‘r HAVE BEFMN RENUCED BY PAID C1LANS

& TYPE OF INSURANCE poucy numser | EFTECTVE | EXFIRATON LIMITS AMOUNT
R (MDY ) M

GENERAL UIABILITY WEE1ZE56 DEASZ0E2 | DEIWAIZY | GENERAL AGGREGATE 52,000,003

FECOMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY PROGLCTS OUMPOR AGG 22,000,000
A [T]EWNERS & CONTRALTORS PROT EACH DOD RRENCE $1,000,001

B FRE DYOMAGE {Ary one firs) 3100000

[ FAED B0 |y e peron) 55,000

ALROMOBILE LIABILITY :

Dmf AJTG CONBIMNED SiNGLE LIMIT k|

[JALL CANNED ALTOS .

LT BOOILY INJURY (Per peran) 8

Lib eAte BODHLY INJURY (Porauideil) -

[MONOWED ALTES ;

E PROPERTY DAMAGE g
| GARAGE LIABILITY ALITO ORLY EA ALCIOENT

[JANY AUTO O HER THAN AUTO ORLY _

[HORIMMED ALITCS EACH ACCITENT

B ~ AGGREGATE

EXCESS LIABILITY EACH DOCUFNENCE AGEREGATE -

LMERELLS FORM

[JOTHER THAN LMBRELLA FORM SR

WORKERS COMPERSATION STATUTORY LIMITS

B EMPLOYERS LIABILITY EACH ALCEDENT

THE PROFRISTOR PARTHERS! L DESEASE - EACH EMPLOVEE

EXECUTIVE OFFICERS ARE: e DESEASE - BOLICY LIMIT

FOR INFORMATION OhLY

a.wcFﬂ-Em:n..E - DESCRIBEE CANCELL EDBER
THERECF, NOTICE WLL 8E EFJJ#EE}WWHEWTHTFEMJGT' PROVIGIONS

3] Epuﬂ'r,rlaadlum o I-EI_—".SW';#W, UE a Eﬂm [y hised [zl fy sty Fr liﬂ:ﬂtﬂﬂdﬂgﬁfﬁﬂ]ﬂfm LLC in Califomea RS Spenialty Inamnos Senarms

UL (Licanes # 0007516).



