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> h Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1162204

Solicitation Description: Addendum 1: 6623C026 Ready Mixed Cement Concrete & CLSM

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes

Solicitation Response

Version

2023-02-14 14:30

SR 0803 ESR02102300000003681

1

VENDOR

000000201143
RBS INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2300000050

Total Bid: 0

Comments:

Response Date:

2023-02-10 Response Time: 09:40:00

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859

dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X

FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class A Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty

Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Class B Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer
30111505

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 3

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty

Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

12 Class C Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 cCY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 4 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty

Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

16 Class D Concrete 5 or more

0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

17 Class H Concrete 2-2.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

18 Class H Concrete 2-2.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

19 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

20 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer
30111505

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 5

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Class K Concrete 3-3.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Class K Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Mod Class K Concrete 2-2.99

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 6 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Mod Class K Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Mod Class K Concrete 4-4.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Mod Class K Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
30 CLSM Type A 3-3.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code
30111500

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 CLSM Type A 5 or more

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
35 CLSM Type B 4-4.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code
30111500

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 CLSM Type B 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 CLSM Type B-Modified Pipe Slurry 2-2.99 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 CLSM Type B-Modified Pipe Slurry 3-3.99 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 CLSM Type B-Modified Pipe Slurry 3-3.99 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 CLSM Type B-Modified Pipe Slurry 4-4.99 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 CLSM Type C 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
45

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
Additional Haul per truck load over 5 miles 0.00000 MILE

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code
30111500

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023

Page: 10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Penalty Charge per truck, each minute 0.00000 TRKM

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Class B using Silica Sand

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Increased cement 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Water-reducing set retarder 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12162303

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

50 Water reducer

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code
12164801

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 11 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Calcium chloride 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Non-calcium chloride

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 Super plasticizer 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54 Fiber 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12162305

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55 Heated Concrete

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 12 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

56 Ice 0.00000 LB

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12162305

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 15, 2023 Page: 13 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05



State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Highways
Proc Folder: 1162204 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Addendum 1: 6623C026 Ready Mixed Cement Concrete & CLSM Addendum 1 is issued:
1. To attach vendors questions
and responses

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement no other changes
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2023-02-03 2023-02-14 14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2300000050 2

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BUDGET & PROCUREMENT

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 5, RM A-317

1800 KANAWHA BLVD E

CHARLESTON WV 25305

us
VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: 000000201143 . .

Vendor Name : R B S Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix

) PO Box 490,

Address : White Sulphur Springs

Street : WV USA 24986

City : William Snyder

304.645.2277

State :

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith

304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

\Siiegnndac::re X / FEIN# 3\5 OL*/’ 7 ‘ {Ob DATE q %b Z}

Date Printed:  Feb 3, 2023 Page 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05

4(‘\[15"

All offers subject to all te‘ms and conditions contained in this solicitation



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract.

William B. Snyder, V. P.,, RB S Inc.

(Printed Name and Title)
PO Box 490, White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986

(Address)
304.645.2277 / 304.645.2597

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
bill@rbsinc.com

(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that I am
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto on Vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By signing below, I further certify that 1 understand this Contract is subject to the
provisions of West Virginia Code § 5A4-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law.

R B S Inc.
(Company)

_~
(Signature of Au&horizéd—k{presentative)

William B. Snyder, M. P, R B S Inc.
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

9 FEB 2023
(Date)

304.645.2277 / 304.645.2597 RB S ‘ . .
(Phone Number) (Fax Number) S Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix
PO Box 490 :

Revised 09/12/2022 QZ) [ 5 V/hite Sulphur Springs, WV 24986
304.645.2277 -




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM

83  Reports: Vendor shall provide the Agency with quarterly reports, annual
summaries, and/or monthly reports as requested by the Agency and/or the West
Virginia Purchasing Division showing quantities, total dollar value of the Contract
Items purchased, ordered, shipped & invoiced with dates in spreadsheet format as
defined by the Agency. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this Contract.

84  Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
her contact information below.

Contract Manager: M // /'ﬂ/’V/ Q VQ/Z/.

Telephone Number: _304,64/5. 227'%
Fax Number: 30d.64/5. 2597
Email Address: billCrbéinc.c m

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information
provided above within 10 calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may
be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 15 AMA 6623C026
RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix
03 , < PO Box 490
White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986
304.645.2277




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete & CLSM

7. VENDOR DEFAULT:
7.1  The following shall be considered a vendor default under this Contract.

7.1.1 Failure to provide Contract Items in accordance with the requirements
contained herein.

7.1.2 Failure to comply with other specifications and requirements contained
herein.

7.1.3 Failure to comply with any laws, rules, and ordinances applicable to the
Contract Services provided under this Contract.

7.1.4 Failure to remedy deficient performance upon request.
7.2 The following remedies shall be available to Agency upon default.
7.2.1 Immediate cancellation of the Contract.
7.2.2 Immediate cancellation of one or more ADO’s issued under this Contract.
7.2.3 Any other remedies available in law or equity.
8. MISCELLANEOUS:

8.1  No Substitutions: Vendor shall supply only Contract Items submitted in response
to the Solicitation unless a contract modification is approved in accordance with
the provisions contained in this Contract.

82  Vendor Supply: Vendor must carry sufficient inventory of the Contract Items

being offered to fulfill its obligations under this Contract. By signing its bid,
Vendor certifies that it can supply the Contract Items contained in its bid response.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 14 AMA 6623C026

2NN



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: DOT23-50

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this
addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[/] Addendum No. 1 [ 1 Addendum No. 6
[ 1 Addendum No.2 [ 1 Addendum No.7
[ 1 Addendum No.3 [ 1 Addendum No. 8
[ 1 Addendum No. 4 [ 1 Addendum No.9
[ 1 Addendum No.5 [ 1 Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the
information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding.

RS T

Company

IA/I/VMJ*/(/

4%%%

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.
Revised 6/8/2012

RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix

PO Box 490
-
bs))s White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986

304.645.2277

_—



Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
Equal To Proposals - Attachment C (ATT C)

Vendor Name: R B S Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix

Vendor Instructions: ATT C must be submitted at the time of bid if bidding an "equal to" product, and shall comespond with
the prices bid on the Pricing Pages, ATT A. ATT C must be completed in its entirety. Vendor shall list the proposed "equal to"
products' name and product identification number below. If left blank or if ATT C is not submitted with the bid, Agency will

assume Vendor is bidding the requested brand.

Specified Brand

Proposed "Equal to" Product Name & Number

HE-122 Calcium Chloride based accelerator

Darex Set Non-Calcium Chloride based accelerator

Euclid Accelguard 80 1438367A

Eucon 37 Super Plasticizer

ATT C-Equal To Proposals

RBS Inc. Greenbrier Réad)}"f\il'ix
PO Box 490

Write Sulphur Springs, WV 24986
304.645.2277 |

o )rs

——

AMA 6623C026



Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATTA)

Vendor Nam R B S Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix

Source Plant Name & Location(s Greenbrier Ready Mix, 256 Industrial Way, Caldwell, WV 24925

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" beside the counties that correspond with the Source Plant(s) bid prices on
this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per county or per plant, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A) for
each county pricing set or each plant's pricing. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C (if applicable) will result in the
disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a
contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the contract specifications.
Fstimated auantities ara not availahla

District 1 District 2 District 3  District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Poczhontas Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Chio Lewis Tucker Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
* Contract Items 1-40 Includes materials plus delivery within 5 miles of Supplier Plant Location
Contract Contract Item Description Unit of Sizg of List Price
ltem # Measure Project
1 2-2.99 |No Bid
2 3-3.99 No Bid
Cl AC te*
3 ass oncrete CYy 24 99 No Bid
4 5 or more No Bid
5 2-2.99 $390.50
6 3-3.99 $318.75
Cl B *
7 ass B Concrete cY 4-4.99 | $247.50
8 Sormore | $194.40
9 2-2.99 No Bid
10 3-3.99 No Bid
I *
11 Class C Concrete cY 4-4.99 No Bid
12 Sormore | No Bid
13 2-2.99 No Bid
14 . 3-3.99 No Bid
15 Class D Concrete CcY 24 99 No Bid
16 Sormore | No Bid
17 2-299 | No Bid
18 » 3-3.99 No Bid
Class H Concrete cY
19 4-4.99 No Bid
20 5 or more No Bid
RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix
PO Box 490
Iy // S White Sulphur Springs, WV 24386
304.645.2277
ATT A-Pricing Pages Pagelof2 AMA6623C026



Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concreteand CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATTA)

21 2-2.99 $442.75
22 Class K Concrete* cY 3-3.99 $871.50
23 4-4.99 $300.50
24 Sormore | $248.50
25 2-2.99 No Bid
26 . 3-3.99 No Bid
27 Mod Class K Concrete CY 4-4.99 No Bid
28 5 or more No Bid
29 2-2.99 No Bid
30 * 3-3.99 No Bid
31 |CLSMType A cY 4499 | No Bid
32 5 or more No Bid
33 2-2.99 $335.00
34 . 3-3.99 $265.00
35 |C-SMType B cY 4499 | $195.00
36 5 ormore | $130.00
37 2-2.99 $310.00
38 . . . 3-3.99 $240.50
39 CLSM Type B* - Modified Pipe Slumry CY 4499 $185 25
40 Sormore | $117.50
41 2-2.99 $345.00
42 . 3-3.99 $275.00
23 |CtSMType © cY 4499 | $215.00
44 5ormore | $150.00
45 | Additional Haul per truck load over 5 miles Mile | ---—-- $8.00
46 |Penalty Charge per truck, each minute Minute |  ----—-- $2.25
47 |Class B using Silica Sand CcY — $24.00
48 |Increased cement CcY --mm- $15.00
49 |Water-reducing set retarder CY —— $6.50 -
50 |Water reducer cY | - $5.00
51 Calcium chloride CcY — $0.15
52 |Non-calcium chloride cY | - $0.25
653 | Super plasticizer cY | --—-- $14.45
54 |Fiber CcY | --——-- $10.00
55 |Heated Concrete cy | - $8.00
856 __llce [ = T T _$1.00

ATT A -Pricing Pages

Page 2 of 2

RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix
PO Box 490

White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986
304.645.2277
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Vendor Name

Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

R B S Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix

Source Plant Name & Location(s Greenbrier Ready Mix, 256 Industrial Way, Caldwell, WV 24925

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" beside the counties that correspond with the Source Plant(s) bid prices on
this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per county or per plant, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A) for
each county pricing set or each plant's pricing. Failure to include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C (if applicable) will result in the

disqualification of the affected bid.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a
contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the contract specifications.

Fstimated nuantities are nnt availahle

District 1 District 2 District 3  District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour | |Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton [Y{|Pocahontas | |Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer | |Randolph | |Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis [ |Tucker | |Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Y Summers

wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
* Contract Items 1-40 Includes materials plus delivery within 5 miles of Supplier Plant Location
Contract Contract Item Description Untt of S'Ze_ of List Price
ltem # Measure Project

1 2-2.99 No Bid

2 . 3-3.99 No Bid
3 Class A Concrete 1034 44 99 No Bid
4 5 or more No Bid
5 2-2.99 $410.50
6 3-3.99 $338.75

* Y
7 Class B Concrete C 2-4.99 $267.50
8 Sormore | $204.40 |
9 2-2.99 No Bid
10 * 3-3.99 No Bid
11 Class C Concrete CcY 4-4.99 No Bid
12 5 or more No Bid
13 2-2.99 No Bid
14 3-3.99 No Bid
* Y -

15 Class D Concrete C 4-4.99 No Bid
16 5 or more No Bid
17 2-299 | NoBid
18 Cl H Concrete* cY 3'399 No Bid
19 | o © 4-4.99 No Bid
20) 5 or more No Bid

ATT A -Pricing Pages

P9)15
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RBS !nc. Greenbrier Ready Mix

PO Box 490

White Sulphur Springs, WV 24386

304.645.2277
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Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATTA)

21 2-2.99 $462.75
22 * 3-3.99 $391.50
>3 Class K Concrete CcY 4499 $320.50
24 5 or more | $268.50
25 2-2.99 No Bid
26 " 3-3.99 No Bid
o7 Mod Class K Concrete CY 4-4.99 No Bid
28 5 or more No Bid
29 2-2.99 No Bid
30 * 3-3.99 No Bid
31 |C-SMType A cY 4499 | No Bid
32 5 or more No Bid
33 2-2.99 $355.00
34 . 3-3.99 $285.00
35 |C-SMTwpeB cY 4-4.99 | $215.00
36 5 or more | $150.00
37 2-2.99 $330.00
38 N - , 3-3.99 $260.50
39 CLSM Type B* - Modified Pipe Slumy cY 4499 $205.25
40 5 ormore | $137.50
41 2-2.99 $364.00
42 . 3-3.99 $294.00
a3 |CtSMType C cY 4-4.99 | $234.00
44 : 5 ormore | $170.00
45 | Additional Haul per truck load over 5 miles Mile | ee=--- $8.50
46 |Penalty Charge per truck, each minute Minute |  ------ $2.25
47 _ |Class B using Silica Sand cY | - $24.00
48 |Increased cement cY | ------ $15.00
49 |Water-reducing set retarder CY | emee- $8.00
50 |Water reducer cYy | - $5.00
51 |Calcium chloride cYy | ------ $0.15
52 |Non-calcium chloride cYy | ame--- $0.25
53 |Super plasticizer cY | -eee-- $14.45
54 Fiber cYy | - $10.00
55 |Heated Concrete cYy | - $8.00
56 __llce LB | e $1.00

ATT A -Pricing Pages

rIo)is
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RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix
PO Box 490

White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986
304.645.2277
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Vendor Name:

Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
Source Plant Information - Attachment B (ATT B)

R B S Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix

Vendor Instructions: ATT B mustbe submitted at the time of bid and shall correspond with the source
plants listed on the Pricing Pages, ATT A. ATT B must be completed in its entirety. Failure to submit ATT
B at the time of bid will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.

Plant Name Plant Location MCS&T Approval
: Plant Approval Status (mark one
(911 Physical Address) PP ( ) (P/S) Code
) . Approved- Provide P/S Code —>
Greenbrier Ready |256 Industrial Way, .
1|Mix Caldwell, WV 24925 [L] wot Approved/pening GRM1.01.601

I:I Approved- Provide P/S Code —

2 D Not Approved/Pending
D Approved- Provide P/S Code —>

3 D Not Approved/Pending
D Approved- Provide P/S Code —>

4 D Not Approved/Pending
D Approved- Provide P/S Code —>

5 D Not Approved/Pending
D Approved- Provide P/S Code —>

6 D Not Approved/Pending
D Approved- Provide P/S Code —>

7 D Not Approved/Pending
D Approved- Provide P/S Code —>

8 D Not Approved/Pending
D Approved- Provide P/S Code —>

9 D Not Approved/Pending
D Approved- Provide P/S Code —>

10 D Not Approved/Pending

ATT B - Source Plant Information

RBS Inc. Greenbrier Ready Mix

PO Box 490

White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986

304.645.2277

s
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WV-10 State of West Virginia

Approved / Revised

06/08/18 VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia, or bidder is a partnership, association
or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West
Virginia, for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest
of bidder held by another entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

0o 0

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

I:I!“

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor that employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, and for purposes of preducing or distributing the commodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder’s bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder’s affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the
vendor’s bid; or,

D?’

4. Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,
5

-

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or, ‘

6. Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

[ Bidderis aresident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commadities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

7. Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

[ Bidderhas been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

8. Application is made for reciprocal preference.
[ Bidderis a West Virginia resident and is requesting reciprocal preference to the extent that it applies.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order,
or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to
the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder
and if anything contained within this certificate changes during the tegm of the conttact, Bidder will notify the Purchas-

ing Division in writing immediately. /

Bidder: B B S Inc., Greenbrier Ready Mix Signed: -
Date: 9 Feb 2023 Titie: /> R B S Inc. \

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to re):eive. P ) L } ﬁ




Client#: 534075

ACORD.

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

18RBSINC

DATE (MWDD/YYYY)
9/28/2022

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer any rights to the certificate holder in tieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER
McGriff Insurance Services

300 Summers Street, Suite #650
Charleston, WV 25301

CONTACT
NAME:

PHONE v 304 346-0806 FEX noy: 8667513002

L s. CertificatesVAWV@mcgriff.com

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
304 346-0806 INSURER A : Phoenix Insurance Company 25623
INSURED RBS. | INSURER B : Travelers Property Casualty Co of Amer 25674
nc.
’ . Travelers Indemnity Co of America 25666
e
White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986-0409 INSURER E :
INSURER F :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

Rl TYPE OF INSURANCE lﬁ w’%n POLICY NUMBER (ﬁ%ﬁ% nﬁﬂ/uog}'v%xvs) LIMITS
A | _X| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY X | X |Y6601L626379 10/01/2022|10/01/2023 EacH occuRRENCE $1,000,000
| cLams-mADE E OCCUR AR T erence) | 300,000
| _X| PD Ded:10,000 MED EXP (Any one person) | $5,000
|| PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | 51,000,000
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000
|| PouicY D JECT D LOC PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $2,000,000
OTHER: $
C | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY X | X |8101L5769492 10/01/2022(10/01/2023 EMENED SINGLELMIT 1 1,000,000
X ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
|| Doy SCHEDULED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
x| R owr [ NRSAE B s
$
B | X|UMBRELLALMB | X | occur CUP1L6477812 10/01/2022|10/01/2023 EACH OCCURRENCE 55,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE 5,000,000
DED | X| RETENTION 310,000 s
C | WORKERS COMPENSATION N X |UB1L63317422 10/01/2022(10/01/2023 X [E5Rryre | |7
Aor;;'gggm%%g@%mggngECUTIVE@ N/A Includes [Employers|Liability | e each accipent 1,000,000
(Mandatory In NH) Broad Form Section | EL DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| 51,000,000
DESCAPTION OF GPERATIONS below 23-4-2 of WV Code EL DISEASE - PoLiCY LT | 51,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additicnal Remarks Schedutle, may be attached if more space Is required)

** Workers Comp Information **
Other States Coverage

Broad Form Employers Liability
Blanket Waiver of Subrogation (WV)

(See Attached Descriptions)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

State of West Virginia
Division of Highways

1800 Kanawha Blvd East
Charleston, WV 25305-0330

!

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Jacsms £ Sonky.

ACORD 25 (2016/03) 1 of2
#530806519/M30800407

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
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DESCRIPTIONS (Continued from Page 1)

Evidene of Insurnace

SAGITTA 25.3 (2016/03) 2 of 2
#830806519/M30800407
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West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts
(Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

RB S Inc.
Name of Contracting Business Entity:

PO Box 490, White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986

Address:

William Snyder PO Box 490, White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986
Name of Authorized Agent: Address:
Contract Number: OOT LS OOQ)OOOb O Contract Description: zﬂ?d"? /471% [ QviC Vl"-k_a
Governmental agency awarding contract: /Z7§ Cu(ﬁ (/‘/5‘{7 S

O Check here if this is a Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business
entity for each category below (attach additional pages if necessary):

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the Contract
® Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not applicable to publicly traded entities)
O Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

\z\/ 1\\\0\vY\ SW\CXN | 04940\ Sw\d;,r) @:m\()\ 6 Q/\u‘g\c/“ Tms*’

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the applicable contract (excluding legal
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

® Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

Signature: \A 3 \ P Date Signed: q gb Z;
\ b! L v \/ { i 7

Notary Verification

State of \)\))’DN\\%(\U\I oN , County of @remma e’

l, ﬁ\,}\)‘\ Wy g % 6!\1\1 c@e /S , the authorized agent of the contracting business
entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the Disclosure herein is being made under oath and under the
penalty of perjury.

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this C? o day of \46)0 Ty u ; 2023

! % s %M%/@j

Notary Public’'s Signature
To be completed by State Agency: P OFFICIAL SEAL
Date Received by state agency: S0, ) i EET VIRGINIA
Date submitted to Ethics Commission: 4 - 2 ﬁ%‘ﬁgm
Governmental agency submitting Disclosure: Ronoeverte WV 24970
wmmwms

Revised April 1, 2022
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