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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1166364

Solicitation Description: Addendum 1:WINTER GRADE BITUMINOUS PATCHING MIXTURE-COLD MIX

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2023-02-08 14:30 SR 0803 ESR02062300000003549 1

VENDOR

000000203375
KELLY PAVING INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2300000052

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2023-02-06 Response Time: 14:50:56

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Dusty J Smith
304-414-6859
dusty.j.smith@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture 

(Cold Mix)
0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121601    

Commodity Line Comments:  

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE-ATT A FOR ACTUAL COST



Kelly Paving, Inc.

P.O. Box 66

1731 Old State Route 7

Rayland

Ohio US 43943

Rita Lantz

(740) 859-2104

55-0583614 February 8, 2023















































Josh Reed, Manager

P.O. Box 66, Rayland, Ohio 43943

j.reed@shellyandsands.com

Kelly Paving, Inc.

Rita Lantz, Assistant Vice-President

February 8, 2023

(740) 859-2104 / (740) 859-6137

(740) 859-2131 / (740) 859-6137



























Josh Reed

(740) 859-2131

(740) 859-6137
j.reed@shellyandsands.com













Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT ONE
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Boone Clinton @ WV85 TON 10 No Bid
Boone Rock Creek TON 10 No Bid
Boone Seth TON 10 No Bid
Clay Widen Road & CR 11 TON 10 No Bid
Clay Maysel TON 10 No Bid
Kanawha Chelyan TON 25 No Bid
Kanawha Elkview TON 10 No Bid
Kanawha North Charleston TON 50 No Bid
Kanawha St. Albans TON 10 No Bid
Kanawha I-64 @ Rt. 119 and Penn. Avenue TON 10 No Bid
Kanawha I-77 @ Sissonville TON 10 No Bid
Kanawha I-79 @ Amma TON 10 No Bid
Kanawha Corridor G @ Alum Creek TON 10 No Bid
Mason Pt. Pleasant TON 10 No Bid
Putnam Red House TON 10 No Bid
Putnam Hurricane @ Rt. 34 TON 10 No Bid
Putnam Scary TON 10 No Bid
Putnam US 35 @ Fraziers Bottom TON 10 No Bid

Vendor Instructions:     Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location.  

ATT A - Pricing Page Rev. 1/30/23 Page 1 of 10 6623C027



Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT TWO
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Cabell Barboursville TON 105 No Bid
Cabell I-64 @ Huntington TON 10 No Bid
Lincoln West Hamlin TON 30 No Bid
Lincoln Yawkey TON 10 No Bid
Lincoln Harts TON 10 No Bid
Logan Corridor G @ Chapmanville TON 10 No Bid
Logan Wilkinson TON 10 No Bid
Logan Man TON 10 No Bid
Mingo Mingo County @Miller's Creek TON 10 No Bid
Mingo Gilbert TON 10 No Bid
Wayne Crum TON 10 No Bid
Wayne Pritchard TON 10 No Bid
Wayne Wayne TON 90 No Bid

Vendor Instructions:   Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location.  

ATT A - Pricing Page Rev. 1/30/23 Page 2 of 10 6623C027



Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT THREE
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Calhoun Millstone TON 10 No Bid
Jackson Ripley TON 10 No Bid
Jackson I-77 @ Medina TON 10 No Bid
Pleasants Belmont TON 10 No Bid
Pleasants St. Mary's (Colin-Anderson Lot) TON 10 No Bid
Ritchie APD Pennsboro TON 10 No Bid
Ritchie Ellenboro TON 10 No Bid
Ritchie Corridor D @ Nutter Farm TON 10 No Bid
Ritchie Smithville TON 10 No Bid
Roane Lefthand @ WV 36 TON 10 No Bid
Roane Ambler Hill @ US 119 TON 10 No Bid
Roane Spencer TON 10 No Bid
Wirt Elizabeth TON 10 No Bid
Wood Parkersburg @ Rt. 95S TON 10 No Bid
Wood Corridor D @ River Hill TON 10 No Bid
Wood I-77 @ Mill Run Road TON 10 No Bid

Vendor Instructions:   Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location.  

ATT A - Pricing Page Rev. 1/30/23 Page 3 of 10 6623C027



Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT FOUR
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Doddridge Smithburg TON 10 No Bid
Harrison Gore TON 10 No Bid
Harrison I-79 @ Lost Creek TON 10 No Bid
Harrison APD 50 @ Tunnel Hill TON 10 No Bid
Marion Fairmont TON 10 No Bid
Marion Mannington TON 10 No Bid
Monongalia I-79 @ Goshen Road TON 10 No Bid
Monongalia Ridgedale TON 10 No Bid
Monongalia Pentress TON 10 No Bid
Preston Albright TON 10 No Bid
Preston Bruceton TON 10 No Bid
Preston Terra Alta TON 10 No Bid
Preston Fellowsville TON 10 No Bid
Preston Aurora TON 10 No Bid
Preston I-68 @ Copper's Rock TON 10 No Bid
Taylor Fetterman/Prunytown TON 10 No Bid

Vendor Instructions:   Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location.  

ATT A - Pricing Page Rev. 1/30/23 Page 4 of 10 6623C027



Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT FIVE
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Berkeley I-81 @ Martinsburg TON 10 No Bid
Berkeley I-81 @ Exit 8 TON 10 No Bid
Grant Petersburg TON 10 No Bid
Grant Mt. Storm TON 10 No Bid
Grant Corridor H @ Knobley Road TON 10 No Bid
Hampshire Romney TON 50 No Bid
Hampshire Capon Bridge TON 10 No Bid
Hampshire Slanesville TON 10 No Bid
Hardy Moorefield TON 50 No Bid
Hardy Baker TON 50 No Bid
Jefferson Charles Town TON 20 No Bid
Mineral New Creek TON 10 No Bid
Mineral Sky Line TON 10 No Bid
Mineral Short Gap TON 10 No Bid
Mineral District Headquarters TON 10 No Bid
Morgan Berkeley Springs TON 10 No Bid
Morgan Largent TON 10 No Bid

Vendor Instructions:  Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location.  

ATT A - Pricing Page Rev. 1/30/23 Page 5 of 10 6623C027



Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT SIX
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Brooke Wellsburg TON 10 149.00$  
Brooke Weirton TON 10 149.00$  
Hancock New Manchester TON 10 151.00$  
Marshall Glen Dale TON 10 159.00$  
Marshall Cameron TON 20 182.00$  
Ohio Triadelphia TON 10 169.00$  
Ohio I-70 @ Triadelphia TON 20 169.00$  
Tyler Centerville TON 10 184.00$  
Tyler Sistersville TON 50 186.00$  
Tyler Sistersville Old Headquarters TON 10 186.00$  
Wetzel Hundred TON 10 194.00$  
Wetzel New Martinsville TON 20 184.00$  
Wetzel Pine Grove TON 10 186.00$  

Vendor Instructions: Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location.  

ATT A - Pricing Page Rev. 1/30/23 Page 6 of 10 6623C027



Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT SEVEN
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Barbour Phillipi TON 20 No Bid
Braxton Laurel Court TON 20 No Bid
Braxton I-79 @ Coon Knob TON 20 No Bid
Braxton I-79 @ Burnsville TON 20 No Bid
Gilmer Glenville Headquarters TON 20 No Bid
Lewis Weston (Ben Dale) TON 20 No Bid
Upshur Clow Lot @ Buckhannon TON 20 No Bid
Webster Cherry Falls TON 20 No Bid
Webster Cowen TON 20 No Bid
Webster Hacker Valley TON 20 No Bid

Vendor Instructions:  Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location.  
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Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT EIGHT
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Pendleton Franklin TON 10 No Bid
Pocahontas Marlinton TON 10 No Bid
Randolph Corridor H-Elkins TON 10 No Bid
Randolph Elkins TON 25 No Bid
Tucker Corridor H-Thomas TON 10 No Bid
Tucker Parsons TON 10 No Bid

Vendor Instructions: Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location. 
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Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT NINE
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
Fayette Oak Hill TON 10 No Bid
Fayette Corridor L @ Oak Hill TON 10 No Bid
Fayette Lookout TON 10 No Bid
Fayette Glen Ferris TON 10 No Bid
Greenbrier Lewisburg TON 10 No Bid
Greenbrier Crawley TON 10 No Bid
Greenbrier I-64 @ Hart's Run TON 10 No Bid
Monroe Union TON 150 No Bid
Monroe Peterstown TON 10 No Bid
Nicholas Summersville TON 50 No Bid
Nicholas Curtin TON 25 No Bid
Nicholas Corridor L @ Muddlety TON 10 No Bid
Summers Hinton TON 10 No Bid

Vendor Instructions:  Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location. 
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Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture
(Cold Mix)

ATTACHMENT A - PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name : Kelly Paving, Inc.

DISTRICT TEN
Cold Mix per Location Unit of Est. Unit Cost

County Including Delivery Measure Qty Per Ton
McDowell County Headquarters TON 10 No Bid
Mercer County Headquarters TON 10 No Bid
Raleigh County Headquarters TON 10 No Bid
Wyoming County Headquarters TON 10 No Bid

Vendor Instructions: Please provide a bid price for Winter Grade Bituminous Patching Mixture (Cold Mix) Material per ton, delivered to the WVDOH storage 
sites listed below.  Separate delivery charges will not be allowed.  This is a Multiple Vendor award contract; contracts will be awarded to the lowest bidding 
vendor, per storage location.  
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