I,

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

o

Proc Folder: 1278848

Solicitation Description: Poly Pipe HDPE and Bands 10-24-B197

Proc Type: Agency Purchase Order
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2023-09-14 14:30 SR 0803 ESR09142300000001395 1

VENDOR

VS0000002427
Technology International Inc

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000018

Total Bid: 71776 Response Date: 2023-09-14

Comments:

Response Time: 13:30:27

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Amber J Heath

304-414-7105

amber.j.heath@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: ~ Sep 14, 2023 Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Date Printed:

Line Comm Ln Desc

1

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

18" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe

2240.000C LF 19.100000

42784.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

40171520

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
18" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe

Line Comm Ln Desc

2

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

18" HDPE Corrugated Poly Pipe Band

10.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer

40171520

Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
18" HDPE Corrugated Poly Pipe Band

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 36" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe 480.0000C LF 60.400000 28992.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

40171520

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
36" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe

Sep 14, 2023

Page: 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1278848
Doc Description: Poly Pipe HDPE and Bands 10-24-B197

Proc Type: Agency Purchase Order

Reason for Modification:
Addendum 1

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No

Version

2023-09-07 2023-09-14  14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000018

2

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BUDGET & PROCUREMENT
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 5, RM A-317

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name : Technology International, Inc.

Address : 1331 South International Parkway,

Street : Suite 2251,

City : Lake Mary
State : Florida Country : USA

Principal Contact : Rifat Habib

Vendor Contact Phone: 407-359-2373 Extension:

Zip : 32746

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Amber J Heath

304-414-7105
amber.j.heath@wv.gov

Vendor . .
Signature X /st ¥ 2bb FEIN# 650342335

DATE 09/14/2023

All offers subjeét/to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Sep 7, 2023 Page 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ADDENDUM 1 1S ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. TO MODIFY SPECIFICATIONS AND PRICING PAGE

NO OTHER CHANGES

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
DISTRICT TEN DISTRICT TEN
270 HARDWOOD LN 270 HARDWOOD LN
PRINCETON WV PRINCETON WV
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 18" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe 2240.00000 LF $19.10 $42,784.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171520 TDR P Corrugated Pipe TDR Ultra 18 2U18001201061

1pe 450mm Solid Dual Wall Bell End 200 6.1m WT
Extended Description:
18" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe
INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
DISTRICT TEN DISTRICT TEN
270 HARDWOOD LN 270 HARDWOOD LN
PRINCETON WV PRINCETON WV
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 18" HDPE Corrugated Poly Pipe Band 10.00000 EA No Bid No Bid
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171520 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Extended Description:
18" HDPE Corrugated Poly Pipe Band

***Please see our Equipment Proposal TII/WV/0923/32342 attached.

Date Printed: Sep 7, 2023

Page 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
DISTRICT TEN DISTRICT TEN
270 HARDWOOD LN 270 HARDWOOD LN
PRINCETON wv PRINCETON wv
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
3 36" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe 480.00000 LF $60.40 $28,992.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171520 Corrugated Pipe TDR Ultra 36
TDR Pipe 900mm Solid Dual Wall Bell End 200 6.1m WT 2U36001201061

Extended Description:
36" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Line Event Event Date
1 Technical Questions due at 10am ET 2023-09-11

***Please see our Equipment Proposal TII/WV/0923/32342 attached.

Date Printed: Sep 7, 2023 Page 3 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



Document Phase

Document Description

Page

DOT2400000018

Final

Poly Pipe HDPE and Bands 10-24-

B197

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1278848
Doc Description: 18" Poly Pipe HDPE 20' 10-24-B197

Proc Type: Agency Purchase Order

Reason for Modification:

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No

Version

2023-09-06 2023-09-14  14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000018

1

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BUDGET & PROCUREMENT
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 5, RM A-317

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name : Technology International, Inc.

Address : 1331 South International Parkway,

Street : Suite 2251,

City : | ake Mary
State : Florida Country : ysa

Principal Contact : Rifat Habib

Vendor Contact Phone: 407-359-2373 Extension:

Zip : 32746

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Amber J Heath

304-414-7105
amber.j.heath@wv.gov

Vendor . .
Signature X /Wf%ﬁé FEIN# 650342335

DATE 09/14/2023

All offers subjeét/to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Sep 6, 2023 Page 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




| ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

THE WEST VIRIGNIA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION - BUDGET AND PROCUREMENT DIVISION - SOLICITATION OF
A ONE TIME PURCHASE OF POLY PIPE HDPE FOR D10 - PER THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTS.

QUESTIONS REGARDING THE SOLICITATION MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO
DOTPROCUREMENTTECHQUES@WV.GOV PRIOR TO THE QUESTION PERIOD DEADLINE CONTAINED IN THE
INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS SUBMITTING BIDS.

*********NOTICE*********

WE DO NOT ACCEPT EMAIL BIDS
MUST USE ONE THE FOLLOWING TO SUBMIT A BID:

* UPLOAD TO OASIS
* HAND DELIVERY
* MAIL IN HARD COPY
* FAX TO 304-558-0047
MAKE SURE YOU DOWNLOAD ALL INFORMATION - THE COMPLETE SOLICITATION - PRICING PAGES - SIGN THE PAGES
THAT NEED SIGNED
PLEASE NOTE THAT TO BE AWARDED THIS CONTRACT YOU WILL NEED TO BE A REGISTERED VENDOR WITH WV
STATE PURCHASING, AND COMPLIANT WITH SEVERAL AGENCIES SUCH AS THE WVSOS, TAX DEPARTMENT,
WORKER'S COMPENSATION, AND UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
DISTRICT TEN DISTRICT TEN
270 HARDWOOD LN 270 HARDWOOD LN
PRINCETON wv PRINCETON wv
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 18" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe 2240.00000 LF $19.10 $42,784.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171520 ) HDPE Corrugated Pipe TDR Ultra 18
TDR Pipe 450mm Solid Dual Wall Bell End 200 6.1m WT 211800120106

Extended Description:
18" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Line Event

Event Date

1 Technical Questions due at 10am ET 2023-09-11

***Please see our Equipment Proposal TII/WV/0923/32342 attached.

Date Printed: Sep 6, 2023 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



Document Phase

Document Description

Page

DOT2400000018

Final

18" Poly Pipe HDPE 20' 10-24-B197

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1278848
Doc Description: Poly Pipe HDPE and Bands 10-24-B197

Proc Type: Agency Purchase Order

Reason for Modification:
Addendum 1

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No

Version

2023-09-07 2023-09-14  14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000018

2

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

BUDGET & PROCUREMENT
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 5, RM A-317

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name : Technology International, Inc.

Address : 1331 South International Parkway,

Street : Suite 2251,

City : | ake Mary
State : Florida Country : ysa

Principal Contact : Rifat Habib

Vendor Contact Phone: 407-359-2373 Extension:

Zip : 32746

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Amber J Heath

304-414-7105
amber.j.heath@wv.gov

Vendor

Signature X&Mf%éé FEIN# 650342335

DATE 09/14/2023

All offers subjéc/t to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Sep 7, 2023 Page 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ADDENDUM 1 1S ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. TO MODIFY SPECIFICATIONS AND PRICING PAGE

NO OTHER CHANGES

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
DISTRICT TEN DISTRICT TEN
270 HARDWOOD LN 270 HARDWOOD LN
PRINCETON WV PRINCETON WV
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 18" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe 2240.00000 LF $19.10 $42,784.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171520 TDR Pipe HDPE Corrugated Pipe TDR Ultra 18 2018001201061

450mm Solid Dual Wall Bell End 200 6.1m WT

Extended Description:
18" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe

INVOICE TO SHIP TO

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT TEN DISTRICT TEN

270 HARDWOOD LN 270 HARDWOOD LN

PRINCETON wv PRINCETON wv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 18" HDPE Corrugated Poly Pipe Band 10.00000 EA No Bid No Bid
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

40171520 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Extended Description:
18" HDPE Corrugated Poly Pipe Band

Date Printed: Sep 7, 2023 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS
DISTRICT TEN DISTRICT TEN
270 HARDWOOD LN 270 HARDWOOD LN
PRINCETON WV PRINCETON WV
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
3 36" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe 480.00000 LF $60.40 $28,992.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
40171520 . Corrugated Pipe TDR Ultra 36
TDR Pipe 900mm Solid Dual Wall Bell End 200 6.1m wT 2U36001201061

Extended Description:

36" HDPE 20' Corrugated Poly Pipe

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

Event Date
2023-09-11

***Please see our Equipment Proposal TII/WV/0923/32342 attached.

Line Event
1 Technical Questions due at 10am ET
Date Printed: Sep 7, 2023 Page 3

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




SOLICITATION NUMBER : ARFQ DOT24000000018
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation”) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
[ ] Modify bid opening date and time
[¢] Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[ ]| Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ ] Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ | Correction of error

[ ]| Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:
ADDENDUM 1 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. TO MODIFY SPECIFICATIONS AND PRICING PAGE

NO OTHER CHANGES

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
full force and effect.

2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2012



ATTACHMENT A

evised 6/8/2012



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
West Virginia Division of Highways
Corrugated Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe and Bands for District 10

SPECIFICATIONS

1. PURPOSE AND SCOPE: The West Virginia Purchasing Division is soliciting bids on
behalf of the West Virginia Division of Highways-District 10 to establish a contract for
the one-time purchase of Corrugated Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe and Bands for inventory.

2. DEFINITIONS: The terms listed below shall have the meanings assigned to them
below. Additional definitions can be found in section 2 of the General Terms and
Conditions.

2.1 “Contract Item” means Corrugated Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe as more fully
described by these specifications.

2.2 “Pricing Page” means the pages, contained in wvOASIS or attached as Exhibit A,
upon which Vendor should list its proposed price for the Contract Items.

2.3 “Solicitation” means the official notice of an opportunity to supply the State with
goods or services that is published by the Purchasing Division.

3. GENERAL REQUIREMENTS:

3.1 Mandatory Contract Item Requirements: Contract [tem must meet or exceed the
mandatory requirements listed below. The following standard specs sections shall
apply to the administration of this contract: 101, 102 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108,
109, 110, as amended.

3.1.1 High Density Type S Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe, Dual Wall-in 20-foot
length joints. High Density Polyethylene Pipe shall conform to the
requirements of Standard Specs Sections 604 and 714, as amended, and
AASHTO M294.

3.1.2 Flexible pipes shall be bell and spigot joints, and the pipe shall be installed to
preserve the alignment, provide a leak resistant joint that conforms to ASTM
D3212 performance requirements, and prevent the separation of sections.
These shall have the ability to be soil tight.

Revised 10/27/2014



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
West Virginia Division of Highways

Corrugated Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe and Bands for District 10

3.1.3

3.14

The dual wall pipe and fittings shall meet the requirements of ASTM 2881M
or AASHTO M294. Vendors bidding must source approved
suppliers/fabricators from MCS&T, MP 718.007.001 Corrugated
Polyethylene Plastic Pipe, as amended.

Reference:
https://transportation.wv.gov/highways/mcst/pages/APL._By Number.aspx

High Density Type S Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe Bands, which shall
conform to the requirements of Standard Specs Sections 604 and 714, as
amended, and AASHTO M294.

4. CONTRACT AWARD:

4.1 Contract Award: The Contract is intended to provide Agencies with a
purchase price for the Contract Items. The Contract shall be awarded to the
Vendor that provides the Contract Items meeting the required specifications
for the lowest overall total cost as shown on the Pricing Pages.

4.2 Pricing Page: Vendor should complete the Pricing Page by completing the
pricing page. This shall be done by giving the purchase price per each unit in
the Unit Price Box, multiply the Unit Price by the quantity and enter the
amount in the Grand Total Box. The pricing page has been formatted for
convenience to calculate automatically when the Unit Price is entered. The
vendor is responsible for ensuring the calculations are correct. Vendor should
complete the Pricing Page in full as failure to complete the Pricing Page in its
entirety may result in Vendor’s bid being disqualified.

Vendor should type or electronically enter the information into the Pricing Page
to prevent errors in the evaluation.

S. PAYMENT:

5.1 Payment: Vendor shall accept payment in accordance with the payment procedures
of the State of West Virginia.

Revised 10/27/2014



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
West Virginia Division of Highways
Corrugated Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe and Bands for District 10

6. DELIVERY AND RETURN:

6.1 Shipment and Delivery: Vendor shall ship the Contract Items immediately after
being awarded this Contract and receiving a purchase order or notice to proceed.
Vendor shall deliver the Contract Items within 45 working days after receiving a
purchase order or notice to proceed. Contract Items must be delivered to Agency at
270 Hardwood Lane Princeton WV 24740.

6.2 Late Delivery: The Agency placing the order under this Contract must be notified
in writing if the shipment of the Contract Items will be delayed for any reason. Any
delay in delivery that could cause harm to an Agency will be grounds for cancellation
of the Contract, and/or obtaining the Contract Items from a third party.

Any Agency seeking to obtain the Contract Items from a third party under this
provision must first obtain approval of the Purchasing Division.

6.3 Delivery Payment/Risk of Loss: Vendor shall deliver the Contract Items F.O.B.
destination to the Agency’s location.

6.4 Return of Unacceptable Items: If the Agency deems the Contract Items to be
unacceptable, the Contract Items shall be returned to Vendor at Vendor’s expense
and with no restocking charge. Vendor shall either make arrangements for the return
within five (5) days of being notified that items are unacceptable or permit the
Agency to arrange for the return and reimburse Agency for delivery expenses. If the
original packaging cannot be utilized for the return, Vendor will supply the Agency
with appropriate return packaging upon request. All returns of unacceptable items
shall be F.O.B. the Agency’s location. The returned product shall either be replaced,
or the Agency shall receive full credit or refund for the purchase price, at the
Agency’s discretion.

6.5 Return Due to Agency Error: Items ordered in error by the Agency will be returned
for credit within 30 days of receipt, F.O.B. Vendor’s location. Vendor shall not
charge a restocking fee if returned products are in a resalable condition. Items shall
be deemed to be in a resalable condition if they are unused and in the original
packaging. Any restocking fee for items not in a resalable condition shall be the
lower of the Vendor’s customary restocking fee or 5% of the total invoiced value of
the returned items.

7 VENDOR DEFAULT:

Revised 10/27/2014



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
West Virginia Division of Highways

Corrugated Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe and Bands for District 10

7.1 The following shall be considered a vendor default under this Contract.

7.1.1

7.1.4

Failure to provide Contract Items in accordance with the requirements
contained herein.

Failure to comply with other specifications and requirements contained
herein.

Failure to comply with any laws, rules, and ordinances applicable to the
Contract Services provided under this Contract.

Failure to remedy deficient performance upon request.

7.2 The following remedies shall be available to Agency upon default.

7.2.1

7.2.2

7.2.3

Revised 10/27/2014

Immediate cancellation of the Contract.

Immediate cancellation of one or more release orders issued under this
Contract.

Any other remedies available in law or equity.



EXHIBIT A- PRICING PAGE West Virginia Division of Highways
High-Density Polyethylene(HDPE) Corrugated Pipe

Delivered District Ten-WVDOH 270 Hardwood Lane Princeton WV 24740

Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Cost

3.1.1 [18" High-Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Corrugated Pipe 2,240 Linear Feet $19.10 $42,784.00 B
3.1.1 |18" High-Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Corrugated Pipe Band 10 EA No Bid No Bid -
3.1.1 [36" High-Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Corrugated Pipe 480 Linear Feet $60.40 $28,992.00 B
TOTAL:| $71,776.00 .

$71,776.00
Grand Total -

***Please see our Equipment Proposal TII/WV/0923/32342 attached.



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: ARFQ DOT2300000018

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Addendum No. 1 [] Addendum No. 6
[] Addendum No. 2 [ ] Addendum No. 7
[] Addendum No. 3 [] Addendum No. 8
[] Addendum No. 4 [] Addendum No. 9
[ ] Addendum No. 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

Technology International, Inc.
Company

bt 7 abdb

Abthorized Signature

09/14/2023

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 11/1/2022



Technology International, Inc.

TECHNOLOGY 1331 South International Pkwy, Suite 2251
INTERNATIONAL Lake Mary, FL 32746

Descri

Tel: (407) 359-2373
Fax: (407) 359-2372

E-mail: tii@tii-usa.com

Website: www.tii-usa.com

Equipment Proposal

ption:  Poly Pipe HDPE and Bands 10-24-B197

Document ID: ARFQ-0803-DOT2400000018-2

Agency: State of West Virginia

Tll Ref: TII/WV/0923/32342

Date: 09/14/2023

In response to your quote request for Poly Pipe HDPE and Bands 10-24-B197, Technology

International, Inc. is pleased to submit the following for consideration:

ITEM | QTY DESCRIPTION/ MODEL NO. UNIT EXTD.
NO. PRICE PRICE
1 2240 | 2U18001201061 HDPE Corrugated Pipe TDR Ultra 18 $19.10 $42,784.00
450mm Solid Dual Wall Bell End 200 6.1m WT
2 10 18" HDPE Corrugated Poly Pipe Band No Bid No Bid
3 480 |2U36001201061 HDPE Corrugated Pipe TDR Ultra 36 $60.40 $28,992.00

900mm Solid Dual Wall Bell End 200 6.1m WT

See attached data sheets

Total.......coovvvanenns $71,776.00

Warranty: Manufacturer’s standard warranty applies.

Delivery:

Estimated delivery is 3-5 Months after receipt of order and approved submittal.

Please note, due to COVID-19 there may be unanticipated disruptions and delays in the supply
chains globally, for parts, components, equipment and internal manufacturing services such as
engineering, production allocation, and logistics. This may result in manufacturing & delivery




delays out of our control. We will do our best to communicate all such impacts and reduce the
effects of any such delays.

All delivery dates quoted are subject to manufacturer’s confirmation at time of order.

Submittal data will be provided for approval after receipt of order (if applicable)

Customer to provide equipment and personnel to unload

TIl will provide MSO at time of payment confirmation. Customer is responsible for all titling and
registration of trailer (If Applicable)

Freight: Included to Charleston, WV 25305.

Payment Terms: NET 30
Prompt Payment discount: 1/4 % 10 days

Quote Validity: 30 days.

*** Notes:
¢ Quoted price is not available on a line item basis. This is an offer for a lump sum contract.

Technology International, Inc. Corporate data:
We are a small business and our Tax Payer Identification Number (TIN): 650342335. The price
quoted does not include any sales, excise or similar taxes.

We trust that this proposal will meet your requirements and we look forward to hearing from you.

If you have any questions or need more information, please contact us by phone at 407-359-2373,
fax at 407-359-2372 or email us at tii@tii-usa.com

Respectfully submitted,

)
71/ - / // F Y 4
y 4 g o

" Tlabid

Rifat Habib
Business Development Exec.
Technology International, Inc.



