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,a{;m:?”f% Department of Administration State of West Virginia
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Purchasing Division S
2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

o

Proc Folder: 1299978
Solicitation Description: Addendum 1-Asphalt Mat, Delivery & Labor by Vendor by County

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2023-10-31 14:30 SR 0803 ESR10312300000002133 1
VENDOR

000000120293

NEW ENTERPRISE STONE & LIME CO INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000028
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2023-10-31 Response Time:
Comments:

10:30:42

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jerry D Rush

304-414-6683

jerry.d.rush@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN# DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: ~ Oct 31, 2023 Page: 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor by 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Vendor by County
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) for providing its actual Bid. Vendors Note: Do NOT enter prices on commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Mobilization 0.00000 MILE 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

24000000

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT B (Pricing Pages) for providing its actual Bid. Vendors Note: Do NOT enter prices on commodity lines in OASIS.

Date Printed: ~ Oct 31, 2023

Page: 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Highways

Proc Folder: 1299978 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Addendum 1-Asphalt Mat, Delivery & Labor by Vendor by County Addendum 1

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

2023-10-23 2023-10-31  14:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2400000028 2
BID RECEIVING LOCAT

BUDGET & PROCUREMENT

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 5, RM A-317

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: 1202 93

Vendor Name : Ney; Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.
Address :

Street: 39719 Brumbaugh Road

City: New Enterprise

State : pa Country: 7.5, Zip: 16664

Principal Contact:  james C Zimmerman

Vendor Contact Phone: 717-267-5961 Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jerry D Rush

304-414-6683

jerry.d.rush@wv.gov

Vendor N
|Signature xm /W FEIN# 23-1374051 DATE 10/31/2023

All offers sub(ect to)all terms Wonditions contained in this solicitation
Date Printed: OcN 3 Page 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020008



[ ) __ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

Addendum 1 is issued for the following reasons:

1.To attach revised specifications.
2.To attach vendor questions and Agency responses.
3.To attach revised ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D.
4.To attach Exhibit 5 and Exhibit 6.
5.To revised bid closing time to 2:30 P.M. on 10/31/2023.

No other changes

[INVOICE TO ~ |[sHiPpTO
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY
LOCATIONS LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City wv No City wWv
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor by Vendor 0.00000 TON
by County
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121600

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) for providing its actual Bid. Vendors Note: Do NOT enter prices on commodity lines in
OASIS.

Date Printed: Oct 23, 2023 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




[INVOICE TO |SHIPTO
VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY
LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER

AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City wv No City Wwv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Mobilization 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

24000000

Extended Description:

Vendor shall use the ATT B (

Pricing Pages) for providing its actual Bid. Vendors Note: Do NOT enter prices on commodity lines in

0ASIS.
|SCHEDULE OF EVENTS _
Line Event Event Date
1 TECHNICAL QUESTION DEADLINE 10:00 A.M. 2023-10-20
Date Printed: Oct 23, 2023 Page 3 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: ARFQ DOT2400000028

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: | hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal. plans and/or specification. etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Addendum No. [J Addendum No. 6

I
[J Addendum No. 2 [J Addendum No. 7
[J Addendum No. 3 [[] Addendum No. 8
(] Addendum No. 4 (] Addendum No. 9
[J Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.
‘ompany

wrized Signature
HIE C Zimme

10/31/2023
Date

an, Area Sales Manager

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 11/1/2022



SOLICITATION NUMBER : ARFQ DOT2400000028
Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as
(“Solicitation™) to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

Applicable Addendum Category:
[y ] Modify bid opening date and time
[v'] Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[¢'] Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[ | Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[ | Correction of error

[¢'| Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:

Addendum 1 is issued for the following reason:

1.To altach revised specifications.

2.To attach vendor questions and Agency responses.
3.To attach revised ATT A, ATT B, ATT C, and ATT D.
4.To attach Exhibit 5 and Exhibit 6.

5.To revised bid closing time to 2:30 P.M. on 10/31/2023.

No other changes

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been
included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in
tull force and effect.

£

Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by
completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith.
Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum
acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

Revised 6/8/2002



ATTACHMENT A

Revised 682012



_New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.

| P.O. Box 77 « New Enterprise, Pennsylvania 16664 » Corporate Office: 814-766-2211
Fax: 814-766-4400

September 30, 2023

To Whom It May Concern:

This letter is to acknowledge that Jim Zimmerman is the Area Sales Manager of New Enterprise Stone &
Lime Co., Inc. In this capacity Jim Zimmerman has the authority to sign and execute documents relating
to New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc..

We the undersigned, hereby authorize Jim Zimmerman to act on our behalf in all manners relating to
bids and contracts. Any and all acts carried out by Jim Zimmerman on our behalf shall have the same
effect as acts of our own.

Unless written notice is received, this authorization is valid through September 30, 2024.

-

f. /_.I"/I p / e
- F

Sincerely,

(
Paul I. Detwiler, Il
President



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Ashcom Blacktop Plant
526 Ashcom Road

Everett PA 15537

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATTC
and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.

This is @ multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will
be determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison | |Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion |x__|Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia | |Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston | |uefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
Contract Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #
1 Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON $70.00
2 Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON $70.00
3 Asphalt Section 401 - Base |l TON $75.00
4 Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON $75.00
5 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON $90.00
6 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON $100.00
7 Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON $80.00
8 Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON $90.00
9 Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON $90.00
10 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON $90.00
11 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON $100.00
12 Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $105.00
13 Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $115.00
14 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IlI TON $115.00
15 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |1l TON $125.00
16 Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $90.00
17 Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $100.00
18 Shoulder Stone Placement for Asphalt Section 307 - Class 10 TON No Bid
19 Shoulder Stone Mobilization -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM E—
20 Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - First Ton Mile TON MILE No Bid
21 Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - Each Additional Ton Mile TON MILE No Bid
22 Surcharge for PG Binder - 64H minus 22 TON $8.00
23 Surcharge for PG Binder 64E minus 22 ordered in 400 Ton increments TON $8.00
24 ESAL Surcharge - 3 million to 20 million ESALs TON $0.00
25 ESAL Surcharge - Greater than 20 million ESALs TON $0.00
26 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - First Ton Mile TON MILE $5.00
27 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - Each Additional Ton Mile TON MILE $0.50
28 Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 0-100 Tons TON $85.00
29 Laydown of Materials. ltems #1-17, Each Site 101 to 200 Tons TON $45.00
30 Laydown of Materials. ltems #1-17, Each Site 201 to 500 Tons TON $22.00
31 Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 501 Tons or Greater TON $14.00
32 Mobilization - Daytime Paving -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM —
33 Mobilization - Nighttime Paving -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM —
34 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 0 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $19.00
35 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 1001 to 2000 Sq. Yards Sy $9.50
36 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 2001 to 3000 Sq. Yards SY $5.50
37 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 3001 Sq. Yards or Greater sy $4.50

ATT A -Laydown

Pagelof3

2024 6624C018 REVISED



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Ashcom Blacktop Plant
526 Ashcom Road

Everett PA 15537

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATTB, ATTC
and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per praoject will
be determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge | x |Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison | |Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x |Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Maonroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia | |Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston | |Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
Contract Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #
38 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons TON $20.00
39 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons TON $10.00
40 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons TON $6.50
41 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater TON $5.00
42 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons TON $20.00
43 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons TON $10.00
44 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons TON $6.50
45 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater TON $5.00
46 Asphalt Material for Tack Coat GAL $6.50
47 Additional Heel-In Joints LF $19.00
48 Skip Paving Surcharge TON $5.50
49 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WWDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $50.00
50 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WWDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $25.00
51 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WWDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $12.50
52 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WWDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $10.00
53 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $5.50
54 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater SY $4.50
55 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $50.00
56 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards sy $25.00
57 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $12.50
58 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $10.00
59 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards sy $5.50
60 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater sy $4.50
61 Mobilization- Pavement Profiling/Milling -Complete on Attachment B(ATT B) LUMP SUM —
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, First 10 Miles MILE $5.00
= (lnCIUd:}g #??—S,?\Jﬁ?dd#gg{tso} Fine Milli Each Addit | Ton Mil -
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, Eac itional Ton Mile
63 | aftor 10 Milos g TON MILE $0.50
64 Pavement Repair - Asphalt Base Il SY $550.00
65 Asphalt HPTO - SP496 - PG 64E-22 ordered 400 Ton increments TON $155.00
66 Non-Tracking Tack GAL $8.50
67 Lay Down of Materials - to be used with #65 - 400 Ton or Greater TON $35.00
68 Ultra-Thin Asphalt Overlay - SP498 TON $110.00

ATT A -Laydown

Page 2 of 3

2024 6624C018 REVISED



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphait Plant(s): Ashcom Blacktop Plant
526 Ashcom Road

Everett PA 15537

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATTB, ATTC
and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will
be determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Menongalia Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Wetzel Webster
Wood
Contract Contract Item Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #

69 Fine Milling -WWDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $50.00
70 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $25.00
71 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $12.50
72 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $10.00
73 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $5.50
74 Fine Milling -WWDOH Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater SY $4.50
75 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $50.00
76 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $25.00
77 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $12.50
78 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards sY $10.00
79 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards sY $5.50
80 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater SY $4.50
81 Milled Rumble Strips LF $6.50
82 Mobilization - Milled Rumble Strips -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM R
83 Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving - Items #1-17, #65, and #68 TON $10.00
84 Cleaning and Sweeping SY $0.50
85 Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver DAY $1,250.00
86 Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT $7.00
87 Maintaining Traffic - Flagger HOUR $105.00
88 Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board DAY $80.00
89 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY $8,000.00
90 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY $4,000.00
91 Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type P-2 with Installation EACH $75.00
92 Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type R-4 with Installation EACH $75.00
93 Mobilization - RPM Installation -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
94 Raised Pavement Marker (RPM) Removal EACH $750.00
95 Mobilization - RPM Removal -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
96 VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 0-1000 LF LINEAR FOOT $12.00
97 VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 1001-2000 LF LINEAR FOOT $10.00
98 VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 2001-5,000 LF LINEAR FOOT $8.00
99 VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 5,001 LF or greater LINEAR FOOT $6.00
100 VRAM Preparation, Removal of Center Line LINEAR FOOT $7.00
101 Mobilization - VRAM -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM

ATT A -Laydown

Page 3o0of 3
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Chambersburg Blacktop Plant
2921 Stone Quarry Road

Chambersburg PA 17202

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATTB,ATTC
and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will
be determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincaln Jackson Harrison | |Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion | |Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia | |Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston [x_|Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor | |Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood X |Morgan
Gontraet Contract Item Description Unit of Measure | List Price
Item #

1 Asphalt Section 401 - Base | TON $70.00
2 Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave TON $70.00
3 Asphalt Section 401 - Base |l TON $75.00
4 Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level TON $75.00
5 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV TON $90.00
6 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV TON $100.00
7 Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave TON $80.00
8 Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course TON $90.00
9 Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave TON $90.00
10 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1 TON $90.00
11 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 TON $100.00
12 Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $105.00
13 Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave TON $115.00
14 Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing |l| TON $115.00
15 Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing |l| TON $125.00
16 Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $90.00
17 Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave TON $100.00
18 Shoulder Stone Placement for Asphalt Section 307 - Class 10 TON No Bid
19 Shoulder Stone Mobilization -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
20 Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - First Ton Mile TON MILE No Bid
21 Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - Each Additional Ton Mile TON MILE No Bid
22 Surcharge for PG Binder - 64H minus 22 TON $8.00
23 Surcharge for PG Binder 64E minus 22 ordered in 400 Ton increments TON $8.00
24 ESAL Surcharge - 3 million to 20 million ESALs TON $0.00
25 ESAL Surcharge - Greater than 20 million ESALs TON $0.00
26 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - First Ton Mile TON MILE $5.00
27 Asphalt Haul by Vendor - Each Additional Ton Mile TON MILE $0.50
28 Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 0-100 Tons TON $85.00
29 Laydown of Materials. Iltems #1-17, Each Site 101 to 200 Tons TON $45.00
30 Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 201 to 500 Tons TON $22.00
31 Laydown of Materials. ltems #1-17, Each Site 501 Tons or Greater TON $14.00
32 Mobilization - Daytime Paving -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM e
33 Moabilization - Nighttime Paving -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM e
34 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 0 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $19.00
35 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 1001 to 2000 Sq. Yards SY $9.50
36 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 2001 to 3000 Sq. Yards SY $5.50
37 Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 3001 Sq. Yards or Greater SY $4.50

ATT A -Laydown

Page 1of 3

2024 6624C018 REVISED



Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s):

Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.

Chambersburg Blacktop Plant

2921 Stone Quarry Road

Chambersburg PA 17202

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing

Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid.

and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.

Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATTC

This is @ multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will
be determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Moenongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
Contract Contract item Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #
38 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons TON $20.00
39 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons TON $10.00
40 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons TON $6.50
41 Asphalt Base | Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater TON $5.00
42 Asphalt Base Il Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons TON $20.00
43 Asphalt Base |l Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons TON $10.00
44 Asphalt Base |l Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons TON $6.50
45 Asphalt Base |l Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater TON $5.00
46 Asphalt Material for Tack Coat GAL $6.50
47 Additional Heel-In Joints LF $19.00
48 Skip Paving Surcharge TON $5.50
49 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $50.00
50 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $25.00
51 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards Sy $12.50
52 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards sy $10.00
53 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards Sy $5.50
54 Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater SY $4.50
55 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards SY $50.00
56 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $25.00
57 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $12.50
58 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards SY $10.00
59 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $5.50
60 Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater SY $4.50
61 Mobilization- Pavement Profiling/Milling Complete on Attachment B(ATT B) LUMP SUM e
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, First 10 Miles MILE $5.00
62 (Included #49-60 and #69-80) )
63 Haul of PrqﬁledlMHled Cuttings or Fine Millings, Each Additional Ton Mile TONMILE $0.50
After 10 Miles
64 Pavement Repair - Asphalt Base I SY $550.00
65 Asphalt HPTO - SP496 - PG 64E-22 ordered 400 Ton increments TON $155.00
66 Non-Tracking Tack GAL $8.50
67 Lay Down of Materials - to be used with #65 - 400 Ton or Greater TON $35.00
68 Ultra-Thin Asphalt Overlay - SP498 TON $110.00

ATT A -Laydown
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Chambersburg Blacktop Plant
2921 Stone Quarry Road

Chambersburg PA 17202

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set. Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing
Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATTC
and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will
be determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available,

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10
Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge | x |Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison | |Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion | |Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia | |Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor | |Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan
Contract Contract item Description Unit of Measure List Price
Item #

69 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings O to 250 Sq. Yards SY $50.00
70 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $25.00
71 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $12.50
72 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards Sy $10.00
73 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $5.50
74 Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater Sy $4.50
75 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards Sy $50.00
76 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards SY $25.00
77 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards SY $12.50
78 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards Sy $10.00
79 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards SY $5.50
80 Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater SY $4.50
81 Milled Rumble Strips LF $6.50
82 Mobilization - Milled Rumble Strips -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM —————
83 Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving - Items #1-17, #65, and #68 TON $10.00
84 Cleaning and Sweeping SY $0.50
85 Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver DAY $1,250.00
86 Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT $7.00
87 Maintaining Traffic - Flagger HOUR $105.00
88 Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board DAY $80.00
89 Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day DAY $8,000.00
90 Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day DAY $4,000.00
91 Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type P-2 with Installation EACH $75.00
92 Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type R-4 with Installation EACH $75.00
93 Mobilization - RPM Installation -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
94 Raised Pavement Marker (RPM) Removal EACH $750.00
95 Mobilization - RPM Removal -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
96 VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 0-1000 LF LINEAR FOOT $12.00
97 VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 1001-2000 LF LINEAR FOOT $10.00
98 VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 2001-5,000 LF LINEAR FOOT $8.00
99 VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 5,001 LF or greater LINEAR FOOT $6.00
100 VRAM Preparation, Removal of Center Line LINEAR FOOT $7.00
101 Mobilization - VRAM -Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM

ATT A -Laydown
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