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Solicitation Response
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VENDOR

000000197898
W L CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC
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Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2023-10-30 Response Time: 14:19:18

Comments: x

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jerry D Rush
304-414-6683
jerry.d.rush@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Asphalt Materials, Delivery & Labor by 

Vendor by County
0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30121600    

Commodity Line Comments: x

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT A (Pricing Pages) for providing its actual Bid. Vendors Note:  Do NOT enter prices on commodity lines in OASIS.

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Mobilization 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
24000000    

Commodity Line Comments: x

Extended Description:
Vendor shall use the ATT B (Pricing Pages) for providing its actual Bid. Vendors Note:  Do NOT enter prices on commodity lines in OASIS.



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Plant 311 Clearbrook (660 Quarry Lane)

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Contract 
Item #

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37

Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III
Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave 

Plant 312 Strasburg (866 Oranda Road)

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

TON

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON

District 9 District 10

Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 401 - Base II
Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

District 1 District 2

Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 0 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 1001 to 2000 Sq. Yards

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV  
Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON

Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave 
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1
Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 
Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave 
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

Shoulder Stone Placement for Asphalt Section 307 - Class 10
Shoulder Stone Mobilization - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - First Ton Mile
Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - Each Additional Ton Mile
Surcharge for PG Binder - 64H minus 22
Surcharge for PG Binder 64E minus 22 ordered in 400 Ton increments

Asphalt Haul by Vendor - First Ton Mile
Asphalt Haul by Vendor - Each Additional Ton Mile
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 0-100 Tons 
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 101 to 200 Tons
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 201 to 500 Tons
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 501 Tons or Greater
Mobilization - Daytime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Mobilization - Nighttime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)

Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 2001 to 3000 Sq. Yards SY
SYExcavation for Shoulder Paving - 3001 Sq. Yards or Greater

TON

LUMP SUM
TON MILE
TON MILE

TON
TON

TON MILE
TON MILE

TON
TON
TON
TON

LUMP SUM
LUMP SUM

SY
SY

$63.50
$78.50
$70.60
$70.60
$71.30
$76.50
$79.25
$78.00
$95.00
$78.00
$84.70
No Bid
No Bid 
No Bid
No Bid
$88.00
$95.50
$60.00
-------
$3.00
$0.30
$5.00
$12.00

$3.00
$0.25
$85.00
$30.00

Vendor Name:

List Price

$3.50
$2.50

ESAL Surcharge - 3 million to 20 million ESALs TON $4.00
ESAL Surcharge - Greater than 20 million ESALs TON $10.00

$20.00
$8.75
-------
-------
$6.50
$4.50

ATT A -Laydown Page 1 of 3 2024  6624C018  REVISED



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Plant 311 Clearbrook (660 Quarry Lane)

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Contract 
Item #

Plant 312 Strasburg (866 Oranda Road)

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

Vendor Name:

List Price

38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61

62

63

64
65
66
67
68

Pavement Repair - Asphalt Base II
Asphalt HPTO - SP496 - PG 64E-22 ordered 400 Ton increments

Lay Down of Materials - to be used with #65 - 400 Ton or Greater
Non-Tracking Tack

Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, First 10 Miles 
(Included #49-60 and #69-80)
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, Each Additional Ton Mile 
After 10 Miles

Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards 

Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater
Asphalt Material for Tack Coat
Additional Heel-In Joints
Skip Paving Surcharge
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards

Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater 
Mobilization- Pavement Profiling/Milling - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)

SY

Ultra-Thin Asphalt Overlay - SP498

Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
GAL
LF

TON
SY
SY

Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons

SY

SY

SY
SY

SY

TON
TON

SY
LUMP SUM

MILE

TON MILE

SY
TON
GAL

SY

SY
SY

$5.00
No Bid
No Bid

$5.00
$25.00
$17.00
$11.00
$6.50
$3.50
$3.50
$22.00
$15.50

$15.00

$10.50
$5.50
$3.50
$2.50
-------

-------

$5.50

$100.00
No Bid

$20.00

$5.00
$2.50
$20.00
$15.00
$5.00
$2.50
$3.00
$13.00

ATT A -Laydown Page 2 of 3 2024  6624C018  REVISED



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Plant 311 Clearbrook (660 Quarry Lane)

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Contract 
Item #

Plant 312 Strasburg (866 Oranda Road)

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

Vendor Name:

List Price

69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94
95
96
97
98
99

100
101 Mobilization - VRAM - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM

LINEAR FOOTVRAM Preparation, Removal of Center Line $1.90
VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 5,001 LF or greater LINEAR FOOT $4.60

LINEAR FOOT
LINEAR FOOT
LINEAR FOOT

$8.00
$7.40
$6.00

VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 0-1000 LF
VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 1001-2000 LF
VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 2001-5,000 LF

Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices
Maintaining Traffic - Flagger
Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board $35.00

$4,500.00
$1,500.00

Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day
Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater

Milled Rumble Strips
Mobilization - Milled Rumble Strips - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving - Items #1-17, #65, and #68
Cleaning and Sweeping
Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver

Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater

SY
SY

LF

SY
SY
SY
SY
SY
SY

LUMP SUM
TON

$1.00

SY
SY
SY
SY

SY
DAY
UNIT

HOUR
DAY
DAY
DAY

$950.00
$1.00
$68.00

$7.50
$0.10

$30.00

$5.90
$4.10

-------

$23.00
$18.00
$13.00
$6.75
$4.90
$3.10

$20.00
$14.00
$7.75

Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type P-2 with Installation EACH $70.00

Mobilization - RPM Removal - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM

Mobilization - RPM Installation - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
Raised Pavement Marker (RPM) Removal EACH $5.00

Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type R-4 with Installation EACH $50.00

ATT A -Laydown Page 3 of 3 2024  6624C018  REVISED



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Inwood Plant

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Contract 
Item #

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37

ESAL Surcharge - 3 million to 20 million ESALs TON $4.00
ESAL Surcharge - Greater than 20 million ESALs TON $10.00

$20.00
$8.75
-------
-------
$6.50
$4.50
$3.50
$2.50

$30.00

Vendor Name:

List Price

$60.00
-------
$3.00
$0.30
$5.00
$12.00

$3.00
$0.25
$85.00

$63.50
$69.85
$70.60
$70.60
$71.30
$75.40
$74.70
$78.00
$92.50
$78.00
$82.00
No Bid
No Bid 
No Bid
No Bid
$83.30
$84.00

TON
TON
TON

LUMP SUM
LUMP SUM

SY
SY

TON

LUMP SUM
TON MILE
TON MILE

TON
TON

TON MILE
TON MILE

TON

Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 2001 to 3000 Sq. Yards SY
SYExcavation for Shoulder Paving - 3001 Sq. Yards or Greater

Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave 
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1
Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 
Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave 
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

Shoulder Stone Placement for Asphalt Section 307 - Class 10
Shoulder Stone Mobilization - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - First Ton Mile
Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - Each Additional Ton Mile
Surcharge for PG Binder - 64H minus 22
Surcharge for PG Binder 64E minus 22 ordered in 400 Ton increments

Asphalt Haul by Vendor - First Ton Mile
Asphalt Haul by Vendor - Each Additional Ton Mile
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 0-100 Tons 
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 101 to 200 Tons
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 201 to 500 Tons
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 501 Tons or Greater
Mobilization - Daytime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Mobilization - Nighttime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 0 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 1001 to 2000 Sq. Yards

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV  
Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON

390 Pedal Car Drive
Inwood, WV 25428

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

TON

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON

District 9 District 10

Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 401 - Base II
Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

District 1 District 2

Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III
Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave 

ATT A -Laydown Page 1 of 3 2024  6624C018  REVISED



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Inwood Plant

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Contract 
Item #

Vendor Name:

List Price

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

390 Pedal Car Drive
Inwood, WV 25428

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2

38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61

62

63

64
65
66
67
68

$5.00
$2.50
$20.00
$15.00
$5.00
$2.50
$3.00
$13.00

$10.50
$5.50
$3.50
$2.50
-------

-------

$5.50

$100.00
No Bid

$20.00

$5.00
No Bid
No Bid

$5.00
$25.00
$17.00
$11.00
$6.50
$3.50
$3.50
$22.00
$15.50

$15.00

SY

TON
TON

SY
LUMP SUM

MILE

TON MILE

SY
TON
GAL

SY

SY
SY

SY

SY

SY
SY

Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
GAL
LF

TON
SY
SY

Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons

Ultra-Thin Asphalt Overlay - SP498

Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater 
Mobilization- Pavement Profiling/Milling - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)

SY
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards 

Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater
Asphalt Material for Tack Coat
Additional Heel-In Joints
Skip Paving Surcharge
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards

Lay Down of Materials - to be used with #65 - 400 Ton or Greater
Non-Tracking Tack

Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, First 10 Miles 
(Included #49-60 and #69-80)
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, Each Additional Ton Mile 
After 10 Miles
Pavement Repair - Asphalt Base II
Asphalt HPTO - SP496 - PG 64E-22 ordered 400 Ton increments

Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards

ATT A -Laydown Page 2 of 3 2024  6624C018  REVISED



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Inwood Plant

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Contract 
Item #

Vendor Name:

List Price

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

390 Pedal Car Drive
Inwood, WV 25428

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2

69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94
95
96
97
98
99

100
101

Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type P-2 with Installation EACH $70.00

Mobilization - RPM Removal - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM

Mobilization - RPM Installation - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
Raised Pavement Marker (RPM) Removal EACH $5.00

Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type R-4 with Installation EACH $50.00

$20.00
$14.00
$7.75

-------

$23.00
$18.00
$13.00
$6.75
$4.90
$3.10

$950.00
$1.00
$68.00

$7.50
$0.10

$30.00

$5.90
$4.10

SY
DAY
UNIT

HOUR
DAY
DAY
DAY

SY
SY
SY
SY

Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater

SY
SY

LF

SY
SY
SY
SY
SY
SY

LUMP SUM
TON

$1.00

Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices
Maintaining Traffic - Flagger
Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board $35.00

$4,500.00
$1,500.00

Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day
Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater

Milled Rumble Strips
Mobilization - Milled Rumble Strips - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving - Items #1-17, #65, and #68
Cleaning and Sweeping
Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver

Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards

VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 5,001 LF or greater LINEAR FOOT $4.60

LINEAR FOOT
LINEAR FOOT
LINEAR FOOT

$8.00
$7.40
$6.00

VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 0-1000 LF
VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 1001-2000 LF
VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 2001-5,000 LF

Mobilization - VRAM - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
LINEAR FOOTVRAM Preparation, Removal of Center Line $1.90
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Millville Plant

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan

Contract 
Item #

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37

ESAL Surcharge - 3 million to 20 million ESALs TON $4.00
ESAL Surcharge - Greater than 20 million ESALs TON $10.00

$20.00
$8.75
-------
-------
$6.50
$4.50
$3.50
$2.50

$30.00

Vendor Name:

List Price

$60.00
-------
$3.00
$0.30
$5.00
$12.00

$3.00
$0.25
$85.00

$66.20
$71.00
$73.20
$73.20
$73.80
$75.40
$77.70
$79.80
$93.50
$79.80
$82.70
No Bid
No Bid 
No Bid
No Bid
$84.50
$85.00

TON
TON
TON

LUMP SUM
LUMP SUM

SY
SY

TON

LUMP SUM
TON MILE
TON MILE

TON
TON

TON MILE
TON MILE

TON

Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 2001 to 3000 Sq. Yards SY
SYExcavation for Shoulder Paving - 3001 Sq. Yards or Greater

Asphalt Section 402 - 9.5mm Superpave 
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing 1
Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing 1 
Asphalt Section 401 - 4.75mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 402 - 4.75mm Superpave 
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing III

Shoulder Stone Placement for Asphalt Section 307 - Class 10
Shoulder Stone Mobilization - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - First Ton Mile
Haul by Vendor Shoulder Stone Placement - Each Additional Ton Mile
Surcharge for PG Binder - 64H minus 22
Surcharge for PG Binder 64E minus 22 ordered in 400 Ton increments

Asphalt Haul by Vendor - First Ton Mile
Asphalt Haul by Vendor - Each Additional Ton Mile
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 0-100 Tons 
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 101 to 200 Tons
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 201 to 500 Tons
Laydown of Materials. Items #1-17, Each Site 501 Tons or Greater
Mobilization - Daytime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Mobilization - Nighttime Paving - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 0 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Excavation for Shoulder Paving - 1001 to 2000 Sq. Yards

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing IV  
Asphalt Section 401 - 19mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 401 - Scratch Course

Asphalt Section 401 - Base I

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON

57 Blair Road
Harpers Ferry, WV 25425

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

TON

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON

District 9 District 10

Asphalt Section 401 - 25mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 401 - Base II
Asphalt Section 401 - Patch and Level
Asphalt Section 401 - Wearing IV

District 1 District 2

Asphalt Section 402 - Wearing III
Asphalt Section 401 - 12.5mm Superpave
Asphalt Section 402 - 12.5mm Superpave 
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Millville Plant

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan

Contract 
Item #

Vendor Name:

List Price

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

57 Blair Road
Harpers Ferry, WV 25425

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2

38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61

62

63

64
65
66
67
68

$5.00
$2.50
$20.00
$15.00
$5.00
$2.50
$3.00
$13.00

$10.50
$5.50
$3.50
$2.50
-------

-------

$5.50

$100.00
No Bid

$20.00

$5.00
No Bid
No Bid

$5.00
$25.00
$17.00
$11.00
$6.50
$3.50
$3.50
$22.00
$15.50

$15.00

SY

TON
TON

SY
LUMP SUM

MILE

TON MILE

SY
TON
GAL

SY

SY
SY

SY

SY

SY
SY

Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards

TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
TON
GAL
LF

TON
SY
SY

Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons
Asphalt Base I Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 0 to 100 Tons
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 101 to 200 Tons

Ultra-Thin Asphalt Overlay - SP498

Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater 
Mobilization- Pavement Profiling/Milling - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)

SY
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards 

Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 201 to 500 Tons
Asphalt Base II Shoulder Paving Surcharge - 501 Tons or Greater
Asphalt Material for Tack Coat
Additional Heel-In Joints
Skip Paving Surcharge
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards

Lay Down of Materials - to be used with #65 - 400 Ton or Greater
Non-Tracking Tack

Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, First 10 Miles 
(Included #49-60 and #69-80)
Haul of Profiled/Milled Cuttings or Fine Millings, Each Additional Ton Mile 
After 10 Miles
Pavement Repair - Asphalt Base II
Asphalt HPTO - SP496 - PG 64E-22 ordered 400 Ton increments

Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 Sq. Yards or Greater 
Pavement Profiling/Milling-Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Vendor's Sourced Asphalt Plant(s): Millville Plant

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan

Contract 
Item #

Vendor Name:

List Price

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Contract Item Description Unit of Measure

57 Blair Road
Harpers Ferry, WV 25425

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" the counties that correspond with the Asphalt Plant(s) bid prices on this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per 
county, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B if different) for each county pricing set.  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages 
(ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D 
WILL BE DISQUALIFIED.   

This is a multiple vendor award contract.  All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be 
determined at the time of need, as per Section 6.1 of the contract specifications.  Estimated quantities are not available.

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2

69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94
95
96
97
98
99

100
101

Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type P-2 with Installation EACH $70.00

Mobilization - RPM Removal - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM

Mobilization - RPM Installation - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
Raised Pavement Marker (RPM) Removal EACH $5.00

Raised Pavement Marker (RPM), Type R-4 with Installation EACH $50.00

$20.00
$14.00
$7.75

-------

$23.00
$18.00
$13.00
$6.75
$4.90
$3.10

$950.00
$1.00
$68.00

$7.50
$0.10

$30.00

$5.90
$4.10

SY
DAY
UNIT

HOUR
DAY
DAY
DAY

SY
SY
SY
SY

Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater

SY
SY

LF

SY
SY
SY
SY
SY
SY

LUMP SUM
TON

$1.00

Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices
Maintaining Traffic - Flagger
Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board $35.00

$4,500.00
$1,500.00

Off-Season Plant Opening - First Day
Off-Season Plant Opening - Each Additional Day

Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 501 to 1000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 1001 to 2500 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 2501 to 5000 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling -WVDOH Owns Millings 5001 SY or Greater

Milled Rumble Strips
Mobilization - Milled Rumble Strips - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B)
Surcharge for Parking Lot and Facility Paving - Items #1-17, #65, and #68
Cleaning and Sweeping
Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver

Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 0 to 250 Sq. Yards
Fine Milling- Vendor Owns Millings 251 to 500 Sq. Yards

VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 5,001 LF or greater LINEAR FOOT $4.60

LINEAR FOOT
LINEAR FOOT
LINEAR FOOT

$8.00
$7.40
$6.00

VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 0-1000 LF
VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 1001-2000 LF
VRAM (Void Reducing Asphalt Membrane) 2001-5,000 LF

Mobilization - VRAM - Complete on Attachment B (ATT B) LUMP SUM
LINEAR FOOTVRAM Preparation, Removal of Center Line $1.90
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT B  MOBILIZATION PRICING PAGE  (ATT B)

Vendor Name:

County Unit of 
Measure

Item 19, 
Mobilization

Shoulder 
Stone 

Item 32, 
Mobilization

DAYTIME 
Paving

Item 33, 
Mobilization 
NIGHTTIME 

Paving

Item 61, 
Mobilization
Pavement 
Profiling 

Item 82, 
Mobilization 

Milled 
Rumble 
Strips

Item 93 
Mobilization 

RPM 
Installation

Item 95 
Mobilization 

RPM 
Removal

Item 101 
Mobilization 

VRAM

Boone LUMP SUM
Clay LUMP SUM
Kanawha LUMP SUM
Mason LUMP SUM
Putnam LUMP SUM
Cabell LUMP SUM
Lincoln LUMP SUM
Logan LUMP SUM
Mingo LUMP SUM
Wayne LUMP SUM
Calhoun LUMP SUM
Jackson LUMP SUM
Pleasants LUMP SUM
Ritchie LUMP SUM
Roane LUMP SUM
Wirt LUMP SUM
Wood LUMP SUM
Doddridge LUMP SUM
Harrison LUMP SUM
Marion LUMP SUM
Monongalia LUMP SUM
Preston LUMP SUM
Taylor LUMP SUM

Di
st

ric
t 1

Di
st

ric
t 2

Di
st

ric
t 3

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall complete the Mobilization Pricing Pages by entering a bid price for the Contract Items below, to correspond with the 
Contract items on Pricing Pages - Attachment A (ATT A).  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant 
Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Di
st

ric
t 4
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT B  MOBILIZATION PRICING PAGE  (ATT B)

Vendor Name:

County Unit of 
Measure

Item 19, 
Mobilization

Shoulder 
Stone 

Item 32, 
Mobilization

DAYTIME 
Paving

Item 33, 
Mobilization 
NIGHTTIME 

Paving

Item 61, 
Mobilization
Pavement 
Profiling 

Item 82, 
Mobilization 

Milled 
Rumble 
Strips

Item 93 
Mobilization 

RPM 
Installation

Item 95 
Mobilization 

RPM 
Removal

Item 101 
Mobilization 

VRAM

 

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall complete the Mobilization Pricing Pages by entering a bid price for the Contract Items below, to correspond with the 
Contract items on Pricing Pages - Attachment A (ATT A).  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant 
Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Berkeley LUMP SUM 3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,500.00$     3,000.00$     5,800.00$     
Grant LUMP SUM
Hampshire LUMP SUM 3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,500.00$     3,000.00$     5,800.00$     
Hardy LUMP SUM 3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,500.00$     3,000.00$     5,800.00$     
Jefferson LUMP SUM 3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,500.00$     3,000.00$     5,800.00$     
Mineral LUMP SUM
Morgan LUMP SUM 3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,000.00$     3,500.00$     3,000.00$     5,800.00$     
Brooke LUMP SUM
Hancock LUMP SUM
Marshall LUMP SUM
Ohio LUMP SUM
Tyler LUMP SUM
Wetzel LUMP SUM
Barbour LUMP SUM
Braxton LUMP SUM
Gilmer LUMP SUM
Lewis LUMP SUM
Upshur LUMP SUM
Webster LUMP SUM
Pendleton LUMP SUM
Pocahontas LUMP SUM
Randolph LUMP SUM
Tucker LUMP SUM

Di
st

ric
t 5

Di
st

ric
t 6

Di
st

ric
t 7

Di
st

ric
t 8
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT B  MOBILIZATION PRICING PAGE  (ATT B)

Vendor Name:

County Unit of 
Measure

Item 19, 
Mobilization

Shoulder 
Stone 

Item 32, 
Mobilization

DAYTIME 
Paving

Item 33, 
Mobilization 
NIGHTTIME 

Paving

Item 61, 
Mobilization
Pavement 
Profiling 

Item 82, 
Mobilization 

Milled 
Rumble 
Strips

Item 93 
Mobilization 

RPM 
Installation

Item 95 
Mobilization 

RPM 
Removal

Item 101 
Mobilization 

VRAM

 

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall complete the Mobilization Pricing Pages by entering a bid price for the Contract Items below, to correspond with the 
Contract items on Pricing Pages - Attachment A (ATT A).  Vendor must complete TWO (2) Pricing Pages (ATT A and ATT B) as well as TWO (2) Plant 
Information Forms (ATT C  and ATT D) with bid.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Fayette LUMP SUM
Greenbrier LUMP SUM
Monroe LUMP SUM
Nicholas LUMP SUM
Summers LUMP SUM
McDowell LUMP SUM
Mercer LUMP SUM
Raleigh LUMP SUM
Wyoming LUMP SUMDi

st
ric

t 1
0

Di
st

ric
t 9
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Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT C - Asphalt Plants (ATT C)

Plant Name:
Plant Location:

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates: 39-15-09 N  78-04-58 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Plant Name:
Plant Location: 866 Oranda Road, Strasburg VA 22657

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates: 39-00-50 N  78-20-02 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Plant 312 Strasburg

Vendor Name:

District 8 District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3

Plant 311 Clearbrook
Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  
District 7District 4 District 6

660 Quarry Lane, Clearbrook VA 22624

District 5

District 7

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall enter below the source ASPHALT Plant Names and Locations asphalt may be pulled from under this 
contract, and which are listed on Attachment A, including their 911 address.  Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location 
listed the counties that plant will be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 6.3 for additional information.  If additional space 
is needed to list additional plant locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment C (ATT C) pages to ensure all plants are accounted 
for under this contract.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

District 9 District 10

Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 8

ATT C -Asphalt Plants (Laydown) Page ____ of ____ 2024  6624C0018



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT C - Asphalt Plants (ATT C)

Plant Name:
Plant Location:

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates: 39-20-52 N   78-02-20 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Plant Name:
Plant Location: 57 Blair Road, Harpers Ferry WV 25425

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates: 39-17-14 N   77-47-38 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan

District 6

390 Pedal Car Drive, Inwood WV 25428

District 5

District 7

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall enter below the source ASPHALT Plant Names and Locations asphalt may be pulled from under this 
contract, and which are listed on Attachment A, including their 911 address.  Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location 
listed the counties that plant will be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 6.3 for additional information.  If additional space 
is needed to list additional plant locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment C (ATT C) pages to ensure all plants are accounted 
for under this contract.  Bids submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

District 9 District 10

Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  

District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 8

Millville Plant

Vendor Name:

District 8 District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3

Inwood Plant
Vendor's ASPHALT Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  
District 7District 4

ATT C -Asphalt Plants (Laydown) Page ____ of ____ 2024  6624C0018



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT D - Shoulder Stone Plants (ATT D)

Plant Name:
Plant Location: 508 Quarry Lane, Clearbrook VA 22624

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-15-09 N  78-04-58 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Plant Name:
Plant Location:

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-00-50 N  78-20-02 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  

Carmeuse Strasburg Operations
1696 Oranda Road, Strasburg VA 22657

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall enter below the sourced STONE Plant Names and Locations stone may be pulled from under this 
contract, including their 911 address(es).  Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location listed the counties that plant will 
be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 6.3 for additional information.  If additional space is needed to list additional plant 
locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment D (ATT D) pages to ensure all plants are accounted for under this contract.  Bids 
submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

Vendor Name: W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Carmeuse Winchester Operations

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

ATT D -Shoulder Stone Plants (Laydown) Page _____ of ______ 2024  6624C018



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT D - Shoulder Stone Plants (ATT D)

Plant Name:
Plant Location: 508 Quarry Lane, Clearbrook VA 22624

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-15-09 N  78-04-58 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Plant Name:
Plant Location:

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-00-50 N  78-20-02 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  

Carmeuse Strasburg Operations
1696 Oranda Road, Strasburg VA 22657

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall enter below the sourced STONE Plant Names and Locations stone may be pulled from under this 
contract, including their 911 address(es).  Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location listed the counties that plant will 
be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 6.3 for additional information.  If additional space is needed to list additional plant 
locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment D (ATT D) pages to ensure all plants are accounted for under this contract.  Bids 
submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

Vendor Name: W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Carmeuse Winchester Operations

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

ATT D -Shoulder Stone Plants (Laydown) Page _____ of ______ 2024  6624C018



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT D - Shoulder Stone Plants (ATT D)

Plant Name:
Plant Location: 9171 Winchester Ave, Inwood WV 25428

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-20-52 N   78-02-20 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Plant Name:
Plant Location:

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-17-14 N   77-47-38 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  

Millville Quarry
57 Blair Road, Harpers Ferry WV 25425

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall enter below the sourced STONE Plant Names and Locations stone may be pulled from under this 
contract, including their 911 address(es).  Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location listed the counties that plant will 
be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 6.3 for additional information.  If additional space is needed to list additional plant 
locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment D (ATT D) pages to ensure all plants are accounted for under this contract.  Bids 
submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

Vendor Name: W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Inwood Quarry

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

ATT D -Shoulder Stone Plants (Laydown) Page _____ of ______ 2024  6624C018



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT D - Shoulder Stone Plants (ATT D)

Plant Name:
Plant Location: 508 Quarry Lane, Clearbrook VA 22624

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-15-09 N  78-04-58 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Plant Name:
Plant Location:

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-00-50 N  78-20-02 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion x Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia x Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  

Carmeuse Strasburg Operations
1696 Oranda Road, Strasburg VA 22657

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall enter below the sourced STONE Plant Names and Locations stone may be pulled from under this 
contract, including their 911 address(es).  Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location listed the counties that plant will 
be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 6.3 for additional information.  If additional space is needed to list additional plant 
locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment D (ATT D) pages to ensure all plants are accounted for under this contract.  Bids 
submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

Vendor Name: W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Carmeuse Winchester Operations

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

ATT D -Shoulder Stone Plants (Laydown) Page _____ of ______ 2024  6624C018



Asphalt Materials Delivery Labor by Vendor by County
ATTACHMENT D - Shoulder Stone Plants (ATT D)

Plant Name:
Plant Location: 9171 Winchester Ave, Inwood WV 25428

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-20-52 N   78-02-20 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood x Morgan

Plant Name:
Plant Location:

Latitude & Longitude Coordinates:  39-17-14 N   77-47-38 W

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge x Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston x Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

District 9 District 10District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8
This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  

Millville Quarry
57 Blair Road, Harpers Ferry WV 25425

Vendor's SHOULDER STONE Plant Location for use with LAYDOWN services:

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall enter below the sourced STONE Plant Names and Locations stone may be pulled from under this 
contract, including their 911 address(es).  Vendor must list with each sourced Plant Name and Location listed the counties that plant will 
be used to service for this contract. Reference Section 6.3 for additional information.  If additional space is needed to list additional plant 
locations, Vendor shall submit multiple Attachment D (ATT D) pages to ensure all plants are accounted for under this contract.  Bids 
submissions that do not include ATT A, ATT B, ATT C and ATT D WILL BE DISQUALIFIED. 

Vendor Name: W-L Construction & Paving, Inc.

Inwood Quarry

This plant may service the following counties under this contract:  
District 1 District 2 District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8 District 9 District 10

ATT D -Shoulder Stone Plants (Laydown) Page _____ of ______ 2024  6624C018
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